Bid Tabulation Official Newspaper 2025/2026

ADVERTISMENT		Los Fresnos	News	C	urrent
Classified Ads	per column inch	\$	9.00	\$	8.00
Legal Notices	per column inch	\$	9.00	\$	8.00
Public Hearing Notices	per column inch	\$	9.00	\$	8.00
Total:		\$	27.00	\$	24.00

CITY OF LOS FRESNOS OFFICIAL NEWSPAPER AGREEMENT

	PARTIES and between the City of Los Fresnos and The Los Fresnos News. ibed as CITY and Los Fresnos News referred to as CONTRACTOR.
	PURPOSE establish an understanding and cooperation between the CITY and ed of a service contract for the purpose of being the Official os.
be printed by fax to the CONTRAG Furthermore, it is an understanding City Secretary prior to the ad being requested along with an itemized s price that was submitted on bid of notices and legal notices and not cl	AGREEMENT Int it is an understanding that the CITY will provide a copy of the ad to OR stating the date and number of times the ad is to run. The tast the CONTRACTOR must send a proof copy and price of ad to the Int. CONTRACTOR must submit a Publisher's Affidavit, when the ement at the end of each month. CONTRACTOR must provide the follows: \$9.00 per column inch for classified ads, public hearing the price for the period of this Agreement, which shall be for a tober 1, 2025 and ending September 30, 2026.
CONTRACTOR of violations that 1. Failing to run ad 2. Failing to provid Publisher's Affic 3. Failing to provid	requested. temized list of ads run by the end of each month and copy of
The term of this Agreement will be may terminate Agreement upon this	rom October 1, 2025 to September 30, 2026. However, either party (30) day written notice.
Executed this 9th day of Septemb	2025.
CITY OF LOS FRESNOS	LOS FRESNOS NEWS
Signature	Signature

Printed Name and Title

BID TABULATIO	BID TABULATION TIRE SERVICE	
2025,	2025/2026	
SERVICE REQUIRED	La Hormiga #3	Current
Lawn Mower & Small Vehicle Tire Flat Repair	\$ 8.00	\$ 8.00
Car Tire Flat Repair (15 - 18)	\$ 8.00	\$ 8.00
Pick Up & Van Tire Flat Repair (15 - 18)	\$ 8.00	\$ 8.00
Large Truck Tire Flat Repair (Up to 20)	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00
Front (Small) Tractor Tire Flat Repair (12 - 16)	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00
Rear (Large) Tractor Tire Flat Repair (16 - 24)	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00
SERVICE REQUIRED	AMOUNT PER TIRE	AMOUNT PER TIRE
Car Tire Balanced & Rotated	\$ 40.00	\$ 40.00
Pick Up & Van Tire Balanced & Rotated	\$ 52.00	\$ 52.00
Large Truck Tire Balanced & Rotated	\$ 60.00	\$ 60.00
SERVICE REQUIRED	AMOUNT PER TIRE	AMOUNT PER TIRE
Car Front End Alignment	n/a	n/a
Pick Up & Van Front End Alignment	n/a	n/a
Large Truck Front End Alignment	n/a	n/a

CITY OF LOS FRESNOS VEHICLE MAINTENANCE AGREEMENT TIRE SERVICE

STATE OF TEXAS)(
CITY OF LOS FRESNOS)(

PARTIES

This AGREEMENT, entered into by and between the City of Los Fresnos and <u>La Hormiga #3 Tire Shop.</u> The City of Los Fresnos herein described as CITY and La Hormiga Tire Shop referred to as CONTRACTOR.

PURPOSE

The purpose of this Agreement is to establish an understanding and cooperation between the CITY and CONTRACTOR. The CITY is in need of a service contract for the purpose of Tire Service for city vehicles.

AGREEMENT

Upon closing of this service agreement it is an understanding that the CITY will provide a work order to the CONTRACTOR with the vehicle number and a brief description of what work needs to be completed. Furthermore it is an understanding that the CONTRACTOR must complete the work order within two (2) days of the date that the CONRACTOR receives the work order. CONTRACTOR must submit an itemized list of work completed on each vehicle within five (5) days after work has been completed. CONTRACTOR must provide the price that was submitted on bid of \$8.00 for Lawn Mower & Small Vehicle Tire Flat Repair, \$8.00 Car Tire Flat Repair (15-18), \$8.00 Pickup & Van Tire Flat Repair (15-18), \$10.00 Large Truck Tire Flat Repair (up to 20), \$25.00 Front (small) Tractor Tire Flat Repair (12-16), \$50.00 Rear (Large) Tractor Tire Flat Repair (16-24), \$40.00 per each Car Tire Balanced & Rotated, \$52.00 each rotation for Pick Up & Van Tire Balanced & Rotated, \$60.00 each rotation for Large Truck Tire Balanced & Rotated and not change the price for the period of this Agreement, which shall be for a twelve (12) month period starting October 1, 2025 and ending September 30, 2026.

VIOLATIONS

The purpose of describing violations is to have a clear understanding between the CITY and CONTRACTOR of violations that may terminate the Agreement.

- 1. Failing to comply with work order within two (2) days.
- 2. Failing to provide itemized list of work completed within five (5) days.
- 3. Failing to provide the City with a contact name and number between the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m. Monday thru Friday.
- 4. Changing price.
- 5. Unsatisfactory work.

TERM

The term of this Agreement will be from October 1, 2025 to September 30, 2026. However, either party may terminate Agreement upon thirty (30) day written notice.

Executed this <u>9th</u> day of <u>September</u>, 2025.

CITY OF LOS FRESNOS	LA HORMIGA #3 TIRE SHOP
Signature	Signature
Mark W. Milum, City Manager	
Printed Name and Title	Printed Name and Title

CITY OF LOS FRESNOS VEHICLE WASHING, VACUUMING AND OTHER DETAIL SERVICE AGREEMENT

STATE OF TEXAS
CITY OF LOS FRESNOS

PARTIES

This AGREEMENT entered into by and between the City of Los Fresnos and <u>Under Construction</u>. The City of Los Fresnos herein described as CITY and Under Construction referred to as CONTRACTOR.

PURPOSE

The purpose of this AGREEMENT is to establish an understanding and cooperation between the CITY and CONTRACTOR. The CITY is in need or a service contract for the purpose of washing, vacuuming and other detail service for all city vehicles.

AGREEMENT

Upon closing of this service agreement it is an understanding that the will provide a work sheet to the CONTRACTOR with the vehicle number, make, model, license and account. There are twelve (12) copies of the work sheet attached to this agreement. CONTRACTOR must fill out a work sheet each month and turn in to City Hall when all work is completed. CONTRACTOR must provide the price that was submitted on bid **SEE ATTACHED LIST** which shall be for a twelve (12) month period starting October 1, 2025 and ending September 30, 2028.

VIOLATIONS

The purpose of describing violations is to have a clear understanding between the CITY and CONTRACTOR of violations that may terminate the Agreement.

- 1. Failure to comply with work.
- 2. Failure to provide itemized list of work completed within five (5) days.
- 3. Changing price.
- 4. Unsatisfactory work.
- 5. Failure to provide the City with a contact name and number between the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m. Monday thru Friday.

TERM

The term of this Agreement will be from October 1, 2025 to September 30, 2028. However, either party may terminate Agreement upon thirty (30) day written notice.

Executed this 9th day of September, 2025.	
CITY OF LOS FRESNOS	UNDER CONSTRUCTION
Signature	Signature
Mark W. Milum, City Manager Printed Name and Title	Printed Name and Title

BID TABULATION VEHICLE WASHING 2025-2026

DETAIL	\$15.00	\$15.00	\$35.00	\$35.00	\$35.00	\$35.00	\$35.00	\$35.00	\$35.00						\$35.00	\$356.00	\$35.00	\$35.00	\$35.00					\$35.00	\$35.00	\$35.00										\$25.00		\$35.00				\$35.00	\$35.00	\$35.00	\$35.00			\$35.00				\$35.00			Ī	Ī	
	\$5.00		\$10.00	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$10.00		\$10.00		\$5.00 n/a	\$5.00 n/a	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$10.00			nla n/a	nla			\$10.00	\$10.00		nla n/a	\$5.00 n/a	\$5.00 n/a					\$5.00	n\a				elu elu		\$10.00	\$10.00	\$10.00			\$10.00	nka n/a			\$10.00	\$10.00	n\a n/a		-	
MONTHLY	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$15.00	\$25.00	\$20.00	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$25.00			\$10.00 n/a	\$10.00	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$10.00	\$10.00 n/a	\$10.00	\$10.00			\$10.00	\$10.00 n/a	\$20.00	\$10.00 n/a	\$25.00	610.00 nla	200	\$10.00 m/a	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$20.00	\$10.00	\$25.00	\$15.00 n/a	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$15.00			
DETAIL			35.00	35.00	35.00	35.00	35.00	35.00	25.00	35.00				35.00	35.00	35.00	35.00	35.00	35.00	35.00	35.00			35.00	35.00	35.00	35.00					35.00	35.00					35.00		35.00	00.00	35.00	35.00	35.00	35.00			35.00				35.00		35.00	35.00	35.00	20.00
WAX			10.00	10.00	10.00	10.00	10.00	10.00	10.00	10.00	_	5.00 N/A	5.00 N/A	10.00	10.00	10.00	10.00	10.00	10.00	10.00	10.00			10.00	10.00	10.00	10.00			5.00 N/A	_	10.00	10.00			5.00 N/A	_	00.00		10.00	2	10.00	10.00	10.00	10.00		N/A	10.00		ΝA		10.00		10.00	10.00	10.00	10.00
MONTHLY	10.00	10.00	25.00 \$	25.00 \$	25.00 \$	25.00 \$	25.00 \$	25.00 \$	15.00 \$	25.00 \$	20.00 N/A	10.00	10.00	25.00 \$	25.00 \$	25.00 \$	25.00 \$	25.00 \$	25.00 \$	25.00 \$		_	10.00 N/A	25.00 \$	25.00 \$	25.00 \$	_		10.00 N/A	10.00	10.00	25.00 \$	_	_	10.00 N/A	20.00		25.00 \$	_	_	10.00	25.00 \$	25.00 \$	25.00 \$	25.00 \$	20.00 N/A	10.00 N/A	25.00 \$	_		10.00 N/A	25.00 \$	20.00	25.00 \$	25.00 \$	25.00 \$	40.00
DETAIL	8	\$	35.00 \$	32.00 \$	35.00 \$	35.00 \$	35.00 \$	35.00 \$	25.00 \$		₩.	\$	\$	32.00 \$	32.00 \$	32.00 \$	35.00 \$	35.00 \$	32.00 \$	35.00 \$	35.00 \$	\$	\$	35.00 \$	32.00 \$	35.00 \$	35.00 \$	\$	€9	€9	_	35.00 \$	35.00 \$	69 (₩.	φ.	-	35.00	9 6	35.00 \$	9	35.00 \$	32.00 \$	32.00 \$	32.00 \$	69	\$	35.00 \$	₩	S	_	35.00 \$	€9	35.00 \$	35.00 \$	35.00 \$	20.02
WAX			10.00	10.00	10.00	10.00	_	_	10.00	10.00		5.00 N/A	5.00 N/A	10.00	10.00	10.00	10.00	10.00	10.00	10.00	10.00	N/A	-	10.00	10.00	10.00	10.00	N/A	_	5.00 N/A	-	_	10.00	A/N	A/A	5.00 N/A		00:0L	V X	10.00	9	10.00	10.00	10.00	10.00		N/A	10.00		N/A	_	10.00		10.00	10:00	10.00	10.00
MONTHLY	10.00	10.00	25.00 \$	25.00 \$	25.00 \$	25.00 \$	25.00 \$	25.00 \$	15.00 \$	25.00 \$	20.00 N/A	10.00 \$	10.00	25.00 \$	25.00 \$	25.00 \$	25.00 \$	25.00 \$	25.00 \$	25.00 \$		10.00 N/A	10.00 N/A		25.00 \$	25.00 \$	_	10.00 N/A	10.00 N/A	10.00	10.00	25.00 \$	_	_	10.00 N/A	20.00		25.00 \$			10.00		25.00 \$		25.00 \$	20.00 N/A	10.00 N/A	25.00 \$	15.00	_	10.00 N/A	25.00 \$	20.00	25.00 \$	25.00 \$	25.00 \$	40.00
D	4XASEE576KA276359 \$	4XASEE573KA276383 \$	3C4PDCAB5GT238959 \$	1FAHP2MK9GG154980 \$	3N1AB7AP9GL646270 \$	1FTEW1C52KKC16375 \$	1FTEW1C54KKC16376 \$	1FM5K8AR0KGB55195 \$	7L31F6213KG001151 \$	1GNLCDKC7LR116855 \$	7KC1E1625LT000615 \$	4XATAA998M8385355	4XASEA509MA707310 \$	1FTFW1E50PKD15740 \$	1FM5K8AB1PGB13144 \$	1FM5K8AB2PGB12729 \$	1FM5K8AB6PGB12751 \$	1GNSCLED0PR511427 \$	1GNSCLED9PR511488 \$	1GNSCNKD1RR392774 \$	1FM5K8AB6SGA81879 \$	1P9RG2112EA277830 \$	1P9RG2116EA277829 \$	1FTEW1EF7GKF34022 \$	1FTFW1E58PKD23178 \$	1FTRF12246NB66849 \$	1FTNF2A59AEB17168 \$	1TC920MAJEX020125 \$	4YMBU1422MT000369 \$	3NSMAA505NE546349 \$	1TC930MCAPT125356 \$	1FT7W2AA9REF51821 \$	1FTMF1K53RKF44900 \$	4K8AX1010V1A21766	5VNBU1620BT089737 \$	JALE5W163E7902684 \$	1PY5065ELFY145738 \$	1 FDRF 3 G66 GEA 85808 \$	11C03.0MC ID11.2E207	1FT7W2AA2RFF52664 \$	T0310GX 950500 \$	1FTSW21P66EA89891 \$	1FTRW12W36KB22166 \$	1FDNF20599EA41010 \$	1FTMF1CM1DKF78493 \$	1U9FS1320DA044052 \$	1TC930MCCEY022953 \$	1FTEW1E52JKC97423 \$	5F13D1412J1006368 \$	1TC930MVAKT080025 \$	16V1U2028M2034353 \$	1FTEX1CB8MKE95210 \$	1FTEX1CBXMKE95211 \$	1T0310LXVPF441611 \$	1F1BKZBAZKEF1Z514 \$	1FTMF1K55RKF45062 \$	1EBAX2CMAKKBA7573 &
LICENSE			HMB-3231	136-5912	SBN9242	LHW-1612	CHW-0869	139-0888	910-9359	MRD-9606	912-6663			1565222	1436085	1436086	1552149	1559530	1559531	VTN9103		902-2214	902-2213	134-6678	1469550	123-8015	107-4421		910-9360			1611861	1611841	902-2211	902-2212	111-7019		134-6666	Ī	1611862	100	123-7975	BE4-8457	131-7891	111-6984	902-2192		136-5927	M02-0704		912-6664	1469406	1469407		1559647	1559648	141-8173
MODEL	Sportsman 570	Sportsman 570	Journey	Interceptor Sedan	Sentra	F-150 Pickup (E)	F-150 Pickup (E)	Explorer	Speed Radar Trailer	Tahoe	Utility Trailer	Ranger 100	SMAN 450	F-150	Explorer	Explorer	Explorer	Tahoe	Tahoe	Tahoe	Explorer	Recycling Trailer	Recycling Trailer	F-150 Super Cab 4X4	F-150 Super	F-150 Pickup	F-250 Pickup	Z-920 M (48)	14' Utility Trailer	Ranger 500	Z-930 M (60)	F-250 Crew Cab 6.75' Box	F-150 XL Regular Cab 6.5' Box	10' Utility Trailer	16' Utility Trailer	435 Sweeper	5065E	F-350 Flat Bed	Z 030 M (60)	E-250 Crew Cab 6 75' Box	310 G Backhoe (DSI.)	F-250 Pickup (Diesel)	F-150 Pickup	F-250 Pickup	F150 Pickup	Sewer Machine	Z-930 M (60)	F-150 Pickup (E)	LightTower	Z-930 M (54)	16' Utility Trailer	F-150 Super Cab	F-150 Super Cab	2023 310L Backhoe Loader	F-250 4x4 Regular Cab 8 Box	F-150 XL Regular Cab 6.5' Box	No.
MAKE	Polaris	Polaris	Dodge	Ford	Nissan	Ford	Ford	Ford	SAM	Chevrolet	Wells Cargo	Polaris	Polaris	Ford	Ford	Ford	Ford	Chevrolet	Chevrolet	Chevrolet	Ford	Pro-Gravity	Pro	Ford	Ford	Ford	Ford	John Deere	Carry On	Polaris	John Deere	Ford	Ford	Big Tex	CM	nznsı	John Deere	Ford	Wallou	Ford	John Deare	Ford	Ford	Ford	Ford	US Jetting	John Deere	Ford	Wanco	John Deere	Big Tex	Ford	Ford	John Deere	Ford	Ford	Ford
YEAR	2019	2019	2016	2016	2016	2019	2019	2019	2019	2020	2020	2021	2021	2023	2023	2023	2023	2023	2023	2024	2025	2015	2015	2016	2023	2006	2010	2014	2021	2022	2023	2024	2024	1997	2011	2014	2016	2016	2002	2022	2005	2006	2006	2009	2013	2013	2014	2018	2018	2019	2021	2021	2021	2023	2024	2024	2010
CITY ID	PD-191	PD-192	PD-163	PD-165	PD-166	PD-191	PD-192	PD-193	PD-194	PD-202	PD-204	PD-211	PD-212	PD-232	PD-233	PD-234	PD-235	PD-236	PD-237	PD-241	PD-251	EV-151	EV-152	EV-162	EV-231	PK-061	PK-101	PK-142	PK-211	PK-221	PK-231	PK-244	PK-246	RD-971	RD-111	RD-141	RD-161	RD-162	20.00	RD-245	130-SW	WS-064	WS-065	WS-091	WS-131	WS-132	WS-143	WS-181	WS-182	WS-191	WS-212	WS- 213	WS- 214	WS-231	WS-242	WS-243	101 00
DEPT	Police	Police	Police	Police	Police	Police	Police	Police	Police	Police	Police	Environmental	Environmental	Environmental	Environmental	Parks	Parks	Streets	Streets	Streets	Streets	Streets	Stroots	Streets	Litility	Utility	Utility	Utility	Utility	Utility	Utility	Utility	Utility	Utility	Utility	Utility	Utility	Utility	Utility	Otility	Senior Citizene																

Bid Tabulation Chemicals 2025/2026

		OTHER FEES	\$50.00 PER MO. CYCLINDER RENTAL	\$10.00 PER MONTH CYLINDER RENTAL	\$5.40 SUPERFUND TAX PER CYLINDER & \$50 PER MONTH RENTAL	\$.41 SUPER TAX PER CYLINDER & \$10 POER MONTH RENTAL		**PRODUCT BEING BID ON IS CHEMTRADE'S CLAR+ION 91024.	****PRICING IS BASED ON A MIN. ORDER OF 24,000 LBS. ANY ORDER LESS THAN THIS IS SUBJECT TO PRICE ADJUSTMENT.		87.35 F/S FEE PER ORDER	87.35 F/S FEE PER ORDER			
	CURRENT	BID PRICE PER POUND	\$1.24	\$2.003	\$1.24	2.003	0.2450/LB.	**PRC	***\$0.19 PRICE EQUATES TO 24,00 24,00	0.65/ LB	4.00 PER GALLON	#85"			
		BID PRICE	\$2480.00/cylinder	\$300.45/cylinder	\$2480.00/cylinder	\$300.45/cylinder	0.2450/pounds	spunod/	spunod/	\$35.70/bag	220.00/drum	290.00/drum	spunod/	/cylinder	/cylinder
	USALCO,LLC	BID PRICE PER POUND						\$0.23							
	NSA	BID PRICE	/cylinder	/cylinder	/cylinder	/cylinder	spunod/	\$0.23/pounds	spunod/	Abag	/drum	/drum	spunod/	/cylinder	/cylinder
	Chemtrade 3 YEARS	BID PRICE PER POUND	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	**\$0.175	***\$0.25	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Chemi	BID PRICE	/cylinder	/cylinder	/cylinder	/cylinder	spunod/	spunod/	spunod/	/bag	/drum	mn.p/	spunod/	/cylinder	/cylinder
	Chemtrade 1 YEAR	BID PRICE PER POUND	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	*\$0.232	**\$0.167	***\$0.20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Chemtra	BID PRICE	/cylinder	/cylinder	/cylinder	/cylinder	spunod/	spunod/	spunod/	/bag	/drum	mn.p/	spunod/	/cylinder	/cylinder
	CHEMSOL SERVICES	BID PRICE PER POUND	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	1.65 LB.	5.00 GAL	.65 LB.	3.30LB.	NO BID	NO BID
	CHEM	BID PRICE	/cylinder	/cylinder	/cylinder	/cylinder	spunod/	spunod/	spunod/	/bag	/drum	/qrnm	spunod/	/cylinder	/cylinder
	m Inc.	BID PRICE PER POUND					\$0.2230/LB.			\$40.00/bag			\$2.87/pound		
	Amchem Inc.	BID PRICE	/cylinder	/cylinder	/cylinder	/cylinder	\$0.2230/pounds	spunod/	spunod/	\$40.00/bag	/drum	/qrnm	\$2.87/pound	/cylinder	/cylinder
	тс	OTHER FEES											(one pallet 100 LB \$387.49)(2 pallets 1000 Lb 559.08)		
0707/5707	JL PRODUCETS, LLC	BID PRICE PER POUND											2.52(50 lb. Buckets) or 2.27 (100 lb .buckets)		
•		BID PRICE	/cylinder	/cylinder	cylinder	/cylinder	spunod/	spunod/	spunod/	/bag	/drum	/drum	\$2520.00 or \$2270.00 for 1000/pounds	/cylinder	/cylinder
		OTHER FEES	\$50.00 per month cylinder rental	\$10.00 per month cylinder rental	\$50.00 per month cylinder rental	\$10.00 per month cylinder rental									
	PVS DX, INC.	BID PRICE PER POUND	\$1.29 per pound	\$2.06 per pound	\$1.24 per pound	\$2.0003 per pound									
		BID PRICE	\$2580.00/cylinder	\$309.00/cylinder	\$2480.00/cylinder	\$300.45/cylinder	spunod/	spunod/	spunod/	/bag	/drum	mn.p/	spunod/	/cylinder	/cylinder
		APPROXIMATE USAGE	5850 Pounds	eou Pounds	34,950 Pounds	e00 Pounds	88,500 Pounds	222,500 Pounds	56,200 Pounds	1,500 Pounds	1,100 Gallons	1,000 Gallons	1,000 Pounds	10 cylinders	10 cylinders
		CONTAINER	1 ton Cylinder	150 Pound Cylinder	1 ton Cylinder	150 Pound Cylinder	3,000 Gal. Bulk	6,000 Gal. Bulk	3,000 Gal. Bulk	50 Pound Bag	55 Gallon Drum	55 Gallon Drum	50/100 Bucket	100cf Cylinder	125cf Cylinder
		CHEMICAL	Sulfer Dioxide	Sulfur Dioxide	Chlorine Gas	Chlorine Gas	Caustic Soda 50%	Liquid Alum Blend	Liquid Ammonium Sulfate	Sodium Bicarbonate	Sodium Hypochlorite	Hydrochloric Acid	Calcium Hypochlorite Granular	Acetylene (welding)	Oxygen (welding)

STATE OF TEXAS)(CITY OF LOS FRESNOS)(PARTIES
This AGREEMENT, entered into by and between the City of Los Fresnos and PVS DX,INC The City of Los Fresnos herein described as CITY and PVS DX, INC., referred to as CONTRACTOR.
<u>PURPOSE</u> The purpose of this Agreement is to establish an understanding and cooperation between the CITY and CONTRACTOR. The CITY is in need of a service contract for the purpose of supplying Sulfur Dioxide and Chlorine Gas.
AGREEMENT Upon closing of this service agreement it is an understanding that the CITY will provide a purchase order to the CONTRACTOR with the amount of chemicals needed. Furthermore, it is an understanding that the CONTRACTOR must complete the work order within two (2) days of the date that the CONRACTOR receives the purchase order. CONTRACTOR must submit an itemized list of chemicals delivered. CONTRACTOR must provide an invoice and statement at the end of each month to the CITY. CONTRACTOR must provide the price that was submitted on bid as follows:
 Sulfur Dioxide 1-ton cylinder container \$2,580.00 per cylinder (\$1.29/lb.) with a \$50.00 monthly cylinder rental fee Sulfur Dioxide 150-pound cylinder \$309.00 per cylinder (\$2.006/lb.) with a \$10.00 monthly cylinder rental fee Chlorine Gas 1-ton cylinder \$2,480.00 per cylinder (\$1.24/lb) with a \$50.00 monthly rental fee Chlorine Gas 150-pound cylinder \$300.45 per cylinder (\$2.003/lb) with a \$10.00 monthly rental fee
and not change the price for the period of this Agreement, which shall be for a twelve (12) month period starting October 1, 2025 and ending September 30, 2026.
VIOLATIONS
The purpose of describing violations is to have a clear understanding between the CITY and CONTRACTOR of violations that may terminate the Agreement.
1. Failing to comply with work order within two (2) days.
 Failing to provide an invoice and statement at the end of each month. Failing to provide the City with a contact name and number between the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m. Monday thru Friday.
4. Changing price.
5. Unsatisfactory delivery. TERM
<u>x DAU.x</u>
The term of this Agreement will be from October 1, 2025 to September 30, 2026. However, either party may terminate Agreement upon thirty (30) day written notice.
Executed this 9th day of September, 2025.
CITY OF LOS FRESNOS PVS DX, INC.

Signature

Printed Name and Title

Signature

	HEMICAL SERVICE AGREEMENT
STATE OF TEXAS)(CITY OF LOS FRESNOS)(PARTIES
	and between the City of Los Fresnos and AmChem, Inc. The City of Los AmChem, Inc. referred to as CONTRACTOR.
	PURPOSE stablish an understanding and cooperation between the CITY and d of a service contract for the purpose of supplying Caustic Soda 50%, alorite Granular.
CONTRACTOR with the amount of c must complete the work order within t CONTRACTOR must submit an itemi	AGREMENT t it is an understanding that the CITY will provide a purchase order to the hemicals needed. Furthermore, it is an understanding that the CONTRACTOR wo (2) days of the date that the CONRACTOR receives the purchase order. Ized list of chemicals delivered. CONTRACTOR must provide an invoice and the CITY. CONTRACTOR must provide the price that was submitted on bid
 <u>Caustic Soda 50% \$0.2230/lb</u> <u>Sodium Bicarbonate \$40.00 p</u> <u>Calcium Hypochlorite Granu</u> 	per bag
and not change the price for the period October 1, 2025 and ending September	of this Agreement, which shall be for a twelve (12) month period starting r 30, 2026.
	<u>VIOLATIONS</u>
The purpose of describing violations is violations that may terminate the Agree	s to have a clear understanding between the CITY and CONTRACTOR of tement.
1. Failing to comply w	ith work order within two (2) days.
	n invoice and statement at the end of each month. The City with a contact name and number between the hours of 8:00 a.m. and nru Friday.
5. Unsatisfactory deliv	·
	<u>TERM</u>
The term of this Agreement will be from terminate Agreement upon thirty (30)	om October 1, 2025 to September 30, 2026. However, either party may day written notice.
Executed this 9th day of September, 2	025.
CITY OF LOS FRESNOS	AMCHEM INC.
Signature	Signature

Printed Name and Title

STATE OF TEXAS)(CITY OF LOS FRESNOS)(<u>PARTIES</u>
	d between the City of Los Fresnos and <u>ChemSol Services</u> The City of Los ChemSol Services referred to as CONTRACTOR.
Treshos herein described as eff f and e	shembor betvices referred to as Corvina ici orc.
	PURPOSE ablish an understanding and cooperation between the CITY and of a service contract for the purpose of supplying Sodium Hypochlorite and
CONTRACTOR with the amount of che CONTRACTOR must complete the wor purchase order. CONTRACTOR must	AGREEMENT it is an understanding that the CITY will provide a purchase order to the emicals needed. Furthermore it is an understanding that the rk order within two (2) days of the date that the CONRACTOR receives the submit an itemized list of chemicals delivered. CONTRACTOR must end of each month to the CITY. CONTRACTOR must provide the price
 Sodium Hypochlorite \$5.00 pe Hydrochloric Acid \$0.65/lb 	r gallon
And not change the price for the period October 1, 2025 and ending September	of this Agreement, which shall be for a twelve (12) month period starting 30, 2026.
violations that may terminate the Agree 1. Failing to comply with 2. Failing to provide an i	h work order within two (2) days. nvoice and statement at the end of each month. City with a contact name and number between the hours of 8:00 a.m. and u Friday.
The term of this Agreement will be from terminate Agreement upon thirty (30) day	n October 1, 2025 to September 30, 2026. However, either party may ay written notice.
Executed this 9th day of September, 202	5.
CITY OF LOS FRESNOS	CHEMSOL SERVICES
Signature	Signature

Printed Name and Title

Mark W. Milum, City Manager

Printed Name and Title

Signature			Signature
CITY OF LOS I	FRESNOS		CHEMTRADE CHEMICALS, US LLC.
Executed this 9th	a day of September	er, 2025.	
	-	e from October 1, 2025 (30) day written notice.	to September 30, 2026. However, either party may
		<u>TE</u>	<u>CRM</u>
5.	Unsatisfactory d	lelivery.	PDM
4.	Changing price.		
3.	Failing to provide 5:00 p.m. Mond		ct name and number between the hours of 8:00 a.m. and
2.			nent at the end of each month.
1.	Failing to compl	ly with work order with	
	describing violational terminate the A	ons is to have a clear und	ATIONS derstanding between the CITY and CONTRACTOR of
	he price for the pe and ending Septe	mber 30, 2026.	which shall be for a twelve (12) month period starting
convers • <u>Liquid</u>	sion purposes only Ammonium Sulfa ess than this is sub	y, price equates to 1 yea te \$0.20 per pound. Sta	duct being bid on is Chemtrade's CLAR+ion 91024, for r \$334.00/ton tes prices is based on a minimum order of 24,000 lbs. any , for conversion purpose only, price equates to 1 year
provide an invoi		at the end of each montl	n to the CITY. CONTRACTOR must provide the price
CONTRACTOR	R must complete the	ne work order within tw	o (2) days of the date that the CONRACTOR receives the d list of chemicals delivered. CONTRACTOR must
		ment it is an understand	EMENT ling that the CITY will provide a purchase order to the Furthermore, it is an understanding that the
Liquid Ammoni	um Sulfate.		
CONTRACTOR	R. The CITY is in	to establish an understa	POSE and cooperation between the CITY and act for the purpose of supplying Liquid Alum Blend and
	Fresnos herein de	by and between the Cit	y of Los Fresnos and <u>Chemtrade Chemicals</u> , <u>US LLC</u> . nemtrade Chemicals, <u>US LLC</u> . referred to as
CITY OF LOS	FRESNOS)(PAR	RTIES
STATE OF TE)(

Printed Name and Title