

BID TABULATION TIRE SERVICE**2026-2027**

SERVICE REQUIRED	CURRENT	NO BID
Lawn Mower & Small Vehicle Tire Flat Repair	\$ 8.00	\$ 8.00
Car Tire Flat Repair (15 - 18)	\$ 8.00	\$ 8.00
Pick Up & Van Tire Flat Repair (15 - 18)	\$ 8.00	\$ 8.00
Large Truck Tire Flat Repair (Up to 20)	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00
Front (Small) Tractor Tire Flat Repair (12 - 16)	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00
Rear (Large) Tractor Tire Flat Repair (16 - 24)	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00
SERVICE REQUIRED	AMOUNT PER TIRE	AMOUNT PER TIRE
Car Tire Balanced & Rotated	\$ 40.00	\$ 40.00
Pick Up & Van Tire Balanced & Rotated	\$ 52.00	\$ 52.00
Large Truck Tire Balanced & Rotated	\$ 60.00	\$ 60.00
SERVICE REQUIRED	AMOUNT PER TIRE	AMOUNT PER TIRE
Car Front End Alignment	n/a	n/a
Pick Up & Van Front End Alignment	n/a	n/a
Large Truck Front End Alignment	n/a	n/a

Bid Tabulation Official Newspaper
 2026-2027

ADVERTISEMENT		San Benito News	
		1 year or 3 year	COMMENTS
Classified Ads	per column inch	\$ 11.00	10/20 word or less
Legal Notices	per column inch	\$ 11.00	\$4.55 per line/line ad
Public Hearing Notices	per column inch	\$ 11.00	\$4.55 per line/line ad
Total:		\$ 33.00	

Bid Tabulation Chemicals 2026-2027																				
			PVS DX, INC.			Amchem Inc.		Penco, Inc		Chemtrade 1 YEAR			Chemtrade 3 YEARS		USALCO,LLC		CURRENT			
CHEMICAL	CONTAINER	APPROXIMATE USAGE	BID PRICE	BID PRICE PER POUND	OTHER FEES	BID PRICE	BID PRICE PER POUND	BID PRICE	BID PRICE PER POUND	BID PRICE	BID PRICE PER POUND	OTHER FEES	BID PRICE	BID PRICE PER POUND	BID PRICE	BID PRICE PER POUND	BID PRICE	BID PRICE PER POUND	OTHER FEES	
Sulfur Dioxide	1 ton Cylinder	5850 Pounds	\$2580/cylinder	1.29/lb	\$50 per month cylinder rental	/cylinder	NO BID	/cylinder	NO BID	/cylinder	NO BID		/cylinder	NO BID	/cylinder	NO BID	\$2580.00/cylinder	\$1.29	\$50.00 PER MO. CYLINDER RENTAL	PVC
Sulfur Dioxide	150 Pound Cylinder	600 Pounds	\$309/cylinder	\$2.06/lb	\$10 per month cylinder rental	/cylinder	NO BID	/cylinder	NO BID	/cylinder	NO BID		/cylinder	NO BID	/cylinder	NO BID	\$309.00/cylinder	\$2.006	\$10.00 PER MONTH CYLINDER RENTAL	PVC
Chlorine Gas	1 ton Cylinder	34,950 Pounds	\$2480/cylinder	1.24/lb	\$50 per month cylinder rental	/cylinder	NO BID	/cylinder	NO BID	/cylinder	NO BID		/cylinder	NO BID	/cylinder	NO BID	\$2480.00/cylinder	\$1.24	\$5.40 SUPERFUND TAX PER CYLINDER & \$50 PER MONTH RENTAL	PVC
Chlorine Gas	150 Pound Cylinder	600 Pounds	\$300.45/cylinder	\$2.003/lb	\$10 per month cylinder rental	/cylinder	NO BID	/cylinder	NO BID	/cylinder	NO BID		/cylinder	NO BID	/cylinder	NO BID	\$300.45/cylinder	2.003	\$.41 SUPER TAX PER CYLINDER & \$10 POER MONTH RENTAL	PVC
Caustic Soda 50%	3,000 Gal. Bulk	88,500 Pounds	/pounds	NO BID		\$.23/pounds	\$.23/LB.	/pounds	NO BID	/pounds	*0.248	*Please note pricing is based on minimum order of 25,000 lbs (1,950 gals). Any order less than this is subject to price adjustment. For conversion purposes only, price equates to \$496.00/Liquid Ton	/pounds	NO BID	/pounds	NO BID	0.2230/pounds	0.2230/LB.		AmChem
Liquid Alum Blend	6,000 Gal. Bulk	222,500 Pounds	/pounds	NO BID		/pounds	NO BID	/pounds	NO BID	/pounds	**0.2005	** Product os Chemtrade's Clar+ion 910424. For conversion purposes only, prices equate as follows: (1 yr) \$401.00/ton; (3 yr) \$421.00/ton	/pounds	**0.2105	\$0.23/pounds	\$.23	/pounds	**\$0.167	** States product deing bid in is Chemtrade's CLR+ion 91024, for conversion purposes only, price equates to 1 year \$334.00/ton	Chemtrade
Liquid Ammonium Sulfate	3,000 Gal. Bulk	56,200 Pounds	/pounds	NO BID		/pounds	NO BID	/pounds	\$.0197/LB	/pounds	***0.225	*** Pricing is based on a minimum order of 24,000 lbs. Any order less than this is subject to price adjustment. For conversion purposes only, prices equate as follows: (1yr) \$450.00/ton; (3 yr) \$600.00/ton	/pounds	***0.3	/pounds	NO BID	/pounds	***\$.20 PRICE EQUATES TO \$400.00/TON	***States prices is based on a munium order 24,00 lbs any order kess than this is subject to prouce adjustmnet, for conversion purposes only, price equates to 1 year \$400.00/ ton	Chemtrade
Hydrochloric Acid	55 Gallon Drum	1,000 Gallons	/drum	NO BID		/drum	NO BID	/drum	NO BID	/drum	NO BID		/drum	NO BID	/drum	NO BID	/drum	\$0.65/lb		ChemSol
Calcium Hypochlorite Granular	50/100 Bucket	1,000 Pounds	/pounds	NO BID		\$2.90/pound	2.90/pound	/pounds	NO BID	/pounds	NO BID		/pounds	NO BID	/pounds	NO BID	/pounds	2.87/lb		AmChem
Acetylene (welding)	100cf Cylinder	10 cylinders	/cylinder	NO BID		/cylinder	NO BID	/cylinder	NO BID	/cylinder	NO BID		/cylinder	NO BID	/cylinder	NO BID	/cylinder			
Oxygen (welding)	125cf Cylinder	10 cylinders	/cylinder	NO BID		/cylinder	NO BID	/cylinder	NO BID	/cylinder	NO BID		/cylinder	NO BID	/cylinder	NO BID	/cylinder			