LINCOLN Parish Police Jury

P.0. Box 979 RUSTON, LOUISIANA 71273-0979
PH: 1-318-513-6200 FAX: 1-318-513-6209

Lincoln
LRI

BID TABULATION SHEET

Item #: One - Asphalt Materials

Bid Date: Thursday, March 31, 2022

Budgeted Amount: $360,000.00

Notes: A budget amendment will have to be made due
to this increase.

Asphalt Product Unlimited, Inc. $5.10 $3.09 5000 gal 24 hours

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions No Bid $3.50 5400 gal 3 day

Note: Amount in red parentheses denotes previous bid amount.

U:\Bids\Bid Tabulation Sheet/Bid Tabulation Sheet/Asphalt Mat 2020



LINCOLN Parish Police Jury

i P.0.Box 979 RUSTON, LOUISIANA 71273-0979
PH: 1-318-513-6200 FAX: 1-318-513-6209

BID TABULATION SHEET

Item #: #1 - Air Burner Container
Bid Date: Thursday, March 31, 2022

Budgeted Amount: Not budgeted
Notes: A budget amendment will have to be made.

Air Burners, Inc $208,105.00 September 22, 2022
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= LINCOLN Parish Police Jury

P.0.Box 979 RUSTON, LOUISIANA 71273-0979
PH: 1-318-513-6200 FAX: 1-318-513-6209

BID TABULATION SHEET
Item #: #1 - Self-Propelled Road Sweeper
Bid Date: Thursday, March 31, 2022
Budgeted Amount: $66,800.00

Notes:
_ Bidder L Model | Bid | Delivery Date_
Scott Equipment Co. DT74J $69,800.00 July 15, 2022
H&E Equipment Services No Bid No Bid No Bid
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= LINCOLN Parish Police Jury

P.0.Box 979 RUSTON, LOUISIANA 71273-0979
PH: 1-318-513-6200 FAX: 1-318-513-6209

BID TABULATION SHEET
Item #: #2 - Soil Stabilizer/Recycler
Bid Date: Thursday, March 31, 2022
Budgeted Amount: $500,000.00

Notes:
Bidder Model Bid Delivery Date
H&E Equipment Services Wirtgen WR200XLI | $492,500.00 November 2022
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LINCOLN Parish Police Jury

P.0.Box 979 RUSTON, LOUISIANA 71273-0979
PH: 1-318-513-6200 FAX: 1-318-513-6209

i
A
L

BID TABULATION SHEET
Item #: #3-New 6/8 Yard Dump Truck
Bid Date: Thursday, March 31, 2022
Budgeted Amount: $100,000.00
Notes:

Originally budgeted for a sand truck but the jury approved to

purchase a dump truck and sand spreader as two separate
units for versatility. A budget amendment will h to b

d

International MV607
w/Warren F-10-3238

Scott Truck LLC Dump Body $113,350.00 After January 1, 2024
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LINCOLN Parish Police Jury

P.0.Box 979 RUSTON, LOUISIANA 71273-0979

PH: 1-318-513-6200 FAX: 1-318-513-6209

BID TABULATION SHEET

Item #:

#4 - Boom Truck

Bid Date:

Thursday, March 31, 2022

Budgeted Amount:

$150,000.00

Rivercity Hydraulics

Notes:

A budget amendment will have to be made.

Freightliner M2-106
Petersen TL3 Boom
Hardox Dump Body

$184,089.00 June 2022
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Lincoln
LIS

LINCOLN Parish Police Jury

P.0.Box 979 RUSTON, LOUISIANA 71273-0979
PH: 1-318-513-6200 FAX: 1-318-513-6209

Wastequip Manufacturing

BID TABULATION SHEET
Item #: #5 - 40 Each 8YD Refuse Containers
Bid Date: Thursday, March 31, 2022
Budgeted Amount: $60,000.00
Notes:

8 cubic yard

$1276.10 ea /
$51,044.00 Total 6-8 weeks or sooner
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LINCOLN Parish Police Jury

e P.0.Box 979 RUSTON, LOUISIANA 71273-0979
PH: 1-318-513-6200 FAX: 1-318-513-6209

BID TABULATION SHEET
Item #: #6 - Two New Transfer Refuse Trailers
Bid Date: Thursday, March 31, 2022
Budgeted Amount: Originally budgeted in 2021
Notes: This is a rebid, an amendment will have to be made.

Bidder e Model =~  B@d =@
Within 90 days of bid
Trailco of I-49, LLC Travis Chasis S-102 WF $187,162.00 acceptance

U:\Bids\Bid Tabulation Sheet/Bid Tabulation Sheet/Boom (3)



