Crystal Caldera

From: Melinda Moritz

Sent: Wednesday, November 9, 2022 11:02 AM
To: Crystal Caldera

Subject: FW: Backflow - Obasi

Here you go!

From: Marco Casanova <mjccontractingl@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, November 4, 2022 3:46 PM

To: Melinda Moritz <m.moritz@leonvalleytexas.gov>; David Dimaline <d.dimaline@leonvalleytexas.gov>
Subject: Backflow

Good afternoon sir core and main has one
Backflow preventer, materials cost 13,728.16
Insulation wrap cost from Star Mechanical Insulation is 2, 200 for 8 inch Backflow

Materials amd protective wrap total 15,928.16 not including install cost

Marco Casanova

President

MJC Contracting,LLC

Cell :(210)527-3904

San Antonio Tx, 78250
Mijccontractingl @gmail.com




