
RESOLUTION No. 24-00_R 
 

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF LEON VALLEY, TX., CITY COUNCIL 
REAPPOINTING DR. CHICHI JUNDA WOO AS THE HEALTH AUTHORITY FOR THE 
CITY OF LEON VALLEY.  

 
WHEREAS, during the 68th Legislature, Governor Mark White signed the “Local Public 
Health Reorganization Act” into law; and 
 
WHEREAS, During the 71st Legislature, the legislature recodified the Act as Chapter 
121 of the Texas Health and Safety Code. Which, among other things, defines the 
powers of the counties and municipalities as it relates to the local regulation of public 
health, including the establishment of a public health district; and, 
 
WHEREAS, Bexar County and the City of Leon Valley are members of the Bexar 
County Metropolitan Health District, a public health district under Texas Health and 
Safety Code Chapter 121, Subchapter E; and, 
  
WHEREAS, the members of the public health district shall approve the reappointment 
of a physician as the health authority for the district; and,  
 
WHEREAS, the Health and Safety Code defines a health authority as an individual who 
acts as a state officer when performing their duties, which include; aiding the state with 
quarantine, sanitation enforcement, public health law enforcement, reportable diseases, 
and vital statistics collections; and, 
  
WHEREAS, a health authority must be a competent physician with a reputable 
professional standing who is a resident of Texas, is legally qualified to practice 
medicine, shall serve for two years, and may be appointed to successive terms. 
 
WHEREAS, Leon Valley seeks a health authority that strives to do what is in the best 
interest of all Leon Valley residents, one who encourages preparedness, prevention, 
planning, response, and recovery activities; and,  
 
WHEREAS, Leon Valley requires the reappointment of a health authority who will work 
collaboratively with the county’s chief elected official, the Office of Emergency 
Management, county staff, and the Bexar County Hospital District; and, 
 
WHEREAS, Dr. Woo is a licensed physician who meets all the Health and Safety Code 
requirements. She has held a Texas Medical License since June 2004, she currently 
serves in the adjunct clinical faculty at the UT School of Public Health, and the 
University of the Incarnate Word School of Osteopathic Medicine. 
 
 
 
 



NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED THAT THE CITY OF LEON VALLEY: 
APPROVES THE REAPPOINTMENT OF DR. CHICHI JUNDA WOO AS THE HEALTH 
AUTHORITY FOR THE CITY OF LEON VALLEY.  
 
PASSED, ADOPTED AND APPROVED by the City Council of the City of Leon Valley 
this the 7th day of May, 2024.       
        APPROVED 
 
          
           ______________________ 
                             CHRIS RILEY 
                MAYOR 
  
 
Attest : 
 
 
____________________________ 
 

SAUNDRA PASSAILAIGUE, TRMC 
              City Secretary 
 
 
 
 
 
Approved as to Form: City Attorney 
 
 
_________________________ 

ART RODRIGUEZ 
 City Attorney 


