

SCOTT R. BAKER JENNIFER H. ELOWSKY

sbaker@bakerelowsky.com

Of Counsel

LEANN K. KIMBERLIN

MATTHEW C. QUINN

August 25, 2021

Via Email

Sheryl Mitchell, DBA, MSA City Administrator City of Lathrup Village 27400 Southfield Road Lathrup Village, MI 48076 Pam Bratschi, MiCPT, CPFA City Treasurer City of Lathrup Village 27400 Southfield Road Lathrup Village, MI 48076

Re: Legal Department Billing for July 1 through July 31, 2021

Dear Dr. Mitchell and Ms. Bratschi:

The following is our law firm's billing to the City of Lathrup Village for the month of July, 2021:

1. General Retainer	\$2,500.00
2. Special Legal Services	\$3,932.50
3. Downtown Development Authority	\$
4. Project Reimbursement	\$
5. Prosecution/Code Enforcement	<u>\$1,560.00</u>
	\$7,992.50

If you should have any questions, please feel free to contact me.

Very truly yours,

BAKER & ELOWSKY, PLLC

Scott R. Baker

Enclosures



August 25, 2021

City of Lathrup Village 27400 Southfield Road Lathrup Village, MI 48076

> Invoice Number: 1151 Invoice Period: 07-01-2021 - 07-31-2021

RE: General Retainer

Time Details

Date	Professional	Description	Hours	Amount
07-01-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: July meeting agenda items	0.25	No Charge
07-01-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: soil erosion permits	0.25	No Charge
07-01-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from S. Stec re: BP bond letter	0.25	No Charge
07-01-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from S. Stec re: BP bond letter	0.25	No Charge
07-01-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from S. Stec re: 27236 Southfield Road	0.25	No Charge
07-06-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: Council vacancy	0.25	No Charge
07-06-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: July 12 meeting agenda	0.25	No Charge
07-06-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: CIP update	0.25	No Charge
07-06-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Clerk re: charter amendments	0.25	No Charge
07-08-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: Council vacancy	0.25	No Charge
07-08-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: draft agenda	0.25	No Charge
07-08-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from S. Stec re: 27236 Southfield Road	0.25	No Charge
07-09-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from S. Stec re: SAD resolution	0.25	No Charge
	V	/e appreciate your business. Checks may be made payable to Baker & Elowsky, PLLC.	Page	e 1 of 8

Date	Professional	Description	Hours	Amount
07-09-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from K. London re public hearing notice	0.25	No Charge
07-09-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Mayor re draft agenda	0.25	No Charge
07-09-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: SAD notice of public hearing	0.25	No Charge
07-09-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: SAD notice of public hearing	0.25	No Charge
07-09-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: public comment received	0.25	No Charge
07-09-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: public comment received	0.25	No Charge
07-09-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: public comment received	0.25	No Charge
07-09-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Clerk re: Cambridge SAD	0.25	No Charge
07-09-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Mayor Pro-tem Re: draft agenda	0.25	No Charge
07-09-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: CIP updates	0.25	No Charge
07-10-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: special meeting agenda	0.25	No Charge
07-10-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: cannabis information	0.25	No Charge
07-10-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: cannabis public notice	0.25	No Charge
07-10-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: public comment received	0.25	No Charge
07-10-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: Special assessment resolution	0.25	No Charge
07-10-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: agenda documents	0.25	No Charge
07-11-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: 27208 Southfield Road public comment	0.25	No Charge
07-12-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: contract amendments	0.25	No Charge
07-12-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: gun violence roundtable	0.25	No Charge
07-12-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: JMC property	0.25	No Charge
07-12-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: resident correspondence	0.25	No Charge
07-12-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: Precision MRI	0.25	No Charge
07-12-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: SAD publication	0.25	No Charge
07-12-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Mayor Pro-tem Re: 7/12 agenda	0.25	No Charge
	We	e appreciate your business. Checks may be made payable to Baker & Elowsky, PLLC.	Page	e 2 of 8

Date	Professional	Description	Hours	Amount
07-12-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from S. Stec re: cannabis ordinance	0.25	No Charge
07-13-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from S. Stec re: SAD correspondence	0.25	No Charge
07-14-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from S. Stec re: cannabis petition	0.25	No Charge
07-14-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Mayor Pro-Tem re: Cannabis petition	0.25	No Charge
07-14-2021	SRB	Draft correspondence to Treasurer re: audit letter/ pending litigation, tribunal matters	0.25	No Charge
07-14-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: Public comment	0.25	No Charge
07-14-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: Public comment	0.25	No Charge
07-14-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: Public comment	0.25	No Charge
07-14-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: Budget information	0.25	No Charge
07-14-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: JMC correspondence	0.25	No Charge
07-14-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: 28820 Southfield	0.25	No Charge
07-14-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: cannabis petition	0.25	No Charge
07-14-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: Officer Upshaw	0.25	No Charge
07-14-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: Cannabis petition	0.25	No Charge
07-15-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: 28820 Southfield	0.25	No Charge
07-15-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: JMC properties	0.25	No Charge
07-16-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: JMC properties	0.25	No Charge
07-16-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from S. Stec re: Planning Commission meeting	0.25	No Charge
07-17-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Mayor Pro-Tem re: Cannabis resolutions	0.25	No Charge
07-17-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: Planning Commission meeting	0.25	No Charge
07-17-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: Cannabis resolutions	0.25	No Charge
07-19-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: Public comment received	0.25	No Charge
07-19-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: Public comment received	0.25	No Charge
	We	e appreciate your business. Checks may be made payable to Baker & Elowsky, PLLC.	Page	e 3 of 8

Date	Professional	Description	Hours	Amount
07-19-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: cannabis resolutions	0.25	No Charge
07-19-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: Precise MRI	0.25	No Charge
07-19-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: public comment submitted	0.25	No Charge
07-19-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: public comment submitted	0.25	No Charge
07-19-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: cannabis resolutions	0.25	No Charge
07-19-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: council updates	0.25	No Charge
07-19-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: planning commission agenda	0.25	No Charge
07-19-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Clerk re: Public comment received	0.25	No Charge
07-19-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Clerk re: Public comment received	0.25	No Charge
07-19-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from K. London re initiative petition	0.25	No Charge
07-19-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Mayor Pro-Tem re cannabis resolutions	0.25	No Charge
07-19-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Clerk re Planning Commission minutes	0.25	No Charge
07-19-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from S. Stec re: Planning Commission meeting agenda	0.25	No Charge
07-19-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from S. Stec re: Planning Commission meeting agenda	0.25	No Charge
07-20-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from S. Stec re: park title search	0.25	No Charge
07-20-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from S. Stec re: cannabis petition	0.25	No Charge
07-20-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from S. Stec re: planning commission materials	0.25	No Charge
07-20-2021	SRB	Review correspondence form Commissioner Hammond re comprehensive plan	0.25	No Charge
07-20-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: candidate filings	0.25	No Charge
07-21-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: public comment received	0.25	No Charge
07-21-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: hybrid meeting	0.25	No Charge
07-21-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from K. London re petition received	0.25	No Charge
07-21-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Mayor Pro-Tem re cannabis petition	0.25	No Charge
	V	Ve appreciate your business. Checks may be made payable to Baker & Elowsky, PLLC.	Page	e 4 of 8

Date	Professional	Description	Hours	Amount
07-21-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from S. Stec re: cannabis ordinance	0.25	No Charge
07-22-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Clerk re: candidate affidavit	0.25	No Charge
07-22-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from K. London re: candidate affidavit	0.25	No Charge
07-22-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Clerk re Public comments	0.25	No Charge
07-22-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from K. London re: candidate affidavit	0.25	No Charge
07-22-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Mayor Pro-Tem re: ballot question	0.25	No Charge
07-22-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Clerk re: charter amendments	0.25	No Charge
07-22-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: candidate affidavit	0.25	No Charge
07-22-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: JMC properties	0.25	No Charge
07-22-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: Southfield road improvement	0.25	No Charge
07-23-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: Charter amendment	0.25	No Charge
07-23-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: council meeting	0.25	No Charge
07-23-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: council meeting agenda	0.25	No Charge
07-23-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: council meeting update	0.25	No Charge
07-23-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Clerk re Public comments	0.25	No Charge
07-23-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from K. London Re Greg Ruvolo affidavit	0.25	No Charge
07-23-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Mayor Pro-Tem re: Greg Ruvolo affidavit	0.25	No Charge
07-23-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Clerk re: Greg Ruvolo affidavit	0.25	No Charge
07-23-2021	SRB	Draft correspondence to City Council and Staff, review response from same re initiative petition	0.25	No Charge
07-23-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from K. London re: candidate withdrawal	0.25	No Charge
07-23-2021	SRB	Review multiple correspondence from Council re timing of public comment	0.25	No Charge
07-24-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Council re timing of public comment	0.25	No Charge
07-24-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: public comment procedure	0.25	No Charge

We appreciate your business. Checks may be made payable to Baker & Page 5 of 8 Elowsky, PLLC.

Date	Professional	Description	Hours	Amount
07-24-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: alley vacation	0.25	No Charge
07-24-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: comprehensive plan resolution	0.25	No Charge
07-24-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: council meeting update	0.25	No Charge
07-25-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: council meeting agenda update	0.25	No Charge
07-25-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Mayor re: public comment	0.25	No Charge
07-26-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Clerk re: public comment received	0.25	No Charge
07-26-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Clerk re: Cambridge SAD	0.25	No Charge
07-26-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Clerk re: Cambridge SAD	0.25	No Charge
07-26-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Clerk re: nominating petition	0.25	No Charge
07-26-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from S. Stec re: public comments received	0.25	No Charge
07-26-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: public comment received	0.25	No Charge
07-26-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: Cambridge SAD	0.25	No Charge
07-26-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: amended agenda for study session	0.25	No Charge
07-26-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: public comment received	0.25	No Charge
07-26-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: public comment received	0.25	No Charge
07-26-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: public comment received	0.25	No Charge
07-26-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: public comment received	0.25	No Charge
07-26-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: public comment received	0.25	No Charge
07-26-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: public comment received	0.25	No Charge
07-26-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: SAD publication	0.25	No Charge
07-26-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: Cannabis ordinance	0.25	No Charge
07-26-2021	SRB	Prepare for, attend and participate in City Council Study Session	1.50	No Charge
07-26-2021	SRB	Prepare for, attend and participate in City Council regular meeting	4.50	No Charge
07-27-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: FOIA request	0.25	No Charge
	V	Ve appreciate your business. Checks may be made payable to Baker &	Page	e 6 of 8

Elowsky, PLLC.

Date	Professional	Description	Hours	Amount
07-27-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: council follow up items	0.25	No Charge
07-27-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: alley vacation resolution	0.25	No Charge
07-27-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: JMC litigation	0.25	No Charge
07-27-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: cannabis update	0.25	No Charge
07-27-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from S. Stec re: public hearing notice	0.25	No Charge
07-27-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from S. Stec re: park grant	0.25	No Charge
07-27-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Mayor re Bike Path signage/ expense	0.25	No Charge
07-27-2021	SRB	Review multiple correspondence from Mayor re resident correspondence	0.50	No Charge
07-27-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Clerk re SAD public hearing notice	0.25	No Charge
07-27-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Clerk re FOIA request	0.25	No Charge
07-27-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from K. London re citizen petition	0.25	No Charge
07-28-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Clerk re proof of publication	0.25	No Charge
07-28-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Clerk re alley vacation	0.25	No Charge
07-28-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Clerk re SAD notice of public hearing	0.25	No Charge
07-28-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from K. London re resident petition	0.25	No Charge
07-28-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Clerk re cannabis zoning ordinance notice of adoption	0.25	No Charge
07-28-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: cannabis update	0.25	No Charge
07-29-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: ordinance introduction dates	0.25	No Charge
07-29-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: study session recording	0.25	No Charge
07-29-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: cannabis zoning ordinance	0.25	No Charge
07-29-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: council meeting recording	0.25	No Charge
07-29-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: officer upshaw	0.25	No Charge
07-30-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: driveway approaches	0.25	No Charge
			Dem	7 . f 0

We appreciate your business. Checks may be made payable to Baker & Page 7 of 8 Elowsky, PLLC.

Date	Professional	Description	Hours	Amount
07-30-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: study session cancellation	0.25	No Charge
07-30-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: CIP update	0.25	No Charge
07-31-2021	SRB	Services Rendered		2,500.00
			Total	2,500.00
Time Sum	mary			
Professional			Hours	Amount
Scott Baker			44.50	2,500.00
		Total		2,500.00

Total for this Invoice 2,500.00



August 25, 2021

City of Lathrup Village 27400 Southfield Road Lathrup Village, MI 48076

> Invoice Number: 1152 Invoice Period: 07-01-2021 - 07-31-2021

RE: Prosecution/Code Enforcement

Time Details

Date	Professional	Description	Hours	Amount
07-06-2021	SRB	Conduct telephone pre-trial conference with defendant, prepare plea offer and draft correspondence to defendant and Court with same re: 21L0001232	0.50	65.00
07-06-2021	SRB	Conduct telephone pre-trial conference with defendant, prepare plea offer and draft correspondence to defendant and Court with same re: 21LV00880A	0.50	65.00
07-06-2021	SRB	Conduct telephone pre-trial conference with defendant, prepare plea offer and draft correspondence to defendant and Court with same re: 14LV02141A	0.50	65.00
07-06-2021	SRB	Conduct telephone pre-trial conference with defendant, prepare plea offer and draft correspondence to defendant and Court with same re: 20LV00515 A & B	0.50	65.00
07-06-2021	SRB	Conduct telephone pre-trial conference with defendant, prepare plea offer and draft correspondence to defendant and Court with same re: 21LV00564A	0.50	65.00
07-06-2021	SRB	Attempt to contact Defendant to conduct telephone pre-trial conference re: 12LV00150A	0.25	32.50
07-06-2021	SRB	Conduct telephone pre-trial conference with defendant, prepare plea offer and draft correspondence to defendant and Court with same re: 12LV00150A	0.50	65.00
07-06-2021	SRB	Conduct telephone pre-trial conference with defendant, prepare plea offer and draft correspondence to defendant and Court with	0.50	65.00
		We appreciate your business. Checks may be made payable to Baker & Elowsky, PLLC.	Page	1 of 3

Date	Professional	Description	Hours	Amount
		same re: 21L00766A		
07-06-2021	SRB	Review and respond to correspondence of code enforcement officer	0.25	32.50
07-07-2021	SRB	Appear for prosecution docket in 46th District Court	1.00	130.00
07-09-2021	SRB	Review and respond to correspondence of code enforcement officer	0.25	32.50
07-12-2021	SRB	Review correspondence and appearance of attorney re Mobile MRI citation	0.25	32.50
07-13-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Admin re: Precise MRI	0.25	32.50
07-13-2021	SRB	Correspondence with Police Clerk concerning discovery re: 21LV00865A,B.	0.25	32.50
07-13-2021	SRB	Conduct telephone pre-trial conference with defendant, prepare plea offer and draft correspondence to defendant and Court with same re: 21LV00422A, B & C	0.50	65.00
07-13-2021	SRB	Conduct telephone pre-trial conference with defendant, prepare plea offer and draft correspondence to defendant and Court with same re: 21LV00399A, B & C	0.50	65.00
07-13-2021	SRB	Conduct telephone pre-trial conference with defendant, prepare plea offer and draft correspondence to defendant and Court with same re: 21LV00403A, B & C	0.50	65.00
07-13-2021	SRB	Conduct telephone pre-trial conference with defendant, prepare plea offer and draft correspondence to defendant and Court with same re: 21LV00466A, B	0.50	65.00
07-13-2021	SRB	Conduct telephone pre-trial conference with defendant, prepare plea offer and draft correspondence to defendant and Court with same re: 20LV02216A	0.50	65.00
07-14-2021	SRB	Appear for prosecution docket in 46th District Court	2.75	357.50
07-21-2021	SRB	Phone call with Defendant concerning plea and payment of fines re: 21LV00339ABC.	0.25	32.50
07-26-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from code enforcement officer re property line tree maintenance	0.25	32.50
07-28-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Court re 8/18 prosecution docket	0.25	32.50
			Total	1,560.00
Time Sum Professional	-		Hours	Amount
Scott Baker	<u> </u>		12.00	1,560.00
2 Sett Buildi		Total	12.00	1,560.00

Total for this Invoice 1,560.00



August 25, 2021

City of Lathrup Village 27400 Southfield Road Lathrup Village, MI 48076

> Invoice Number: 1153 Invoice Period: 07-01-2021 - 07-31-2021

RE: Special Legal Services

Time Details

Date	Professional	Description	Hours	Amount
07-01-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from 46th District Court re privacy policy updates	0.25	32.50
07-01-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from 46th District Court re privacy policy updates	0.25	32.50
07-01-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from building official re BP development	0.25	32.50
07-01-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from building official re Soil erosion administration	0.25	32.50
07-01-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from City Engineer re Soil erosion administration	0.25	32.50
07-01-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from building official re Soil erosion permit for BP development	0.25	32.50
07-08-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from liability carrier attorney re JMC litigation	0.25	32.50
07-09-2021	SRB	Draft notice of public hearing for Cambridge SAD, send to Clerk for publication.	0.25	32.50
07-12-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from liability carrier attorney re JMC litigation	0.25	32.50
07-12-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from City Planner Re: City Council meeting	0.25	32.50
	,	We appreciate your business. Checks may be made payable to Baker & Elowsky, PLLC.	Page	1 of 3

Date	Professional	Description	Hours	Amount
07-14-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Oakland Press re SAD publication	0.25	32.50
07-15-2021	SRB	Meeting with Staff and Planner re cannabis scoring criteria	2.25	292.50
07-16-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from City Planner re: cannabis scoring	0.25	32.50
07-16-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Building official re: JMC properties	0.25	32.50
07-19-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from City Planner re cannabis resolutions	0.25	32.50
07-20-2021	SRB	Prepare for and participate in Planning Commission meeting	2.50	325.00
07-20-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from City Planner re initiative petition	2.50	325.00
07-20-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from City Planner re comprehensive plan	2.50	325.00
07-22-2021	SRB	Review affidavit prepared by Mr. Ruvolo and revise format, send to Clerk for Mr. Ruvolo's review and execution.	0.25	32.50
07-22-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from and telephone conference with Attorney representing Oakland Cares Coalition re withdrawal of initiative petition, respond to same.	0.75	97.50
07-22-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Building Official re JMC properties	0.25	32.50
07-23-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from City Planner re Southfield Road improvement .	0.25	32.50
07-23-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Oakland County Elections re: Greg Ruvolo affidavit	0.25	32.50
07-23-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from defense attorney, telephone conference with same re Mobile MRI	0.50	65.00
07-23-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from and telephone conference with Attorney representing Oakland Cares Coalition re withdrawal of initiative petition, respond to same.	0.25	32.50
07-23-2021	SRB	Multiple exchanges with City Planner re comprehensive plan and resolution adopting same.	0.50	65.00
07-23-2021	SRB	Review and respond to correspondence from resident re cannabis ordinance and petition inquiry.	2.00	260.00
07-23-2021	SRB	Review, edit and finalize the cannabis general ordinance.	1.50	195.00
07-23-2021	SRB	Draft and send suggested resolution and notice of public hearing re Cambridge SAD	1.50	195.00
07-23-2021	SRB	Draft and send suggested resolution re partial vacation of public alley	0.50	65.00
07-23-2021	SRB	Draft correspondence to Planner re comprehensive master plan	0.25	32.50
	۷	Ve appreciate your business. Checks may be made payable to Baker & Elowsky, PLLC.	Page	2 of 3

Date	Professional	Description	Hours	Amount
		resolution.		
07-26-2021	SRB	Review and respond to multiple correspondence from residents, telephone conference with residents re Cannabis ordinance, procedure and petitions	2.00	260.00
07-26-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from City Planner re Cannabis orfinance	0.25	32.50
07-27-2021	SRB	Review and respond to multiple correspondence from residence re City council Meeting/Cannabis ordinance	1.50	195.00
07-28-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from Resident re: nomination petition status	0.25	32.50
07-28-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from liability carrier attorney re JMC litigation	0.25	32.50
07-28-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from City Planner re: cannabis business zoning ordinance	0.25	32.50
07-28-2021	SRB	Draft Notice Of Adoption re Chapter 18 cannabis business	0.25	32.50
07-28-2021	SRB	Draft Notice Of Adoption re cannabis business zoning ordinance amendments	0.25	32.50
07-29-2021	SRB	Research, Review and draft opinion correspondence re cannabis citizen petition	2.00	260.00
07-29-2021	SRB	Draft notice of adoption for cannabis zoning ordinance, send same to Clerk	0.25	32.50
07-29-2021	SRB	Draft correspondence to resident re: opinion correspondence on cannabis citizen petition	0.25	32.50
07-29-2021	SRB	Draft correspondence to resident re: nomination petition status	0.25	32.50
07-30-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from City Planner re flag pole variance	0.25	32.50
07-30-2021	SRB	Review correspondence from building official re driveway approaches	0.25	32.50
			Total	3,932.50
Time Summary Professional			Hours	Amount

Professional	Hours	Amount
Scott Baker	30.25	3,932.50
	Total	3,932.50

Total for this Invoice 3,932.50