



27 S. Broadway St. Suite 2  
Lake Orion, Michigan 48362

sbaker@bakerpllc.com

January 28, 2026

Via Email

Mike Greene  
City Administrator

City of Lathrup Village  
27400 Southfield Road  
Lathrup Village, MI 48076

Re: Legal Department Billing for November 1 through November 30, 2025

Dear Mr. Greene:

The following is our law firm's billing to the City of Lathrup Village for the month of December 2025:

General Retainer	\$ 2,500.00
Prosecution/Code Enforcement	1,592.50
Special Legal Services	455.00
Downtown Development Authority	162.50
Project Reimbursement	
	<hr/>
	\$ 4,710.00

If you should have any questions, please feel free to contact me.

Very truly yours,

Baker Legal Group, PLLC

Scott R. Baker

Enclosures



27 S. Broadway St. Suite 2 Lake Orion, Michigan 48362  
[SBaker@bakerpllc.com](mailto:SBaker@bakerpllc.com)  
(248) 230-4103

January 28, 2026

City of Lathrup Village  
27400 Southfield Road  
Lathrup Village, MI 48076

**Invoice Number: 1875**  
Invoice Period: 12-01-2025 - 12-31-2025

**RE: General Retainer**

**Time Details**

Date	Professional	Description	Hours	Amount
12-01-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re: FOIA request	0.25	No Charge
12-01-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Clerk re Ordinance FOIA request	0.25	No Charge
12-01-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Clerk re Ordinance FOIA request	0.25	No Charge
12-01-2025	SRB	Prepare for and attend City Council Study Session	1.75	No Charge
12-01-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from Mayor Kantor re: Southfield road project	0.25	No Charge
12-01-2025	SRB	Draft correspondence to City Administrator re library services	0.25	No Charge
12-02-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from Mayor Kantor re: rules of council procedure	0.25	No Charge
12-02-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re: DDA parcel sale	0.25	No Charge
12-03-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re: investigative process	0.25	No Charge
12-03-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re: Litigation update Zimmerman v. Lathrup	0.25	No Charge
12-03-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from Mayor Kantor re: rules of council procedure	0.25	No Charge

We appreciate your business

<b>Date</b>	<b>Professional</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Amount</b>
12-03-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from Council Member Hammond re: Council Rules of Procedure	0.25	No Charge
12-03-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from Council Member Hammond re: Council Rules of Procedure	0.25	No Charge
12-03-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from Council Member Hammond re: Council Rules of Procedure	0.25	No Charge
12-08-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re: FOIA response	0.25	No Charge
12-08-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Clerk re Ordinance FOIA request	0.25	No Charge
12-08-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Clerk re Ordinance FOIA request	0.25	No Charge
12-09-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Clerk re Ordinance FOIA request	0.25	No Charge
12-09-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Clerk re Ordinance FOIA request	0.25	No Charge
12-09-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Clerk re Ordinance FOIA request	0.25	No Charge
12-09-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Clerk re Ordinance FOIA request	0.25	No Charge
12-09-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Clerk re Ordinance FOIA request	0.25	No Charge
12-09-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re: DDA parcel sale	0.25	No Charge
12-09-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re: FOIA fee waiver	0.25	No Charge
12-09-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Clerk re Ordinance Records Certification	0.25	No Charge
12-10-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re: FOIA fee waiver	0.25	No Charge
12-10-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Clerk re Ordinance FOIA request	0.25	No Charge
12-11-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Clerk re Ordinance FOIA request	0.25	No Charge

<b>Date</b>	<b>Professional</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Amount</b>
12-11-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re: Study Session	0.25	No Charge
12-12-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re: Council Meeting Packets	0.25	No Charge
12-12-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re: Council Meeting Packets	0.25	No Charge
12-12-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re: Council Meeting Packets	0.25	No Charge
12-12-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Clerk re Ordinance FOIA request	0.25	No Charge
12-12-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Clerk re Ordinance Records Certification	0.25	No Charge
12-15-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Clerk re Ordinance Records Certification	0.25	No Charge
12-15-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re: Estate Claim	0.25	No Charge
12-15-2025	SRB	Prepare for and attend City Council Study Session	1.75	No Charge
12-15-2025	SRB	Prepare for and attend City Council Regular Meeting	2.75	No Charge
12-16-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from Mayor Kantor re: rules of council procedure	0.25	No Charge
12-16-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re: Outdoor Collection Boxes Ordinance	0.25	No Charge
12-17-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re: CIP Bond	0.25	No Charge
12-18-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Clerk re Ordinance Records Certification	0.25	No Charge
12-22-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re:1/5 Study Session	0.25	No Charge
12-23-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Clerk re FOIA procedure	0.25	No Charge
12-29-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from T. Kennedy re Solar Ordinance updates	0.25	No Charge
12-29-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re:1/5 Study Session	0.25	No Charge
12-31-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from Mayor Kantor re: draft agenda	0.25	No Charge

<b>Date</b>	<b>Professional</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Amount</b>
12-31-2025	SRB	Services Rendered		2,500.00

**Total** 2,500.00

**Time Summary**

<b>Professional</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Amount</b>
Scott Baker	17.50	2,500.00
<b>Total</b>		2,500.00

**Total for this Invoice** 2,500.00



27 S. Broadway St. Suite 2 Lake Orion, Michigan 48362  
[SBaker@bakerpllc.com](mailto:SBaker@bakerpllc.com)  
(248) 230-4103

January 28, 2026

City of Lathrup Village  
27400 Southfield Road  
Lathrup Village, MI 48076

**Invoice Number: 1876**  
Invoice Period: 12-01-2025 - 12-31-2025

**RE: Prosecution/Code Enforcement**

**Time Details**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Professional</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Amount</b>
12-01-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from defense attorney re 25LV01129A	0.25	32.50
12-01-2025	SRB	Draft correspondence to Police Clerk re record request for 12/10 prosecution docket	0.25	32.50
12-03-2025	SRB	Receipt and review correspondence police Police Clerk re record request for 1/7 prosecution docket; review attached records	0.75	97.50
12-04-2025	SRB	Receipt and review of correspondence from Code Officer re ordinance updates.	0.25	32.50
12-04-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from defense attorney re 24LV01095A	0.25	32.50
12-08-2025	SRB	Receipt and review correspondence from 46th District Court re 12/10 prosecution docket	0.25	32.50
12-08-2025	SRB	Receipt and review correspondence police Police Clerk re record request for 1/7 prosecution docket; review attached records	0.75	97.50
12-08-2025	SRB	Draft correspondence to Police Clerk re record request for 12/10 prosecution docket	0.25	32.50
12-09-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from defense attorney re 24LV01095A	0.25	32.50
12-09-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from defense attorney re 25LV01124A	0.25	32.50

<b>Date</b>	<b>Professional</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Amount</b>
12-09-2025	SRB	Conduct telephone pre-trial conference, prepare plea offer and draft correspondence to defense attorney and Court with same re: 25LV01124A	0.75	97.50
12-10-2025	SRB	Prepare for and appear in 46th District Court for Prosecution Docket	3.00	390.00
12-16-2025	SRB	Receipt and review correspondence from 46th District Court re March Judicial calendars	0.25	32.50
12-22-2025	SRB	Receipt and review correspondence from 46th District Court re 1/7/26 pre-trials.	0.25	32.50
12-22-2025	SRB	Draft correspondence to Police Clerk for record request re prosecution cases	0.25	32.50
12-22-2025	SRB	Draft correspondence to Police Clerk re record request for 1/7 prosecution docket	0.25	32.50
12-22-2025	SRB	Receipt and review correspondence police Police Clerk re record request for 1/7 prosecution docket; review attached records	0.75	97.50
12-23-2025	SRB	Conduct telephone pre-trial conference, prepare plea offer and draft correspondence to defense attorney and Court with same re: 25LV01156A	0.75	97.50
12-23-2025	SRB	Conduct telephone pre-trial conference, prepare plea offer and draft correspondence to defense attorney and Court with same re: 25LV01192A	0.75	97.50
12-23-2025	SRB	Conduct telephone pre-trial conference, prepare plea offer and draft correspondence to defense attorney and Court with same re: 23LV01939A	0.75	97.50
12-30-2025	SRB	Receipt and review correspondence from 46th District Court; prepare nolle prosequi re 14LV02137B	0.50	65.00
12-30-2025	SRB	Receipt and review correspondence from 46th District Court; prepare nolle prosequi re 06L970394A	0.50	65.00
			<b>Total</b>	1,592.50

### Time Summary

<b>Professional</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Amount</b>
Scott Baker	12.25	1,592.50
<b>Total</b>		1,592.50
<b>Total for this Invoice</b>		1,592.50



27 S. Broadway St. Suite 2 Lake Orion, Michigan 48362  
[SBaker@bakerpllc.com](mailto:SBaker@bakerpllc.com)  
(248) 230-4103

January 28, 2026

City of Lathrup Village  
27400 Southfield Road  
Lathrup Village, MI 48076

**Invoice Number: 1877**  
Invoice Period: 12-01-2025 - 12-31-2025

**RE: Special Legal Services**

**Time Details**

Date	Professional	Description	Hours	Amount
12-11-2025	SRB	Draft business records certification affidavit; forward same to Clerk.	0.25	32.50
12-16-2025	SRB	Draft amendments to and notice of adoption re Outdoor Collection Box ordinance; forward same to City Administrator.	0.50	65.00
12-16-2025	SRB	Prepare for and attend Planning Commission Meeting	2.75	357.50
			<b>Total</b>	455.00

**Time Summary**

Professional	Hours	Amount
Scott Baker	3.50	455.00
<b>Total</b>		455.00

**Total for this Invoice** 455.00



27 S. Broadway St. Suite 2 Lake Orion, Michigan 48362  
[SBaker@bakerpllc.com](mailto:SBaker@bakerpllc.com)  
(248) 230-4103

January 28, 2026

City of Lathrup Village  
27400 Southfield Road  
Lathrup Village, MI 48076

**Invoice Number: 1874**  
Invoice Period: 12-01-2025 - 12-31-2025

**RE: DDA**

**Time Details**

Date	Professional	Description	Hours	Amount
12-05-2025	SRB	Receipt and review of correspondence from DDA Director re Suburban Sown proposal	0.25	32.50
12-08-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from DDA Director; review proposal re Suburban Sown proposal	0.50	65.00
12-08-2025	SRB	Research and draft correspondence re property sale terms for DDA parcel sale	0.50	65.00
			<b>Total</b>	162.50

**Time Summary**

Professional	Hours	Amount
Scott Baker	1.25	162.50
<b>Total</b>		162.50

**Total for this Invoice** 162.50