

27 S. Broadway St. Suite 2  
Lake Orion, Michigan 48362

sbaker@bakerllc.com



December 22, 2025

Via Email

Mike Greene  
City Administrator

City of Lathrup Village  
27400 Southfield Road  
Lathrup Village, MI 48076

Re: Legal Department Billing for November 1 through November 30, 2025

Dear Mr. Greene:

The following is our law firm's billing to the City of Lathrup Village for the month of November 2025:

General Retainer	\$ 2,500.00
Prosecution/Code Enforcement	\$1,560.00
Special Legal Services	\$ 585.00
Downtown Development Authority	\$
Project Reimbursement	
	<hr/>
	\$4,645.00

If you should have any questions, please feel free to contact me.

Very truly yours,

Baker Legal Group, PLLC

Scott R. Baker

Enclosures



27 S. Broadway St. Suite 2 Lake Orion, Michigan 48362  
[SBaker@bakerpllc.com](mailto:SBaker@bakerpllc.com)  
(248) 230-4103

December 22, 2025

City of Lathrup Village  
27400 Southfield Road  
Lathrup Village, MI 48076

**Invoice Number: 1871**  
Invoice Period: 11-01-2025 - 11-30-2025

**RE: General Retainer**

**Time Details**

Date	Professional	Description	Hours	Amount
11-04-2025	SRB	Draft correspondence to and review response from City Administrator re Outdoor Collection Boxes Ordinance.	0.25	No Charge
11-05-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re Headlee proposal	0.25	No Charge
11-05-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re Headlee proposal	0.25	No Charge
11-05-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re Charter Amendment proposal	0.25	No Charge
11-05-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re Refuse Millage	0.25	No Charge
11-05-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re litigation update Zimmerman v. Lathrup	0.25	No Charge
11-05-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re budget options	0.25	No Charge
11-05-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re library contract	0.25	No Charge
11-07-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator recode enforcement	0.25	No Charge
11-07-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from Code enforcement Officer	0.25	No Charge

Date	Professional	Description	Hours	Amount
11-07-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Clerk re Council Oath	0.25	No Charge
11-10-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Clerk re Council Oath	0.25	No Charge
11-10-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Clerk re FOIA request	0.25	No Charge
11-10-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re: Council oath	0.25	No Charge
11-10-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re: Council oath	0.25	No Charge
11-10-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re: JMC litigation update	0.25	No Charge
11-13-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Clerk re FOIA request	0.25	No Charge
11-13-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Clerk re FOIA request	0.25	No Charge
11-14-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from A. Colston re Crypto ATM ordinance	0.25	No Charge
11-17-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re: DDA Meeting	0.25	No Charge
11-19-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re: DDA parcel sale	0.25	No Charge
11-19-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re: DDA parcel sale	0.25	No Charge
11-21-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re: Council packet	0.25	No Charge
11-21-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re: DDA parcel sale	0.25	No Charge
11-24-2025	SRB	Prepare for and attend City Council Study Session	1.75	No Charge
11-24-2025	SRB	Prepare for and attend City Council Regular Meeting	2.75	No Charge
11-25-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Clerk re Ordinance Notice of Adoption	0.25	No Charge
11-26-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re: DDA parcel sale	0.25	No Charge
11-26-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re: DDA parcel sale	0.25	No Charge

Date	Professional	Description	Hours	Amount
11-26-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from City Administrator re: Council packet	0.25	No Charge
11-30-2025	SRB	Services Rendered		2,500.00
			<b>Total</b>	2,500.00

### Time Summary

Professional	Hours	Amount
Scott Baker	11.50	2,500.00
	<b>Total</b>	2,500.00
		<b>Total for this Invoice</b> 2,500.00



27 S. Broadway St. Suite 2 Lake Orion, Michigan 48362  
[SBaker@bakerpllc.com](mailto:SBaker@bakerpllc.com)  
(248) 230-4103

December 22, 2025

City of Lathrup Village  
27400 Southfield Road  
Lathrup Village, MI 48076

**Invoice Number: 1872**  
Invoice Period: 11-01-2025 - 11-30-2025

**RE: Prosecution/Code Enforcement**

**Time Details**

Date	Professional	Description	Hours	Amount
11-04-2025	SRB	Receipt and review correspondence from 46th District Court re tax garnishment authorization.	0.25	32.50
11-05-2025	SRB	Conduct telephone pre-trial conference, prepare plea offer and draft correspondence to defense attorney and Court with same re: 02L877876A/B/C	0.75	97.50
11-05-2025	SRB	Conduct telephone pre-trial conference, prepare plea offer and draft correspondence to defense attorney and Court with same re: 25LV00989A	0.75	97.50
11-05-2025	SRB	Conduct telephone pre-trial conference, prepare plea offer and draft correspondence to defense attorney and Court with same re: 25LV00935A	0.75	97.50
11-05-2025	SRB	Conduct telephone pre-trial conference, prepare plea offer and draft correspondence to defense attorney and Court with same re: 25LV01007A	0.75	97.50
11-05-2025	SRB	Conduct telephone pre-trial conference, prepare plea offer and draft correspondence to defense attorney and Court with same re: 25LV01018A	0.75	97.50
11-06-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from defense attorney re 25LV00935A	0.25	32.50
11-10-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from defense attorney re 25LV00935A	0.25	32.50
11-10-2025	SRB	Receipt and review correspondence from 46th District Court re 11/12 prosecution docket.	0.25	32.50

Date	Professional	Description	Hours	Amount
11-12-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from defense attorney re 25LV01007A	0.25	32.50
11-12-2025	SRB	Prepare for and appear in 46th District Court for Prosecution Docket	3.00	390.00
11-12-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from defense attorney re 25LV00935A	0.25	32.50
11-17-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from defense attorney re 25LV00935A	0.25	32.50
11-18-2025	SRB	Draft correspondence to PD records Clerk for add-on prosecution file records	0.25	32.50
11-18-2025	SRB	Review correspondence from PD records Clerk and prosecution file records	0.25	32.50
11-18-2025	SRB	Receipt and review correspondence from 46th District Court re final docker for 11/19/2025	0.25	32.50
11-19-2025	SRB	Receipt and review correspondence from 46th District Court re draft docket for 12/10/2025	0.25	32.50
11-19-2025	SRB	Prepare for and appear in 46th District Court for Prosecution Docket	2.00	260.00
11-19-2025	SRB	Receipt, review and respond to correspondence from defense attorney re 25LV00935A	0.25	32.50
11-26-2025	SRB	Receipt and review of correspondence from 46th District Court re March and April Prosecution dockets	0.25	32.50
				<b>Total</b> 1,560.00

### Time Summary

Professional	Hours	Amount
Scott Baker	12.00	1,560.00
	<b>Total</b>	1,560.00
<b>Total for this Invoice</b>		1,560.00



27 S. Broadway St. Suite 2 Lake Orion, Michigan 48362  
[SBaker@bakerpllc.com](mailto:SBaker@bakerpllc.com)  
(248) 230-4103

December 22, 2025

City of Lathrup Village  
27400 Southfield Road  
Lathrup Village, MI 48076

**Invoice Number: 1873**

Invoice Period: 11-01-2025 - 11-30-2025

**RE: Special Legal Services**

#### Time Details

Date	Professional	Description	Hours	Amount
11-04-2025	SRB	Draft and finalize Outdoor Collection Boxes Ordinance.	1.50	195.00
11-10-2025	SRB	Receipt and review of correspondence from Appellate Attorney; Review Court of Appeals opinion re JMC Litigation	0.50	65.00
11-14-2025	SRB	Review existing draft Crypto ATM ordinance, provide comments and revisions re same.	0.75	97.50
11-18-2025	SRB	Prepare for and attend Planning Commission Meeting	1.50	195.00
11-25-2025	SRB	Draft Notice of Adoption for Crypto ATM Ordinance	0.25	32.50
			<b>Total</b>	<b>585.00</b>

#### Time Summary

Professional	Hours	Amount
Scott Baker	4.50	585.00
<b>Total</b>	<b>585.00</b>	

**Total for this Invoice** 585.00