BID TABULATION
Public Works Substation Structure and Electrical Equipment

Date: April 3, 2025

Town of Landis Time: 2:00 PM, EDT

Landis, North Carolina

Substation Virginia
WESCO MVA Power Nucor Enterprises Trans. Corp.

Bidder Clayton, NC Montreal, QB Rock Hill, SC Alabaster, AL Roanoke, VA
Schedule I
115KV Transmission Pole $  14,177.00 $  25450.00 $  45,093.00 $ NoBid $ NoBid
Manufacturer: CHM MVA
Delivery: 20-24 Weeks 22-24 Weeks
Schedule 11
115KV-12.47/7.2 KV

Substation Structure $ NoBid $_ 595,729.00 $  NoBid $_ 372,426.00 $  NoBid
Manufacturer: MVA SEI
Delivery: 32-34 Weeks 50-52 Weeks
Schedule I1I
115KV Circuit Switcher $ 100,901.00 $ 109,701.00 $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
Manufacturer: S&C Electric Southern States
Delivery: 70-74 Weeks 65-66 Weeks
Schedule IV
Power Transformer w/LTC $ NoBid $ 2,059,200.00 $  NoBid $  NoBid $ 1,721,558.00
Manufacturer: Astor A.S. VTC
Delivery: Unknown 65-70 Weeks
Schedule V
Four 15KV Circuit Breakers $ 134,708.00 $ 288,000.00 $ No Bid $  NoBid $ NoBid
Manufacturer: MEPPI EMA USA
Delivery: 65 Weeks 26-28 Weeks

Alternate
$155,304.00

Myers Cont. Pwr.
56-58 Weeks
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BID TABULATION (Continued)
Public Works Substation Structure and Electrical Equipment

Town of Landis
Landis, North Carolina

Bidder

Schedule VI
Equipment Building
Manufacturer:
Delivery:

Schedule VII

Relay and Control Board
Manufacturer:

Delivery:

Applicable Price Terms

Page 2 of 2

Date: April 3, 2025
Time: 2:00 PM, EDT

Substation Virginia
WESCO MVA Power Nucor Enterprises Trans. Corp.
Clayton, NC Montreal, QB Rock Hill, SC Alabaster, AL Roanoke, VA
$  NoBid $__ 350,000.00 $_ NoBid $  NoBid $_ NoBid
Joaquin
20-24 Weeks
$ NoBid $  112,200.00 $  NoBid $  NoBid $  NoBid
CP USA
16-18 Weeks
Net 30 Days Negotiable
Proposed
30% w/PO
30% w/Approvals

40% Completed



Public Works Substation Structure and Electrical Equipment

BID TABULATION

Town of Landis
Landis, North Carolina

WEG
Bidder

Washington, MO

Howard Ind.
Laurel, MS

Schedule I

115KV Transmission Pole $ NoBid

Manufacturer:

No Bid

Delivery:

Schedule 11
115KV-12.47/7.2 KV

Substation Structure $ NoBid

Manufacturer:

No Bid

Delivery:

Schedule 111

115KV Circuit Switcher $ NoBid

Manufacturer:

No Bid

Delivery:

Schedule IV
Power Transformer w/LTC $ 1,816,319.00

Manufacturer: WEG

1,890,000.00

Howard

Delivery: 120-130 Weeks

88 Weeks

Schedule V
Four 15KV Circuit Breakers $
Manufacturer:

No Bid

No Bid

Delivery:

OTC Services Siemens/NTS

Louisville, OH Raleigh, NC
$  NoBid $  NoBid
$  NoBid $  NoBid
$  NoBid $ No Bid
$ 2,182,897.00 $ No Bid

OTC
208 Weeks

$ No Bid $ 103,428.00
Siemens
26 Weeks

Date: April 3, 2025

Time:

2:00 PM, EDT

CO7 Tech.

Montreal, QB

$ NoBid
$ NoBid
$ No Bid
$ No Bid
$ 152,400.00
CcO7
29-30 Weeks
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BID TABULATION (Continued) Page 2 of 2
Public Works Substation Structure and Electrical Equipment

Date: April 3, 2025
Town of Landis Time: 2:00 PM, EDT

Landis, North Carolina

WEG Howard Ind. OTC Services Siemens/NTS CO7 Tech.
Bidder Washington, MO Laurel, MS Louisville, OH Raleigh, NC Montreal, QB

Schedule VI
Equipment Building $ NoBid $ NoBid $  NoBid $  No Bid $  No Bid
Manufacturer:
Delivery:

Schedule VII
Relay and Control Board $ NoBid $ NoBid $ NoBid $ NoBid $  NoBid
Manufacturer:
Delivery:

Applicable Price Terms Price Not Firm Price Not Firm Net 30 Days




Town of Landis
Landis, North Carolina

Bidder

Schedule I

115KV Transmission Pole
Manufacturer:

Delivery:

Schedule 11
115KV-12.47/7.2 KV

Substation Structure
Manufacturer:
Delivery:

Schedule I1I

115KV Circuit Switcher
Manufacturer:

Delivery:

Schedule 1V

Power Transformer w/LTC
Manufacturer:

Delivery:

Schedule V

Four 15KV Circuit Breakers
Manufacturer:

Delivery:

Public Works Substation Structure and Electrical Equipment

BID TABULATION

Utility Packaging
Carrollton, GA

Birmingham
Control
Bessemer, AL

Modular
Connections VEP, Inc.
Bessemer, AL Roanoke, VA
$ No Bid $ No Bid
$ NoBid $ NoBid
¢ NoBid $ NoBid
$ No Bid $ No Bid
$__ NoBid $ NoBid

$ NoBid $ NoBid
$ NoBid $ NoBid
¢  NoBid $ No Bid
¢ NoBid $ NoBid
$ NoBid $ NoBid

Date: April 3, 2025
Time: 2:00 PM, EDT

SEL
Charlotte, NC

$ No Bid
$ No Bid
§ NoBid
¢ NoBid
$ No Bid




BID TABULATION (Continued) Page 2 of 2
Public Works Substation Structure and Electrical Equipment

Date: April 3, 2025
Town of Landis Time: 2:00 PM, EDT

Landis, North Carolina

Modular Birmingham

Connections VEFP, Inc. Utility Packaging Control SEL
Bidder Bessemer, AL Roanoke, VA Carrollton, GA Bessemer, AL Charlotte, NC
Schedule VI
Equipment Building $  138,021.00 $ 144,116.00 $__ NoBid $ NoBid $ NoBid
Manufacturer: Mod. Conn. VFP
Delivery: 26 Weeks 30-32 Weeks
Schedule VII
Relay and Control Board $_ NoBid $ NoBid $  64,808.00 $  72,995.00 $  78873.00
Manufacturer: UP&C BCS SEL
Delivery: 18-24 Weeks 14-16 Weeks 18-20 Weeks
Applicable Price Terms Net 30 Days 45% w/Approvals

55% Complete
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