City of
7 Lake Worth

>4

ORIDA

City of Lake Worth Beach
Bid Tabulation

IFB #24-117 Laboratory Sampling & Analysis Services

Advanced Environmental

Laboratories, Inc.

ANNUAL UNIT UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
Item # DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL OFFER PRICE OFFER PRICE OFFER PRICE OFFER
LAKE WORTH TREATMENT PLANT
1A |Palm Beach County - HPC’s 416 sample $30.00 $12,480.00 $18.00 $7,488.00 $25.00 | $10,400.00| $45.50 [$18,928.00
2A  |Trihalomethanes THM's 4 sample $35.00 $140.00 $30.00 $120.00 $39.00 $156.00 $58.50 $234.00
3A  |Haloacetic Acids HAA5's 4 sample $50.00 $200.00 $62.00 $248.00 $77.00 $308.00 $97.50 $390.00
4A  [Nitrate & Nitrite 1 sample $15.00 $15.00 $22.00 $22.00 $23.24 $23.24 $19.50 $19.50
5A |Lake Worth Annual Testing (Table 1) 1 sample $157.00 $157.00 $175.00 $175.00 $202.73 $202.73 $243.10 $243.10
Lake Worth Beach Annual Concentrate Testing
6A  [(Table i) 1 sample $925.00 $925.00 $850.00 $850.00 $943.71 $943.71 | $1,393.60| $1,393.60
7A  |Palm Beach County ECR Il (Table II) 30 sample $94.00 $2,820.00 $69.00 $2,070.00 $97.34 $2,920.20 | $140.40 | $4,212.00
Palm Beach County ERM - Wellfield Permit
8A  |Requirements - 3 potable wells for FL-PRO 6 sample $45.00 $270.00 $49.00 $294.00 $53.00 $318.00 $58.50 $351.00
Palm Beach County ERM - Wellfield Permit
9A  |Requirements - EPA test method 8270 by SIM 6 sample $100.00 $600.00 $170.00 | $1,020.00 | $285.00 | $1,710.00 | $97.50 $585.00
Palm Beach County ERM - Wellfield Permit
10A |Requirements - EPA test method 8015B 6 sample $120.00 $720.00 $165.00 $990.00 $272.00 | $1,632.00 | $110.50 | $663.00
Palm Beach County ERM - Wellfield Permit $100.00
11A  |Requirements - EPA test method 8260B 2 sample $50.00 $100.00 $39.00 $78.00 $50.00 ' $117.00 | $234.00
Palm Beach County ERM - Wellfield Permit
Requirements - 2 groundwater monitoring wells for
12A  |FL-PRO 4 sample $45.00 $180.00 $49.00 $196.00 $53.00 $212.00 | $58.50 | $234.00
Palm Beach County ERM - Wellfield Permit
13A  |Requirements - EPA test method 8270 4 sample $100.00 $400.00 $170.00 $680.00 $285.00 | $1,140.00 | $97.50 $390.00
Palm Beach County ERM - Wellfield Permit
14A  |Requirements - EPA test method 8015B 4 sample $80.00 $320.00 $165.00 $660.00 $272.00 | $1,088.00 | $110.50 | $442.00
15A |VOC’s 1 sample $60.00 $60.00 $53.00 $53.00 $68.00 $68.00 $149.50 | $149.50
16A |Radionuclides (gross alpha) 1 sample $50.00 $50.00 $49.00 $49.00 $95.00 $95.00 $71.50 $71.50
17A  |Radionuclides 1 sample $135.00 $135.00 $125.00 $125.00 $162.68 $162.68 $240.50 | $240.50
18A |Secondary Inorganics 1 sample $125.00 $125.00 $130.00 $130.00 $166.21 $166.21 $227.50 | $227.50
19A |PCB’s & Pesticides (SOC’s) 4 sample $530.00 $2,120.00 $630.00 | $2,520.00 | $642.00 | $2,568.00 | $975.00 | $3,900.00
20A |Lead and Copper 30 sample $16.00 $480.00 $19.00 $570.00 $20.00 $600.00 $26.00 $780.00
21A  |Water Quality Parameters (WQP) (monthly) 26 sample $56.00 $1,456.00 $243.00 | $6,318.00 $61.40 $1,596.40 | $220.90 | $5,743.40
21B  |Water Quality Parameters (WQP) (quarterly) 28 sample $165.00 $4,620.00 no bid no bid $212.00 | $5,936.00 no bid no bid




22A  |Chlorides 368 sample $10.00 $3,680.00 $11.00 $4,048.00 $11.62 $4,276.16 | $19.50 | $7,176.00
23A |Dual Zone Samples (monthly) 36 sample $56.00 $2,016.00 $63.00 $2,268.00 $61.40 $2,210.40 | $96.00 | $3,456.00
23B [Dual Zone Samples (quarterly) 12 sample $165.00 $1,980.00 no bid no bid $212.00 | $2,544.00 no bid no bid
SUBTOTAL Water Treatment Plant (Items 1A - 23B) $36,049.00 Incomplete Bid $41,376.73 Incomplete Bid
LAKE WORTH POWER PLANT
Palm Beach County ERM — Wellfield Permit
1B Requirements - VOC'’s 12 sample $50.00 $600.00 $39.00 $468.00 $50.00 $600.00 $58.50 $702.00
Palm Beach County ERM - Wellfield Permit
2B Requirements — Semi-VOC'’s 12 sample $75.00 $900.00 $65.00 $780.00 $100.00 | $1,200.00 | $97.50 | $1,170.00
Palm Beach County ERM - Wellfield Permit
3B Requirements 12 sample $45.00 $540.00 $49.00 $588.00 $53.00 $636.00 $58.50 $702.00
Palm Beach County ERM - Wellfield Permit
4B Requirements - VOC'’s 6 sample $60.00 $360.00 $53.00 $318.00 $68.00 $408.00 $117.00 | $702.00
Beach County ERM - Wellfield Permit
5B  |Requirements — Semi-VOC's 6 sample $75.00 $450.00 $65.00 $390.00 $100.00 $600.00 | $175.50 | $1,053.00
Palm Beach County ERM - Wellfield Permit
6B Requirements 6 sample $45.00 $270.00 $49.00 $294.00 $53.00 $318.00 $117.00 | $702.00
Industrial Wastewater Discharge - IPP Permit
7B Requirements (Semi-Annual) 2 sample $425.00 $850.00 $780.00 | $1,560.00 $83.00 $166.00 $80.60 $161.20
Industrial Wastewater Discharge - IPP Permit
7B Requirements (Annual) 1 sample $475.00 $475.00 $780.00 $780.00 | $1,367.88 | $1,367.88 | $715.00 | $715.00
8B NPDES Stormwater Discharge — Collect 2012 4 sample $12.00 $48.00 $8.00 $32.00 $12.47 $49.88 $9.10 $36.40
SUBTOTAL Electric Plant (Items 1B - 8B) $4,493.00 $5,210.00 $5,345.76 $5,943.60
SUBTOTAL Water Treatment Plant (Items 1A - 23B) $36,049.00 Incomplete $41,376.73 Incomplete
TOTAL ANNUAL BID: $40,542.00 Incomplete $46,722.49 Incomplete

Regular turn-around time from receipt of sample

10 business days

7-10 business days

10 business days, Rads
4 weeks, 8015 15
business days

10-15 business days

Rate per Hour for Field Sampling Charge

$65/hr

$75/hr

$60/hr; portal to portal
24 hr compositor $100

$75/hr

For sample evaluations requiring urgent attention: 24 Hours

100% above unit cost

100% above unit cost

300% above unit cost

100% above unit cost

48 Hours

75% above unit cost

75% above unit cost

250% above unit cost

75% above unit cost

72 Hours

50% above unit cost

50% above unit cost

200% above unit cost

50% above unit cost

Weekends/standard hours of operation

Limited Weekends/M-F 8 am
-5pm

Saturdays/8 am - 5 pm
Sundays upon request

Weekends upon request
for a fee/M-F 8 am -5
pm

Only due to extenuating
circustances

Response in emergency situation/procedures

See IFB response

See IFB response

See IFB response

See IFB response

Additional charges if samples are picked up by laboratorty

$30.00

No charge

$50/weekday;
$100/weekends/$150
holidays

$100.00

Standard method of getting samples to laboratory

See IFB response

See |IFB response

Courier/drop off coolers

See IFB response

Compliance

YES

No - Bid incomplete.
Bidder did not submit
revised Schedule of Unit
Prices (B4) issued with
Addendum No. 2

YES

No - Bid incomplete.
Bidder did not submit

revised Schedule of
Unit Prices (B4) issued
with Addendum No. 2




	Unit Pricing 

