/\ Lake Worth
Beach

City of Lake Worth Beach

Emergency Utility Repairs for Murry Hills

Cost Tab
Contractor:

ITEM # DESCRIPTION Extended Cost Extended Cost Extended Cost
GC-2 Emergency Mobilization/Demobilization Costs for Utility Right of Way Repairs $ 3,000.00| $ 3,000.00 NO BID
GC-8 MOT Residential Street $ 1,750.00 | $ 2,500.00 NO BID
GC-12 |Density Test $ 4,500.00 NO BID
GC-13  |Proctor Test $ 200.00 NO BID
W-1 Furnish and Install 4" C-900 DR18 PVC watermain $ 6,240.00 NO BID
W-2 4" CL350 Dip $ 2,160.00 NO BID
W-37 6"x4" Tapping Sleeve w/Valve and Valve Box (J&D Tap Assembly only) $ 3,333.00| $ 4,000.00 NO BID
W-100 [Sample Point $ 1,000.00 NO BID
W-106 |Short Double Service $ 21,000.00 NO BID
W-109 [Long Single Service (up to 50' long) $ 12,500.00 NO BID
W-110 |Long Double Service (up to 50' long) (J&D Long Double Service) $ 90,000.00 | $ 40,000.00 NO BID
W-112 [Additional services on long service meter bank $ 37,800.00 NO BID
W-118 |Watermain Crew $ 36,540.00 NO BID
R-1 Remove and dispose of 6" Thick Concrete $ 2,700.00 NO BID
R-2 Furnish and Install 4" concrete without wire $ 3,600.00| $ 4,860.00 NO BID
R-13 Furnish and install Floratam sod-up to 1,000sf $ 600.00| $ 1,800.00 NO BID
R-16 Water Truck for Sod $ 400.00 NO BID
R-17 Removal and Disposal of Existing Asphalt Pavement $ 900.00| $ 3,900.00 NO BID
R-20 Furnish and Install 1-1/2" Type S-I $ 30,420.00 NO BID
R-21 Furnish and Install 1" Type S-3 surface course $ 4,000.00 NO BID
R-27 6" Slime Rock $ 17,940.00 NO BID
R-28 8" Limerock w/Crushed Concrete base, primed (J&D Limerock only) $ 2,200.00( $ 19,500.00 NO BID
R-29 12" Compacted subgrade $ 700.00| $ 9,360.00 NO BID

NO BID
X Additional poly service beyond 50' long $ 2,750.00 NO BID
X Remove and dispose of 4" thick concrete $ 2,400.00 NO BID
X Water Service Material escalations $ 3,180.00 NO BID
X Asphalt escalations $ 3,000.00 NO BID
X Concrete escalations $ 4,800.00 NO BID
X Irrigation Restoration $ 4,000.00 NO BID
X Striping restoration $ 1,500.00 NO BID
X Landscape restoration $ 8,750.00 NO BID
X Preconstruction video $ 1,500.00 NO BID

NO BID

Total:| $ 198,503.00| $ 205,780.00
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