
BUDGET ADJUSTMENT Adjustment No.:  #1-2024
DATE: 10/1/2023

ACCOUNT DESCRIPTION ACCOUNT NUMBER FROM TO

Balance Brought Forward 001-399.999 $194,623.00

Professional Services 001-512-110-31000 $17,000.00

Operating Supplies 001-512-110-52000 $12,080.00

ARPA 001-589-900-52700 $103,490.00

Contractual Services 001-597-408-34000 $7,570.00

Repairs & Maintenance 001-597-408-46000 $4,004.00

Improvements Other than Bldg 001-597-408-63000 $38,854.00

Professional Services 001-512-106-31000 $2,265.00

Library Materials - Grants 001-571-700-56200 $9,360.00

Balance Brought Forward 110-399.999 $236,477.00

Professional Services 110-552-520-31000 $53,487.00

Improvements Other than Bldg 110-552-520-63000 $182,990.00

Balance Brought Forward 190-399.999 $88,741.00

Professional Services 190-541-190-31000 $84,482.00

Traffic Signs & Signals 190-541-190-46600 $4,259.00

Balance Brought Forward 301-399.999 $836,326.00

PBC Discretionary Surtax Projects 301-521-301-63100 $284,350.00

DEP-22FRP76 2nds St Bioswale 301-521-301-63828 $526,513.00

Grant - CDBG 301-541-301-63823 $25,463.00

Balance Brought Forward 402-399.999 $229,387.00

Professional Services 402-538-402-31000 $64,062.00

Repairs & Maintenance 402-538-402-46000 $165,325.00

Balance Brought Forward 404-399.999 $30,762.00

Repairs & Maintenance 404-534-404-46000 $28,037.00

Vehicle Parts & Supplies 404-534-404-46300 $2,725.00

TOTAL $0.00 $3,232,632.00

APPROVALS:

TOWN OF LAKE PARK

DEPARTMENT:  Re-encumber PO's

Explanation:  Re-encumber 28 Purchase Order balance open at 9/30/2023, per
attached report.  Additionally, MCCI balance not used in 2023 and ALA Library and
Community Connect grant funds received Jul-Sept 2023 not spent

jduvall
Typewritten Text
Attachment B



Commission:  ________________________________ Date:  ______________

Department Head:  ____________________________ Date:  ______________
Finance Director:  _____________________________ Date:  ______________
Town Manager:  ______________________________ Date:  ______________
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Barbara Gould

From: Vivian Mendez
Sent: Friday, October 6, 2023 10:00 AM
To: Barbara Gould
Cc: Jeffrey Duvall
Subject: RE: Requisition REQ00038 is ready for Approval

Thank you Barbara. We would like those funds placed in the 2023/2024 budget for this project just in case we are, once again, told that the project 
would cost more than budgeted. Thank you.  
 
 
Sincerely, 
 
Vivian Mendez, MMC 
Town Clerk 
Town of Lake Park  
535 Park Avenue 
Lake Park, Florida 33403 
561-881-3311 
561-881-3314 (fax) 
vmendez@lakeparkflorida.gov 

   
* Please note: Florida has a very broad public records law. Written communication regarding Town business are public records available to the public upon request. Your email 
communications are therefore subject to public disclosure. If you do not want your email address released in response to a public records request, do not send electronic mail to this 
entity, instead contact this office by phone. Florida State Statute Section 668.6076. 
 

From: Barbara Gould <bgould@lakeparkflorida.gov>  
Sent: Friday, October 6, 2023 9:57 AM 
To: Vivian Mendez <vmendez@lakeparkflorida.gov> 
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Cc: Jeffrey Duvall <jduvall@lakeparkflorida.gov> 
Subject: RE: Requisition REQ00038 is ready for Approval 
 
Vivian 
The MCCI Purchase Order for FY22-23 was issued for $13,491.70.  That was a combination of funds unspent on the original PO and the funds allocated in the 
FY22-23 budget.   
 
The invoices received to date for FY22-23 scanning services totaled to $11,226.96. 
 
That would leave a balance of $2,264.74 unspent.  If there are no additional invoices for FY 22-23, you could request these funds be brought forward into FY 23-
24. 
 
Thank you 
 
Sincerely, 
 
Barbara A. Gould 
Assistant Finance Director 
Town of Lake Park 
535 Park Avenue 
Lake Park, FL  33404 
561-881-3350 ext. 354 
561-841-0393 direct line 
561-881-3358 fax 
bgould@lakeparkflorida.gov 
 

From: Vivian Mendez <vmendez@lakeparkflorida.gov>  
Sent: Friday, October 6, 2023 9:33 AM 
To: Bryan Frick <bryanf@mccinnovations.com> 
Cc: Town Clerk <townclerk@lakeparkflorida.gov>; Jeffrey Duvall <jduvall@lakeparkflorida.gov>; Barbara Gould <bgould@lakeparkflorida.gov> 
Subject: RE: Requisition REQ00038 is ready for Approval 
 
Good morning Bryan, 
 
I hope you are well. 
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As you may be aware October 1st began a new fiscal year. Therefore, it is not as simple as signing a change order.  A new purchase order is being 
issued and is currently going through the review process. I will be out of the office next week. Once the purchase order has been issued you will 
receive an email with a copy of the new purchase order. I will follow up on the status of the purchase order upon my return to the office.   
 
If you have any questions please reply to everyone in this email so that an answer can be provided during my absence. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Sincerely, 
 
Vivian Mendez, MMC 
Town Clerk 
Town of Lake Park  
535 Park Avenue 
Lake Park, Florida 33403 
561-881-3311 
561-881-3314 (fax) 
vmendez@lakeparkflorida.gov 

   
* Please note: Florida has a very broad public records law. Written communication regarding Town business are public records available to the public upon request. Your email 
communications are therefore subject to public disclosure. If you do not want your email address released in response to a public records request, do not send electronic mail to this 
entity, instead contact this office by phone. Florida State Statute Section 668.6076. 
 

From: Bryan Frick <bryanf@mccinnovations.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, October 4, 2023 2:28 PM 
To: Vivian Mendez <vmendez@lakeparkflorida.gov> 
Subject: RE: Requisition REQ00038 is ready for Approval 
 
Thanks Vivian.  I just need a signature on the Change Order and the PO can follow whenever it is ready.  Thanks! 
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Bryan Frick 
Account Executive 

. 

. Phone: 850-701-0725 ext. 7729 
Cell: 352-258-5203 
Support: 850-701-0737 
bryanf@mccinnovations.com 
www.mccinnovations.com  

 
 

From: Vivian Mendez <vmendez@lakeparkflorida.gov>  
Sent: Wednesday, October 4, 2023 2:23 PM 
To: Bryan Frick <bryanf@mccinnovations.com> 
Subject: Requisition REQ00038 is ready for Approval 
 
Bryan, below is the P.O. number. As more information becomes available I will forward it to you. 
 
 
Requisition Number: REQ00038 
Description: Scanning Project 
Requestor: Vivian Mendez 
Department: TOWN CLERK  
Vendor: MCCI LLC 
Total Amount: $20,000.00 
 
 
 
Sincerely, 
 
Vivian Mendez, MMC 
Town Clerk 
Town of Lake Park  
535 Park Avenue 
Lake Park, Florida 33403 
561-881-3311 
561-881-3314 (fax) 
vmendez@lakeparkflorida.gov 



5

   
* Please note: Florida has a very broad public records law. Written communication regarding Town business are public records available to the public upon request. Your email 
communications are therefore subject to public disclosure. If you do not want your email address released in response to a public records request, do not send electronic mail to this 
entity, instead contact this office by phone. Florida State Statute Section 668.6076. 
 
 

IMPORTANT: The contents of this email and any attachments are confidential and intended for the named recipient(s) only. If you have received 
this email by mistake, please notify the sender immediately and do not disclose the contents to anyone or make copies thereof. 
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Barbara Gould

From: Cynthia Ornelas
Sent: Thursday, December 14, 2023 5:03 PM
To: Barbara Gould
Cc: Judith Cooper
Subject: RE: grant funds not spent

Hi Barbara, 
 
Per our conversation today there is only one item that we paid for in August 2023. 
Unfortunately, we may have coded it under 700-52000 and not against the grant money. 
If you need anything else just let me know.  It was paid with the Bank of America Card 
And this charge appears on the July 16 – August 15, 2023.  
 
 
PS: see comments below in regards to the other grants. 
 
Regards, 
Cynthia L Ornelas 
Accounting Tech 
Lake Park Public Library 
529 Park Avenue 
Lake Park, Florida   33403 
561-881-3330 x 332 
A 2018 Star Library   
www.lakeparkflorida.gov/government/departments/Lake-Park-Public-Library 
 
 
 
 

Date Vendors 
Invoice 
# Amounts Description 

   $        2,000.00    
     
8/1/2023 Amazon  $         (139.75) Blue Micro Cases 

 
 
 
 

 

 |  Your Account  |  Amazon.com

Order Confirmation
Order #112-6152535-4359413
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Hello Judie Cooper, 
Thank you for shopping with us. We’ll send a confirmation once your items have shipped. Your order details are 
indicated below. If you would like to view the status of your order or make any changes to it, please visit Your 
Orders on Amazon.com.  

This order is placed on behalf of Lake Park Public Library.  
 

 

Your guaranteed delivery date is:  
Monday, August 7  

Your shipping speed:  
FREE Shipping  

Order Details  
 

Your order will be sent to:  
Judie Cooper  
LAKE PARK, FL  
United States  

 

Order Details 
Order #112-6152535-4359413  
Placed on today, August 1  

 

 

5 x Pelican Products 1040-026-100Pelican 1040 Micro 
Case (Blue/Clear)  
Camera  
Sold by Amazon.com Services LLC  

$27.95  

 

Order Total:  $139.75  

 

To learn more about ordering, go to Ordering from Amazon.com. 
If you want more information or need more assistance, go to Help.  

 

Thank you for shopping with us. 
Amazon.com  
 

Recommended for you based on items in your order 
 

 

Pelican 1042 Foam Set (1040-400-
000),... 

$5.99 

 

 

amFilm Screen Protector 
Compatible... 

$12.99 

 

 

 

 

By placing your order, you agree to Amazon.com’s Privacy Notice and Conditions of Use. Unless otherwise noted, items sold by 
Amazon.com are subject to sales tax in select states in accordance with the applicable laws of that state. If your order contains one or 
more items from a seller other than Amazon.com, it may be subject to state and local sales tax, depending upon the seller's business 
policies and the location of their operations. Learn more about tax and seller information.  

This email was sent from a notification-only address that cannot accept incoming email. Please do not reply to this message.  
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From: Barbara Gould <bgould@lakeparkflorida.gov>  
Sent: Wednesday, December 13, 2023 4:07 PM 
To: Cynthia Ornelas <cornelas@lakeparkflorida.gov> 
Cc: Judith Cooper <jcooper@lakeparkflorida.gov> 
Subject: grant funds not spent 
 
Cynthia 
 
I am following up on those 3 grants 
Community Connect $2000 received 7/31/2023 
ALA Library $6000 received 8/14/2023  - We began spending the Grant money in October 2023 
ALA Library $1500 received 9/21/2023 – Nothing has been spent yet. 
 
I need to get any of these funds not spent before 9/30/2023 into the Budget Adjustment set to go before the 
Commission in January.  Please forward those figures as soon as possible. 
 
Thank you 
 
 
Sincerely, 
 
Barbara A. Gould 
Assistant Finance Director 
Town of Lake Park 
535 Park Avenue 
Lake Park, FL  33404 
561-881-3350 ext. 352 
561-881-3352 direct line 
561-881-3358 fax 
Please note the change in telephone numbers 
bgould@lakeparkflorida.gov 
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