



## Folds Walker, LLC

527 E University Ave  
Gainesville, FL 32601  
US  
kim@foldswalker.com  
www.foldswalker.com  
O: 352-372-1282

## INVOICE

Number	2977
Issue Date	2/1/2024
Matter	668900 - GENERAL REPRESENTATION
Email	taylor@lcfia.com

### Bill To:

CITY OF LAKE CITY

O: 386-719-5794

### Time Entries

Time Entries	Billed By	Rate	Hours	Subtotal
1/2/2024 Review draft letter to Columbia County Board of County Commissioners pertaining to voluntary annexation	Danielle C. Adams	\$175.10	0.10	\$17.51
1/5/2024 Email correspondence with Robert Angelo regarding staff report and recommendation for circle k hearing	Danielle C. Adams	\$175.10	0.10	\$17.51
1/8/2024 Telephone conference with and review email and associated documents from Audrey Sikes concerning multiple miscellaneous matters	Clay Martin	\$175.10	0.50	\$87.55
1/9/2024 Research issues concerning exempt information for law enforcement investigative information for public records request; Office conference with Audrey Sikes regarding same	Clay Martin	\$175.10	1.20	\$210.12
1/10/2024 Prepare and review submissions by counsel for Circle K	S. Scott Walker	\$175.10	8.00	\$1,400.80
1/10/2024 Prepare for and attend P&Z Meeting on Circle K Site Plan Application	Danielle C. Adams	\$175.10	6.00	\$1,050.60
1/10/2024 Multiple telephone conferences and emails with Audrey Sikes concerning exemptions to public records requests and time frames for responses to same; research issues regarding same	Clay Martin	\$175.10	1.70	\$297.67
1/11/2024 Multiple telephone conferences and emails with Audrey Sikes regarding responses to public records requests, information exempted from same; costs of same, and timing of response to same; Multiple emails with counsel for Sylvester Warren regarding same; Telephone conference with Alysha Jenkins regarding pending City matters; Office conference with DCA regarding multiple pending City matters	Clay Martin	\$175.10	1.80	\$315.18
1/11/2024 Office conference with WCM regarding various issues: public records, quasi judicial, public comment	Danielle C. Adams	\$175.10	0.50	\$87.55

Time Entries	Billed By	Rate	Hours	Subtotal
1/12/2024 Multiple telephone conferences with Council Members regarding agenda matters for City Council agenda; Telephone conference with Audrey Sikes regarding same; Telephone conference with Dee Johnson regarding same; Review email and 11th Circuit freedom of speech case relevant to public comments in City Council meetings; Research issues regarding same; Research decorum policies and procedures best practices	Clay Martin	\$175.10	2.70	\$472.77
1/16/2024 Attend council meeting	Allison E. Folds	\$175.10	0.80	\$140.08
1/17/2024 Attend planning and zoning meeting regarding Circle K site plan review, etc.	Allison E. Folds	\$175.10	6.00	\$1,050.60
1/17/2024 Telephone conference with Robert Angelo regarding FDOT emails and set up for hearing tonight	Danielle C. Adams	\$175.10	0.10	\$17.51
1/17/2024 Prepare for and telephone conference with counsel for Sylvester Warren regarding pending public records requests; Review and reply to multiple emails from City finance staff regarding expenditure of impact fee funds and constraints on same; Research issues regarding same	Clay Martin	\$175.10	1.40	\$245.14
1/17/2024 Prepare for and attend Historic Preservation Committee meeting and Planning and Zoning Committee meeting (Circle K)	Clay Martin	\$175.10	6.30	\$1,103.13
1/18/2024 Telephone conference with WCM regarding next steps in case of an appeal for Circle K Site Plan Application	Danielle C. Adams	\$175.10	0.20	\$35.02
1/18/2024 Review and reply to email from Florida Retail Federation regarding shopping cart ordinance; Research issues regarding same	Clay Martin	\$175.10	0.80	\$140.08
1/22/2024 Prepare for and attend City Council Workshop for allocation of Mariah Fund dollars; Telephone conference with Dee Johnson and Councilwoman Young regarding same	Clay Martin	\$175.10	2.20	\$385.22
1/24/2024 Review emails from counsel for Circle K and Patel regarding withdrawal of application	Clay Martin	\$175.10	0.50	\$87.55
1/24/2024 Telephone conference with Robert Angelo regarding meeting minutes	Danielle C. Adams	\$175.10	0.10	\$17.51
1/25/2024 Research issues concerning "Giglio" records request from USDOJ; Telephone conference with Audrey Sikes regarding same; Telephone conference with Audrey Sikes regarding multiple matters of litigation concerning the City	Clay Martin	\$175.10	1.70	\$297.67
1/29/2024 Telephone conference with Clay regarding P&Z ordinances	Danielle C. Adams	\$175.10	0.10	\$17.51
1/29/2024 Telephone conference with Nikki Starling regarding public records request process and navigating FOIA web interface	Clay Martin	\$175.10	0.30	\$52.53
1/30/2024 Review email from Audrey Sikes regarding response to citizen request concerning methods of amending the City Charter; Research issues regarding same; Respond to same	Clay Martin	\$175.10	0.30	\$52.53
1/31/2024 Review email from A. Sikes regarding public comment and secured area; telephone conference with WCM regarding public comment and secured area	Danielle C. Adams	\$175.10	0.20	\$35.02
	<b>Time Entries Total</b>		<b>43.60</b>	<b>\$7,634.36</b>

**Total (USD) \$7,634.36**

Paid \$0.00

**Balance \$7,634.36**

**Total Outstanding \$7,634.36**

## Terms & Conditions

**DUE AND PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT. SUBJECT TO 1% PER MONTH FINANCE CHARGE AFTER 30 DAYS.**

In the event the balance of this invoice is submitted for collection, the Plaintiff shall be entitled to a reasonable attorney's fee and costs.

## Timekeeper Totals

Name	Rate	Hours	Total
Danielle C. Adams	\$175.10	7.40	\$1,295.74
Clay Martin	\$175.10	21.40	\$3,747.14
S. Scott Walker	\$175.10	8.00	\$1,400.80
Allison E. Folds	\$175.10	6.80	\$1,190.68

## Trust Account Balance

Date	Item	Amount	Balance
3/4/2024	Current Balance		\$0.00