

City of Lake City

Procurement

Brenda Karr, Procurement Specialist 205 N. Marion Ave., Lake City, FL 32055

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

ITB No. 016-2023

Petroleum Products and Delivered Diesel Fuel- Annual Term Contract

RESPONSE DEADLINE: October 4, 2023 at 2:00 pm Report Generated: Wednesday, October 4, 2023

G W Hunter, Inc Proposal

CONTACT INFORMATION

Company:

G W Hunter, Inc

Email:

tlhunter@gwhunterinc.com

Contact:

Terry Hunter

Address:

1130 US Hwy 90 West Lake City, FL 32055

Phone:

N/A

Website:

N/A

Submission Date:

Oct 2, 2023 2:57 PM

ADDENDA CONFIRMATION

Addendum #1
Confirmed Oct 2, 2023 2:45 PM by Terry Hunter

QUESTIONNAIRE

1. References*

Pass

As per the <u>Terms and Conditions</u>, please provide the company name, address, contact person, telephone number and length of time services, using the following format, of at least three (3) client/customer references.

*Note: only list those client/customers in which a similar type of equipment/product of scope of work/service was provided.

Company Name:	
Address:	
Business Phone #:	
Contact Person:	
Email:	
Length of time services provided:	

Columbia County School

218 NW CR 25-A

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT ITB No. 016-2023

Petroleum Products and Delivered Diesel Fuel- Annual Term Contract

Lake City, FL 32055

386-755-8061

Daniel Taylor

Daniel Taylor <taylord1@columbiak12.com>

June 1985

Dale's Excavation

6139 SW SR 47

Lake City, FL 32024

Dale Peeler

386-867-4923

June 1985

Columbia County Sheriff Department

4917 US Hwy 90 East

Lake City, FL 32055

Mark Hunter

June 1985

2. Title and Organization*

Pass

Please provide your title and organization's name.

Terry Hunter, Consulatant

3. Local Office*

Pass

Please provide the city and state for your local office. If you do not have a local office, please type "N/A".

G. W. Hunter, Inc

1130 US Hwy 90 West

Lake City, FL

4. Principal Office*

Pass

Please provide the city and state for your Principal Office.

Same as above

5. Conflict of Interest Statement*

- A. The above named entity is submitting a Bid for the City of Lake City 016-2023 described as Petroleum Products and Delivered Diesel Fuel- Annual Term Contract.
- B. The Affiant has made diligent inquiry and provides the information contained in the Affidavit based upon his/her own knowledge.

- C. The Affiant states that only one submittal for the above proposal is being submitted and that the above named entity has no financial interest in other entities submitting proposals for the same project.
- D. Neither the Affiant nor the above named entity has directly or indirectly entered into any agreement, participated in any collusion, or otherwise taken any action in restraints of free competitive pricing in connection with the entity's submittal for the above proposal. This statement restricts the discussion of pricing data until the completion of negotiations if necessary and execution of the Contract for this project.
- E. Neither the entity not its affiliates, nor anyone associated with them, is presently suspended or otherwise ineligible from participation in contract letting by any local, State, or Federal Agency.
- F. Neither the entity nor its affiliates, nor anyone associated with them have any potential conflict of interest due to any other clients, contracts, or property interests for this project.
- G. I certify that no member of the entity's ownership or management is presently applying for an employee position or actively seeking an elected position with the City of Lake City.
- H. I certify that no member of the entity's ownership or management, or staff has a vested interest in any aspect of the City of lake City.
- I. In the event that a conflict of interest is identified in the provision of services, I, on behalf of the above named entity, will immediately notify the City of Lake City.

Confirmed

6. Disputes Disclosure Form*

Pass

Please select all that pertain to your organization. To answer yes, click on the options that pertain to your organization.

None

7. Disputes Disclosure Form - Explanation*

If you answered yes for any in the previous question, state the nature of the request for equitable adjustment, contract claim, litigation, or protest, and state a brief description of the case, the outcome or status of the suit and the monetary amounts or extended contract time involved. If you selected none, please type "N/A".

N/A

8. Disputes Disclosure Form - Acknowledgement*

Pass

I hereby certify that all statements made are true and agree and understand that any misstatement or misrepresentation or falsification of facts shall be cause for forfeiture of rights for further consideration of this proposal for the City of Lake City.

Confirmed

9. Drug Free Workplace Certificate*

Pass

I, the undersigned, in accordance with Florida Statute 287.087, hereby certify that, as an authorized signatory on behalf of our organization, publishes a written statement notifying that the unlawful manufacture, distribution, dispensing, possession or use of a controlled substance is prohibited in the workplace named above, and specifying actions that will be taken against violations of such prohibition.

- Informs employees about the dangers of drug abuse in the work place, the firm's policy of maintaining a drug free working environment, and available drug counseling, rehabilitation, and employee assistance programs, and the penalties that may be imposed upon employees for drug use violations.
- Gives each employee engaged in providing commodities or contractual services that are under bid or proposal, a copy of the statement specified above.
- Notifies the employees that as a condition of working on the commodities or contractual services that are under bid or proposal, the employee will abide by the terms of the statement and will notify the employer of any conviction of, plea of guilty or nolo contender to, any violation of Chapter 1893, of any controlled substance law of the State of Florida or the United

States, for a violation occurring in the work place, no later than five (5) days after such conviction, and requires employees to sign copies of such written (*) statement to acknowledge their receipt.

- Imposes a sanction on, or requires the satisfactory participation in, a drug abuse assistance or rehabilitation program, if such is available in the employee's community, by any employee who is so convicted.
- Makes a good faith effort to continue to maintain a drug free work place through the implementation of the drug free workplace program.

"As a person authorized to sign this statement, I certify that the above named business, firm or corporation complies fully with the requirements set forth herein".

Confirmed

10. Non-Collusion Affidavit*

- A. By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Bidder Acknowledges that he/she is authorized to submit the attached response on behalf of their organization for: 016-2023, Petroleum Products and Delivered Diesel Fuel- Annual Term Contract;
- B. He/She is fully informed respecting the preparation and contents of the attached proposal and of all pertinent circumstances respecting such proposal;
- C. Such Proposal is genuine and is not a collusive or sham proposal;
- D. Neither the said Bidder nor any of its officers, partners, owners, agents, representatives, employees, or parties in interest, including this affiant, has in any way colluded, connived, or agreed, directly or indirectly, with any other Bidder, firm or person to submit a collusive or sham Proposal in connection with such Contract, or has in any manner, directly or indirectly, sought by agreement or collusion or communication or conference with any other Bidder, firm, or person to fix the price or prices in the attached proposal or any other Bidder, or to fix any overhead, profit or cost element of the proposal price or the proposal price of any other Bidder, or to secure through any collusion, connivance, or unlawful agreement any advantage against the City of Lake City, Florida or any person interested in the proposed Contract; and;

E. The price or prices quoted in the attached proposal are fair and proper and are not tainted by any collusion, conspiracy, connivance, or unlawful agreement on the part of the Bidder or any of its agents, representatives, owners, employees, or parties in interest, including this affiant.

Confirmed

11. E-Verify Affirmation Statement*

Pass

016-2023-Petroleum Products and Delivered Diesel Fuel- Annual Term Contract

Contractor/Proposer/Bidder acknowledges and agrees to utilize the U.S. Department of Homeland Security's E-Verify System to verify the employment eligibility of,

- (a) all persons employed by Contractor/Proposer/Bidder to perform employment duties within Florida during the term of the Contract, and,
- (b) all persons (including subcontractors/vendors) assigned by Contractor/Proposer/Bidder to perform work pursuant to the Contract.

The Contractor/Proposer/Bidder acknowledges and agrees that use of the U.S. Department of Homeland Security's E-Verify System during the term of the Contract is a condition of the Contract.

Confirmed

12. Bidder's Checklist*

Pass

By submitting a response to this solicitation, the bidder acknowledges that they have read, understand and agree to all requirements and that they have completed in their entirety all required documents and/or attachments as a part of their bid submission.

Confirmed

13. Clarifications and Exceptions*

Petroleum Products and Delivered Diesel Fuel- Annual Term Contract

Please explain in detail any deviation from the specifications. Each deviation must be itemized by number and must specifically refer to the applicable specification. Otherwise it will be considered that items offered are in strict compliance with these specifications and the successful Bidder will be held responsible for meeting the specification. If there will not be any deviation, please type "N/A".

N/A

14. Federal Identification No. (FEID)*

Pass

Please provide your FEIN number here.

59-1615975

15. Acknowledgments*

- A. This sworn statement is submitted with 016-2023.
- B. I understand that a "public entity crime" as defined in Paragraph 287.133(1)(g), Florida Statutes, means a violation of any state or federal law by a person with respect to, and directly related to, the transaction of business with any public entity or with an agency or political subdivision of any other state or with the United States, including, but not limited to, any bid or contract for goods or services to be provided to any public entity or an agency or political subdivision of any other state or of the United States and involving antitrust, fraud, theft, bribery, collusion, racketeering, conspiracy or material misrepresentations.
- C. I understand that "convicted" or "conviction" as defined in Paragraph 287.133(1)(b), Florida Statutes, means a finding of guilt or a conviction of a public entity crime, with or without an adjudication of guilt, in any federal or state trial court of record relating to charges brought by indictment or information after July 1, 1989, as a result of a jury verdict, non-jury trial, or entry of a plea of guilty or nolo contendere.
- D. I understand that an "affiliate" as defined in Paragraph 287.133(1)(a), Florida Statutes means:
 - 1. A predecessor or successor of a person convicted of a public entity crime; or

- 2. an entity under the control of any natural person who is active in the management of the entity and who has been convicted of a public entity crime. The term "affiliate" includes those officers, directors, executives, partners, shareholders, employees, members and agents who are active in the management of an affiliate. The Ownership by one person of shares constituting a controlling interest in another person, or a pooling of equipment or income among persons when not for fair market value under an arm's length agreement, shall be a prima facie case that one person controls another person. A person who knowingly enters into a joint venture with a person who has been convicted of a public entity crime in Florida during the preceding 36 months shall be considered an affiliate.
- E. I understand that a "person" as defined in Paragraph 287.133(1)(c), Florida Statutes, means any natural person or entity organized under the laws of any state of the United States with the legal power to enter into a binding contract and which bids or applies to bid on contracts for the provision of goods or services let by a public entity, or which otherwise transacts or applies to transact business with a public entity. The term "person" includes those officers, directors, executives, partners, shareholders, employees, members and agents who are active in management of an entity.

Confirmed

16. Please indicate which statement applies.*

Pass

Based on information and belief, the statement, which I have marked below, is true in relation to the entity submitting this sworn statement.

Neither the entity submitting this sworn statement, nor any officers, directors, executives, partners, shareholders, employees, members or agents who are active in management of the entity, nor any affiliate of the entity have been charged with or convicted of a public entity crime subsequent to July 1, 1989.

17. Required Documents

Pass

Please upload your Final Order if you selected Option 3 or Option 4 above.

2021_GW_Hunter_Inc_W9.pdf

18. Describe Action Taken

Pass

Please describe any action taken by, or pending with, the Department of General Services, if you selected Option 5 above.

N/A

PRICE TABLES

PETROLEUM PRODUCTS & DELIVERED DIESEL FUEL

Total Fuel Cost Inclusive of Tax

Line Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Total Cost Inclusive of Tax
1	Unleaded Regular E-10	Gallon	\$3.0866
2	Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel	Gallon	\$3.7002
3	Low Sulfur Dyed Diesel	Gallon	\$3.407

CURRENT APPLICABLE TAX CALCULATIONS (GASOLINE)

Line Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	No Bid
4	State Taxes	Tax in \$	\$0.2032	
5	County Taxes	Tax in \$	\$0.159	
6	State Pollution (FL EPA)	Tax in \$	\$0.0207	
7	State Agriculture Inspection Fee	Tax in \$	\$0.0019	

Line Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	No Bid
8	Federal Environmental Fee	Tax in \$	\$0.0039	
9	Lust Tax	Tax in \$	\$0.001	

CURRENT APPLICABLE TAX CALCULATIONS (ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL)

Line Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	No Bid
10	State Taxes	Tax in \$	\$0.202	
11	County Taxes	Tax in \$	\$0.159	_
12	State Pollution (FL EPA)	Tax in \$	\$0.0207	
13	State Agriculture Inspection Fee	Tax in \$	\$0.0021	
14	Federal Environmental Fee	Tax in \$	\$0.0039	
15	Lust Tax	Tax in \$	\$0.001	

CURRENT APPLICABLE TAX CALCULATIONS (LOW SULFUR DYED DIESEL-OFF ROAD)

Line Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	No Bid
16	State Taxes	Tax in \$	\$0.00	
17	County Taxes	Tax in \$	\$0.00	
18	State Pollution (FL EPA)	Tax in \$	\$0.0207	
19	State Agriculture Inspection Fee	Tax in \$	\$0.0021	

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

ITB No. 016-2023

Petroleum Products and Delivered Diesel Fuel- Annual Term Contract

Line Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	No Bid	10
20	Federal Environmental Fee	Tax in \$	\$39.00 💍	.39	TX
21	Lust Tax	Tax in \$	\$0.001		

Description	Mark-Up	Taxes	Total Mark-Up & Taxes
Unleaded Regular E-10	0.08	0.3897	0.4697
Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel	0.08	0.3887	0.4687
Low Sulfur Dyed Diesel	0.145	0.0277	0.1727
Current Applicable Taxes	Gasoline	Undyed L/S Diesel	Dyed H/S Diesel
State Taxes	0.2032	0.202	0
County Taxes	0.159	0.159	0
State Pollution (FL EPA)	0.0207	0.0207	0.0207
State Agriculture	0.0019	0.0021	0.0021
Federal Environmental Fee	0.0039	0.0039	0.0039
Lust Tax	0.001	0.001	0.001
TOTAL TAXES:	0.3897	0.3887	0.0277