
  
 
  
                                                                                                    BID OPENING 
                                MINUTES 
                                 April 21, 2026 
                                                                                                         4:00 P.M. 
 

Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; and Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement Manager 
 
The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall. 

 
The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids: 

 
ASPHALT 

Vendor: Black Ops Materials Fuller Asphalt 
Materials W-L Const. & Paving Summers Taylor Inc. 

Asphalt Surface, Plant Mix (411-E, W/Rap)  
Per Ton No Bid No Bid $105.00 $109.00 

Asphalt Surface, Plant Mix (411-E, No Rap) 
Per Ton $123.50 $126.00 $106.00 $118.00 

Asphalt Binder, Plant Mix (307-C)  
Per Ton $123.50 $122.00 $99.00 $104.00 

Asphalt Binder, Plant Mix (307-B)  
Per Ton $113.00 $118.00 $94.00 $99.15 

Asphalt Surface, Plant Mix (411-D, W/Rap)  
Per Ton No Bid No Bid $104.00 $111.00 

Asphalt Surface, Plant Mix (411-D, No Rap)  
Per Ton No Bid No Bid $107.00 $116.00 

     
 
 The submitted bids will be evaluated and a recommendation made at a later date. 


