
 

OFFICE OF AUDITOR OF STATE  
STATE OF IOWA 

State Capitol Building 
Des Moines, Iowa 50319-0004 

Telephone (515) 281-5834 

Rob Sand 
Auditor of State 

 

July 14, 2025 

Kristi Onstot 
Executive Council 
L O C A L 

Subject: Tornado Damages to Adair South ISICS Communication Tower on May 21, 2024  
 Department of Public Safety 
 Claim dated August 15, 2024 

AOS Claim ID: 3771 

In accordance with Executive Council policy, we have examined the invoices and 
supporting documentation for final payment related to the damages and have found the 
items to be in order as shown below: 

Documented request       $        75,009.06 
 

 Executive Council Allocation     $   2,000,000.00 

 Less: 
  Previous payments  $     17,267.75 
  This payment          75,009.06 
   Total      $        92,276.81 

 Remaining Executive Council allocation   $   1,907,723.19 

 
We recommend reimbursement be made in the amount of $75,009.06.  This 

represents partial payment of the loss.  

Sincerely, 
 
 
 
 
Brian R. Brustkern, CPA 
Deputy Auditor of State 

cc: Lieutenant Joshua Duden, Communications & Interoperability Bureau, Department  
  of Public Safety 





ORIGINAL INVOICE
Transaction Numbar

1187148C84 300,036.25 USD

Transactlon Date

28-MAY-2025

P.O. Number

CON'RACT

P.o. Date Cu3tomer Account No

10001s9978

Payment oue Date

27-JUN 2C25

IOWA. STATE OF
AT_IN: Accoun:s Payabie
79OO HICKMAN RD STE 5OO

WINOSOR HEIGHTS IA 50324
Unhed Slales

BillTo Address

Project l{o: USlA24D034

Proj.ct Name: US|A24DC34 STATE OF IA STORI\r! R

Forall invoice payment inquirieG contact
AccounisRecelvable@mo:orclasolutions.com
Telephone; 800-247'2346
Faxr +1(631)8$-a238

Sales Orde(s): US,A24D031

IIIPORTANT INFORMATIO{

SPECIAL INSTRUCTIONS / COMMENTS

Line
h€m #

Descrjplion otJ Unit Prlc€
(USD) (USD)

300.436 2a 300 036 2525Ol" OF THE CONTRACT PRICE OUE UPON COMPLETION OF
-THE 

OESIGN REVIEW

IF THERE ARE ANY OUESTIONS REOAROING TIlIS ITiVOICE,
PLEASE CONTACT
ACCOUNTSRECEIVABLE@r\IOTOROLASOLUTIONS.COti. THANK
YOU FOR CHOOSING I,IOTOROLA SOLUTIONS, INC,

INVOICE DUE PER TER]\1S OF THE CONTRACT, NET 30

300,035.25
0.00

300,035.25
300,035.25

tfr,
."-^ \\

LJSD Subtotal
USD Total Tax
USD Total
USD Amount Duetc,

1,1, *r*Jt / i>rl >i7
1!2

o MOTAROLA SOLUTIONS

Motorola Solutions, lnc-
500 West Monroe
Chicago lL 60661
United States
Federal Tax lD: 36-'1115800

Vislr our weoste ai \rlv1!. m ctorolasol!1ic... com

Please detach here end return the bottom portion with your paym6nt

Payment Coupon

Please put your Transacton Nlmberand your Customer Account Numbe. on your paymentfor prompl processing'

Payment Transfer DetailsIOWA, STATE OF
ATTN:Accounls Payable
79OO HICKMAN RD STE 5OO

WINDSOR HEIGHTS IA 50324
United Slates

Send Paym€nts To:

@ fr,O7OE'OLA SOLUTIONS

l\,lotorola Solutions, lnc.
13104 Collections Center Drive
Chicago IL 60693
United States
Please provide your remittance details to
US.remittaoce@motorolasolutions.com

300,036,25 USD
Payment Due Date

27-JUN-2025
Transaction Numb€r

1187148084
Cu3tom6r Account No

10001s9s78

DIVERS]ON CONTRARY TO EXPORT CON;ROL LAW IS PROHIB]TED

I

I

sf: :SaleU

\

.4
CHICAGO
WIRE Routing Transit Number: 026009593
ACH/EFT Routing Transit Number: 111000012
SWIFT: BOFAUS3N
Bank Account No: 3756319819



2t2

@ NOTOFIOLA SOLUTIONS

Motorola Solutions, lnc.
500 Wesl Monroe
Chlcago lL 60661
llnlied States
Federal Tax lDi 36"1115800

Visii our websil€ at 
',r,tvw. 

motorolasolu:ron s.com

ORIGINAL INVOICE
Transaction Totel

300,036.25 USD

Trrnsactlon Number

1187148084 28-MAY-2025

P.O. Number

CONTRACT

P.O. Date

Payment Due Date

27-JUN-2025

DIVERSION CONTRARY 
-IO EXPORT CONTROL LAVr' IS PROHIBITED

l

Customer Account No

1000 r99978



Cook Katelyn

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Attachments:

Follow Up Flag:
Flag Status:

Dostal Sandra
Thursday, May 29, 2025 10:55 AM
Cook Katelyn; Hove Heath
RE: ** External Email Alert ** IOWA, STATE OF [100019997811ar9e Contracts]
Recently Generated lnvoice
Moto lnv 1 1 1 87148084001.pdf

Follow up
Flagged

- MSI

Here you go

Sandra Dostal
Administrative Assistant I DPS lnteroperability Communication Bureau
Office of the Commissioner
Administrative Services Division
lowa Department of Public Safety
2'15 East 7th Street, Des Moines, lowa 50319
Office. 515-725-6095
Fax. 5'1 5-725-6193
dostal@dos. state. ia. us
https://dps. iowa gov/
https://dpscareers.com/

I/1WA I

D€partment of
Public safety

From: Cook Katelyn < kcook@d ps. state.ia. us>

Sent: Thursday, May 29,2025 10:42 AM
To: Hove Heath <hove@dps.state.ia.us>; Dostal Sandra <dostal@dps.state.ia.us>

Subject: RE: ** External Email Alert ** IOWA, STATE OF [1000199978 | Large Contracts] - MSI Recently Generated lnvoice

We wilt pay this up here. Sandra, if you want to get it coded as it usually would be (4529) and have Hove sign
it. I'll steal the originally signed invoice and we will get this going.

Best,

Katelyn Cook

Accountant
Administrative Services Division I Finance Bureau
lowa Department of Public Safety
215 East 7th Street, Des Moines, lowa 50319
Oftice'. 515-725-6243
kcook@dps.state. ia. us

https://dps. iowa.qov/
htt s.//d scareers.com/

1



Department of
Public Safety

From: Hove Heath <hove(dd os.state.ia. us>

Sent: Thursday, May 29,2025 9:09 AM
To: Dostal Sandra <dostal.adps.state.ia.us>; Cook Kately n <kcook@dos.state.ia.us>
Subject: FW: ** External Email Alert ** IOWA, STATE OF [1000199978 | Large Contracts] - MSt Recently Generated
lnvoice

DDR Mitestone invoice.

Thank you,

Gaptain Heath Hove, 385

Bureau Chief

lnteroperability Communications Bureau
lowa Department of Public Safety
2'15 East 7th Street, Des Moines, lowa 50319
Office. 515-725-6092
Ivlobile: 51 5-204-7288
hove s.state.ia.us

https://dps. iowa.qov/
https.//dpscareers. com/

lnwA"
-NOTICE* This email message (including any file attachments lransmitted with it) is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and
may contain confidential and legally privileged information. Any unauthorized use or disclosure of this email by an unintended iecipient
is prohibited. lf you have received this e-mail in error please notify the sender by relurn e-mail and destroy all copies of the originai
message. No representation is made that this email or any attachments are free of viruses. Virus scanning is recommended and is the
responsibility of the recipient.

d

Dopartmant of
Public Safety

.NOTICE. This email message (including any file attachments transmitted with it) is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and
may contain mnlldential and legally privileged information. Any unauthorized use or disclosure of this email by an unintended recipient
is prohibited. lf you have received this e-mail in error please notify the sender by relum e-mail and deslroy all copies ofthe original
message. No representation is made that this email or any attachments are free of viruses. Virus scanning is recommended and is the
responsibility of the recipienl.

From: Kacper Fejdych <accou ntsreceivable@ motoro lasolutions.com>
Sent: Thursday, May 29, 2025 9:06 AM
To: Hove Heath < hove @dos. state. ia. us>

Subject: *x External Email Alert ** IOWA, STATE OF [10001999781 Large Contracts] - MSI Recently Generated Invoice

"*External Enrail Alert-. This email is from outside DPS. DO NOT CLICK links or attachments unless you
expected them. lf unsure please forward to ITOC for review.

Dear Customer IOWA, STATE OF,
This is a courtesy emaii to ensure that you received our recentty issued invoice (attached for your reference). Ptease tet me know if you have any questions or

lf the nvoice has atread been processed for the payment, ptease di rd this notice.

I^WA"

Transaction
Currenc.tr

Origin6tTrr
Amouit OpenBatance MSI S6tes OrderTRXNumber PO#TRx Date lnvoice Due Dato

concerns with this invoice and we wit[ address

2

I



1187148084 2025 05 28 2425 A6 21 USD 300.036.251 300.036.2s1 00032036148971 co\TRACT
Thank you for your attention and support

rds.

Kacper Fejdych
count Receivables Anatyst

Motorola Solutions lnc,
Phone: 0018889196551

t
ll

I

3

ADVANCING .T .ll
'rHt I



l.rwA
1000068432

$**r300,036.25

05t30t2025
PRC MOTOROLA28MY25KCC25

. 
FOR QIJESNONS, CONTACT:
Public Safety, Dept of
51,5-725-6249

Department of
Administrative Services

00547

Motorola Solutions lnc
13108 Collection Center Dr
Chicago, IL 60693-0001

LINE # CHECK DESCRIPTION

1 Invoice #11871,18084

INVOICE # INVOICE DATE

1187148084 0s/28/2025

AMOUNT

300,036.25

]OTAL WARRANT AMOLINT
;*300,036.25

SAEOO,l

il.LOOOOESI, I2r, r:O?l0eIOB5r: B0 l8 lELq0ErF

000'1 -595-R75-4529-2693

State of lowaWarrant
volD 6 i.,roNTHS AFTER 05_30_2025 No. 1000068432

33-2308
730

$,fi30o,036.25

MOTOROTA28MY25KCC25

For additional information about this payment, please go to https://i3public. iowa.gov/payments/index.faces

I3, Treasurer of State

rHREE HUNDRED rHousAND rHrRrr r,* oo.*P. r'r"" 
Moines' Iowa 503 l9

Motorola Solutions lnc
13108 Collection Center Dr
Chicago, lL 60693-0001

.'Z-
DEPARTMENT OFAOUINISTRATIVE SERI'ICES
AUTHOBIZEO SIGNAIUFE

AMOUNT

,ay

(



-o
7,

NC

:o
m

-t!
oj
ozq
I

I

oot

a
l

!

a

5

l

TI



PRC 595  MOTOROLA28MY25KCC25 1

STATE OF IOWA
PAGE: 1 of 2

PAYMENT REQUEST - COMMODITY BASED
BFY: 2025 FY: 2025 PERIOD: 11 CREATION DATE: 05-30-2025

DOCUMENT TOTAL: $300,036.25
DOCUMENT DESCRIPTION:

Motorola Inv #1187148084, FY 2025, FEMA
 

ENTERED BY: kcook
LAST USER: cgibatchadm



PRC 595  MOTOROLA28MY25KCC25 1

STATE OF IOWA
PAGE: 2 of 2

PAYMENT REQUEST - COMMODITY BASED
VNDR LN: 1 VENDOR#: 00002099390 DISB TYPE: Check AMOUNT: $300,036.25

Motorola Solutions Inc
 

 

13108 Collection Center Dr

Chicago, IL 60693-0001
OVERRIDE ADDRESS:

 
 

INV#: 1187148084 VND INV DT: 05-28-2025 TRACKING DT: 05-29-2025

AGREEMENT DOC: MA 005 22185

COMM LN: 1 COMM#: 72574 TYPE: Item RECEIVED SERVICE
FROM: 05-30-2025 TO: 05-30-2025

QTY: 1.00000 UNIT: EA UNIT PRICE: 300,036.250000 TOTAL: $300,036.25
DISC UNIT PRICE: 300,036.250000 CONTRACT AMT:  

INV#: 1187148084 INV LN#: 1 VND INV DT: 05-28-2025 TRACKING DT: 05-29-2025

REF DOC:    REF VNDR LN: 0 REF COMM LN: 0 REF TYPE:  

COMMODITY
Two-Way Radio, Portable, Including Vehicle Radio Relay Syste

CL DESCRIPTION:
Motorola radios and related equipment

ACCT 1 BFY: 2025 FY: 2025 PERIOD: 11 EVENT TYPE: AP01 LINE AMOUNT: $300,036.25

REF DOC:    REF VNDR LN: 0 REF ACTG LN:  REF TYPE: PARTIAL

CHECK DESCR:
Invoice #1187148084
ACCT LINE DESC:
ISICS Adair South, 25% of Contracted Amount, Completion of Design Review

FUND DEPT ORGN / SUB APPR OBJIT / SUB REV / SUB
0001 595 4529 ADAS R75 2693    
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