## MARQUESS LAW OFFICE, P.C

203 W. HIGH STREET P.O. BOX 51 TOLEDO, IA 52342 641-484-1001 mike@tamalaw.com

June 16, 2022

Victoria Newton Executive Council Room 114 State Capitol Des Moines, IA 50319

Re: Special Counsel Update, May - June 2022

Dear Honorable Council Members:

I write to update you on my work as Special Counsel representing the State of Iowa in criminal prosecutions of non-native offenders for offenses occurring on the Meskwaki Settlement. We have seen an increase in violent offenses during the last month, with a sexual abuse case and threat of mass shooting at the casino. While the bulk of our cases continue to be narcotics, driving and theft offenses, and violent offenses are rare, the increase is concerning. I am working closely with the Meskwaki Nation Police Dpeartment on these matters and will update you in the future.

I have enclosed an invoice containing a detailed accounting of my time broken down by each particluar case. I also recently spoke with Assistant Attorney General Scott Brown for a general review of our cases over the last year and all is well. Should you have any questions or concerns, please do not hesistate to contact me. I look forward to continuing to serve the State of Iowa.

Sincerely,

Michael Marquess

Enc.

Cc: Office of the Attorney General for the State of Iowa

# **Marquess Law PC**

203 W. High St., P.O. Box 51 Toledo, Iowa 52342



### **SCAN TO PAY!**

Invoice # 1878 Date: 06/16/2022 Due On: 07/16/2022

Iowa Executive Council Room 114 State Capitol Des Moines, IA 50319

#### iowa-

### **Criminal Prosecution for Meskwaki Settlement Matters**

Type	Date	Notes	Quantity	Rate	Total
Service	05/17/2022	Telephone call with public defender on various matters.	0.50	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	05/18/2022	FLOWERS: Pulled Pleadings and Drafted and Filed an Appearance.	0.30	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	05/19/2022	HILL: Case management conference.	0.50	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	05/19/2022	MEYER: Probation hearing.	0.50	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	05/19/2022	LOPEZ-JAIME: Case management conference.	0.50	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	05/19/2022	CARMER: Case management conference.	0.50	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	05/19/2022	PATTERSON: Pulled pleadings; Added dates in calendar	0.20	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	05/19/2022	HUYNH: Pulled pleadings; Added dates to calendar	0.20	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	05/19/2022	MEYER: Pulled pleadings; Added dates to calendar	0.30	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	05/19/2022	WILLIAMS: Pulled Pleadings	0.10	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	05/19/2022	LOPEZ: Pulled pleadings; Added date to calendar	0.20	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	05/23/2022	YODER: Pulled Pleadings and Drafted and Filed	0.30	\$0.00	\$0.00

		Appearances.			
Service	05/24/2022	ARREDONDO-MEDELLIN: Drafted and filed Trial Information, Minutes of Testimony and proposed Order Setting Arraignment.	1.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	05/24/2022	BLEDSOE: Drafted and filed Trial Information, Minutes of Testimony and proposed Order Setting Arraignment.	1.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	05/24/2022	BOEDING: Reviewed report, drafted and filed Motion to Dismiss and proposed Order.	0.30	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	05/24/2022	CASTORENA: Drafted and filed Trial Information, Minutes of Testimony and proposed Order Setting Arraignment.	1.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	05/24/2022	GILCHRIST: Drafted and filed Trial Information, Minutes of Testimony and proposed Order Setting Arraignment.	1.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	05/24/2022	LOPEZ JAIME: Drafted and filed Motion to Amend Trial Information, proposed Order to Amend Trial Information, and Amended Trial Information.	0.30	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	05/24/2022	WILKENING: Drafted and filed Trial Information, Minutes of Testimony and proposed Order Setting Arraignment.	1.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	05/26/2022	BAXTER: Case management conference.	0.50	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	05/26/2022	HUYNH: Arraignment (continued after arrival).	0.50	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	05/26/2022	HILL: Case management conference.	0.50	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	05/26/2022	PRINCE: Case management conference.	1.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	05/31/2022	BLY: Case management conference.	0.50	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	05/31/2022	JOHNSON: Case management conference.	0.50	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	06/01/2022	KELSO: Research, emails with opposing counsel.	0.30	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	06/01/2022	BLY: Emails with opposing counsel.	0.20	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	06/02/2022	BLY: Sentencing.	0.50	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	06/02/2022	HUYNH: Arraignment/plea/sentencing.	0.50	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	06/02/2022	CASTORENA: Arraignment.	0.50	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	06/02/2022	GILCHRIST: Arraignment.	0.50	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	06/02/2022	ARREDONDO-MEDELLIN: Arraignment.	0.50	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	06/02/2022	KELSO: Case management conference.	0.50	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	06/02/2022	RUIZ-ROMERO: Sentencing.	0.50	\$0.00	\$0.00

Service	06/06/2022	SLAYBAUGH: Reviewed Pleadings and Drafted and Filed Appearances.	0.30	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	06/06/2022	STOFFEL: Review Pleadings and Drafted and Filed an Appearance.	0.30	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	06/06/2022	HAYSLETT: Emails with police and opposing counsel.	0.30	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	06/14/2022	BOWERS: Telephone call to victim's mother.	0.30	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	06/15/2022	BOWERS: Drafted and filed Trial Information, Minutes of Testimony, and proposed Order Setting Arraignment.	1.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	06/15/2022	COWAN: Drafted and filed Trial Information, Minutes of Testimony and proposed Order Scheduling Arraignment.	1.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Service	06/15/2022	STOFFEL: Drafted and filed Trial Information, Minutes of Testimony and proposed Order Setting Arraignment.	1.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Expense	06/16/2022	Reimbursable expenses: Prosecution Services May - June 2022	1.00	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00

Total \$5,000.00

### **Detailed Statement of Account**

#### **Current Invoice**

Invoice Number	Due On	Amount Due	Payments Received	Balance Due
1878	07/16/2022	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00 \$0.00	
The state of the s			Outstanding Balance	\$5,000.00
			Total Amount Outstanding	\$5,000.00

To pay your invoice, please feel free to use the QR code in the top rigtht corner of this invoice!

Please make all amounts payable to: Marquess Law PC

Please pay within 30 days.