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September 3, 2024

Accounting Department
Office of the Treasurer

Lucas Building
321 E 12" Street
Des Moines, IA, 50319

The Executive Council, in a meeting held on today’s date, approved Department of Public Safety’s request for
an emergency allocation $9,500.00, subject to audit of actual invoices. On November 28, 2023, a random cover
was damaged on the Albia ISICS Communication Tower. Request was to cover repair costs.
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cc: Lieutenant Heath Hove, Interoperability Communications Bureau, Department of
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Sergeant Joshua Duden, Interoperability Communications Bureau, Department of
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Heather Hackbarth, Department of Management
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August 21, 2024

Kristi Onstot
Executive Council
LOCAL

Subject: Damages to Radome Cover on Albia ISICS Communication Tower due to
Weather on November 28, 2023
Department of Public Safety
Claim dated August 12, 2024
AOS Claim ID: 3659

In accordance with Executive Council policy, we have examined the claim for
29C.20 funds for the above-mentioned damages. It is our conclusion that the above
damage incurred by the Department of Public Safety is covered by Chapter 29C.20 of the
Code of Iowa. Therefore, we recommend Executive Council approval in the amount of
$9,500.00, subject to an audit of actual invoices.

Sincerely,

o 2 B e
Brian R. Brustkern, CPA
Deputy Auditor of State

cc: Lieutenant Heath Hove, Interoperability Communications Bureau, Department of
Public Safety
Sergeant Joshua Duden, Interoperability Communications Bureau, Department of
Public Safety
Heather Hackbarth, Department of Management
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August 12, 2024
AON 29C20 allocation request ref. broken radome cover on the Albia ISICS tower.

State of lowa Executive Council:

On 11-28-23 Dave Gordon, Motorola Warranty Representative, advised during the bi-weekly warranty
maintenance call that Motorola work crews discovered a broken radome cover on the Albia ISICS tower.

Motorola Warranty Representative Dave Gordon was able to provide the DPS Interoperability Communications
Bureau an estimate of $9,500 for repairs to the broken radome covers. Repairs will commence when a tower crew
becomes available.

The DPS Interoperability Communications Bureau is respectfully submitting a 29C20 Allocation Request for
$9,500 regarding this act of nature damage.

Thank you for your consideration.

Sincerely,

%MM\@ wlain

Lieutenant Joshua Duden

Iowa DPS Communications & Interoperability Bureau
Office of the Commissioner

215 E.7™ Street

Des Moines, IA 50319

INTEROPERABILTY COMMUNICATIONS BUREAU e 215 EAST 7T STREET e DES MOINES, IOWA 50319-0041  515-725-6095

Protection All Ways



Newton, Victoria [TOS]

From: Pierce Richard

Sent: Tuesday, November 28, 2023 10:10 AM

To: ExecutiveCouncil@tos.iowa.gov; Tammy Hollingsworth

Cc: Seiler Katelyn; Dave Gordon; Josh Duden (duden@dps.state.ia.us); Dostal Sandra
(dostal@dps.state.ia.us)

Subject: 11-28-23 29C20 Initial Notification ref. Albia ISICS Tower - Radome Damage AON

Executive Council and Tammy

During the 11-28-23, Dave Gordon, Motorola Warranty Representative, advised during the bi-weekly warranty
maintenance call that Motorola work crews discovered a broken radome cover on the Albia ISICS Tower. A repair
estimate is pending. Please accept this email as the required 29C20 Initial Notification.

Captain Richard Pierce

Bureau Chief | DPS Interoperability Communication Bureau
Office of the Commissioner

lowa Department of Public Safety

215 East 7% Street | Des Monies, lowa 50319

Office: 515-725-6113

Cell: 712-269-0730

pierce@dps.state.ia.us

I ﬁ WA Department of
= | Public Safety

Notice: This email message (including any file attachments transmitted with it) is for the sole use of the intended
recipient(s) and may contain confidential and legally privileged information. Any unauthorized use or disclosure of this
email by an unitended recipient is prohibited. If you have received this email in error please notify the sender by return
email and destroy all copies of the original message. No representation is made that this email or any attachments are
free of viruses. Virus scanning is recommended and is the responsibility of the recipient.




Newton, Victoria [TOS]

From: Dave Gordon <dave.gordon@motorolasolutions.com>
Sent: Tuesday, November 28, 2023 2:39 PM

To: ISICSAdmin; Gray, Steven

Cc: ISICS Statewide FSO; DAVID GORDON

Subject: ** External Email Alert ** Albia Dish Radome Damage

**External Email Alert** This email is from outside DPS. DO NOT CLICK links or attachments unless you
expected them. If unsure please forward to ITOC for review.

Good Afternoon,

Here are the pictures regarding the radome damage at Albia.




Dave Gordon

Customer Support Manager
Motorola Solutions, Inc.
State of lowa

M: +1.319.321.1134
E: dave.gordon@motorolasolutions.com

For more information on how and why we collect your personal information, please visit our Tueeg} ¥ spy}2



Newton, Victoria [TOS]

From: Tammy Hollingsworth <Tammy.Hollingsworth@AOS.IOWA.GOV >

Sent: Wednesday, January 17, 2024 9:59 AM

To: Pierce Richard; ExecutiveCouncil@tos.iowa.gov

Cc: Seiler Katelyn; DAVID GORDON; Duden Joshua; Dostal Sandra; Zemira Rahmanovic

Subject: ** External Email Alert ** RE: 11-28-23 29C20 Initial Notification ref. Albia ISICS Tower - Radome
Damage AON

**External Email Alert* This email is from outside DPS. DO NOT CLICK links or attachments unless you
expected them. If unsure please forward to ITOC for review.

Notification of 29C.20 Damages Received — AOS Claim #3659

From: Pierce Richard <pierce@dps.state.ia.us>

Sent: Tuesday, November 28, 2023 10:10 AM

To: ExecutiveCouncil@tos.iowa.gov; Tammy Hollingsworth <Tammy.Hollingsworth@AOS.IOWA.GOV>

Cc: Seiler, Katelyn <seiler@dps.state.ia.us>; DAVID GORDON <dave.gordon@motorolasolutions.com>; Duden, Joshua
[DPS] <duden@dps.state.ia.us>; Dostal, Sandra [DPS] <dostal@dps.state.ia.us>

Subject: 11-28-23 29C20 Initial Notification ref. Albia ISICS Tower - Radome Damage AON

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of AOS. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the

sender and know the content is safe.

Executive Council and Tammy

During the 11-28-23, Dave Gordon, Motorola Warranty Representative, advised during the bi-weekly warranty
maintenance call that Motorola work crews discovered a broken radome cover on the Albia ISICS Tower. A repair
estimate is pending. Please accept this email as the required 29C20 Initial Notification.

Captain Richard Pierce

Bureau Chief | DPS Interoperability Communication Bureau
Office of the Commissioner

lowa Department of Public Safety

215 East 7t Street | Des Monies, lowa 50319

Office: 515-725-6113

Cell: 712-269-0730

pierce@dps.state.ia.us

I nWA | Department of
« | Public Safety

Notice: This email message (including any file attachments transmitted with it) is for the sole use of the intended
recipient(s) and may contain confidential and legally privileged information. Any unauthorized use or disclosure of this
email by an unitended recipient is prohibited. If you have received this email in error please notify the sender by return
email and destroy all copies of the original message. No representation is made that this email or any attachments are
free of viruses. Virus scanning is recommended and is the responsibility of the recipient.

1



This email message and its attachments may contain confidential information that is exempt from disclosure under lowa Code chapters 22, 1394, and other
applicable law. Confidential information is for the sole use of the intended recipient. If you believe that you have received this transmission in error, please
reply to the sender, and then delete all copies of this message and any attachments. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any
review, use, retention, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this message may be prohibited by law.

Auditor.lowa.Gov
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