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SECRETARY OF STATE T xecutitte Couneil of Jofoa
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HON. ROBY SMITH DES MOINES, IOWA 50319
TREASURER OF STATE PHONE: 515 281-5368

HON. MIKE. NAIG
SECRETARY OF AGRICULTURE

March 3, 2025

Accounting Department
Office of the Treasurer

Lucas Building

321 E 12th Street

Des Moines, IA, 50319

The Executive Council, in a meeting held on today’s date, approved Department of Administrative Services
request for an emergency allocation in the amount of $4,468.98, subject to an audit of actual invoices. On
December 15, 2024, Vehicle #8398 was stolen. Request was to cover repair costs.

EXECUTIVE COUNCIL OF IOWA
Kristi Onstot
Kfristi Onstot

Executive Secretary

cc: Adam Steen, Director, Department of Administrative Services
DAS Fleet Services, Risk
Matt Bender, Department of Management
Heather Hackbarth, Department of Management

AOS Claim # 3962
TOS Job #



OFFICE OF AUDITOR OF STATE

STATE OF IOWA
Rob Sand

Auditor of Stat
State Capitol Building uditor ot State

Des Moines, lowa 50319-0004

Telephone (515) 281-5834

February 6, 2025

Kristi Onstot
Executive Council
LOCAL

Subject: Vehicle #8398 was Stolen on December 15, 2024
Department of Administrative Services
Claim dated January 9, 2025
AOS Claim ID: 3962

In accordance with Executive Council policy, we have examined the claim for
29C.20 funds for the above-mentioned damage. It is our conclusion that the above damage
incurred by the Department of Administrative Services is covered by Chapter 29C.20 of the
Code of Iowa. Therefore, we recommend an Executive Council allocation in the amount of
$4,468.98, subject to an audit of actual invoices.

Sincerely,

P AR

Brian R. Brustkern, CPA
Deputy Auditor of State

CC: Adam Steen, Director, Department of Administrative Services
Mariah Fucaloro, Fleet Services Manager, Department of Administrative Services
Heather Hackbarth, Department of Management



I nWA ' Department of
Administrative Services

KIM REYNOLDS, GOVERNOR ADAM STEEN, DIRECTOR
CHRIS COURNOYER, LT. GOVERNOR

Date: January 9, 2025

To:  Tammy Hollingsworth, Auditor of State
Victoria Newton, Treasurer of State
Executive Council

Re: ALLOCATION REQUEST - 29C20 Claim for Executive Council Consideration

Vehicle / Event | #8398 / Theft

December 15, 2024

Event Date

Summary Vehicle 8398 - Stolen, not recovered. (TL2504)

Amount $4,468.98 - Calculated ACV (actual cash value)

Requested

Supporting 29C20 Email Notification, Incident Report, ACV Calculation with

Documentation | supporting documentation

If you have any questions or are in need of additional information, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Thank you,

‘// Zd
Ryan Betts

DAS Fleet Services
ryan.bettsl @iowa.gov
515-281-8008

Hoover State Office Building | 1305 East Walnut Street | Des Moines, IA 50319 | 515.242.5120 | das.iowa.gov



1/2/25, 3:31 PM State of lowa Mail - RE: FW: Scanned image from lowa School for The Deaf

I () W A Risk, DAS <das.risk@iowa.gov>

RE: FW: Scanned image from lowa School for The Deaf
1 message

Tammy Hollingsworth <Tammy.Hollingsworth@aos.iowa.gov>
To: "Risk, DAS" <das.risk@iowa.gov>, TOS ExecutiveCouncil <executivecouncil@tos.iowa.gov>

Thu, Jan 2, 2025 at 3:19 PM

Notification of 29C.20 Damages Received — AOS Claim #3962

From: ryan.betts1@iowa.gov <ryan.betts1@iowa.gov> On Behalf Of Risk, DAS

Sent: Monday, December 16, 2024 10:43 AM

To: Tammy Hollingsworth <Tammy.Hollingsworth@AOS.IOWA.GOV>: TOS ExecutiveCouncil <executivecouncil@tos.iowa.gov>
Subject: Fwd: FW: Scanned image from lowa School for The Deaf

Please accept this email as initial 24 hr notification for AON, vehicle 8398 was stolen on 12/15/2024. | will forward all information as soon
as it is received.

All accidents must be reported via email or phone to Fleet Services within 24 hours. All accident reports and estimates are due
within 72 hours of an accident. Agencies have 60 days to complete repairs to vehicles once approval is given.

DAS Risk
Central Procurement and Fleet Services Enterprise

lowa Department of Administrative Services

109 SE 13 St, Des Moines, IA 50319
515-281-3162 office
das.risk@iowa.gov

https://das.iowa.gov

|IOWA.

Department of
Administrative Services

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Mark Huss <mark.huss@iaedb.org>

Date: Mon, Dec 16, 2024 at 9:03 AM

Subject: RE: FW: Scanned image from lowa School for The Deaf

To: Fucaloro, Mariah <mariah.fucaloro@iowa.gov>, DAS Risk <das.risk@iowa.gov>

https://mail.google.com/mail/b/AEoRXRTtZ_hMIBKEktuz1 em4fvn09tSXGMyCQ5Xn2p1 GMWIGkaF/u/O/?ik=fc086bf760&view:pt&search:alI&permt. - 1/3



1/2/25, 3:31 PM State of lowa Mail - RE: FW: Scanned image from lowa School for The Deaf

Plate Number is 8398

VIN — 1GCHK34U45E248080

Mark Huss, M.B.A.

- Business Operations Director

L. APLUS Logo Phone (712) 366.3214 / Fax (712) 366-3218
3501 Harry Langdon Boulevard, Council Bluffs, IA 51503
iowaschoolforthedeaf.org + iowa-braille.k12.ia.us

From: Fucaloro, Mariah <mariah.fucaloro@iowa.gov>

Sent: Monday, December 16, 2024 9:02 AM

To: Mark Huss <mark.huss@iaedb.org>; DAS Risk <das.risk@iowa.gov>
Subject: Re: FW: Scanned image from lowa School for The Deaf

What is the plate # or VIN?

Mariah Fucaloro, CPM
Fleet Manager

Central Procurement and Fleet Services Enterprise
lowa Department of Administrative Services

109 SE 13 st, Des Moines, 1A 50319
515-725-2243 office

515-414-6582 mobile
mariah.fucaloro@iowa.gov
https://das.iowa.gov

I n WA Department of
e Administrative Services

On Mon, Dec 16, 2024 at 8:59 AM Mark Huss <mark.huss@iaedb.org> wrote:

Mariah,

Good Morning, | wanted to let you know that our Red Power House Truck was stolen Sunday Morning. | am attaching the information |
have at this time. | am not sure who needs to be contacted at DAS.

Let me know.

Thanks,

https://mail.google.com/mail/b/AEoRXRTtZ_hMQBKEktuz1 em4fvn09tSXGMyCQ5Xn2p1 GMWIGkaF/u/O/?ik:f0086bf760&view=pt&search:all&permt. - 2/3



1/2/25, 3:31 PM State of lowa Mail - RE: FW: Scanned image from lowa School for The Deaf
Mark

Mark Huss, M.B.A.

Business Operations Director

Phone (712)366.3214 / Fax (712) 366-3218

3501 Harry Langdon Boulevard, Council Bluffs, IA 51503
iowaschoolforthedeaf.org * iowa-braille.k12.ia.us

----- Original Message-----

From: scan@iaedb.org <scan@iaedb.org>

Sent: Monday, December 16, 2024 8:46 AM

To: Mark Huss <mark.huss@iaedb.org>

Subject: Scanned image from lowa School for The Deaf

Reply to: admin scan <scan@iaedb.org>
Device Name: lowa School for The Deaf
Device Model: BP-50C45

Location: Admin Front Desk

File Format: PDF MMR(G4)
Resolution: 200dpi x 200dpi

Attached file is scanned image in PDF format.

NOTICE TO RECIPIENT: The contents of this e-mail message and any attachments is covered by the Electronic Communication
Privacy Act, 18 U.S.C. 2510-2521, is confidential, and intended solely for addressee. In addition, any student related information
contained in this e-mail (including attachments) is protected by the Family Educational Rights and Privacy Act of 1994. If you are not the
intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any retention, dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly
prohibited. Please immediately notify the sender by reply e-mail or phone and delete this message and its attachments, if any. This
communication and any response to it may constitute a public record and, therefore, may be available upon request in accordance with
lowa public records law, lowa Code Chapter 22. [8th2]

NOTICE TO RECIPIENT: The contents of this e-mail message and any attachments is covered by the Electronic Communication Privacy
Act, 18 U.S.C. 2510-2521, is confidential, and intended solely for addressee. In addition, any student related information contained in this
e-mail (including attachments) is protected by the Family Educational Rights and Privacy Act of 1994. If you are not the intended recipient,
you are hereby notified that any retention, dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. Please
immediately notify the sender by reply e-mail or phone and delete this message and its attachments, if any. This communication and any
response to it may constitute a public record and, therefore, may be available upon request in accordance with lowa public records law,
lowa Code Chapter 22. [8th2]

This email message and its attachments may contain confidential information that is exempt from disclosure under lowa Code chapters 22, 139A, and other applicable law.
Confidential information is for the sole use of the intended recipient. If you believe that you have received this transmission in error, please reply to the sender, and then
delete all copies of this message and any attachments. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any review, use, retention, dissemination,
distribution, or copying of this message may be prohibited by law.

Auditor.lowa.Gov

https://mail.google.com/mail/b/AEoRXRTtZ_hMQBKEktuz1 em4fvn08tSXGMyCQ5Xn2p1 GMWIGkaF/u/O/?ik=f0086bf76c&viewzpt&search=a|I&permt. @ 3/3



Vehicle Accident Report

Time and location of accident

Accident Date (Mo/Day/Year)

No. of Vehicles n

/15 /a4

County Pj;) O+’%’ \

Vehicle 1 {State vehicla)

Driver’s Name

Work Street Address

State F‘x OW A

2501 Hawylangdow [uip

Dave Siaughtev

Driver’s License No./State City, State, Zip
51U 3wy Towk Counci! Blulls, A 51807
Date of Birth Department Work Phone Home Phone
G-7-6/ Power bow< [112)364-323¢ [0 366 -0 ¢
License Plate No. YIN Year, Make, Model

3399 16CAK3Sule 2450 30 2005 Chevy 1T To W

Estimate ($) of Damage

Description of Damage’

Driver’s Name

| Veh[c[e X (other vehmle) if mare than two vehn:les -Lse add;tlonal ferms

No Damgges
S-Mﬁ@m

Street Address

Driver’s License No./State

City, State, Zip

Date of Birth Work Phone

Home Phone License Plate No.

Description of Damage

bAS F!eet Servicas @ 109 S.E. 13th st. O Des Molnes IA 50319 . 515 281- 3152

Webslte 1ttps://,




Property Damage other than vehzcie (fence, utr!lty pole etc)

Owner’s Name, Address and Phone

Descripticn of Property Damaged

Vehicle No. 1/ Name and Address

No  DAavare /sHolen

Describe Injuries

Vehicle No. 2/ Name and Address

Describe Injuries

Witness

Address/Phone

Name

Address/Phone

' Accident Diagram

Complete diagram below, include a description of what happened.
Use the outline below to sketch the scene of your accident,
writing in street or highway names or numbers.

Use number 1 to indicate the State vehicle.

- DAS Fleet Services @ 109 S.E. 13th 5t. @ Des Momes 1A 50319 . 515-281-3162

WEbSle htf:s das iowa, ovracurmentﬂet services . Email: das. nsk@:owa gov




COUNCIL BLUFFS POLICE DEPARTMENT

1 Ezra Jackson Way
Council Bluffs, IA 51503
(712) 328-4715

Case CB24-012439 Printed on January 3, 2025
Status Approved

Report Type Uniform

Primary Officer Colton Schaefer

Investigator Trevor Benson

Reported At 12/15/24 02:45

Incident Date 12/15/24 02:45

Incident Code STNV : STOLEN VEHICLE

Location 3501 HARRY LANGDON BLVD, COUNGIL BLUFFS, IA 51503 (IOWA SCHOOL FOR THE DE,
Zone CBPD District 4

Beat

Disposition Open / Active

Disposition Date/Time 12/19/24 15:38

Review for Gang Activity None

Historical Case Number

Offense Information

Offense Theft 2nd -- Motor Vehicle Theft Under $10,000
Statute 714.2(2)

NIBRS Code 240 - Motor Vehicle Theft

Counts 1

Offense Details Completed
Include [n NIBRS Yes

Completed Yes
Bias Motivation None (no bias)
Location School - Elementary/Secondary

Entry Forced No
Cargo Theft No

Victim

IOWA SCHOOL FOR THE DEAF 714.2(2) - Theft 2nd -- Motor Vehicle Theft Under $10,000
- Completed

Vehicles

8398 A - (Victim)
2005 Red Chevrolet Silverado
Owner TRANSPOR, IOWA STATE UNIVERSITY -

1. Narrative/Overview Narrative By Colton Schaefer

On December 15th 2024 at approximately 0245 hours, | Officer Colton Schasfer #556 was dispatched to the lowa

School of the Deaf for a stolen vehicle.

Case CB24-012439

Page 10f 2



Upon arriving | spoke with maintenance employee Dave Slaughter who advised that he arrived at work around 0030
hours to relieve the previous worker, Dave advised that he used the vehicle to drive around the campus and then take

Dave advised the vehicle is a 2005 Red Chevy 2500 with a snow plow attached to the front, 1SD decal on the side with
state license plates. The vehicle will be entered in NCIC as stolen.

End of Report.
3. Public Release Narrative By Colton Schaefer

On December 15th 2024 at approximately 0245 hours, | Officer Colton Schaefer #556 was dispatched to the lowa
School of the Deaf for a stolen vehicle,

Case CB24-012439 Page 2 of 2



DAS - Fleet

Loss/Risk valuation Calculation

Variables - Input:
Agency
Vehicle Number
Vehicle - Yr, Make, Model
VIN#
Date of Report
Claim Number
Mileage

Dealership Price - Off Contract
Purchase Price - On Contract
NADA - Trade in - Clean Value @ Time of Loss

Dealership Price - Off Contract
Purchase Price - On Contract
Difference
Percentage Difference
Calculations:
NADA Value @ Time of Loss or purchase price, which ever is lower
Percentage Decrease for Contract Price
Loss calculated

Loss Amount to be Provided to Agency:

620 - ED
8398
2005 Chevrolet Silverado
1GCHK34U45E248080
12/15/2024
TL2504
79,357
$32,228.00
$19,662.00
$7,325.00
$32,228.00
$19,662.00
$12,566.00
38.99%
$7,325.00
38.99%
4,468.98

$4,468.98




Purchase Invoice and Vehicle Checklist:

On Wed, Jan &, 2025 at 1:57 PM Risk, DAS <das. risk(@
Let me know if we need to have a meeting on this, bi
We do not have the purchase documents. Howevel

was 519,662.00
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NADA value at time of loss:

BLACK BOOK

~ & B

Froducts

Run Vehicle Market User All
« Bvutl  Lists  Trends Insights  Reports Specs  Value:

Uscdcara

“' Light Truck
Values

¢ Historical : 3 pesec .
Used Car & Free Form Drill Down
Mediin s Vehicle Search

H uty

1GCH K34U45E24080

R

Recreational

el YalUeS LD &R
a@ Mo;orc}'de 2005 Chevrolet Silverado 3500 Base Reg Cab 4WD
An

™ ) PowerSports MSRP: $29.810 2 1GCHK34U45E248080




DAS - Fleet

Loss/Risk valuation Calculation

Variables - Input:

Agency
Vehicle Number
Vehicle - Yr, Make, Model
VIN#
Date of Report
Claim Number
Mileage
Dealership Price - Off Contract
Purchase Price - On Contract
NADA - Trade in - Clean Value @ Time of Loss
Dealership Price - Off Contract
Purchase Price - On Contract
Difference

Percentage Difference
Calculations:
NADA Value @ Time of Loss or purchase price, which ever is lower
Percentage Decrease for Contract Price
Loss calculated

Loss Amount to be Provided to Agency:

620 -ED
8398
2005 Chevrolet Silverado
1GCHK34U45E248080
12/15/2024
TL2504
79,357
$32,228.00
$19,662.00
$7,325.00
$32,228.00
$19,662.00
$12,566.00
38.99%
$7,325.00
38.99%
4,468.98

$4,468.98




Purchase Invoice and Vehicle Checklist:

On Wed, Jan §, 2025 at 1:57 PM Risk, DAS =das risk@iowa.gov= wrote:
Let me know if we need to have a meeting on this, but below is what | just got back from Jeremy. | don't ki

We do not have the purchase documents. However our asset management team states that we purch

was 519,662.00



Dealership "Sticker" Price when vehicle was purchased:

2005 Chevrolet Silverado 3500 Base Reg Cab 4WD
MSRP: $29,810 . 1GCHK34U4A5E248080

Loan Value: $7,200 UVC: 2005160270

Equip Ret: $30,987 Model # CK35903

MPGC: —/— Price Incl- 8CY AC AT

MY s | et

X-CL Clean Average Rough
Base
Options

Mileage
Region
Adjusted

History
History
Adjusted

‘History Adjustments are calculated for events present on the Experian
AutoCheck® report a5 of woday.

¥ ELIY Mot Selected =

76001 - 90000 2 - Add/Deducts *

201

Z. 7 CHEVROLET

' — Siandard Equlpment —

Ib&r:{f::éu@ﬁfelg;i- Included at No EXTRA cHAHGE in the Standand Vehicle Price

D TE A CAS ENGE ~CTIRONE FAONT BUIF:
« INDEPENDENT FRONT SUSPENSION - CHROME REAN Boma!
- MULTI-LEAF REAR SPRINGS » FRONT RECOVERY HOC
- STAINLESS STEEL EXHALIST “ INTERIOR **
= EXTENDED LIFE SPARK PLUGS TR T T
« SYNTHETIC REAR AXLE FLUID 7 BUAL ZONE AR CONDR
* TRAILETING Wine HARNESE - INTERRITTENT WIFERS
oz l ]
“&-WHEEL ABS W/DYNAMIC REAR s TILT STEERNG WhERL
PROPORTIONING " CRU'SE CONTROL
» 4-WHEEL DISC BRAKES * B o
.EEIIHEE%EIGHT FRAT PASSENGER + BATTERY RUN DOWN P
« THEFT DETERRENT IGNITION + I LIFE MONITORING &
* DAYTIME RUNNING LAWPS =24 ROUN ROATSIDE AS
UTO-CONTROL HALOGEN
" HEADLAMBS

| = ADJ. FRT SEAT HEAD RESTRAINTS

sn‘ us at www. f:hevy com
& I others in the FREE FHEL 64 '

CITY MPG

a HIGHWAY
W | Fuel Economy |
-1| Information {
ACTUAL MILEAGE
FOR COMPARY
:‘,j.'.r{qf,_g;eg,eﬂ,,;, A L] NOT APPLICABLE TO THIS VEHICLE proits s
TIGH. PESLL TS

SPEGLA
A
Lt
XK AND MOC WP 1 THE CITY ¥

WWD BETVEEN
M AW K MPG DM THE ESTIMATED ANNUAL FUEL COST:
HIGHYAY

T CLES WITH THESE
ESTIATES Wit ACHEVE BE TWE |§E

x5 T

W rannmg' ; -'.-

pecemomoeveoss 1R MEAR e
BALES MODEL £008 <127

%TBCLEWNE. INC. DERLER M0 1150
FIMAL ASEEMESLY FINTIA
BOONE, IA 500360544 VIN 1GCHE 4L



NADA value at time of loss:

BLACK BOOK

= L — ELILA

i Rumn Vehicle Market User All
&= Frodusts « Bidu-l Lists  Trends Insights  Reports  Specs  Value
Used Car &
" Light Truck
Values
Historical
Light Truck
Vehicle Search
Medi &
@ Hga:r:'":)“w 1GCHK34U45E248080
Trucks
Recreational
@ Vehicle n
Values
@ ;1.':;"”"‘3'“ 2005 Chevrolet Silverado 3500 Base Reg Cab 4WD
PowerSports MSRP: £29,810 C1GCHK34U45E248080




	TREASEMG_DAS Vehicles.pdf
	EXECUTIVE COUNCIL OF IOWA

	ZHH. DAS Vehicle #8398 AOS Claim 3962 Allocation Request.pdf
	3962 Request for Allocation Letter AOS-Signed.pdf
	DOC010925-01092025081445 (002).pdf
	Car 8398 ED 2005 Chevrolet Silverado (1).pdf
	Loss Calc
	Purchase Docs
	Off-Contract Pricing
	NADA



