
MEMBERS OF COUNCIL 

HON. KIM REYNOLDS 

  GOVERNOR 

HON. PAUL D. PATE 

  SECRETARY OF STATE 

HON. ROB SAND  

  AUDITOR OF STATE 

HON. ROBY SMITH 

  TREASURER OF STATE 

HON. MIKE NAIG 

  SECRETARY OF AGRICULTURE 

AOS Claim # 1608 

TOS Job # 19AL 

CAPITOL BUILDING 

DES MOINES, IOWA 50319 

PHONE: 515 281-5368 

May 6, 2024 

Accounting Department 
Office of the Treasurer 
Lucas Building 

321 E 12th Street 

Des Moines, IA, 50319 

The Executive Council, in a meeting held on this date, approved a Judicial Branch request for an emergency 
allocation and reimbursement in the amount of $152,186.11. On July 19, 2018, Marshall County Courthouse 
was damaged by a tornado. Request was to cover repair costs. This represents full and final payment and this 
allocation will be closed. 

EXECUTIVE COUNCIL OF IOWA 

Kristi Onstot 
Acting Executive Secretary 

cc: Bob Gast, Judicial Branch, State Court Administrator 

Kent Farver, Judicial Branch, Director of Finance 

Matt Bender, Department of Management  

Heather Hackbarth, Department of Management 



 

OFFICE OF AUDITOR OF STATE  
STATE OF IOWA 

State Capitol Building 
Des Moines, Iowa 50319-0004 

Telephone (515) 281-5834 

Rob Sand 
Auditor of State 

 

April 10, 2024 

Victoria Newton 
Executive Council 
L O C A L 

Subject: Tornado Damage to Marshall County Courthouse on July 19, 2018 
 Judicial Branch – State Court Administration 
 Claim dated November 16, 2023 

AOS Claim ID: 1608 

In June 2019, an allocation and reimbursement was approved for this claim in 
the amount of $56,309.34.  The claim was then inadvertently closed, even though there 
were additional damages identified at that time.  This 2nd allocation and reimbursement 
request relates to those additional damages identified. 

In accordance with Executive Council policy, we have examined the claim for 
29C.20 funds for the above-mentioned damage.  It is our conclusion that the above 
damage incurred by the Judicial Branch – State Court Administration is covered by 
Chapter 29C.20 of the Code of Iowa.  Therefore, we recommend an Executive Council 
allocation and reimbursement in the amount of $152,186.11.  This represents full and 
final payment of the loss. 

  

Sincerely, 
 
 
 
 
Brian R. Brustkern, CPA 
Deputy Auditor of State 

 
 
 
cc: Bob Gast, Judicial Branch, State Court Administrator 

Kent Farver, Judicial Branch, Director of Finance 



 

STATE COURT ADMINISTRATION 
Iowa Judicial Branch Building 

1111 East Court Avenue 
Des Moines, IA  50319 

 
 
 
KENT A. FARVER, CPA 
Director of Finance 

 
November 16, 2023 
 
 
Tammy Hollingsworth 
Auditor of State’s Office 
Lucas Building 
 
Executive Council 
Victoria Newton 
Executive Secretary 
State Capitol  
 
Dear Ms. Hollingsworth & Ms. Newton: 
 
The Iowa Judicial Branch requests an emergency allocation of funds pursuant to Iowa Code 
section 29C.20 in the amount of $152,186.11.  On July 19, 2018, a tornado hit Marshalltown, 
Iowa damaging the courthouse and the offices of the Marshall County Clerk of Court and the 
courtrooms inside the courthouse.  These invoices represent the final costs associated with 
moving Judicial Branch staff and equipment back into the courthouse 
 
Based on the approval of this request for an emergency allocation of funds, we now request 
reimbursement for the paid invoices listed in the attached document ($152,186.11).  We have 
also attached the supporting documentation for each expenditure.  
 
Please let us know if you have any questions or need additional information. 
 
 
Sincerely, 
 
 
 
Kent A. Farver 
Director of Finance 
 
  
 

farv00
Name



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
       
 
 
 
 



Document ID and Warrant Number 
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Newton, Victoria [TOS]

From: Tammy Hollingsworth <Tammy.Hollingsworth@AOS.IOWA.GOV>
Sent: Sunday, August 20, 2023 10:51 PM
To: Farver, Kent [JB]
Cc: Newton, Victoria [TOS]
Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL]  RE: EXTERNAL:Marshalltown Courthouse claim

Kent, 
It looks like back in June 2019 an allocation and reimbursement was approved for $56,309.34.  The request letter did 
include another $130,000 in expected costs, so it appears I closed the claim on my end in error.  I have reopened the 
claim.  So when you have all of the invoices in order and payment is made, go ahead and submit a request for allocation 
and reimbursement.   
 
The AOS Claim # is 1608. 
 
Tammy 
 

From: Kent Farver <Kent.Farver@iowacourts.gov>  
Sent: Wednesday, May 3, 2023 11:06 AM 
To: Tammy Hollingsworth <Tammy.Hollingsworth@AOS.IOWA.GOV> 
Subject: Re: [EXTERNAL] RE: EXTERNAL:Marshalltown Courthouse claim 
 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of AOS. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the 
sender and know the content is safe. 

Tammy:  
Good morning.  Let me know what we can do with this and if you want to chat.  They have furniture on the way and move 
in scheduled for late summer apparently.    
 
Kent  
 
 
 

 

Kent A. Farver CPA, CGFM | Director of Finance  
Iowa Judicial Branch | State Court Administration 
Judicial Building | 1111 East Court Avenue | Des Moines | Iowa 50319 
515.348.4847 (phone) | 515.348.4913 (fax) 
kent.farver@iowacourts.gov 
www.iowacourts.gov  

 
The Iowa Judicial Branch dedicates itself to providing independent and accessible forums for  
the fair and prompt resolution of disputes, administering justice under law equally to all persons.  
 
 
 
From:        "Tammy Hollingsworth" <Tammy.Hollingsworth@AOS.IOWA.GOV>  
To:        "Farver, Kent [JB]" <kent.farver@iowacourts.gov>  
Date:        05/01/2023 05:31 PM  
Subject:        [EXTERNAL]  RE: EXTERNAL:Marshalltown Courthouse claim  
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Kent,  
I just wanted to reach out regarding this information.  From what I have on file, all of the 29C.20 claims for the Judicial Branch have 
been closed.  Could you let me know what event these damages are related to?  
   
Tammy  
   
From: Kent Farver <Kent.Farver@iowacourts.gov>  
Sent: Wednesday, April 19, 2023 5:28 PM 
To: Tammy Hollingsworth <Tammy.Hollingsworth@AOS.IOWA.GOV> 
Subject: EXTERNAL:Marshalltown Courthouse claim  
   

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of AOS. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and 
know the content is safe. 

 
Tammy:  
Good afternoon.  Hope you are doing well.  I wanted to send a quick FYI that we are finally almost done with the 
Marshalltown claim.  The furniture has been ordered and we are scheduled to finally move court staff back in this 
summer.  Once we get the invoices, I will be in touch.  If you have any questions, please let me know.  Thank you!  
 
Kent  

 

Kent A. Farver CPA, CGFM | Director of Finance  
Iowa Judicial Branch | State Court Administration 
Judicial Building | 1111 East Court Avenue | Des Moines | Iowa 50319 
515.348.4847 (phone) | 515.348.4913 (fax) 
kent.farver@iowacourts.gov 
www.iowacourts.gov  

 
 
The Iowa Judicial Branch dedicates itself to providing independent and accessible forums for  
the fair and prompt resolution of disputes, administering justice under law equally to all persons.  
----- Forwarded by Kent Farver/SCA/JUDICIAL on 04/19/2023 05:25 PM -----  
 
From:        Jim Evans/SCA/JUDICIAL  
To:        "Sara Guerrero" <sguerrero@workspaceinc.net>  
Cc:        Scott Hand/District2/JUDICIAL@JUDICIAL, Kent Farver/SCA/JUDICIAL@JUDICIAL, Carolyn Haney/District2/JUDICIAL@JUDICIAL  
Date:        04/14/2023 11:25 AM  
Subject:        Re: [EXTERNAL]  RE: Schedule crude draft  

 
 
 
Sara,  
Please place the order for Marshall County.    
 
Reference quotes:    
#7070 in the amount of $17,277.21  
#70508 in the amount of $98,759.53  
#70509 in the amount of $56,194.57  
 
Please let us know about delivery and what else we can do to make this go as smooth as possible.  
 
Thanks!  
 
 
   

 You don't often get email from kent.farver@iowacourts.gov. Learn why this is important   
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Jim Evans | Director of State Judicial Facilities, Safety, and Security  
Iowa Judicial Branch | Office of State Court Administration 
Judicial Building | 1111 East Court Avenue | Des Moines | Iowa 50319 
515.348.4884 (phone) | 515.490.7759 (mobile) | 515.348.4914 (fax)  
Jim.Evans@iowacourts.gov 
www.iowacourts.gov  

 
 
The Iowa Judicial Branch dedicates itself to providing independent and accessible forums for  
the fair and prompt resolution of disputes, administering justice under law equally to all persons.  
 
 
 
 
From:        "Sara Guerrero" <sguerrero@workspaceinc.net>  
To:        "Jim Evans" <Jim.Evans@iowacourts.gov>  
Date:        04/14/2023 10:43 AM  
Subject:        [EXTERNAL]  RE: Schedule crude draft  

 
 
 
 
Jim,  
  
We just met internally on this order. We still have this soft scheduled for May 15-19th. Are you planning to place both 4th & 5th floor 
orders today? My team is getting nervous about furniture arriving in time, so they would like to plan for the first couple days the 
week of May 22nd. Let me know if that works and if we can get this order in the system. Thanks!  
  
Sara Guerrero    
Account Manager  
P  515.782-5395  
  
309 LOCUST STREET  
DES MOINES, IA 50309  

 
  
From: Jim Evans <Jim.Evans@iowacourts.gov>  
Sent: Thursday, April 13, 2023 2:22 PM 
To: Sara Guerrero <sguerrero@workspaceinc.net> 
Subject: Fw: Schedule crude draft  
  
Hi Sara!  I think you were copied on many of these but just noticed you were left off this one.    
This is a crude schedule for Marshalltown.  Can you verify it will work from your end?  
Let me know any questions or concerns.  
Thanks  

 

Jim Evans | Director of State Judicial Facilities, Safety, and Security  
Iowa Judicial Branch | Office of State Court Administration 
Judicial Building | 1111 East Court Avenue | Des Moines | Iowa 50319 
515.348.4884 (phone) | 515.490.7759 (mobile) | 515.348.4914 (fax)  
Jim.Evans@iowacourts.gov 
www.iowacourts.gov  

 
 
The Iowa Judicial Branch dedicates itself to providing independent and accessible forums for  
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the fair and prompt resolution of disputes, administering justice under law equally to all persons.  
 
----- Forwarded by Jim Evans/SCA/JUDICIAL on 04/13/2023 02:20 PM -----  
 
From:        Jim Evans/SCA/JUDICIAL  
To:        Scott Hand/District2/JUDICIAL@JUDICIAL, Carolyn Haney/District2/JUDICIAL@JUDICIAL  
Date:        04/06/2023 03:07 PM  
Subject:        Schedule crude draft  

 
 
 
 
 
 
Week of:  
 
April 10 - 14     Order Furniture (Jim, Sara, Scott)  
 
April 17 - 21  
 
April 24 -28      CTI installations in the Grand courtroom (Valentina)  
 
May 1 - 5  
 
May 8 - 12       Deliver Totes for Packing  
 
May 15 - 19      Furniture installation (Sara)  
 
May 22 - 26      DAJ Courtroom and remaining CTI Installations (Valentina)  
 
May 29 (Memorial Day) May 30 - June 2  Schedule for movers (Jim)  
                      Start moving employees in shifts through June 1 (Jim, Carol)  
                       
June 1 GO LIVE IN COURTHOUSE  
 
PENDING:  Telephones?  
                 IT and IT Equipment?  

 

Jim Evans | Director of State Judicial Facilities, Safety, and Security  
Iowa Judicial Branch | Office of State Court Administration 
Judicial Building | 1111 East Court Avenue | Des Moines | Iowa 50319 
515.348.4884 (phone) | 515.490.7759 (mobile) | 515.348.4914 (fax)  
Jim.Evans@iowacourts.gov 
www.iowacourts.gov  

 
 
The Iowa Judicial Branch dedicates itself to providing independent and accessible forums for  
the fair and prompt resolution of disputes, administering justice under law equally to all persons.  

 
 

 

This email message and its attachments may contain confidential information that is exempt from disclosure under Iowa Code chapters 22, 139A, and other applicable 
law. Confidential information is for the sole use of the intended recipient. If you believe that you have received this transmission in error, please reply to the sender, and 
then delete all copies of this message and any attachments. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any review, use, retention, dissemination, 
distribution, or copying of this message may be prohibited by law.  

Auditor.Iowa.Gov  
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This email message and its attachments may contain confidential information that is exempt from disclosure under Iowa Code chapters 22, 139A, and other 
applicable law. Confidential information is for the sole use of the intended recipient. If you believe that you have received this transmission in error, please 
reply to the sender, and then delete all copies of this message and any attachments. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any 
review, use, retention, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this message may be prohibited by law.  

Auditor.Iowa.Gov  
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