%,
CJ
MEMBERS OF COUNCIL %‘, ?g
HON. KIM REYNOLDS o, -m =
A
GOVERNOR
4’2‘0\:@&
HON. PAUL D. PATE - . -
SECRETARY OF STATE 1 xecutifie Council of Jofoa
HON. ROB SAND
AUDITOR OF STATE CAPITOL BUILDING
HON. ROBY SMITH DES MOINES, IOWA 50319
TREASURER OF STATE PHONE: 515 281-5368

HON. MIKE NAIG
SECRETARY OF AGRICULTURE

May 6, 2024

Accounting Department
Office of the Treasurer

Lucas Building

321 E 12" Street

Des Moines, 1A, 50319

The Executive Council, in a meeting held on this date, approved payment of the following cost item:

Department of Public Safety... .. ...$8,087.01
On May 10, 2023, State Patrol Vehlcle #2879 was damaged by a deer Request was to cover repair

costs. This represents full and final payment.
EXECUTIVE COUNCIL OF IODWA
Kristl Onstot

Kristi Onstot
Acting Executive Secretary

cc: Jeannie Adams, lowa State Patrol, Department of Public Safety
DAS Risk
Matt Bender, Department of Management
Heather Hackbarth, Department of Management

AOS Claim ID # 3542
TOS Job #2563



OFFICE OF AUDITOR OF STATE

STATE OF IOWA
Rob Sand

Auditor of Stat
State Capitol Building uditor ot State

Des Moines, lowa 50319-0004
Telephone (515) 281-5834  Facsimile (515) 281-6518

April 11, 2024

Victoria Newton
Executive Council
LOCAL

Subject: Deer Damage to Vehicle #2879 on May 10, 2023
Department of Public Safety — lowa State Patrol
Claim dated December 5, 2023
AOS Claim ID: 3542

In accordance with Executive Council policy, we have examined the invoices and
supporting documentation for final payment related to the loss and have found the items
to be in order as shown below:

Documented request $ 8,087.01
Executive Council Allocation $ 8,087.01
Less:
Previous payments $ 0.00
This payment 8,087.01
Total $ 8,087.01
Remaining Executive Council allocation $ 0.00

As requested by the Department, we recommend reimbursement be made to the
Department of Administrative Services in the amount of $8,087.01. This represents full
and final payment of the loss.

Sincerely,

Brian R. Brustkern, CPA
Deputy Auditor of State

cc: Jeannie Adams, Iowa State Patrol, Department of Public Safety
Mariah Fucaloro, Fleet Services Manager, Department of Administrative Services



Department of Govemor Kim Reynolds
Administrative Services Lt. Govemor Adam Gregg

Empowering People Adam Steen, Director
Collaboration

Customer Service

Date: January 19, 2024

To:  Tammy Hollingsworth, Auditor of State
Victoria Newton, Treasurer of State
Executive Council

From: Karl Bubser, Fleet Administrator

DAS Fleet Services
Department of Administrative Services

Re: REIMBURSEMENT REQUEST - 29C20 Claim

AOS Claim # 3542

Vehicle / Event | #2879/Animal

Event Date May 10, 2023
Summary Vehicle 2879 struck a deer. (256671)
Amount $12,122.01 - Total Valuation
Requested $ 4.035.00 - Salvage Proceeds
$ 8,087.00- TOTAL math is wrong $8,087.01

The Department of Administrative Services, Central Procurement Fleet Services Enterprise, has paid all
vendors to date. We are seeking an allocation for those funds under 29C20 Contingency Fund — Disaster
Aid. Please deposit into the following account: 0665-005-5790-0657.

If you have any questions or need additional information, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Thank you,

A Y—

Karl Bubser, Fleet Administrator
DAS Fleet Services
karl.bubser@iowa.gov
515-281-3162

et S o v,

Hoover State Office Building | 1305 East Walnut Strest | Des Moines, IA50319 | (515) 281-5380 | httpdidas.iowa.gov



Department of Govemor Kim Reynolds
1 Administrative Services Lt. Govemor Adam Gregg

Empowering People
Collaboration
Customer, Service

Adam Steen, Director

Date: December 5, 2023

To: Tammy Hollingsworth, Auditor of State
Victoria Newton, Treasurer of State
Executive Council

From: Mariah Flowers, Fleet Manager
DAS Fleet Services
Department of Administrative Services

Re: ALLOCATION REQUEST - 29C20 Claim for Executive Council Consideration

Vehicle / Event | #2879/Deer

May 10, 2023

Event Date
Summary Vehicle 2879 struck a deer. (256671)
Amount $12,122.01 - Total Valuation

Requested $ 4.035.00 - Salvage Proceeds

$ 8,087.01 - TOTAL

Supporting 29C20 Email Notification, Accident Report, Repair Estimate(s), Photos
Documentation

If you have any questions or are in need of additional information, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Thank you,

e o

Mariah Fucaloro, Fleet Manager
DAS Fleet Services
Mariah.Fucaloro{@iowa.gov
515-414-6582

"~ Hoover State Office Building | 1305 East Walnut Street | Des Moines, [A 50319 | (515) 281-5360 | hitp:/idas jowa.gov



DAS - Fleet

Loss/Risk valuation Calculation

Variables - Input:
Agency

DAS - Dept of Admin Services

Vehicle Number 2579
Vehicle - Yr, Make, Mode 2016 Dodge Durango ST AWD
VIN# 1C4RDJFGBGCA75425
Date of Report 5/11/2023
Claim Number 256671
Mileage 111,423
Dealership Price - Off Contract $37,075.00
Purchase Price - On Contract $27,592.00
NADA - Trade in - Clean Value @ Time of Loss $16,288.65
Calculations:
Dealership Price - Off Contract $37,075.00
Purchase Price - On Contract $27,592.00
Difference $9,483.00
Percentage Difference 25.58%
NADA Value @ Time of Loss or purchase price, which ever is lower $16,288.65
Percentage Decrease for Contract Price 25.58%
Loss calculated 12,122.01
Loss Amount to be Provided to Agency: $12,122.01
NADA Value @ Time of Loss or purchase price, which ever is lower $16,288.65
Repair Estimate $14,681.92
Damage Disclosure Needed (Over 70%) 90.14%




Purchase Invoice and Vehicle Checklist:
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Insurance Auto Auctions, Inc.

Attn: Settlement Group

Two Westbrook Corporate Center Suite 500
Westchester, IL 60154

Phone: (515) 823-0600

Fax: (515) 823-0626

REMITTANCE: 38750485

Remittance Payable To:
State of lowa

DATE: 06/23/2023

lowa Department of Administrative Svcs

109 SE 13th Street
Des Moines, |A 50319
Attn: Salvage Dept

E-mail: |AA_ASAP_DesMoines@iaai.com
Salvage Information

IAA Stock #: 000-36764099

|AA Branch: Des Moines

Fed. Tax |.D. 954455113

Handler: Mariah Flowers
Adjuster: Mariah Flowers
Insured: state of iowa

Owner: state of jowa

Claim #: 2879

Policy #: GOV-538

Vehicle: 2016 DODGE DURANGOQO
Damage: Front end/

Mileage: 111423

Mileage Type: Actual

VIN: 1C4RDJFGE6GC475425
ACV: $15,800.00

NICB Date: N/A

Buyer Information

Account of Sale

Total
Activity

%ACV

0.41

(0.41)
25.54

25.54 %

Sales $4,100.00 25,95
IAA Charges
Consignment Flat Fee $65.00
Less IAA Charges ($65.00)
Net |AA Return $4,035.00
Payment Amount $4,035.00

LKQ Corporation DO NOT USE ACCOUNT CREDIT
5846 Crossing Blvd

Antioch, TN 37013
Resale Certificate # : 364264412 (IA)

Elapsed Days Analysis

Date of Event: Date Days
Loss 6/1/2023 -
Assigned 6/1/2023 1
Released 6/13/2023 13
Pickup 6/13/2023 1
Title Rec'd 6/12/2023 0
Sale Doc. Rec'd 6/12/2023 1
Auction Date 6/20/2023 9
Buyer Payment 6/21/2023 2
Remittance 6/23/2023 3

Elapsed Total Days: 23

|AA Doc. RP002.rpt

+H50

2919-



12/5/23, 7:46 AM State of lowa Mail - FW: Durango vs deer 'Zgjw(pqy )

I ‘ . W A Risk, DAS <das.risk@iowa.gov>
\ =

FW: Durango vs deer
1 message

Adams Jeannie <jadams@dps.state.ia.us> Thu, May 11, 2023 at 11:06 AM
To: "ExecutiveCouncil [TOS]" <ExecutiveCouncil@tos.iowa.gov>, Tammy Hollingsworth
<Tammy.Hollingsworth@aos.iowa.gov>

Cc: "Risk, DAS (das.risk@iowa.gov)" <das.risk@iowa.gov>, Vehicle Assignment Form Mailbox <VAFMAILBOX@iowa.gov>

Vehicle 2879

Jeannie Adams

ISP Fleet & Supply, Fleet Asset Manager

Department of Public Safety

30 N.E. 48th Place

Des Moines, lowa 50313

Direct #: 515-725-0643

Cell Phone: 515-204-3019

Shop: 515-281-3277

Fax: 515-242-6321

Email: jadams@dps.state.ia.us<mailto:;jadams@dps.state.ia.us>

From: Moore Ryan <rmoore@dps.state.ia.us>

Sent: Thursday, May 11, 2023 4:30 AM

To: Sitrick Anne <sitrick@dps.state.ia.us>

Cc: Adams Jeannie <jadams@dps .state.ia.us>; Flowers, Mariah <Mariah.flowers@iowa.gov>
Subject: Fwd: Durango vs deer

Jeannie,

SA Matt Anderson's vehicle is a lease vehicle (DEA)| am out of state until Friday, Anne can get you Matt's vehicle number
if needed.

Thanks,

Ryan

From: "Anderson Matthew" <mranders@dps.state.ia.us<mailto:mranders@dps.state.ia.us>>
Subject: Durango vs deer

Date: 11 May 2023 02:54

To: "Moore Ryan" <rmoore@dps.state.ia.us<mailto:rmoore@dps.state.ia.us>>, "Clark Rhonda"
<clark@dps.state.ia.us<mailto:clark@dps.state.ia.us>>, "Strouse Bryant" <strouse@dps.state.ia.us<
mailto:strouse@dps.state.ia.us>>

On 5/10/23 at 10:40 pm | was traveling home from Mason City where | had dropped off a witness who testified at GJ in
Sioux City. A deer and baby committed suicide by jumping out in front of my vehicle. | notified SAC Stouse right away.
ISP 34 came from Cedar Rapids and completed the accident report. My Durango was towed to Hogelands in
Marshalltown. | believe it will be considered totaled as the air bags did deploy. My mileage was 111432 at the time of the
collision.

| received medical attention at Unity Point in Marshalltown for my neck muscles which are impressively sore. CT of spine
and head were good. Dr prescribed some muscle relaxers to help with the recovery.

I am home and going to bed.
Matt

Rhonda,
You may be hearing from he Dr office to get the proper medical information.

https:/lma?l.google.comlmail.’b/AEoRXRSchJQwEL32rKo4x3niHbISZchyuKVB-DYSAm He471J4/u/0/?ik=fc086bf76cview=pt&search=all&permthid...  1/2



State Vehicle Damage Report
Attach this completed form to an email along with the items identified below and send
to: vehicledamage@dps.state.ia.us ; das.risk@iowa.gov
» One Repair Estimate from Approved State Bid Shop
» DOT MARS Report (if reportable)
» Memo from the Driver of the State Vehicle
» 3-4 photos of the vehicle damage
***Sworn Officers only: Complete a Line of Duty Form #432037 and send to DOT if 10-
50 was reportable!!!

STATE VEHICLE: (Mark if Act of Nature[ ]) CASE #: “°*°9'#%™

Date: 05/10/2023 Time: 10:40 pm a.m,
(Month/Day/Year) (Time plus a.m./p.m.)

Vehicle Plate #: ESS007 Vehicle Mileage: 111432
Vehlcl_e . 2016 Dodge Durango UT, VIN 1C4RDJFG6GC475425
Description:

(Yr/Make/Model/ &

Vin#)

Assigned To: Matt Anderson Badge # I-75
Driven By: Matt Anderson Badge # -75
Driver’s Lic #: 770YY0967 Damage: $ 20.000.00
Vehicle Towed: | No e Towed By: ——
(Yes / No)

Towed To: Hogeland Towing Cost: $ UNK
Seat Belt: Yes vEs Type of Vehicle: Marked
(Yes / No) (Marked/Semi /Unmarked) Unmarked
Injured/Injuries: Neck, right ankle

Occupants:

(Other than driver)

VEHICLE #2:

DL #: State:

Vehicle Lic. # State:

Driver's Name:
Driver's Address:

Owner’'s Name:
Owner’s Address:

DPS Form 32 August 2018



Owner’s Phone:

Insurance Info:
(Carrier/Policy #/Phone)

Veh Description:
(Yr/Make/Model & Vin#)

Damage: $ Seat Belt: No
(Yes / No)

Injured/Injuries:

Occupants:

(Other than driver)

Occupant(s) Wearing Seat Belt: (es/No) | Yes

OTHER INFORMATION:

Witnhesses: none

Accident Location: t-47 North of 220th Street
(Street/Hwy)

County: Tama
Weather/Road Conditions: Clear/ Dry

Narrative:

deploy.

A deer ran across the road coming from the west, running east. | was traveling south bound on
County Road T-47. | struck the deer with the left front of my vehicle causing the airbags to

Property Damage other than
Vehicles:

None

Cost:

Citations Issued To:
(List Charge(s) and Statute Code(s))

| Investigating Officer:

| Trooper Tylor Fairbanks —|

VEHICLE #3: (If needed) (For more vehicles, please make extra copies of

this portion)

DL #:

State:

Vehicle Lic. #

State:

Driver's Name:

Driver's Address:

Owner's Name:

August 2018



Owner's Address:

Owner’s Phone:

Insurance Info:
(Carrier/Policy #/Phone)

Veh Description:
(Yr/Make/Model & Vin#)

Damage:

Seat Belt:
(Yes / No)

Yes

Injured/Injuries:

Occupants:
(Other than driver)

Occupant(s) Wearing Seat Belt: (ves/No)

| Yes

August 2018



Karl Chevrolet Collision Center Ankeny
1101 Southeast Oralabor Road, Ankeny, IA 50021
Phone: (515) 299-4337, Fax: (515) 964-2293

Owner: STATE OF IOWA Insurance: STATE OF IOWA Estimator: Michael Wright Vehicle Out:

RO Number: Claim Number:

Year: 2016 Color: WHITE License Plate:  ESS007 Production Date:  6/2016
Make: DODG Body Style: 4D UTV State: 1A Mileage In: 111,423
Model: Durango Special S...  Engine: 6-3.6L Gasoline S... VIN: 1C4RDIFG6GC475425  Condition:

5/15/2023 5/15/2023
Comments: Comments:

5/15/2023 5/15/2023
Comments:; Comments:

5/15/2023 5/15/2023
Comments: Comments:

5/15/2023 2:57:34 PM Page 1
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Karl Chevrolet Collision Center Ankeny
1101 Southeast Oralabor Road, Ankeny, IA 50021
Phone: (515) 299-4337, Fax: (515) 964-2293

Owner: STATE OF IOWA Insurance: STATE OF IOWA Estimator: Michael Wright Vehicle Out:

RO Number: Claim Number:

Year: 2016 Color: WHITE License Plate: ESS007 Production Date:  6/2016
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Comments: Comments:
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Karl Chevrolet Collision Center Ankeny
1101 Southeast Oralabor Road, Ankeny, IA 50021
Phone: (515) 299-4337, Fax: (515) 964-2293

Owner: STATE OF IOWA Insurance: STATE OF IOWA Estimator: Michael Wright Vehicle Out:

RO Number: Claim Number:

Year: 2016 Color: WHITE License Plate:  ESS007 Production Date:  6/2016
Make: DODG Body Style: 4D UTV State: 1A Mileage In: 111,423
Model: Durango Special S...  Engine: 6-3.6L Gasoline S... VIN: 1C4RDIFG6GC475425 Condition:

5/15/2023 5/15/2023
Comments: Comments:
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