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May 6, 2024 

Accounting Department 
Office of the Treasurer 

Lucas Building 

321 E 12th Street 

Des Moines, IA, 50319 

The Executive Council, in a meeting held on this date, approved payment of the following cost item: 

Board of Regents - University of Northern Iowa………………....……………........$727,051.61 

On December 15, 2021, a wind storm caused damages to the roof of the Nielsen Fieldhouse and Wellness and 

Recreation Center. Request was to cover repair costs. 

This represents full and final payment. 

EXECUTIVE COUNCIL OF IOWA 

Kristi Onstot  
Acting Executive Secretary 

cc: Sarah Harms, University of Northern Iowa 

John Nash, Director of Facilities, Board of Regents 

Andrea Anania, Board of Regents 

Aimee Claeys, Board of Regents  

Matt Bender, Department of Management  

Heather Hackbarth, Department of Management  

CAPITOL BUILDING 

DES MOINES, IOWA 50319 

PHONE: 515 281-5368 

FAX: 515 281-7562 



OFFICE OF AUDITOR OF STATE  
STATE OF IOWA 

State Capitol Building 
Des Moines, Iowa 50319-0004 

Telephone (515) 281-5834      Facsimile (515) 281-6518 

Rob Sand 
Auditor of State 

April 10, 2024 

Victoria Newton 
Executive Council 
L O C A L 

Subject: Damages to Roofs of Nielsen Fieldhouse and Wellness Recreation Center due to 
Wind Storm on December 15, 2021  

University of Northern Iowa – Board of Regents 
Claim dated March 1, 2022 
AOS Claim ID: 2249 

In accordance with Executive Council policy, we have examined the invoices and 
supporting documentation for final payment related to the damages and have found the 
items to be in order as shown below: 

Documented request $   727,051.61 

Executive Council Allocation $  1,005,153.40 

Less: 
Previous payments $     278,101.79 
This payment        727,051.61 

Total $  1,005,153.40 

Remaining Executive Council allocation $  0.00 

We recommend reimbursement be made in the amount of $727,051.61. This 
represents full and final payment on this allocation. 

. 

Sincerely, 

Brian R. Brustkern, CPA 
Deputy Auditor of State 

cc: Sarah Harms, Assistant to Senior Vice President for Finance & Operations, University 
 of Northern Iowa 

 John Nash, Director of Facilities, Board of Regents 
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Newton, Victoria [TOS]

From: Sarah Harms <sarah.harms@uni.edu>
Sent: Friday, March 22, 2024 3:41 PM
To: Hollingsworth, Tammy [AOS]
Cc: ExecutiveCouncil [TOS]
Subject: Re: Final Report: 12-15-21 Wind Storm

Tammy -  
I think I have a simple explanation, but it can also sound confusing!  When the storm came through and damaged the 
roof, only parts of the roof were damaged (roof 3 and 12b).  However, once the work began we decided to repair more 
of the roof.  So the invoices I submitted are just for the roof areas related to the wind damage.  ISG and Black Hawk Roof 
did additional work on the WRC at the same time and therefore submitted other invoices that aren't related to the 
claim.  Also, these two vendors assisted with the roof repair for Nielsen Fieldhouse, which was also damaged by the 
wind storm.  That part of the 29c20 claim has already been processed (which was submission #1 of this claim).  I hope 
that helps but if you need anything else, or would prefer a call/zoom let me know. 
 
Thanks - and have a good weekend, 
Sarah 
 
 
On Wed, Mar 20, 2024 at 9:03 AM Tammy Hollingsworth <Tammy.Hollingsworth@aos.iowa.gov> wrote: 

Sarah, 

I have a couple of questions regarding this request. 

  

1. For the I&S Group claims, total request of $66,200.00.  When looking at the support, I noticed the following.  For 
invoice #90293, the prior billed amount is $63,900, but according to the payments the total paid has only been 
$56,400.  For invoice #98539, the prior billed amount is $70,200, but according to the payments the total paid 
has only been $61,400.  I’m wondering if there are some invoices missing from the request?  Or is it possible 
that the prior billed amounts per the vendor invoices are incorrect?  The total contract is for $75,000, with only 
$66,200 in payments, a difference of $8,800, which is the difference on the last invoice between the prior billed 
amount and payments noted. 

2. For the Black Hawk Roof Co, Inc invoices, why are we starting with application #3?  Do the previous payments oF 
$1,491,049.98 not qualify for 29C.20 reimbursement? 

  

Tammy 

  

From: Sarah Harms <sarah.harms@uni.edu>  
Sent: Friday, March 1, 2024 4:25 PM 
To: Nash, John C [BOARD] <john.nash@iowaregents.edu>; ExecutiveCouncil [TOS] <ExecutiveCouncil@tos.iowa.gov>; 
Tammy Hollingsworth <Tammy.Hollingsworth@AOS.IOWA.GOV> 
Subject: Final Report: 12-15-21 Wind Storm 
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CAUTION: This email originated from outside of AOS. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the 
sender and know the content is safe. 

Good Morning -  
Please see the attached final report regarding damage due to a wind storm on UNI's campus on Dec. 15, 2021.  This 
relates to AOS Claim 2249. 
 
Thank you, 
Sarah 

 
 

  

--  

Sarah Harms 
Assistant to the Senior Vice President 

  

University of Northern Iowa 
Office of the Senior Vice President for Finance & Operations 
319-273-2382 
122 LANG HALL  /  Cedar Falls, IA 50614-0003 
uni.edu 

 
To help protect you r priv acy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.
UNI / University of Northern Iowa

 

 
 
 

 

This email message and its attachments may contain confidential information that is exempt from disclosure under Iowa Code chapters 22, 139A, and other 
applicable law. Confidential information is for the sole use of the intended recipient. If you believe that you have received this transmission in error, please 
reply to the sender, and then delete all copies of this message and any attachments. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any 
review, use, retention, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this message may be prohibited by law.  

Auditor.Iowa.Gov  
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--  
Sarah Harms 
Assistant to the Senior Vice President 
 
University of Northern Iowa 
Office of the Senior Vice President for Finance & Operations 
319-273-2382 
122 LANG HALL  /  Cedar Falls, IA 50614-0003 
uni.edu 
 

To help protect you r priv acy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.
UNI / University of Northern Iowa
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