SVP Invoices - SFY 2022 (07/12/22)

Date Paid by Approval
Vendor Description Amount Executive
Received . Date
Council

7/5/22 Rachel Xahn, Ph.D. Triak Testimany Compton $2,400.00

/1122 Barry M. Leavitt, Psy.D, Final Evaluation Patterson $4,000.00

7/5/22 Rachel Kahn, Ph.D. Final Evaluation Compton $800.00

6/27/22 David Thoernton, Ph.D. Initial Evaluation Wiese $3,200.00

6/17/22 leffrey Davis, Ph.D. Record Review/Report Preparation Ihlenfeldt $3,200.00

6/20/22 William A Schmitt Ph.D. Final Evaluation Seely $4,000.00

7/10/22  william A Schmitt Ph.D. tnitial Eval/Preliminary Report Steele $3,200.00

7/7/22  william A Schmitt Ph.D. final Eval and report Robinson $4,000.00

7/10/22  William A Schmitt Ph.D, initial Repart/Prelim Report Carmer $3,200.00

$28,000.00 $0.00




Rachel Kahn. Ph.D.

P.0. Box 6491

Monoena, WI 53716-0491
USA

Phone: 608-620-3067

To:

Towa Office of the Attorney General
¢/o Olivia McAtee

Area Prosecutions Division

Hoover Building

1305 E. Walnut Street

Des Moines, IA 50319

YCI

DATE: JUNE 30, 2022

Description Amount
Trial Testimony: Marcel Steven Compton $2400
Engagement Letter; 02/23/2022

Trial Date: 06/28/2022

Total $2,400

Payment should made out to Rachel Kahn and mailed to Rache! Kahn, P.C. Box 6491, Monona, WI 53716~

0491
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Rachel Kahn, Ph.D.”
Licensed Psychologist
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Palmer, Tina

L 000 A
From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]
Sent: Tuesday, July 5, 2022 10:17 AM
To: McAtee, Olivia; Palmer, Tina
Subject: RE: invoice MC trial

Approved

SCOTT

Please note new email address: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov

5 Scott D. Brown

Special Assistant Attorney General/Area Prosecutions Division
Office of the Attorney General of lowa

1305 E. Walnut St.

Des Moines, |1A 50319

Main: (515) 281-5164 | Division: (515) 281-3648 | Direct: (515) 281-6691 | Fax: (515) 281-8894
Email: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov | www.iowaattorneygeneral.gov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email message (including any attachments) may be confidential or
protected by one or more of the following: the attorney-client privilege, attorney work product doctrine, or
applicable laws. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this message in error, please: (1) do not
read, print, copy, distribute or use it in any way; (2) permanently delete or destroy the message (including any
attachments); and (3) notify the sender immediately by reply email or telephone. Any unintended transmission
of this email message does not constitute a waiver of any applicable privilege or protection. Thank you.

From: McAtee, Olivia <QOlivia.Mcatee @ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Friday, July 1, 2022 2:35 PM

To: Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>; Palmer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: invoice MC trial

Please see the attached invoice. Thank you!

From: Rachel Kahn <rachel kahn@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, June 30, 2022 3:13 PM

To: McAtee, Olivia <Qlivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: invoice MC trial

Hi QOlivia,
Here is the invoice for the MC trial. Let me know if you have any questions.

Talk soon,




Barry M. Leavitt, Psy.D.

Barry M. Leavitt, Psy.D. & Associates, LLC
1500 Skokie Boulevard, Suite 315
Northbrook, IL 60062
(847) 849-555%

Fax: (847) 849-5554
banymieavitt@comcast.net

INVOICE FOR FORENSIC PSYCHOLOGICAL SERVICES

Date: June 30, 2022 |

For Professional Services: Barry M. Leavitt, Psy. DD, Fee:
RE: Dewayne Patterson

1aDOCH 6040396
05/30/2022 Final Evaluation $4000.00.
Total: | $4,000.00
Please make checks payable to:
Dr, Barry M. Leavitt

Barry M. Leavitt, Psy. D. and Associates, LLC

(P-4 o) Cfsopoa.

Baﬁ"y M. Leavitt, Psy. D.” Date
Illinois Licensed Psychologist

Illinois Licensed Sex Offender Evaluator

Ilinois Licensed Sex Offender Treatment Provider
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Palmer, Tina

. N L i M M
From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]

Sent: Friday, July 1, 2022 1:40 PM

To: McAtee, Olivia; Palmer, Tina

Subject: RE: Patterson, Dewayne Evaluation and Invoice

Approved

Scott

Seat from my Verizon, Samsung Galaxy smartphone

-------- Original message --------

From: "McAtee, Olivia” <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.ijowa.gov>

Date: 7/1/22 12:57 PM (GMT-06:00)

To: "Palmer, Tina" <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>, "Brown, ScottAG [AG]" <Scott. Brown{@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: Patterson, Dewayne Evaluation and Invoice

Please see the attached invoice. Thank you!

From: Barry Leavitt <barrymleavitt@comcast.net>
Sent: Wednesday, June 29, 2022 7:54 PM

To: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: Patterson, Dewayne Evaluation and Invoice

Hi Olivia,

[ hope you are enjoying your summer. | have attached the evaluation for Dewayne Patterson, along
with my signature page and invoice.

| also want to be sure you have received the original new contract for 2022/23 that | sighed and
mailed back to you last week. Please let me know you have received this and the Patterson
attachments | listed above.

Best regards,
Barry




Rachel Kahn. Ph.D.

P.O. Box 6491

Monona, WI 53716-0451
USA

Phone: 608-620-3067

To:

Iowa Office of the Attorney General
¢fo Olivia McAtee

Area Prosecutions Division

Hoover Building

1305 E. Walnut Street

Des Moines, TA 50319

INVOICE

BDATE: JUNE 10, 2022

Description Amount
Final Evaluation on Marcel Steven Compton $4,000.00
Engagement Letter: 02/23/2022

Report Date: 06/07/2022

Total $3,200.00

Payment should made out to Rachel Kahn and mailed to Rachel Kahn, P.O. Box 6491, Monona, WI 53716-

0491

W

Rachel Kahn, Ph.D.
Licensed Psychologist
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Palmer, Tina
E

. I -
From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]
Sent: Tuesday, July 5, 2022 1:21 PM
To: ivicAtee, Olivia; Palmer, Tina
Subject: RE: MC Final
Approved.
SCOTT

Please note new email address: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov

Scott D. Brown

Special Assistant Attorney General/Area Prosecutions Division
Office of the Attorney General of lowa

1305 E, Walnut St

Des Moines, IA 50319

Main: (515) 281-5164 | Division: (515) 281-3648 | Direct: (515) 281-6691 | Fax: (515) 281-8894
Email: scott.brown{@ag.iowa.qov | www.iowaatiorneygeneral.qov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email message (including any attachments) may be confidential or
protected by one or more of the following: the attorney-client privilege, attorney work product doctrine, or
applicable laws. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this message in error, please: (1) do not
read, print, copy, distribute or use it in any way; (2) permanently delete or destroy the message (including any
attachments); and (3) notify the sender immediately by reply email or telephone, Any unintended transmission
of this email message does not constitute a waiver of any applicable privilege or protection. Thank you.

From: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, July 5, 2022 11:04 AM

To: Palmer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>; Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: MC Final

I apologize for missing this!
Can we please get that extra $800 paid to Dr. Kahn? | don’t know if I've ever had this happen before so if there’s a
different protocol please let me know and I'll let Dr. Kahn know.

Thank youl
Olivia

From: Rachel Kahn <rachel.kahn@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, July 1, 2022 4:36 PM

To: McAtee, Olivia <Clivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: Fwd: MC Final

Hi Olivia,



David Thornton, Ph.D.

4230 East Towne Bivd #115

Madison
WI 53704
USA
Phone 608-698-8406 DATE: JUNE 26, 2022
For the Attention of: Olivia McAtee, Office of the Attorney General of Iowa
Description Amount

Initial Evaluation and Preliminary Report on Dominick Wiese and | $3,200.00
summarize findings to PRC 06/17/2022)

Total $3,200.00

Payment should be by check made out to David Thornton and mailed to David Thornton, 4230 East Towne
Blvd #115, Madison WI 53704
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Palmer, Tina

From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]

Sent: Monday, June 27, 2022 11:28 AM

To: McAtee, Olivia; Palmer, Tina

Subject: RE: Invoice re Preliminary Examination of Dominick Wiese
Approved

SCOTT

Please note new email address: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov

5 Scott D. Brown

Special Assistant Attorney GeneralfArea Prosecutions Division
Office of the Attorney General of lowa

1305 E. Walnut St.

Des Moines, |A 50319

Main: (515) 281-5164 | Division: (515) 281-3648 | Direct: (515) 281-6691 | Fax: (515) 281-8894
Email: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov | www.iowaatiorneygenerat.qov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email message (including any attachments) may be confidential or
protected by one or more of the following: the attorney-client privilege, attorney work product doctrine, or
applicable laws, If you are not the intended recipient or have received this message in error, please: (1) do not
read, print, copy, distribute or use it in any way; (2) permanently delete or destroy the message (including any
attachments); and (3) notify the sender immediately by reply email or telephone. Any unintended transmission
of this email message does not constitute a waiver of any applicable privilege or protection. Thank you.

From: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Monday, June 27,2022 11:27 AM

To: Palmer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>; Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: Invoice re Preliminary Examination of Dominick Wiese

Please see the attached invoice. Thank you!

From: David Thornton <davidsmthornton®@icloud.com>

Sent: Sunday, June 26, 2022 8:40 AM

To: McAtee, Olivia <QOlivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>

Subject: Invoice re Preliminary Examination of Dominick Wiese

Hi QOlivia
Here is my invoice for my preliminary report on Mr. Wiese,

David



Jeffrey Davis, Ph.D.

Licensed Psychologist  lowa License #083838 # California License #PSY 19044
P.O. Box 6243 ¢ Los Osos, CA 93412 « 805-748-5081
jeffreydavisphd@gmail.com

June 17, 2022

Olivia McAtee, [nvestigator |
lowa Attorney General’s Office
1305 E. Walnut

Des Moines, 1A 50319

Respondent: Ihlenfeldt, Nicholas Tyler
DCl No.: 6799103

Dear Ms. McAlee,

Below is the invoice for the preliminary evaluation of Nicholas Ihlenfeldt to lowa
Code § 229A. Please remit to the address shown above.

Activity Report Date Total

Record Review/Report Preparation June 15, 2022 $3,200

Please do not hesitate to contact me if you have questions.

Respectiully,

L %HJ)
Jeffrey Davis, Ph.D, 7 iy
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Palmer, Tina

RN RN
From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]
Sent: Friday, June 17, 2022 10:21 PM
To: McAtea, Olivia; Palmer, Tina
Subject: RE: invoice for Prelim Eval of Mr. .
Approved
Scott

Sent from my Verizon, Samsung Galaxy smartphone

-------- Original message --------

From: "McAtee, Olivia" <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>

Date: 6/17/22 2:06 PM (GMT-06:00)

To: "Palmer, Tina" <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>, "Brown, ScottAG [AG]" <Scott. Brown{@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: Invoice for Prelim Eval of Mr. L.

Please see the attached invoice. Thank you!

From: Jeff Davis <jeffreydavisphd @gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, June 17, 2022 10:56 AM

To: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee @ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: Invoice for Prelim Eval of Mr. 1.

Hi Olivia,

Here's the invoice for the eval for today’s PRC.
Thanks,

Jeff

Jeffrey Davis, Ph.D.
Licensed Psychologist

CONFIDENTIALLY NOTICE: This message, and any attachments, may contain information that is confidential, privileged, and/or protected from
disclosure under state and federal laws that deal with privacy and security of information, If you receive this message in error or through
inappropriate means, please reply to this message to notify the sender that the message was received by you in error, and then permanently delete this
message from all storage media, without forwarding or retaining a copy. Thank you.




William A. Schmitt, Ph.D., LLC
Licensed Clinical Psychologist

PO Box 930376
Verona, W1 53593
(608) 698-2713
wschmitt55@gmail.com

INVOICE
Final Evaluation for lowa §229A

Re: Michael Seely
DOB: March 29, 1992

Evaluator: William A. Schmitt, PhDD
Date: June 20, 2022

Final Evaluation and Report was completed and submitted June 20, 2022.

Contracted fee for services rendered: $4000.00

Thank you for this interesting referral.
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Palmer, Tina

From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]

Sent: Monday, June 20, 2022 2:32 PM
To: McAtee, Olivia; Palmer, Tina
Subject: RE: Schmitt invoice
Approved

SCOTT

Please note new email address: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov

L -' Scoti D. Brown

Special Assistan{ Attorney General/Area Prosecutions Division
Office of the Attorney General of lowa

1305 E. Walnut SL

Des Moines, IA 50319

Main: (515) 281-5164 | Division: (515) 281-3648 | Direct: (5158) 281-6691 | Fax: (515) 281.8854
Email: scott.brown@an.iowa.gov | www.iowaattorneygeneral.gov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email message (including any attachments) may be confidential or
protected by one or more of the following: the attorney-client privilege, attorney work product doctrine, or
applicable laws. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this message in error, please: (1) do not
read, print, copy, distribute or use it in any way; (2) permanently delete or destroy the message (including any
attachments); and (3) notify the sender immediately by reply email or telephone. Any unintended transmission
of this email message does not constitute a waiver of any applicable privilege or protection. Thank you.

From: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>
Sent: Monday, June 20, 2022 9:01 AM

To: Palmer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>; Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown(@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: Schmitt invoice

Please see the inveice attached. Thank you!

QOlivia McAtee

. Investigator |
W% Office of the Attorney General of lowa
e 1305 £. Walnut St,
& Des Moines, lowa 50319
Main: (515) 281-5164 | Division; {515) 281-3648 | Direcl: (515) 281-6566
Email: glivia.mcatee@ag. iowa.qov | www.iowaailornevgeneral.gov




William A. Schmitt, Ph.D., LLC

Licensed Psychologist

PO Box 930376
Verona, WI 53593
(608) 698-2713
wschmitt55@gmail.com

INVOICE

Preliminary Evaluation for lowa §229A

Re: Micheal Steele
DOB: June 26, 1998

Evaluator: William A. Schmitt, PhD
Date: May 16, 2022

e Initial Evaluation/Preliminary Report was completed and submitted May 16, 2022.

Contracted fee for services rendered: $3200.

Thank you for this interesting referral.

lASLLig 5>

William A. Schmitt, Ph.D.
Licensed Psychologist
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Palmer, Tina

A R N .
From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]
Sent: Sunday, July 10, 2022 5:24 PM
To: McAtee, Olivia; Palmer, Tina
Subject: RE: Dr. Schmitt invoice

Approved

Scott

Seat from my Verizen, Samsung Galaxy smartphone

-------- Original message --------

From: "McAtee, Olivia" <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>

Date: 7/10/22 4:26 PM (GMT-06:00)

To: "Brown, ScottAG {AG]" <Scott.Brown(@ag.iowa.gov>, "Palmer, Tina" <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: Dr, Schmitt invoice

Hi Scott and Tina,

i don't believe the attached invoice was ever approved and therefore has not yet been paid out. Dr. Schmitt emailed me
on Friday asking about the status of this payment.

Thank you,
Olivia

From: McAtee, Olivia

Sent: Monday, May 16, 2022 5:45 PM

To: Palmer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>; Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: Dr. Schmitt invoice

Please see the attached invoice. Thank you both!

Olivia NcAtee

%, Investigator I

& Office of the Attorney General of lowa

‘W 1305 E. Walnut St.
#d° Des Moines, lowa 50319

b Main: (515) 281-5164 | Division: (515) 281-3648 | Direct: (515) 281-6566
Emait: olivia.mcatee@ag.iowa.gov | www.iowaatlornavgeneral. gov




William A. Schmitt, Ph.D., LLC
Licensed Psychologist

PO Box 930376
Verona, WI 53593
(608) 698-2713
wschmitt55@gmail.com

INVOICE

Final Evaluation for Iowa §229A

Re: Marques Robinson
DOB: June 3, 1985

Evaluator: William A. Schmitt, PhD

Date: July 6, 2022

Final Evaluation and Report was completed and submitted July 6, 2022.

Contracted fee for services rendered:

Thank you for this interesting referral,

lhASL i

William A. Schmitt, Ph.D.
Licensed Psychologist

$40090.00
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Palmer, Tina

0000000000000 R I
From: Brown, ScottAG {AG]
Sent: Thursday, July 7, 2022 12:34 PM
To: McAtee, Clivia; Palmer, Tina
Subject: RE: Final Report

Approved

SCOTT

Please note new email address: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov

- Scott D. Brown

Special Assistant Attorney General/Area Prosecutions Division
Office of the Attorney General of lowa

1305 E. Walnut St.

Des Moines, 1A 50319

Main: (515) 281-5164 | Division: (515) 281-3648 | Direct: {515) 281-6691 | Fax: (515) 281-8894
Email: scott.brown{@ag.iowa.gov | www.icwaattorneygeneral.qov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email message (including any attachments) may be confidential or
protected by one or more of the following: the attorney-client privilege, attorney work product doctrine, or
applicable laws. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this message in error, please: (1) do not
read, print, copy, distribute or use it in any way; (2) permanently delete or destroy the message (including any
attachments); and (3) notify the sender immediately by reply email or telephone. Any unintended transmission
of this email message does not constitute a waiver of any applicable privilege or protection. Thank you.

From: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Thursday, July 7, 2022 11:51 AM

To: Palmer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>; Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: Final Report

Please see the attached invoice. Thank you both!

From: Bill Schmitt <wschmiti55 @gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, July 6, 2022 4:31 PM

To: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: Final Report

Re: Marques Robinson.
He continues to be a 'YES' for me.

Attached are the final report, Static-99R and Invoice.




William A. Schmitt, Ph.D., LL.C
Licensed Psychologist

PO Box 930376
Verona, W1 53593

(608) 698-2713
wschmitt35@gmail.com

INVOICE

Preliminary Evaluation for lowa §229A
Re: Scotty Carmer
DOB: August 7, 1987

Evaluator: William A. Schmitt, PhD
Date: July 8,2022
o Initial Evaluation/Preliminary Report was completed and submitted July 8, 2022.
Contracted fee for services rendered: $3200,
Thank you for this interesting referral.

wwm&ﬁw\'vb

William A. Schmitt, Ph.D.
Licensed Psychologist
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Palimer, Tina

00 L - TR
From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]

Sent: Sunday, July 10, 2022 5:24 PM

To: MicAtee, Olivia; Palmer, Tina

Subject: RE: Dr. William Schmitt invoice for Scotty Carmer prelim

Approved

Scott

Sent from my Verizon, Samsung Galaxy smartphone

———————— Original message ~-=-----
From: "McAtee, Olivia" <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>
Date: 7/10/22 4:23 PM (GMT-06:00)

To: "Palmer, Tina" <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>, "Brown, ScottAG [AG]" <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: Dr. William Schmitt invoice for Scotty Carmer prelim

Hi Tina and Scott, please see the attached invoice. Thank youl

Olivia McAtee

y Investigator

s Office of the Attorney General of lowa

i 1305 E. Walnut St.

4 Des Moines, lowa 50319

' Main: (515) 281-5164 | Division: (515) 281-3648 | Direct: (515} 281-6566
Email: glivia.mcatee@ag.iowa.gov | www.iowaattorneygeneral.gav




