SVP Invoices - SFY 2023 (11/30/22)

Date Paid by Approval
) Vendot Description Amount Executive
Received X Date
Council
11/15/22 Barry M Leavitt Psy.D. Preliminary Evaluation - Porter $3,200.00
11/15/22 William A Schmitt, Ph.D. Initial Eval/Preliminary Report - Chamberlin $3,200.00
11/18/22 leffrey Davis, Ph.D. Preliminary Evaluation - Green $3,200.00
11/18/22 william A Schmitt, Ph.D. Commitment trial - Manning $2,400.00
11/21/22 David Thornton, Ph.D. Interview/Final Report/Testimony - Majerus $6,400.00
$18,400.00 $0.00




Barry M. Leavitt. Psy.D.

Barry M. Leavitt, Psy.D. & Associates, LLC
1500 Skokie bo.u[cvard, Suite 35
Northbrook, Il. 60062
(847) 849-5553%

Fax: (847) 849-5554

barru mleavittecomcast.net

INVOICE FOR FORENSIC PSYCHOLOGICAL SERVICES

Date: November 12, 2022J

For Professional Services: Barry M. Leavitt Psy.D. Fees:
Re: Ronald Stanley Porter JaDOC #0035730

11/12/2022 Preliminary Evaluation e $3,200.00

Total: | $3,200.00

Please make checks payable to:
Dr: Barry M. Leavitt
Barry M. Leavitt, Psy.D. and Associates, LLC
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Barry M, Leavitt, Psy.D. Date
[llinois Licensed Psychologist

llinois Licensed Sex Offender Evaluator

Hlinois Licetised Sex Offender Treatment Provider
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Palmer, Tina

From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]

Sent: Tuesday, November 15, 2022 1:54 PM
To: McAtee, Olivia; Palmer, Tina

Subject: RE: Ronald Porter

Approved

SCOTT

Please note new email address; scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov

Scott D. Brown

Special Assistant Attorney General/Area Prosecutions Division
Office of the Attorney General of lowa

1305 £. Walnut St.

Des Moines, |A 50319

Main: (515) 281-5164 | Division: (515) 281-3648 | Direct: (515) 281-6691 | Fax: (515) 261-8894
Email: scott.brown@ag.iowa.qgov | www.iowaattorneygenaral.gov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email message (including any attachments) may be confidential or
protected by one or more of the following: the attorney-client privilege, attorney work product doctrine, or
applicable laws. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this message in error, please: (1) do not
read, print, copy, distribute or use it in any way; (2) permanently delete or destroy the message (including any
attachments); and (3) notify the sender immediately by reply email or telephone. Any unintended transmission
of this email message does not constitute a waiver of any applicable privilege or protection. Thank you.

From: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, November 15, 2022 1:32 PM

To: Palmer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>; Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: Ronald Porter

Hi, please see the attached invoice. Thank you!

From: Barry Leavitt <barrymleavitt@comcast.net>
Sent: Monday, November 14, 2022 4:05 PM

To: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa,gov>
Subject: Ronald Porter

Hi Olivia,

[ hope you had an enjoyable weekend. | have attached the Preliminary Eval for Ronald Porter, along
with my signature page and invoice. | would appreciate you letfing me know you have received this.

| look forward to discussing this case at the Friday morning PRC meeting.

3




Re:
DOB:

Evaluator:
Date:

William A. Schmitt, Ph.D., LLC
Licensed Psychologist

PO Box 930376

Verona, W1 53593

(608) 698-2713

wschmift55@gmail.com

INVOICE

Preliminary Evaluation for Iowa §229A

Stanley Chamberlin

William A. Schmitt, PhD
November 15, 2022
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» Initial Evaluation/Preliminary Report was completed and submitted November 15, 2022.

Contracted fee for services rendered: $3200.

Thank you for this interesting referral.

ihASS L ig DD

William A. Schmitt, Ph.D.
Licensed Psychologist




Palmer, Tina

004 I 0 AR
From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]
Sent: Tuesday, November 15, 2022 10:31 PM
To: McAtee, Olivia; Palmer, Tina
Subject: Re: Schmitt invoice - Chamberlin prelim
Approved.
Scott
Get Qutlook for Android

From: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, November 15, 2022 9:51:55 PM

To: Palmer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>; Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: Schmitt invoice - Chamberlin prelim

Hi, please see the attached invoice. Thank you!

Olivia McAtee

. Investigator Il
Office of the Attorney General of lowa
£ 1305 £, Walnut St.
* Des Moines, lowa 50319
Main: (515) 281-5164 | Division: (515) 281-3648 | Direct: (615) 281-6566
Email: olivia. mcatee@aq.iowa.gov | www.iowaattorneygeneral.gov




Jeffrey Davis, Ph.D.

Licensed Psychologist » lowa License #083838 e California License #P5Y 19044
P.0O. Box 6243 e Los Osos, CA 93412 « 805-748-5081

Jeffreydavisphd@gmail.com

November 18, 2022

Olivia McAtee, Investigator il
lowa Attorney General’s Office
1305 E. Walnut

Des Moines, |A 50319

Dear Ms. McAtee,

Below is the invoice for the preliminary evaluation of Kenneth D. Green pursuant to
lowa Code § 229A. Please remit to the address shown above.

Approved By j{F y

Date_

Ciags

Respondent: Kenneth D. Green

DCI No.: 6926284

Activity

Report Date

Total

Record Review/Report Preparation

11-16-22

$3,200

Please do not hesitate to contact me if you have questions.

Respectfully,

Jte PP

Jeffrey Davis, Ph.D.
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Palmer, Tina

M

From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]

Sent: Friday, November 18, 2022 3:55 PM
To: McAtee, Olivia; Palmer, Tina
Subject: RE: Invoice far eval

Approved

SCOTT

Please note new email address: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov

} B scott D. Brown

Special Assistant Attorney General/Area Prosecutions Division
Office of the Attorney General of lowa

1305 E. Walnut St

Des Moines, |1A 50319

Main: (515) 281-5164 | Division: (515) 281-3648 | Direct: (515) 281-6691 | Fax: (515) 281-8894
Email: scott.brown@ag.lowa.qov | www.iowaattorneygeneral.goy

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email message (including any attachments) may be confidential or
protected by one or more of the following: the attorney-client privilege, attorney work product doctrine, or
applicable laws. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this message in error, please: (1) do not
read, print, copy, distribute or use it in any way; (2) permanently delete or destroy the message (including any
attachments); and (3) notify the sender immediately by reply email or telephone. Any unintended transmission
of this email message does not constitute a waiver of any applicable privilege or protection. Thank you.

From: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee @ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Friday, November 18, 2022 3:52 PM

To: Palmer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>; Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: Invoice for eval

Hi, please see the attached invoice. Thank you!

From: Jeff Davis <jeffreydavisphd @gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, November 18, 2022 3:45 PM

To: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: [nvoice for eval

Hi Olivia,

Please find attached the invoice for the prelim evaluation of Mr. K. Green.
Thanks

Jeff




William A. Schmitt, Ph.D., LLC
Licensed Psychologist

PO Box 930376
Verona, W153593
(608) 698-2713
wschmitt55@gmail.com

INVOICE
Towa §229A Commitment Trial
Name: Lawrence Manning Apg}rwe@_j{/ /73 f[j{;//’?igz/i
DOB: April 28, 1970 Date /{30003 et Vi 7, ,
Evaluator: William A. Schmitt, PhD reency_ SVUP Expense = Wanniy (7
Date: November 17, 2022 Ctass Obj Qry
OOCH3N01 315

Commitment trial occurred on November 17, 2022

Contracted fee for services rendered: $2400.00

Total = $2400
Thank you for this interesting referral.

lASL i >

William A. Schmitt, Ph.D.
Licensed Psychologist



Palmer, Tina

W

From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]

Sent: Friday, November 18, 2022 3:55 PM
To: McAtee, Olivia; Palmer, Tina

Cc: Cretsinger, Keisha [AG)

Subject: RE; Trial invoice

| would approve this. If Schmitt put in the time to be ready and made the trip and at the
last minute the respondent admitted we are obligated to pay him.

SCOTT

Please note new email address: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov

§ Scott D. Brown

Special Assistant Attorney General/Area Prosecutions Division
Office of the Attorney General of lowa

1305 E. Walnut St.

Des Moines, 1A 50315

Main: (515) 281-5164 | Division: (515) 281-3648 | Direct: {515) 281-6691 | Fax: (515) 281-8394
Email: scott.browni@aa.jowa qov | www.iowaatiorneygeneral.gov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email message (including any attachments) may be confidential or
protected by one or more of the following: the attorney-client privilege, attorney work product doctrine, or
applicable laws. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this message in error, please: (1) do not
read, print, copy, distribute or use it in any way; (2) permanently delete or destroy the message (including any
attachments); and (3) notify the sender immediately by reply email or telephone. Any unintended transmission
of this email message does not constitute a waiver of any applicable privilege or protection. Thank you.

From: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee @ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Friday, November 18, 2022 12:42 P

To: Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>; Palmer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>
Cc: Cretsinger, Keisha {AG] <Keisha.Cretsinger@ag.iowa.gov>

Subject: FW: Trial invoice

Hi Scott and Tina,

Please see the attached invoice and the below email. Manning decided to stipulate to go to CCUSO but he did so at the
very last minute, on the day of his trial. So we still had Dr. Schmitt ready to testify. | don’t know that we have ever had
that happen since I've been here so I'm not sure if there is a different protocol to get Dr. Schmitt paid. Please let me
know.

Thank you!
Olivia




David Thornton, Ph.D. INVOICE

4230 East Towne Blvd #115

Madison
WI 53704
USA
Phone 608-698-8406 DATE: NOVEMBER 20, 2022
For the Attention of: Olivia McAtee, Office of the Attorney General of Jowa
Description Amount
Interview and final report on Majerus $4,000.00
Testimony re Majerus $2,400.00
Total $6,400.00

Payment should be by check made out to David Thornton and mailed to David Thornton, 4230 East Towne
Blvd #115, Madison WI 53704
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Palmer, Tina

M

From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]

Sent: Monday, November 21, 2022 8:56 AM
To: McAtee, Olivia; Palmer, Tina

Subject: RE: Majerus

Approved

SCOTT

Please note new email address: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov

Scott D. Brown

Special Assistant Attorney General/Area Prosecutions Division Office of the Attorney General of lowa
1305 E. Walnut 5t.

Des Moines, 1A 50315

Main: (515) 281-5164 | Division: {515} 281-3648 | Direct: (515) 281-6691 | Fax; {515) 281-8894
Email: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov | www.ilowaattorneygeneral.gov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email message (including any attachments) may be confidential or protected by one or
more of the following: the attorney-client privilege, attorney work product doctrine, or applicable laws. if you are not
the intended recipient or have received this message in error, please: {1} do not read, print, copy, distribute or use it in
any way; (2) permanently defete or destroy the message (including any attachments); and (3) notify the sender
immediately by reply email or telephone. Any unintended transmission of this email message does not constitute a
waiver of any applicable privilege or protection. Thank you.

From: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee @ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Monday, November 21, 2022 8:50 AM

To: Palmer, Tina <Tina.Paimer@ag.iowa.gov>; Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: Majerus

Good morning,

Please see the attached invoice. Thank you!

----- Original Message-—-

From: David Thornton <davidsmthornton@icloud.com>

Sent: Sunday, November 20, 2022 12:38 PM

To: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>

Subject: Re: Majerus

Hi Olivia

Please find attached my invoice for the Interview, final report and testimony re Majerus.

David




