Department of Govemnor Kim Reynolds
B Administrative Services Lt. Govemor Adam Gregg

Empowering People
Collaboration
Customer Service

Adam Steen, Director

Date: September 8, 2022

To: Tammy Hollingsworth, Auditor of State
Victoria Newton, Treasurer of State
Executive Council

From: Mariah Flowers, Fleet Manager
DAS Fleet Services

Department of Administrative Services

Re: ALLOCATION REQUEST - 29C20 Claim for Executive Council Consideration

Vehicle / Event | #414/Wind
December 7, 2021
Event Date
Summary Vehicle #414 sustained wind damage. (230690)
Amount $2,041.60 - Estimate
Requested
Supporting 29C20 Email Notification, Accident Report, Repair Estimate(s), Photos
Documentation

If you have any questions or are in need of additional information, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Thank yo
|

Mariah Flowers, Fleet Manager
DAS Fleet Services

Mariah. Flowers@iowa.gov
515-414-6582

Hoover State Office Building | 1305 East Walnut Street | Des Moines, IA50319 | (515) 281-5360 | http://das.iowa.gov



9/8/22, 11:49 AM State of lowa Mail - Fwd: FW: Vehicle damage to driver's door 12/07/2021

Risk, DAS <das.risk@iowa.gov>

Fwd: FW: Vehicle damage to driver's door 12/07/2021

1 message

Risk, DAS <das.risk@iowa.gov> Tue, Dec 21, 2021 at 10:09 AM
To: Electronic Claims <eclaims@creativerisksolutions.com>

Vehicle 414
Agency 595

All accident reports and estimates are due within 72 hours of an accident. Agencies have 60 days to complete
repairs to vehicles once approval is given.

Thank you,

DAS Fleet Services, Risk

lowa Department of Administrative Services
Division of Business and Property Services

Department of
4 Administrative Services

Empowering People

Coltaboration Office: 515-725-2243
Customer Service DaS.RiSk@iOWG.gOV

https://das.iowa.gov

---------- Forwarded message -------—

From: Adams Jeannie <jadams@dps.state.ia.us>

Date: Wed, Dec 8, 2021 at 2:15 PM

Subject: FW: Vehicle damage to driver's door 12/07/2021

To: Tammy.Hollingsworth@auditor.state.ia.us <Tammy.Hollingsworth@auditor.state.ia.us>,
executivecouncil@tos.iowa.gov <executivecouncil@tos.iowa.gov>

Cc: DAS.Risk@iowa.gov <DAS.Risk@iowa.gov>

Good afternoon

We were notified today that while 414 was out on patrol the wind caught his door and sprung the hinges.

The pictures and SVD report are attached. An estimate will be forthcoming. We will supply more information as it comes
in.

Thank you

Jeannie Adams
ISP Fleet & Supply, Fleet Asset Manager

Department of Public Safety

30 N.E. 48" Place
https://mail.google.com/mail/b/AMmrJ40JkZ4uojBLGgxXOkMITMycmw7Ngq86z6nJggilTzO7JRG_/u/0/?ik=fc086bf76c&view=pt&search=all&permthid=... 1/3



9/8/22, 11:49 AM State of lowa Mail - Fwd: FW: Vehicle damage to driver's door 12/07/2021
Des Moines, Iowa 50313

Direct #: 515-725-0643
Cell Phone: 515-204-3019
Shop: 515-281-3277

Fax: 515-242-6321

Email: jadams@dps.state.ia.us

From: Jalas Dean <jalas@dps.state.ia.us>

Sent: Wednesday, December 8, 2021 9:52 AM

To: Guill Bryan <guill@dps.state.ia.us>; Adams Jeannie <jadams@dps.state.ia.us>

Cc: Jalas Dean <jalas@dps.state.ia.us>; Morey Russell <morey@dps.state.ia.us>; Andreasen Jeremy
<andrease@dps.state.ia.us>; Dolf Ryan <dolf@dps.state.ia.us>

Subject: FW: Vehicle damage to driver's door 12/07/2021

Lt. Guill and Jeannie,

Here is the notification of an act of nature damage to a patrol car last evening. Damage report will follow.

Thanks, Dean

From: Morey Russell <morey@dps.state.ia.us>

Sent: Wednesday, December 08, 2021 9:47 AM

To: Jalas Dean <jalas@dps.state.ia.us>

Cc: Andreasen Jeremy <andrease@dps.state.ia.us>; Dolf Ryan <dolf@dps.state.ia.us>
Subject: FW: Vehicle damage to driver's door 12/07/2021

414 had damage last night.

Wasn't sure if it should be fixed — | told him yes and he sent me a memo.

I'll work on a damage report today.

431

From: Meislahn Brian <meislahn@dps.state.ia.us>
Sent: Tuesday, December 7, 2021 9:17 PM

To: Morey Russell <morey@dps.state.ia.us>
Subject: Vehicle damage to driver's door 12/07/2021

https://mail.google.com/mail/b/AMmrJ40JkZ4uojBL GgxX0kMIfMycmw7Nggq96z6nJggil TzO7JRG_/u/0/7ik=fc0BBbf7 6c&view=pl&search=all&permthid=... 2/3



9/8/22, 11:49 AM State of lowa Mail - Fwd: FW: Vehicle damage to driver's door 12/07/2021

Sgt. Morey,

While making a traffic stop south of exit 53 on US 63NB on 12/07/2021, strong winds threw my driver’'s door open and
extended it passed the normal range. This caused the hinges to not function properly, put a crease in the driver's door,
and the driver's door and front fender then rubbed against each other. | drove it to Copeland's in Hedrick, and they were
able to push the hinges in and pull the front fender out further. The driver’s door is opening without contacting the fender
at this time. My vehicle has 91,189 miles on it.

Thank you,

Brian #414

3 attachments

IMG_0107.JPG
2715K

@ State Vehicle Damage Rpt form - updated .doc
86K

ﬂ State of lowa Meislahn.pdf
187K

https://mail.google.com/mail/b/AMmrJ40JkZ4uojBLGgxX0kMIfMycmw7Ngq96z6nJggil Tz07JRG_/u/0/7ik=fc086bf76c&view=pt&search=all&permthid=... 3/3



State Vehicle Damage Report

Attach this completed form to an email along with the items identified below and send
to: vehicledamage@dps.state.ia.us ; das.risk@iowa.gov

» One Repair Estimate from Approved State Bid Shop

» DOT MARS Report (if reportable)

» Memo from the Driver of the State Vehicle

> 3-4 photos of the vehicle damage

***Sworn Officers only: Complete a Line of Duty Form #432037 and send to DOT if 10-
50 was reportable!!!

STATE VEHICLE: (Mark if Act of NaturelX ) CASE #: 2021029557

Date: 12/07/21 Time: 4:00 pm
(Month/Day/Year) (Time plus a.m./p.m.)

Vehicle Plate #: | 414 Vehicle Mileage: 91,189
Vehicle

Description: 2019 Dodge Charger

(Yr/Make/Model/ & 2C3CDXKT9KH622746

Vin#)

Assigned To: Trp. Meislahn Badge # 414
Driven By: Trp. Meislahn Badge # 414
Driver’s Lic #: Damage: $None
Vehicle Towed: | No Towed By: None
(Yes / No)

Towed To: None Towing Cost: $0.00
Seat Belt: No Type of Vehicle: Marked
(Yes / No) (Marked/Semi /Unmarked)
Injured/Injuries: None

Occupants: None

(Other than driver)

VEHICLE #2:

DL #: State:

Vehicle Lic. # State:

Driver's Name:

Driver's Address:

Owner’'s Name:

Owner’s Address:

August 2018



Owner’s Phone:

Insurance Info:
(Carrier/Policy #/Phone)

Veh Description:
(Yr/Make/Model & Vin#)

Damage: $ Seat Belt:
(Yes / No)

Injured/Injuries:

Occupants:
(Other than driver)

Occupant(s) Wearing Seat Belt: (ves/iNo) |

OTHER INFORMATION:

Witnesses:

Accident Location: Exit 53 on US 63 nb
(Street/Hwy)

County: Mahaska
Weather/Road Conditions: | Clear/Dry/Windy

Trooper Meislahn was making a traffic stop. As he exited his car, the wind
caught the door and opened it past the door stop. This caused damage to
the door hinges and put a crease/dent in the front portion of the door. The
door was difficult to open and would not function properly. A local body
shop was able to reset the hinges so the door opens/closes in a normal
manner. Trooper Meislahn notified supervision about the damage.

Property Damage other than | None

Vehicles:
Cost: $0.00
Citations Issued To: None

(List Charge(s) and Statute Code(s))

| Investigating Officer: | Sgt. Russ Morey #431 |

VEHICLE #3: (If needed) (For more vehicles, please make extra copies of

this portion)
DL #: State:
Vehicle Lic. # State:

Driver's Name:
Driver's Address:

Owner's Name:

August 2018



Owner’s Address:

Owner’s Phone:

Insurance Info:
(Carrier/Policy #/Phone)

Veh Description:
(Yr/Make/Model & Vin#)

Damage: Seat Belt: Yes
(Yes / No)

Injured/Injuries:

Occupants:

(Other than driver)

Occupant(s) Wearing Seat Belt: (ves/No) | Yes

August 2018



QUALITY CLAIMS SOLUTIONS

7405 S Bitterroot Pl. Suite 100
SIOUX FALLS, SD 57108
Phone: (877) 237-3727, FAX:(866) 371-2844
qcs@qcesdirect.com

Workfile ID:

For:

QUALITY CLAIMS SOLUTIONS
DAS Fleet Services

Estimate of Record

dba963cf

Owner: STATE OF IOWA

STATE OF IOWA

Collision

Insured:
Type of Loss:

Point of Impact: 10 Left Front Pillar (Left

Side)

Owner:
STATE OF IOWA
OSKALOOSA, IA 52577

Written By: Chuck Tilton, CT- 2437980

Claim #:
Days to Repair: 0

Policy #: UNK

Date of Loss:  12/21/2021 12:00 PM

Inspection Location: Repair Facility:

Copeland Collision Center

Job Number:

APDS0I10230690-001

1308 17th ave E
Oskaloosa, IA 52577
Other

(641) 676-6060 Evening

VEHICLE

2019 DODG Charger Police AWD (Fleet) 4D SED 8-5.7L Gasoline Sequential MPI Grey

VIN: 2C3CDXKT9KHE622746 Production Date: Interior Color:
License: Odometer: 91,250 Exterior Color: Grey
State: Condition:
TRANSMISSION CONVENIENCE AM Radio Cloth Seats
Automatic Transmission Air Conditioning FM Radio Bucket Seats
4 Wheel Drive Intermittent Wipers Stereo Reclining/Lounge Seats
POWER Tilt Wheel Search/Seek WHEELS

Power Steering
Power Brakes
Power Windows
Power Locks
Power Mirrors
Power Driver Seat
DECOR

Dual Mirrors
Tinted Glass
Overhead Console

12/22/2021 2:59:00 PM

Cruise Control

Rear Defogger

Keyless Entry

Message Center

Steering Wheel Touch Controls
Telescopic Wheel

Climate Control

Backup Camera

Parking Sensors

RADIO

Auxiliary Audio Connection
SAFETY

Drivers Side Air Bag
Passenger Air Bag
Anti-Lock Brakes (4)

4 Wheel Disc Brakes

Front Side Impact Air Bags
Head/Curtain Air Bags
Hands Free Device
SEATS

314048

Styled Steel Wheels
PAINT

Clear Coat Paint
OTHER

Traction Control
Stability Control
California Emissions
Power Trunk/Liftgate

Page 1



Estimate of Record

Owner: STATE OF IOWA Job Number:
2019 DODG Charger Police AWD (Fleet) 4D SED 8-5.7L Gasoline Sequential MPI Grey

Line Oper Description Part Number Qty Extended Labor Paint
Price $
1 FRONT BUMPER
2 R&I R&I bumper cover 1.9
3 # R&I Push bar 1.0
4 FENDER
5 ¥ Rpr LT Fender 3.0 2.0
6 Add for Clear Coat 0.8
7 # Decals 1 1.0
8 R&I RT Fender liner 3.6, 5.7 liter 0.3
9 R&I LT Fender liner 3.6, 5.7 liter 0.3
10 FRONT DOOR
11 % Rpr LT Door shell (HSS) 4.0 2.1
12 Overlap Major Adj. Panel -0.4
13 Add for Clear Coat 0.3
14 Add for Edging 0.5
15 # Decals 1 1.0
16 R& LT Power mirror w/o heat, w/o 0.5
memory, w/o blind spot blue
17 Repl LT Applique 57010427AE 1 161.00 0.2
18 R&I LT R&I trim panel 0.5
19 R&I LT Handle, outside black 0.4
20 Repl LT Upper hinge 55113661AC 1 80.20 0.3 0.5
21 Repl LT Lower hinge 55113665A1 1 82.00 0.3 0.5
22 Overlap Minor Panel -0.2
23 # Pre scan 1 50.00 05 M
24 # Post scan 1 50.00 05 M
25 # Cover Car 1 5.00 0.2
26 # Corrosion Protection 1 6.00
SUBTOTALS 434.20 15.9 6.1
ESTIMATE TOTALS
Category Basis Rate Cost $
Parts 434.20
Body Labor 149hrs @ $ 62.15 /hr 926.04
Paint Labor 6.1hrs @ % 100.00 /hr 610.00
Mechanical Labor 1.0hrs @ $71.36 /hr 71.36
Subtotal 2,041.60
Total Cost of Repairs 2,041.60
Deductible 0.00
Total Adjustments 0.00
Net Cost of Repairs 2,041.60
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