Department of Govemor Kim Reynolds
Administrative Services Lt. Govemor Adam Gregg
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Empowering People Adam Steen, Director
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Customer Service

Date: August 29, 2022

To: Tammy Hollingsworth, Auditor of State
Victoria Newton, Treasurer of State
Executive Council

From: Mariah Flowers, Fleet Manager
DAS Fleet Services
Department of Administrative Services

Re: ALLOCATION REQUEST - 29C20 Claim for Executive Council Consideration

Vehicle / Event | # 565/Deer
August 9, 2022
Event Date
Summary Vehicle 565 struck a deer. (242826)
Amount $3,492.42 - Estimate
Requested
Supporting 29C20 Email Notification, Accident Report, Repair Estimate(s), Photos
Documentation

If you have any questions or are in need of additional information, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Thank you,

W

Mariah Flowers, Fleet Manager
DAS Fleet Services
Mariah.Flowers@iowa.gov
515-414-6582

“Hoover State Office Building | 1305 East Walnut Street | Des Moines, I1A50319 | (515) 281-5360 | http://das.iowa.gov



iowa.gov Risk, DAS <das.risk@iowa.gov>

Car vs Deer. Cari565. Special Agent Elizabeth Miller

1 message

Guill Bryan <guill@dps.state.ia.us> Mon, Aug 15, 2022 at 10:45 AM
To: "Risk, DAS" <das.risk@iowa.gov>, vehicledamage <vehicledamage@dps.state.ia.us>, "ExecutiveCouncil@tos.iowa.gov"
<ExecutiveCouncil@tos.iowa.gov>, Tammy Hollingsworth <Tammy.Hollingsworth@aos.iowa.gov>

All,
Good morning.

Please see attached State Vehicle Damage submission for Elizabeth Miller from 8/9/22. Agent Miller struck a deer on
Highway 69 in Warren County near Pershing Street,

| have also attached email on notifications on what was located per my request in regards to the 24hr procedure. Thanks
for your consideration and | apologize for timeliness of submission.

Thanks
Bryan

Lt. Bryan Guill 498

Commander Fleet & Supply

lowa Department of Public Safety
30 NE 48th Place

Des Moines, IA 50313

F&S Main 515-281-3391

Direct 515-281-3118

Cell 515-201-9958
guill@dps.state.ia.us
1033program@dps.state.ia.us

**Notice™ This e-mail message (including any file attachments transmitted with it) is for the sole use of the intended
recipient(s) and may contain confidential and legally privileged information. Any unauthorized use or disclosure of this e-
mail by an unintended recipient is prohibited. If you have received this e-mail in error, please notify the sender by return
e-mail and destroy all copies of the original message. No representation is made that this e-mail or any attachments are
free of viruses. Virus scanning is recommended and is the responsibility of the recipient.

----- Original Message-----

From: Lamp Scott <selamp@dps.state.ia.us>

Sent: Friday, August 12, 2022 1:00 PM

To: Guill Bryan <guill@dps.state.ia.us>; Miller Elizabeth <emiller@dps.state.ia.us>
Subject: Repair Claim 565, Beth Miller

Lt. Guill here is the estimate for Durango 565, Beth Miller, car versus deer Beth will provide the rest of the accident
paperwork if not already done so.

Scott E. Lamp, M.A. | Special Agent in Charge lowa Division of Criminal Investigation - Department of Public Safety
Support Operations Bureau: Administration-Transcription-CCH Records-Dissemination Identification-Fingerprints-
Equipment-Fleet & Supply

215 East 7th Street | Des Moines | lowa 50319

Office: 515-725-6025 (phone) | Cell: 712-898-0478 State Peace Officer proudly serving since 1994, Badge # 1-65
SELAMP@DPS.STATE.IA.US Correspondence is Discoverable in State/Federal Courts

*NOTICE" This email message (including any file attachments transmitted with it) is for the sole use of the intended
recipient(s) and may contain confidential and legally privileged information. Any unauthorized use or disclosure of this
email by an unintended recipient is prohibited.

If you have received this e-mail in error please notify the sender by return e-mail and destroy all copies of the original



message.

From: Michael A. Wright <ma.wright@karlchevrolet.com>
Sent: Friday, August 12, 2022 12:28 PM

To: Lamp Scott <selamp@dps.state.ia.us>

Subject: ** External Email Alert ** Claim 565

**External Email Alert* This email is from outside DPS. DO NOT CLICK links or attachments unless you expected them.
If unsure please forward to ITOC@dps.state.ia.us<mailto:I TOC@dps state.ia.us> for review.

Estimate for unit 565. Please review and advise.

Thank you

Michael Wright

Body shop Manager

Karl's Fleet and commercial collision center
5936 NE Industry Drive

515-299-4307

5 attachments

@ Image_Report.pdf
4343K

-@ Preliminary_Estimate.pdf
208K

-@ Accident Report.pdf
791K

State Vehicle Damage Rpt form .doc
107K

-@ 8-10-22 FW_ State Car damage 565, Beth Miller.pdf
208K



State Vehicle Damage Report

Attach this completed form to an email along with the items identified below and send
to: vehicledamage@dps.state.ia.us ; das.risk@iowa.qgov

» One Repair Estimate from Approved State Bid Shop

» DOT MARS Report (if reportable)

» Memo from the Driver of the State Vehicle

> 3-4 photos of the vehicle damage

***Sworn Officers only: Complete a Line of Duty Form #432037 and send to DOT if 10-
50 was reportable!!!

STATE VEHICLE: (Mark if Act of Nature[ 1) CASE #:

Date: 8-11-22 Time: 0950AM
(Month/Day/Year) (Time plus a.m./p.m.)

Vehicle Plate #: | KNN948 Vehicle Mileage: 77,579
Vehicle

Description:

(Yr/Make/Model/ & 2017 Dodge Durango

Vini#)

Assigned To: Elizabeth Miller | Badge # 565
Driven By: Elizabeth Miller | Badge # 565
Driver's Lic #: 730YY8972 Damage: $4013.67
Vehicle Towed: | No Towed By:

(Yes / No)

Towed To: Towing Cost: $

Seat Belt: Yes Type of Vehicle: Unmarked
(Yes / No) (Marked/Semi /Unmarked)
Injured/Injuries: None

Occupants:

(Other than driver)

August 2018



OTHER INFORMATION:

Witnesses:

Accident Location: NB 69 S. Pershing
(Street/Hwy)

County: Warren
Weather/Road Conditions: | Clear/Normal

** Please Include narrative of events here**

NB Unit 1 struck an EB deer that entered roadway.

Property Damage other than | None
Vehicles:
Cost: $

Citations Issued To:
(List Charge(s) and Statute Code(s))

| Investigating Officer: | Deputy Tyler Hahn

August 2018



QUALITY CLAIMS SOLUTIONS

105 N Krohn Place
SIOUX FALLS, SD 57103

Phone: (877) 237-3727, FAX:(866) 371-2844

gcs@qcesdirect.com

For:

QUALITY CLAIMS SOLUTIONS

DAS Fleet Services

Estimate of Record

Workfile ID: e4d49289

Owner: STATE OF IOWA 565, STATE OF IOWA 565
Written By: Jon Gustafson

Job Number:

Insured: STATE OF IOWA 565, Policy #: UNKNOWN APDS010242826-001
STATE OF IOWA 565
Type of Loss: Collision Date of Loss:  8/17/2022 12:00 PM Days to Repair: 0
Point of Impact: 12 Front
Owner: Inspection Location: Repair Facility:
STATE OF IOWA 565, STATE OF IOWA KARL CHEVROLET COLLISION CENTER
565 ANK
ANKENY, IA 50021 1101 SOUTHEAST ORLABOR ROAD
Ankeny, IA 50021
Other
(515) 299-4337 Evening
VEHICLE
2017 DODG Durango Special Service AWD (Fleet) 4D UTV 6-3.6L Gasoline Sequential MPI
VIN: 1C4RDIFG7HC921616 Production Date: 5/2017 Interior Color:
License: Odometer: 77,579 Exterior Color:
State: Condition:
TRANSMISSION QOverhead Console AM Radio SEATS
Automatic Transmission CONVENIENCE FM Radio Cloth Seats
4 Wheel Drive Air Conditioning Stereo Bucket Seats
POWER Intermittent Wipers Search/Seek Reclining/Lounge Seats
Power Steering Tilt Wheel Auxiliary Audio Connection WHEELS

Power Brakes
Power Windows
Power Locks
Power Mirrors
Heated Mirrors
Power Driver Seat
DECOR

Dual Mirrors
Privacy Glass

8/17/2022 7:54:46 AM

Cruise Control

Rear Defogger

Keyless Entry

Message Center

Steering Wheel Touch Controls
Rear Window Wiper
Telescopic Wheel

Climate Control

Dual Air Condition

SAFETY

Drivers Side Air Bag
Passenger Air Bag
Anti-Lock Brakes (4)

4 Wheel Disc Brakes
Traction Control

Stability Control

Front Side Impact Air Bags
Head/Curtain Air Bags

314048

Aluminum/Alloy Wheels
PAINT

Clear Coat Paint
OTHER

Fog Lamps

Rear Spoiler

California Emissions
TRUCK

Rear Step Bumper

Page 1



Estimate of Record

Owner: STATE OF IOWA 565, STATE OF IOWA 565 Job Number:
2017 DODG Durango Special Service AWD (Fleet) 4D UTV 6-3.6L Gasoline Sequential MPI

Console/Storage RADIO Hands Free Device

8/17/2022 7:54:46 AM 314048 Page 2



Estimate of Record

Owner: STATE OF IOWA 565, STATE OF IOWA 565

2017 DODG Durango Special Service AWD (Fleet) 4D UTV 6-3.6L Gasoline Sequential MPI

Job Number:

Line Oper Description Part Number Qty Extended Labor Paint
Price $
1 FRONT BUMPER
2 O/H front bumper 2.9
3 ok Repl A/M Bumper cover -25% 1XV03TZZAD 1 289.50 Incl. 2.6
4 Add for Clear Coat 1.0
5 Add for fog lamps 0.4
6 Repl LT Bumper cover side bracket 68411419AD 1 7.30
7 *E Repl A/M Molding center -25% 5113729AB 1 203.25 Incl.
8 *k Repl A/M Lower cover chrome accents 5113672AB 1 108.75 Incl. 1.6
-25%
9 Add for Clear Coat 0.6
10 ** Repl A/M LT Molding outer -25% 5113737AB 1 83.25 Incl.
11 »* Repl A/M Lower grille w/o adaptive 5113686AB 1 78.75 Inci.
cruise -25%
12 ** Repl A/M Lower deflector w/o accent 5113677AB 1 85.50 Incl.
color -25%
13 *x Repl A/M Impact bar w/o adaptive 68227140AC 1 189.75 0.3
cruise -25%
14 ** Repl A/M LT Trim bezel -25% 5113679AC 1 27.00 Incl.
15 *x* Repl A/M LT Trim molding -25% 5113745AB 1 63.00 Incl.
16 ¥ Repl A/M LT Trim ring fog lamp -25% 5113680AA 1 37.50 Incl.
17 = Repl A/M Absorber -25% 68227828AA 1 25.50 Incl.
18 Repl Baffle 68227829AB 1 76.95 0.2
19  FRONT LAMPS
20 Repl A/M LT Fog lamp assy -25% 5182021AB 1 110.25 0.3
21 Aim fog lamps 0.4
22  RADIATOR SUPPORT
23 & Repl A/M Underbody shield 3.6 liter 68091772AB 1 161.25
-25%
24  COOLING
25 Repl Radiator w/HD cooling w/R134A 68273308AA 1 608.00 m 2.1
26 Repl LT Air baffle 68227831AA 1 44,10 Incl.
27  AIR CONDITIONER & HEATER
28 Repl Condenser w/o trans cooler 68232606AB 1 341.00 m 1.5
29 AC Service evacuate & recharge m 1.4
30 AC Service refrigerant recovery m 0.4
31 FENDER
32 Repl A/M LT Fender liner -25% 57010369A7 1 85.50 0.5
33 WINDSHIELD
34 Repl Washer pump 5179153AC 1 139.00
35 Repl Level sensor 5152029AB 1 535
36 # Hazardous Waste 1, 3.00
37 # Flex Agent 1 5.00
38 # Coolant 2 47.40
8/17/2022 7:54:46 AM 314048 Page 3



Estimate of Record

Owner: STATE OF IOWA 565, STATE OF IOWA 565 Job Number:
2017 DODG Durango Special Service AWD (Fleet) 4D UTV 6-3.6L Gasoline Sequential MPI

39 # Pre/Post Scan 1 119.95 05 M
SUBTOTALS 2,945.80 10.9 5.8

ESTIMATE TOTALS

Category Basis Rate Cost $
Parts 2,945.80
Parts Discount $1,221.70 -28.0 % -342.08
Body Labor 104 hrs @ $ 41.00 /hr 426.40
Paint Labor 58hrs @ $ 76.00 /hr 440.80
Mechanical Labor 0.5hrs @ $43.00 /hr 21.50
Subtotal 3,492.42
Total Cost of Repairs 3,492.42
Deductible 0.00
Total Adjustments 0.00
Net Cost of Repairs 3,492.42

THIS IS NOT AN AUTHORIZATION TO BEGIN REPAIRS.

SUPPLEMENTS - Please be advised that the INSURANCE COMPANY requires notice of any supplements prior to the
work being performed. Failure to notify INSURANCE COMPANY and allow INSURANCE COMPANY to review the
supplemental charges may result in non-payment of the supplemental items.

ESTIMATE AUDIT - THIS DOCUMENT IS NOT AN APPRAISAL. INQUIRIES SHOULD BE DIRECTED TO THE
INSURANCE COMPANY LISTED AT THE TOP OF THIS DOCUMENT.

REPAIR SHOPS CAN CONTACT QCS AUDITOR FOR ANY REPAIR RELATED INQUIRIES AT 1-877-237-3727.
THIS ESTIMATE HAS BEEN PREPARED BASED ON THE USE OF AFTERMARKET CRASH PARTS SUPPLIED BY A
SOURCE OTHER THAN THE MANUFACTURER OF YOUR MOTOR VEHICLE. ANY WARRANTIES APPLICABLE TO THESE

REPLACEMENT PARTS ARE PROVIDED BY THE MANUFACTURER OR DISTRIBUTOR OF THESE PARTS RATHER THAN
THE MANUFACTURER OF YOUR VEHICLE.
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