Govemor Kim Reynolds
Lt. Governor Adam Gregg

Empowering People
Collaboration
Customer Service

Adam Steen, Director

Date: December 13, 2021

To: Tammy Hollingsworth, Auditor of State
Victoria Newton, Treasurer of State
Executive Council

From: Mariah Flowers, Fleet Manager

DAS Fleet Services
Department of Administrative Services

Re: ALLOCATION REQUEST - 29C20 Claim for Executive Council Consideration

Vehicle / Event | # 650/Hail

August 28, 2021

Event Date
Summary Vehicle #650 sustained hail damage. (225885)
Amount $12,236.17 - Total Valuation

Requested +§ 210.25 - Review Invoice
-$ 7.425.00 - Salvage Proceeds
$ 5,021.42 - Total

Supporting 29C20 Email Notification, Accident Report, Repair Estimate(s), Photos
Documentation

If you have any questions or are in need of additional information, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Thank you,

Mariah Flowers, Fleet Manager
DAS Fleet Services
Mariah . Flowers(@iowa.gov
515-725-2243

-

" Hoover State Office Building | 1305 East Walnut Street | Des Moines, IA50319 | (515) 2815360 | htip//das jowa.gov




12/13/21, 4:00 PM FW: Hail Damage State Vehicle - das.risk@iowa.gov

Subject: FW: Hail Damage State Vehicle ) Z%g’

2 Adams Jeannie <jadams@dps.state.ia.us> Mon, Aug
s to executivecouncil@tos.iowa.gov, Tammy.Hollingsworth@auditor.state.ia.us, Guill Bryan

You are viewing an attached message. State of lowa Mail can't verify the
authenticity of attached messages.

Executive Council and Tammy,

Please accept this email as the 24 hour notification for SA Cory DiCesare AON vehicle damage. Cafl650m
hail damage to his vehicle on 8-28-21 when a storm came through.

VIR
Jeannie

Jeannie Adams

ISP Fleet & Supply, Fleet Asset Manager
Department of Public Safety

30 N.E. 48™ Place

Des Moines, lowa 50313

Direct #: 515-725-0643

Cell Phone: 515-204-3019

Shop: 515-281-3277

Fax: 515-242-6321

Email: jadams@dps.state.ia.us

From: Dicesare Cory <dicesare@dps.state.ia.us>

Sent: Saturday, August 28, 2021 9:15 PM

To: Lamp Scott <selamp@dps.state.ia.us>; Current Michael <current@dps.state.ia.us>; Adams Jeannie
<jadams@dps.state.ia.us>

Cc: Nelson Troy <tnelson@dps.state.ia.us>

Subject: Hail Damage State Vehicle

All,

At approximately 8 PM on August 28, a 30 minute hail storm rolled through Larchwood with baseball size
damaged my state vehicle #650 while parked in the driveway. Damage includes extensive dents and ding
throughout the entire body, a near shattered windshield, both taillights broken. This damage will be over ¢

Nelson has been notified. If anything else is needed let me know.

Thank you,

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/d/ALGkdOWOEZorlJexJsgllIV7RXVJDss3W2KF3X21ZcR6prndjJvt/?ui=2&view=btop&ver=8q4rbxdb1lg8&msg=%23ms... 1/1



State Vehicle Damage Report
Attach this completed form to an email along with the items identified below and
send to: DPS - Vehicle Damage; DAS — Risk
» One Repair Estimate from Approved State Bid Shop
» DOT MARS Report (if reportable)
» Memo from the Driver of the State Vehicle
> 3-4 photos of the vehicle damage
***Sworn Officers only: Complete a Line of Duty Form #432037 and send to DOT
if 10-50 was reportable!!!

STATE VEHICLE: (Mark if Act of Nature[<]) CASE #:

Date: 8/28/21 Time: 7:30-8:00
(Month/Day/Year) (Time plus a.m./p.m.) p.m.
Vehicle Plate #: | HVYR872 Vehicle Mileage: 59475
Vehicle

Description: 2016 Ford Taurus

(Yr/Make/Model/ & VIN: 1TFAHP2MK1GG113680

Vin#) Vehicle #: 650

Assigned To: SA DiCesare Badge # I-29
Driven By: N/A Badge # N/A
Driver's Lic#: | N/A Damage: $14,087.65
Vehicle Towed: | No Towed By: N/A

(Yes / No)

Towed To: N/A Towing Cost: SN/A
Seat Belt: Yes Type of Vehicle: Marked
(Yes / No) (Marked/Semi /Unmarked)
Injured/Injuries: None

Occupants: None

(Other than driver)

VEHICLE #2:
DL #: State:
Vehicle Lic. # State:

Driver's Name:

Driver's Address:

Owner’'s Name:

Owner’s Address:




Owner’s Phone:

Insurance Info:
(Carrier/Policy #/Phone)

Veh Description:
(Yr/Make/Model & Vin#)

Damage: $ Seat Bel: No
(Yes / No)

Injured/Injuries:

Occupants:
(Other than driver)

Occupant(s) Wearing Seat Belt: (vesno) | Yes

OTHER INFORMATION:

Witnesses: N/A

Accident Location: N/A

(Street/Hwy)

County: Lyon

Weather/Road Conditions: | Thunderstorm w/hail

Narrative: Baseball sized hail went through Larchwood Aug 28, 2021.
Caused extensive damage to state vehicle parked in driveway.

Property Damage other than | N/A
Vehicles:

Cost: $
Citations Issued To: N/A

(List Charge(s) and Statute Code(s))

| Investigating Officer: | N/A

VEHICLE #3: (If needed) (For more vehicles, please make extra
copies of this portion)

DL #: State:

Vehicle Lic. # State:

Driver's Name:

Driver’s Address:

Owner’'s Name:

Owner’s Address:




Owner’s Phone;

Insurance Info:
(Carrier/Policy #/Phone)

Veh Description:
(Yr/Make/Model & Vin#)

Damage: Seat Belt: Yes
(Yes /No)

Injured/Injuries:

Occupants:

(Other than driver)

Occupant(s) Wearing Seat Belt: (ves/No) | Yes




DAS - Fleet

Loss/Risk valuation Calculation

Variables - Input:
Agency
Vehicle Number
Vehicle - Yr, Make, Mode
VIN#
Date of Report
Claim Number
Mileage

Dealership Price - Off Contract
Purchase Price - On Contract
NADA - Trade in - Clean Value @ Time of Loss

Calculations:
Dealership Price - Off Contract
Purchase Price - On Contract
Difference
Percentage Difference

NADA Value @ Time of Loss or purchase price, which ever is lower
Percentage Decrease for Contract Price
Loss calculated

Use only for new vehicle (when B23 is N/A)
Odometer Reading
Life Cycle
Percentage Decrease for Cantract Price
Loss calculated

Loss Amount to be Provided to Agency:

DPS
650
2016 FORD Taurus
1FAHP2MK1GG113680
9/10/2021
225885
59,686
$29,085.00
$25,602.19
$13,900.00
$29,085.00
$25,602.19
$3,482.81
11.97%
$13,900.00
11.97%
12,236.,17
59,686
120,000
49,74%
12,868.09

$12,236.17




Purchase Invoice and Vehicle Checklist:

CARINVOICE STOCKS refsse %}&gﬁﬂm
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Purchase Invoice and Vehicle Checklist:

CARINVQICE 970CK# FE1648 HUBER
. & 138661
EB Stivers Ford Lincoln
1450 E. Hickman Ad = Waukee, lowa
LINCOLN {51B) 987-3697 » www.StlversFordiA.com
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~—PDA

PROPERTY DAMRAGE RAPPRAISERS

Due upon receipt | NVO I CE

INVOICE NUMBER INVOICE DATE
844-0167374 09/13/2021
BILLTO CLIENT CODE
DAS FLEET SERVICES
109 SE 13TH ST BUSINESS LINE / LOSS TYPE
DES MOINESIA 50139 A - Commercial Auto
FOR INQUIRIES: SUBMIT PAYMENT TO:
PDA Sioux City, |A #844 Property Damage Appraisers, Inc.
75-1160563
pdasiouxcity@pdaorg.net Dept #161, P.O. Box 1000
(712) 276-4990 Memphis, TN 38148-0161
Please reference the invoice number and enclose a copy of the invoice on all paymenits.
INSURED CLAIMANT ASSIGNMENT DATE PDAASSIGNMENT #
STATE OF IOWA 09/10/2021 844-109-0046
CLAIM # POLICY # LOSS DATE REFERENCE #
APDSO0I10225885-001
SERVICE FEE: ( 1 Unit(s) @ $179.00) $ 179.00
Mileage: ( 25.00 miles ) @ $1.25 $ 2125
ACH Payment Info:
Bank: First Horizon Bank
ABA (US): 084000026 Bank
Account: 220002525824
Email Remit Information to:
achbackup@pdaorg.net
Click here to pay your invoice at PDACIlientPortal.com
Same-Day Service. Guaranteed. PDA now offers expedited service for standard auto claims in select markets.
*WE HAVE CHANGED OUR BANK REMITTANCE INFORMATION AS NOTED ABOVE :
PLEASE UTILIZE OUR PORTAL FOR ALL OTHER ELECTRONIC PAYMENTS ** TOTAL CHARGES: 210.25
Terms: Professional fees due upon receipt. Interest accrues at 1% per month.
Please include the invoice number on all payments. INVOICE TOTAL: $ 21 0 25

© 2020 by Property Damage Appraisers Incorporated

This document. includina stvle and format. is protected bv Copvricht and all richts are reserved. The use of this document is strictlv brohibited without the written consent and permission of Propertv Damaae Aporaisers. Inc.



2349

A

Insurance Auto Auctions, Inc.

Attn: Settlement Group
1000 Armstrong Dr
De Soto, IA 50069
Phone: (515) 823-0600

Fax;

(515) 823-0626

E-mail: |AA_ASAP_DesMoines@iaai.com
Salvage Information

IAA Stock #;
IAA Branch:
Fed. Tax |.D.
Handler:
Adjuster;
Insured:
Owner;
Claim #:
Policy #:
Vehicle:
Damage:
Mileage:
Mileage Type:
VIN:

ACV:
NICB Date:

000-31410980
Des Moines
954455113
Mariah Flowers
Mariah Flowers
State of lowa
State of lowa
650

2016 FORD SEDAN POLICE
Hail/

60055

Actual
1FAHP2MK1GG113680
$13,550.00

N/A

Buyer Information

S & B Auto Sales

1 Grant St

Carlisle, 1A 50047
Resale Certificate # : D3198 (IA)

Elapsed Days Analysis

Date of Event:

Loss
Assigned
Released
Pickup
Title Rec'd

Sale Doc. Rec'd

Sale Date

Buyer Payment
Remittance

Date Days
9/29/2021 -
9/29/2021 1
9/30/2021 2
10/1/2021 2
10/4/2021 4
10/6/2021 3

10/12/2021 7
10/12/2021 1
10/15/2021 4

17

Elapsed Total Days:

IAA Doc. RP002.rpt

REMITTANCE: 33545822
DATE: 10/15/2021

Remittance Payable To:

State of lowa

lowa Department of Administrative Svcs

109 SE 13th Street

Des Moines, IA 50319
Attn: Salvage Dept

Account of Sale

Total
Activity

%ACV

0.56

(0.55)
54.80

54.80 %

Sales $7,600.00 55.35
IAA Charges
Consignment Flat Fee $75.00
Less IAA Charges ($75.00)
Net |AA Return $7,425.00
Payment Amount $7,425.00

S

WSO~ |



