Department of Govemor Kim Reynolds
Administrative Services Lt. Govemor Adam Gregg

Empowering People ) ) ' ) ) T ——— -
Collaboration Adam Steen, Director

Customer Service

Date: October 4, 2021

To: Tammy Hollingsworth, Auditor of State
Victoria Newton, Treasurer of State
Executive Council

From: Mariah Flowers, Fleet Manager

DAS Fleet Services
Department of Administrative Services

Re: ALLOCATION REQUEST - 29C20 Claim for Executive Council Consideration

Vehicle / Event | #261 & 159/Hail

August 28, 2021
Event Date
Summary Trooper #261 & 159 sustained hail damage. (225559, 225415)
Amount $13,198.30 - Estimates

Requested $ 514.25 - Review Invoices
$13,712.55 - Total

Supporting 29C20 Email Notification, Accident Report, Repair Estimate(s), Photos
Documentation

If you have any questions or are in need of additional information, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Thank yo

L

Mariah Flowers, Fleet Manager
DAS Fleet Services

Mariah.Flowers@iowa.gov
515-725-2243

 Hoover State Office Building | 1305 East Walnut Street | Des Moines, IA50319 | (515) 2815360 | hitpiidas.jowa.gov



Risk, DAS <das.risk@iowa.gov>

2759015

FW: Hail damage #261 & #159

1 message

Guill Bryan <guill@dps.state.ia.us> Mon, Aug 30, 2021 at 4:19 PM
To: "ExecutiveCouncil@tos.iowa.gov" <ExecutiveCouncil@tos.iowa.gov>, "das.risk@iowa.gov"
<das.risk@iowa.gov>, "tammy.hollingsworth@aos.iowa.gov" <tammy.hollingsworth@aos.iowa.gov>

Executive Council and Tammy,

Please accept below as 24 hr notification of hail damage sustained by Troopers Hilt #261 and Troopers Zylstra #159.
Trooper’s Zylstra’s vehicle damage submission is attached. Estimate is for $7790.88 in damage. ISP would like to
pursue 29C20 reimbursement for this AON event,

I will forward #261 reports upon Receipt and thank you in advance for your consideration.

V/R

Bryan

(x. an Gudl +498%
Commander Fleet & Supply

lowa Department of Public Safety

30 NE 481" Place

Des Moines, [A 50313

F&S Main 515-281-3391
Direct 515-281-3118

Cell 515-201-9958
guill@dps.state.ia.us
1033program@dps.state.ia.us

**Notice** This e-mail message (including any file attachments transmitted with it) is for the sole use of
the intended recipient(s) and may contain confidential and legally privileged information. Any
unauthorized use or disclosure of this e-mail by an unintended recipient is prohibited. If you have
received this e-mail in error, please notify the sender by return e-mail and destroy all copies of the original



message. No representation is made that this e-mail or any attachments are free of viruses. Virus
scanning is recommended and is the responsibility of the recipient.

From: Kurtz Vincent <kurtz@dps.state.ia.us>

Sent: Saturday, August 28, 2021 8:51 PM

To: Guill Bryan <guill@dps.state.ia.us>

Cc: Williams Matthew <mwilliam@dps.state.ia.us>; Hesse Chase <hesse@dps.state.ia.us>
Subject: Hail damage #261 & #159

Lt Guill-

Both Troopers Hilt #261 and Zylstra #159 are reporting hail damage to their squad cars from storms
going through Lyon County tonight. They will be submitting estimates to me on Monday and | will forward
on the completed reports to you ASAP.

Thank you.

Sgt Vince Kurtz#495

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: Zylstra Jeff <zylstra@dps.state.ia.us>

To: Hesse Chase <hesse@dps.state.ia.us>, Kurtz Vincent <kurtz@dps.state.ia.us>, Williams Matthew
<mwilliam@dps.state.ia.us>

Cc:

Bce:

Date: Sun, 29 Aug 2021 13:42:52 +0000

Subject: storm damage

| have hail damage on my squad from the storm about 2000 hours on august 28. | will get an estimate
tomorrow from ¢ and h. thanks 159

4 attachments

N storm damage.eml
8K

ik #159 Photos 8-28-21.pdf
3853K

#159 Estimate 8-28-21.pdf
7
120K



State Vehicle Damage Report
Attach this completed form to an email along with the items identified below and
send to: DPS - Vehicle Damage; DAS — Risk
» One Repair Estimate from Approved State Bid Shop
» DOT MARS Report (if reportable)
» Memo from the Driver of the State Vehicle
» 3-4 photos of the vehicle damage
***Sworn Officers only: Complete a Line of Duty Form #432037 and send to DOT
if 10-50 was reportable!!!

STATE VEHICLE: (Mark if Act of NaturelX) CASE #: 2021021216

Date: 8-28-2021 Time: 20:00 p.m.
(Month/Day/Year) (Time plus a.m./p.m.)

Vehicle Plate #: | 159 Vehicle Mileage: 40,380
Vehicle

Description: 2020 DODGE CHARGER

(Yr/Make/Model/ & VIN # 2c3cdxkt0lh127515

Vin#)

Assigned To: Jeffrey Zylstra Badge # 159

Driven By: Parked Badge #

Driver’s Lic #: Damage: $7790.88
Vehicle Towed: | No Towed By: Not Towed
(Yes / No)

Towed To: Not Towed Towing Cost: $Not Towed
Seat Belt: Yes Type of Vehicle:; Marked

(Yes / No) (Marked/Semi /Unmarked)
Injured/Injuries: None

Occupants: None

(Other than driver)

VEHICLE #2:
DL #: State:
Vehicle Lic. # State:

Driver's Name:

Driver's Address:

Owner's Name:

Owner’s Address:




Owner's Phone:

Insurance Info:
(Carrier/Policy #/Phone)

Veh Description:
(Yr/Make/Model & Vind#)

Damage: $ Seat Belt: Yes
(Yes / No)

Injured/Injuries:

Occupants:

(Other than driver)

Occupant(s) Wearing Seat Belt: (ves/No) | Yes

OTHER INFORMATION:

Withesses: NONE

Accident Location: 1434 Coolidge Ave, Larchwood |A
(Street/Hwy)

County: Lyon

Weather/Road Conditions: | Severe Thunderstorm

Narrative: On 8-28-21 Trooper Zylstra's squad car was parked at his
residence as he was off duty. A severe thunderstorm passed through and
his squad car sustained damage from hail.

Property Damage other than | NONE

Vehicles:
Cost: $
Citations Issued To: NONE

(List Charge(s) and Statute Code(s))

| Investigating Officer: | Sgt. Vince Kurtz #495

VEHICLE #3: (If needed) (For more vehicles, please make extra
copies of this portion)

DL #: State:

Vehicle Lic. # State:

Driver’'s Name:

Driver's Address:




Owner's Name:

Owner’s Address:

Owner’s Phone:

Insurance Info:
(Carrier/Policy #/Phone)

Veh Description:
(Yr/Make/Model & Vin#)

Damage: Seat Belt: Yes
(Yes / No)

Injured/Injuries:

Occupants:

(Other than driver)

Occupant(s) Wearing Seat Belt: (ves/No) | Yes




Date:

Estimate ID:
Estimate Version:
Committed
Profile ID:

9/ 7/2021 12:34 PM
8441090011

* Mitchell

Property Damage Appraisers (PDA Sioux City)

Damage Assessed By:

P.O. Box 144, Collins, IA 50055
(712) 276-4990
Fax: (712) 276-660%
Email: pdasiouxcity@pdaorg.net

* Not An Authorization For Repair *
Read disclaimers following appraisal calculations.

LAYNE MCSHER Appraised For: MIKE LONG

Classification: Field
Condition Code: Good Type of Loss:
Date of Loss: 9/ 7/2021
Deductible: 0.00
File Number: 8441090011

Claim Number:

APDS010225415-001

Comprehensive

Insured: STATE OF IOWA
Owner: STATE OF IOWA
Address: 836 HOLDER ST, LARCHWOOD, IA 51241
Mitchell Service: 911667
Description: 2020 Dodge Charger Police Vehicle Production Date: 2/20
Body Style: 4D Sed Drive Train: 5.7L Inj 8 Cyl 5A AWD
VIN: 2C3CDXKTOLH127515 License: 159 IA
Mileage: 41,554
OEM/ALT: A
Parts Profile:  Sioux City Parts Profile Version: 2
Color: Silver
Options: POWER DRIVER SEAT, POWER BRAKE, CRUISE CONTROL, FM RADIO
Line Entry Labor Line Item Part Type/ Dollar Labor
Item Number Type Operation Description Part Number Amount  Units
1 100374 BDY REMOVE/INSTALL Frt Bumper Cover 2.0 #
2 900500 BDY* REMOVE/INSTALL Push Bar Existing 2.0%r
3 100559 BDY REMOVE/REPLACE Hood Panel (Alum) ** QRP Certified 952.00 1.6
4 AUTO REF REFINISH Hood Qutside c 28
5 AUTO  REF REFINISH Add For Hood Underside c14
6 100002 REF BLEND R Fender Outside C 0.8
7 100379 REF BLEND L Fender Outside c 0.8
8 AUTO BDY PAINTLESS REPAIR R Fender Panel ** QUAL REPL PART 225.00 #
9 1 NICKEL SIZE DENT
10 7 QUARTER SIZE DENTS
2% 7 HALF DOLLAR SIZE DENTS
12 AUTO BDY PAINTLESS REPAIR L Fender Panel ** QRP Certified 175.00 #
13 11 QUARTER SIZE DENTS
14 102438 BDY REMOVE/INSTALL R Fender Splash Shield Existing INC r
15 102439 BDY REMOVE/INSTALL L Fender Splash Shield Existing INC r
16 101303 BDY PAINTLESS REPAIR R Door Opening Panel Sublet 275.00 * 0.0%*#
17 8 QUARTER 3 HALF INCLUDES: DOUBLE PANEL
18 101304 BDY PAINTLESS REPAIR L Door Opening Panel Sublet 125.00 * 0.0*%#
19 8 QUARTER INCLUDES DOUBLE PANEL
20 102049 BDY REMOVE/INSTALL R Rocker Moulding 0.4
21 102050 BDY REMOVE/INSTALL L Rocker Moulding 0.4
22 900500 BDY* REMOVE/INSTALL Fender Decals Existing 0.6* r
23 AUTO BDY PAINTLESS REPAIR R Frt Door Shell {Steel/HSS) Sublet 175.00 #
24 7 QUARTER SIZE DENTS
25 3 HALF DOLLAR SIZE DENTS
ESTIMATE RECALL NUMBER: 09/07/2021 12:34:43 8441090011
Mitchell Data Version: OEM: JUL_21_V Alternate Parts: 09/07/2021 12:15:04
Copyright (C) 1994 - 2021 Mitchell International Page 1 of 4

Software Version: 7.1.241

All Rights Reserved



26 AUTO BDY  PAINTLESS REPAIR
27

28

29 101463 BDY  REMOVE/REPLACE
30 AUTO BDY  PAINTLESS REPAIR
31

32 AUTO BDY  PAINTLESS REPAIR
33

34 100739 BDY  REMOVE/REPLACE
35 AUTO BDY  PAINTLESS REPAIR
36

37

38 900500 BDY* REMOVE/INSTALL
39 101699 BDY  REMOVE/INSTALL
40 AUTO BDY  PAINTLESS REPAIR
41

42

43 AUTO BDY  PAINTLESS REPAIR
44

45

46 101795 BDY  REMOVE/INSTALL
47 101797 BDY  REMOVE/INSTALL
48 AUTO BDY  PAINTLESS REPAIR
49

50

51 100462 BDY  REMOVE/INSTALL
52 100463 BDY  REMOVE/INSTALL
53 936012 ADD'L COST

54 AUTO REF  ADD'L OPR

55 933005 BDY  ADD'L OPR

* - Judgment Item
# - Labor Note Applies

L Frt Door Shell (Steel/HSS)
3 QUARTER SIZE DENTS

1 HALF DOLLAR SIZE DENT

R Frt Otr Door Belt Moulding
R Rear Door Shell (Steel/HSS)
4 QUARTER SIZE DENTS

L Rear Door Shell (Steel/HSS)
4 QUARTER SIZE DENTS

R Rear Upr Door Adhesive Moulding
Roof Panel

80 QUARTER SIZE DENTS

22 HALF DOLLAR SIZE DENTS
Police Equipment On Roof
Roof Headliner

R Quarter Outer Panel

8 NICKEL SIZE DENTS

8 QUARTER SIZE DENTS

L Quarter Outer Panel

10 NICKEL SIZE DENTS

10 QUARTER SIZE DENTS
Luggage Lid Assy

Luggage Trim Panel

Luggage Lid Panel

32 QUARTER SIZE DENTS

6 HALF DOLLAR SIZE DENTS
R Rear Combination Lamp

L Rear Combination Lamp
Hazardous Waste Disposal
Clear Coat

Restore Corrosion Protection

** QRP Certified - Quality Replacement Parts - Certified
** QUAL REPL PART - Quality Replacement Parts

C - Included in Clear Coat Calc

r - CEG R&R Time Used For This Labor Operation

UCC/NEW WORLD-DFW
1720 E. HWY 356
(214)352-1191 EXT. 232

IRVING

TX 75060

(214) 352-1191

8 Sublet 225.00
12 Sublet 175.00

KEYSTONE-INS QUALITY PRT
8206 J ST.

OMAHA

NE 68127

(402) 553-0230 (800) 642-1432

3 ** CH1230305C

ESTIMATE RECALL NUMBER: 09/07/2021 12:34:43 8441090011

Mitchell Data Version: OEM: JUL_21_V

Software Version: 7.1.241

Alternate Parts: 09/07/2021 12:15:04

Copyright (C) 1994 - 2021 Mitchell International

All Rights Reserved

952.00

Date: 9/ 7/2021 12:34 PM
Estimate ID: 8441090011
Estimate Version: 0
Committed
Profile ID: * Mitchell
Sublet 125.00 #
57010348AC 108.00 0.2
Sublet 125.00 #
Sublet 125,00 #
57010506AN 118.00 0.2
Sublet 1,200.00
Existing 2.0% r
4.4 #
Sublet 237.50 #
Sublet 237.50 #
0.5
0.3
Sublet 425.00
0.6 #
0.6 #
5.00 *
2.1
10.00 *
Page 2 of 4



Recycler Information Section:

McChesney Auto

2707 Waukon Ave

Somers IA 50586
515-467-5546;nofaxnumber

30 2012 Dodge
Part Number: 20082

CHARGER R.

Description:0P2,RH,WHT,DECAL, RIGHT REAR SIDE DOCR

32 2012 Dodge
Part Number: 18197

CHARGER L

Description: SCRATCH,PS2 SLV, LEFT REAR SIDE DOOR

Disclaimer: Recycled part pricing may represent either actual pricing
(the price at which the recycler is willing to sell the part for in its
existing condition) or undamaged pricing (the price at which the recycler
would sell the part if it was in undamaged condition).

If you are unsure, please contact the automotive recycler.

Remarks
The vehicle has hail damage all over.

Estimate Totals

Date:

Estimate ID:
Estimate Version: 0
Committed
Profile ID:

VA

VA

9/ 7/2021 12:34 PM
8441090011

* Mitchell

250.00

400.00

Add'l
Labor Sublet
I. Labor Subtotals Units Rate Amount Amount Totals
Body 15.8 62.00 10.00 3,450.00 4,439.60 T
Refinish 7.9 107.00 0.00 C.00 84530 T
Taxable Labor 5,284.90
Labor Summary 23.7 5,284.90
III. Additional Costs Amount
Taxable Costs 5.00
Total Additional Costs 5.00

Point(s) of Impact
16 Non-Collision (P)

Insurance Co:

DAS FLEET SERVICES

DES MOINES, IA 50139

Work Phone:

Dollar General
1430 1A 9

Inspection Site:
Address:

(877) 544-7843

Larchwood, IA 51241

Inspection Date: 9/ 7/2021

ESTIMATE RECALL NUMBER: 09/07/2021 12:34:43 8441090011
Alternate Parts: 09/07/2021 12:15:04
Copyright (C) 1994 - 2021 Mitchell International

Mitchell Data Version: OEM: JUL_21_V

Software Version: 7.1.241

All Rights Reserved

v.

III.

V.

Part Replacement Summary
Taxable Parts

Total Replacement Parts Amount

Adjustments
Insurance Deductible

Customer Responsibility

Total Labor:

Total Replacement Parts:

Total Additional Costs:
Gross Total:

Total Adjustments:
Net Total:

Amount
1,178.00

1,178.00

Amount
0.00

0.00
5,284.90
1,178.00

5.00
6,467.90

0.00
6,467.90

Page 3 of 4



~—PDA

PROPERTY DRMAGE APPRAISERS

INVOICE

Due upon receipt

INVOICE NUMBER INVCICE DATE

844-0167186 09/07/2021

BILLTO

CLIENT CODE

Attn: MIKE LONG
DAS FLEET SERVICES
109 SE 13TH ST

DES MOINESIA 50139

DAS105001

BUSINESS LINE / LOSS TYPE

A - Commercial Auto

FOR INQUIRIES:

SUBMIT PAYMENT TO:

PDA Sioux City, |A #844

pdasiouxcity@pdaorg.net
(712) 276-4990

Property Damage Appraisers, Inc.
75-1160563

Dept #161, P.O. Box 1000
Memphis, TN 38148-0161

Please reference the invoice number and enclose a copy of the invoice on all payments.

INSURED CLAIMANT ASSIGNMENT DATE PDAASSIGNMENT #
STATE OF IOWA 09/02/2021 844-109-0011
CLAIM # POLICY # LOSS DATE REFERENCE #
APDS0I0225415-001
SERVICE FEE: ( 1 Unit(s) @ $179.00) $ 179.00
Mileage: (37.00 miles ) @ $1.25 $ 46.25
ACH Payment Info:
Bank: First Horizon Bank
ABA (US): 084000026 Bank
Account: 220002525824
Email Remit Information to:
achbackup@pdaorg.net
Click here to pay your invoice at PDAClientPortal.com
Same-Day Service. Guaranteed. PDA now offers expedited service for standard auto claims in select markets.
*"WE HAVE CHANGED OUR BANK REMITTANCE INFORMATION AS NOTED ABOVE 3
PLEASE UTILIZE OUR PORTAL FOR ALL OTHER ELECTRONIC PAYMENTS.** TRIALCHARGES: 225.25
Terms: Professional fees due upon receipt. Interest accrues at 1% per month.
Please include the invoice number on all payments. INVOICE TOTAL: $ 22525

© 2020 by Property Damage Appraisers incorparated
This document, including style and format, is prolected by Copyright and all rights are reserved. The use of this document Is striclly prohibited without the written consent and permission of Praperty Damage Appraisers, Inc.



State Vehicle Damage Report

Attach this completed form to an email along with the items identified below and
send to: DPS - Vehicle Damage; DAS — Risk
> One Repair Estimate from Approved State Bid Shop

» DOT MARS Report (if reportable)

» Memo from the Driver of the State Vehicle

» 3-4 photos of the vehicle damage

***Sworn Officers only: Complete a Line of Duty Form #432037 and send to DOT
if 10-50 was reportable!!!

STATE VEHICLE: (Mark if Act of Nature(X ) CASE #: 2021021219

Date: 8-28-2021 Time: 19:65 p.m.
{Month/Day/Year) (Time plus a.m./p.m.)

Vehicle Plate #: | 261 Vehicle Mileage: 55,005
Vehicle

Description: 2019 DODGE CHARGER

(Yr/Make/Model/ & VIN # 2C3CDXKT2KH577262

Vintt)

Assigned To: Brian Hilt Badge # 261

Driven By: Brian Hilt Badge # 261

Driver's Lic#:. | 679XX2244 Damage: $7018.90
Vehicle Towed: | No Towed By: Not Towed
(Yes / No)

Towed To: Not Towed Towing Cost: $Not Towed
Seat Belt: Yes Type of Vehicle: Marked

(Yes / No) (Marked/Semi /Unmarked)
Injured/Injuries: None

Occupants: None

(Other than driver)

VEHICLE #2:
DL #: State:
Vehicle Lic. # State:

Driver’'s Name:

Driver’s Address:

Owner's Name:

Owner’s Address:




Driver's Address:

Owner’'s Name:

Owner’'s Address:

Owner’s Phone:

Insurance Info:
(Carrier/Policy #/Phone)

Veh Description:
(Yr/Make/Model & Vin#)

Damage:

Seat Belt:
(Yes / No)

Yes

Injured/Injuries:

Occupants:
(Other than driver)

Occupant(s) Wearing Seat Belt: (ves/No)

| Yes




Date: 9/ 9/2021 01:41 PM
Estimate ID: 8441090032
Estimate Version: 0
Committed
Profile ID: * Mitchell

Property Damage Appraisers (PDA Sioux City)

Damage Assessed By:

Classific

Condition Code:
Date of Loss:
Deductible:

File Number:
Claim Number:

P.O. Box 144, Collins, IA 50055
(712) 276-4990
Fax: (712) 276-6609
Email: pdasiouxcity@pdaorg.net

* Not An Authorization For Repair *
Read disclaimers following appraisal calculations.

LAYNE MOSHER JESSICA HACKBARTH

Field

Appraised For:
ation:

Good Comprehensive
8/28/2021

0.00

8441090039

APDS0I0225559-001

Type of Loss:

Software Version:

7.1.241 All Rights Reserved

Insured: STATE OF IOWA
Owner: STATE OF IOWA
Address: DOON, IA
Mitchell Service: 911667
Description: 2019 Dodge Charger Police Vehicle Production Date: 1/19
Body Style: 4D Sed Drive Train: 5.7L Inj 8 Cyl 5A AWD
VIN: 2C3CDXKT2KH577262 License: 261 IA
Mileage: 56,122
QEM/ALT: A
Parts Profile: Sioux City Parts Profile Version: 2
Color: Silver
Options: POWER DRIVER SEAT, POWER WINDOW, POWER STEERING, POWER BRAKE
Line Entry Labor Line Item Part Type/ Dollar Labor
Item Number Type Operation Description Part Number Amount  Units
1 100374 BDY REMOVE/INSTALL Frt Bumper Cover 2.0 #
2 100377 BDY REMOVE/INSTALL R Front Combination Lamp 0.4 #
3 100389 BDY REMOVE/INSTALL L Front Combination Lamp 0.4 #
4 100559 BDY REMOVE/REPLACE Hood Panel (Alum) ** QRP Certified 952.00 1.6
5 AUTO REF REFINISH Hood Outside c2s8
6 AUTO REF REFINISH Add For Hood Underside CcC1l4
7 100002 REF BLEND R Fender Outside C 0.8
8 100379 REF BLEND L Fender Outside C 0.8
9 AUTO BDY PAINTLESS REPAIR R Fender Panel ** QUAL REPL PART 125.00 #
10 3 QUARTER SIZE DENTS
11 AUTO BDY PAINTLESS REPAIR L Fender Panel ** QRP Certified 125.00 #
12 2 QUARTER SIZE DENTS
13 102438 BDY REMOVE/INSTALL R Fender Splash Shield Existing INC r
14 102439 BDY REMOVE/INSTALL L Fender Splash Shield Existing INC r
15 900500 BDY* REMOVE/INSTALL State Trooper Fender Decals Existing 0.6* r
16 101303 BDY PAINTLESS REPAIR R Door Opening Panel Sublet 275.00 * 0.0%#
17 101304 BDY PAINTLESS REPAIR L Door Opening Panel Sublet 275.00 * 0.0*#
18 102049 BDY REMOVE/INSTALL R Rocker Moulding 0.4
19 102050 BDY REMOVE/INSTALL L Rocker Moulding 0.4
20 AUTO BDY PAINTLESS REPAIR R Frt Door Shell (Steel/HSS) Sublet 125.00 #
21 3 QUARTER SIZE DENTS
22 1 HALF DOLLAR SIZE DENT
23 AUTO BDY PAINTLESS REPAIR L Frt Door Shell (Steel/HSS) Sublet 125.00 #
24 3 QUARTER SIZE DENTS
25 102091 BDY REMOVE/INSTALL R Frt Otr Door Belt Moulding 1.1 #
ESTIMATE RECALL NUMBER: 09/09/2021 13:41:31 8441090039
Mitchell Data Version: OEM: JUL_21_V Alternate Parts: 05/09/2021 13:14:14
Copyright (C) 1994 - 2021 Mitchell International Page 1 of 4



26 102092 BDY REMOVE/INSTALL
27 101468 BDY REMOVE/REPLACE
28 AUTO BDY PAINTLESS REPAIR
29

30 AUTO BDY PAINTLESS REPAIR
31

32 100735 BDY REMOVE/INSTALL
33 100736 BDY REMOVE/INSTALL
34 AUTO BDY PAINTLESS REPAIR
35

36

37

38 900500 BDY* REMOVE/INSTALL
39 AUTO BDY PAINTLESS REPAIR
40

41 AUTO BDY PAINTLESS REPAIR
42

43

44 103148 BDY REMOVE/REPLACE
45 AUTO REF REFINISH

46 AUTO BDY REMOVE/REPLACE
47 AUTO  REF REFINISH

48 900500 BDY* REMOVE/INSTALL
49 100462 BDY REMOVE/INSTALL
50 100463 BDY REMOVE/INSTALL
51 936012 ADD'L COST

52 933002 REF ADD'L OPR

53 933003 REF ADD'L OPR

54 933005 BDY ADD'L OPR

55 933018 REF ADD'L OPR

* - Judgment Item
# - Labor Note Applies

L Frt Otr Door Belt Moulding

L Frt Upr Door Adhesive Moulding
R Rear Door Shell (Steel/HSS)
7 QUARTER SIZE DENTS

L Rear Door Shell {Steel/HSS)
7 QUARTER SIZE DENTS

R Rear Otr Door Belt Mouiding
L Rear Otr Door Belt Moulding
Roof Panel

77 QUARTER SIZE DENTS

16 HALF DOLLAR SIZE DENTS
LARGE DENT @ $240.00
Emergency Roof Equipment

R Quarter Outer Panel

8 QUARTER SIZE DENTS

L Quarter Outer Panel

7 QUARTER SIZE DENTS

2 HALF DOLLAR SIZE DENTS
Luggage Lid Panel

Luggage Lid Outside

Add w/Rear View Camera
Luggage Lid Underside
Luggage Lid Emergency Equipment
R Rear Combination Lamp

L Rear Combination Lamp
Hazardous Waste Disposal
Clear Coat

Tint Color

Restore Corrosion Protection
Mask For Overspray

** QRP Certified - Quality Replacement Parts - Certified
** QUAL REPL PART - Quality Replacement Parts

C - Included in Clear Coat Calc

r - CEG R&R Time Used For This Labor Operation

KEYSTONE-INS QUALITY PRT
2400 KERPER BLVD.

STE. E100A

DUBUQUE

IA 52004

(319) 566-5030 (800) 747-2500

4 ** CH1230305C 952.00

UCC/NEW WORLD-DFW
1720 E. HWY 356
(214)352-1191 EXT. 232

IRVING

TX 75060

(214) 352-1191

9 Sublet 125.00
11 Sublet 125.00

ESTIMATE RECALL NUMBER: 09/09/2021 13:41:31 8441090039

Mitchell Data Version: OEM: JUL_21_V

Software Version: 7.1.241

Alternate Parts: 09/09/2021 13:14:14
Copyright (C) 1994 - 2021 Mitchell International
All Rights Reserved

Date: 9/9/2021 01:41 PM
Estimate ID: 8441090039
Estimate Version: 0
Committed
Profile ID: * Mitchell
1.1 #
57010505AM 101.00 0.2
Sublet 175.00 #
Sublet 175.00 #
0.2
0.2
Sublet 1,090.00 *
Existing 1.0% r
Sublet 175.00 #
Sublet 175.00 #
68312401AG 520.00 1.8
Cc 22
0.4
C 1.0
Existing 3.0% r
0.6 #
0.6 #
5.00 *
2.5%
0.5*
10.00 *
5.00 * 0.2%
Page 2 of 4



Recycler Information Section:

McChesney Auto

2707 Waukon Ave

Somers IA 50586
515-467-5546;nofaxnumber

Date: 9/ 9/2021 01:41 PM
Estimate ID: 8441090039

Estimate Version: 0
Committed

Profile ID: * Mitchell

28 2012 Dodge CHARGER R. VA 250.00
Part Number: 20082
Description:0P2,RH,WHT,DECAL, RIGHT REAR SIDE DOOR
Disclaimer: Recycled part pricing may represent either actual pricing
(the price at which the recycler is willing to sell the part for in its
existing condition) or undamaged pricing (the price at which the recycler
would sell the part if it was in undamaged condition).
If you are unsure, please contact the automotive recycler.
Remarks
The vehicle has hail damage all over.
Estimate Totals
Add'l
Labor Sublet
I. Labor Subtotals Units Rate Amount Amount Totals II. Part Replacement Summary Amount
Body 16.0 62.00 10.00 2,840.00 3,84200 T Taxable Parts 1,573.00
Refinish 12,2 107.00 5.00 0.00 1,31040 T
Total Replacement Parts Amount 1,573.00
Taxable Labor 5,152.40
Labor Summary 28.2 5,152.40
III. Additional Costs Amount IV. Adjustments Amount
Taxable Costs 5.00 Insurance Deductible 0.00
Total Additional Costs 5.00 Customer Responsibility 0.00
1, Total Labor: 5,152.40
II. Total Replacement Parts: 1,573.00
III. Total Additional Costs: 5.00
Gross Total: 6,730.40
v. Total Adjustments: 0.00
Net Total: 6,730.40

Point(s) of Impact
16 Non-Collision (P)

Insurance Co: DAS FLEET SERVICES
DES MOINES, IA 50139

Work Phone: (877) 544-7843

Inspection Site: Sioux County Sheriff's Office
Address: 4363 Ironwood Ave
Orange City, IA 51041

Inspection Date: 9/ 9/2021

ESTIMATE RECALL NUMBER: 09/09/2021 13:41:31 8441090039

Mitchell Data Version: OEM: JUL_21_V

Software Version: 7.1.241

Alternate Parts: 09/09/2021 13:14:14
Copyright (C) 1994 - 2021 Mitchell International
All Rights Reserved
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PROPERTY DAMAGE APPRAISERS Due upon receipt 'NVOICE
INVOICE NUMBER INVOICE DATE
844-0167304 09/09/2021
BILLTO CLIENT CODE
Attn: JESSICA HACKBARTH DAS105001
DAS FLEET SERVICES
109 SE 13TH ST BUSINESS LINE / LOSS TYPE
DES MOINESIA 50139 A - Commercial Auto
FOR INQUIRIES: SUBMIT PAYMENT TO:
PDA Sioux City, IA #844 Property Damage Appraisers, Inc.
75-1160563
pdasiouxcity@pdaorg.net Dept #161, P.O. Box 1000
(712) 276-4990 Memphis, TN 38148-0161
Please reference the invoice number and enciose a copy of the invoice on all payments.
INSURED CLAIMANT ASSIGNMENT DATE PDA ASSIGNMENT #
STATE OF IOWA 09/09/2021 844-109-0039
CLAIM # POLICY # LOSS DATE REFERENCE #
APDSQ0I10225559-001 08/28/2021

SERVICE FEE: ( 1 Unit(s) @ $179.00 )

Mileage: ( 88.00 miles ) @ $1.25

ACH Payment Info:

Bank: First Horizon Bank
ABA (US): 084000026 Bank
Account: 220002525824
Email Remit Information to:
achbackup@pdaorg.net

Click here to pay your invoice at PDAClientPortal.com

$ 179.00

$ 110.00

Same-Day Service. Guaranteed. PDA now offers expedited service for standard auto claims in select markets.

**WE HAVE CHANGED OUR BANK REMITTANCE INFORMATICN AS NOTED ABOVE TOTAL CHARGES:
PLEASE UTILIZE OUR PORTAL FOR ALL OTHER ELECTRONIC PAYMENTS ** )

289.00

Terms: Professional fees due upon receipt. Interest accrues at 1% per month,

Please include the invoice number on all payments. INVOICE TOTAL:

$ 289.00

© 2020 by Property Damage Appraisers Incorporated

This document, including style and format, is protected by Copyright and all righls are reserved. The use of this document is strictly prohibited without the written consent and permission of Property Damage Appraisers, Inc.



