Department of
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Collaboration
Customer Service

Date: November 30, 2021

To: Tammy Hollingsworth, Auditor of State
Victoria Newton, Treasurer of State
Executive Council

From: Mariah Flowers, Fleet Manager
DAS Fleet Services
Department of Administrative Services

Re: ALLOCATION REQUEST - 29C20 Claim for Executive Council Consideration

Govemnor Kim Reynolds
Lt. Govemor Adam Gregg

Adam Steen, Director

Vehicle / Event | #443/Raccoon
October 31, 2021
Event Date
Summary Vehicle #443 struck a raccoon. (228986)
Amount $2,477.85 - Estimate
Requested $ _35.00 - Review Invoice
$2,512.85 - Total
Supporting 29C20 Email Notification, Accident Report, Repair Estimate(s), Photos
Documentation

If you have any questions or are in need of additional information, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Thank you

Mariah Flowers, Fleet Manager

DAS Fleet Services

Mariah.Flowers@iowa.gov

515-725-2243

S

Hoover State Office Building | 1305 East Walnut Street | Des Moines, IA50319 | (515) 281-5360 | http://das.iowa.gov



11/1/21, 4:03 P!

State of lowa Mail - FW: ISP 443 24 hr notice veh dam nature

Risk, DAS <das.risk@iowa.gov>

FW: ISP 443 24 hr notice veh dam nature

1 message

Adams Jeannie <jadams@dps.state.ia.us>

Mon, Nov 1, 2021 at 8:27 AM

To: "executivecouncil@tos.iowa.gov" <executivecouncil@tos.iowa.gov>, "Tammy.Hollingsworth@auditor.state.ia.us"

<Tammy.Hollingsworth@auditor.state.ia.us>

Cc: "DAS.Risk@iowa.gov" <DAS Risk@iowa.gov>, Guill Bryan <guill@dps.state.ia.us>

Good morning

Please accept this as a 24 hour notice on behalf of post 2 for Trooper Knedler (#443). Trooper Knedler hit a
raccoon on 10-31-2021. | will forward more information as it becomes available.

Thank you

Jeannie Adams

ISP Fleet & Supply, Fleet Asset Manager

Department of Public Safety

30 N.E. 48" Place

Des Moines, lowa 50313
Direct #: 515-725-0643
Cell Phone: 515-204-3019
Shop: 515-281-3277

Fax: 515-242-6321

Email: jadams@dps.state.ia.us

From: Major Wade <major@dps.state.ia.us>

Sent: Sunday, October 31, 2021 8:58 PM

To: vehicledamage <vehicledamage@dps.state.ia.us>
Cc: Pollard Brad <pollard@dps .state.ia.us>; Anderson Allen <aanderso@dps.state.ia.us>; Taylor Aaron

<ataylor@dps.state.ia.us>

Subject: ISP 443 24 hr notice veh dam nature

All,

https:.‘/maiI.googIe.comimaiI/blALdeOy-UQu-Y5IgtsdeCDOtGTCZOQpOUEJ]nCeMJTJhXIrTZkauIOI?]k=f0086bf760&view=pt&search=al|&permthid=t. .12



11/1/21, 4:09 PM State of lowa Mail - FW: ISP 443 24 hr notice veh dam nature

On 10/31/21 at approximately 2015 hours Trooper Knedler #443 struck a raccoon with patrol vehicle,
while traveling northbound on Hwy 169, causing damage to the patrol vehicle.

Mileage 40969
VIN 2c3cdxkt01h124226

Thanks,
Sgt. Major #49

From: Knedler Justin <knedler@dps.state.ia.us>

Sent: Sunday, October 31, 2021 8:34 PM

To: Pollard Brad <pollard@dps.state.ia.us>; Taylor Aaron <ataylor@dps.state.ia.us>; Major Wade
<major@dps.state.ia.us>; Anderson Allen <aanderso@dps.state.ia.us>

Subject: 10-50 patrol car/racoon

2 attachments
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State Vehicle Damage Report

Attach this completed form to an email along with the items identified below and send
to: vehicledamage@dps.state.ia.us ; das.risk@iowa.qov

» One Repair Estimate from Approved State Bid Shop

» DOT MARS Report (if reportable)

» Memo from the Driver of the State Vehicle

» 3-4 photos of the vehicle damage

***8worn Officers only: Complete a Line of Duty Form #432037 and send to DOT if 10-
50 was reportable!!!

STATE VEHICLE: (Mark if Act of Nature(X) CASE #: 2021026558

Date: 10/31/2021 Time: 8:16 p.m.
(Month/Day/Year) (Time plus a.m./p.m.)
Vehicle Plate #: | 443 Vehicle Mileage: 40969

Vehicle

Description:
(Yr/Make/Model/ &
Vin#)

2020 Dodge Charger VIN# 2C3CDXKTOLH124226

Assigned To: TRP JUSTIN Badge # 443
KNEDLER

Driven By: TRP JUSTIN Badge # 443
KNEDLER

Driver's Lic#: | 427KK0650 Damage: $2440.85

Vehicle Towed: | NO Towed By: N/A

(Yes / No)

Towed To: N/A Towing Cost: SN/A

Seat Belt: YES Type of Vehicle: Marked

(Yes / No) (Marked/Semi /Unmarked)

Injured/Injuries: NONE

Occupants:

(Other than driver)

VEHICLE #2:
DL #: State:
Vehicle Lic. # State:

Driver's Name:

Driver's Address:

Owner's Name:

August 2018



Owner's Address:

Owner’s Phone:

Insurance Info:
(Carrier/Policy #/Phone)

Veh Description:
(Yr/Make/Model & Vin#)

Damage: $ Seat Belt:
(Yes / No)

Injured/Injuries:

Occupants:
(Other than driver)

Occupant(s) Wearing Seat Belt: (ves/No) |

OTHER INFORMATION:

Withesses:

Accident Location: HWY 169 58 MILE MARKER
(Street/Hwy)

County: MADISON

Weather/Road Conditions: | CLOUDY/DRY

Trooper Knedler #443 was on routine patrol while operating issued marked
patrol vehicle, 2020 Dodge Charger. Trooper Knedler’'s patrol vehicle struck
a raccoon in roadway. As a result Trooper Knedler’s patrol vehicle
sustained minor damage.

Property Damage other than | None

Vehicles:
Cost: $N/A
Citations Issued To: None

(List Charge(s) and Statute Code(s))

| Investigating Officer: | Sgt. Wade Major #49 |

VEHICLE #3: (If needed) (For more vehicles, please make extra copies of

this portion)
DL #: State:
Vehicle Lic. # State:

Driver's Name:
Driver's Address:

August 2018



Owner’'s Name:

Owner's Address:

Owner’s Phone:

Insurance Info:
(Carrier/Policy #/Phone)

Veh Description:
(Yr/Make/Model & Vin#)

Damage: Seat Belt: Yes
(Yes / No)

Injured/Injuries:

Occupants:

(Other than driver)

Occupant(s) Wearing Seat Belt: (ves/No) | Yes

August 2018



QUALITY CLAIMS SOLUTIONS

7405 S Bitterroot Pl. Suite 100
SIOUX FALLS, SD 57108
Phone: (877) 237-3727, FAX:(866) 371-2844
qcs@qcesdirect.com

Workfile 1D: 18e58661

For:
QUALITY CLAIMS SOLUTIONS
DAS Fleet Services

Estimate of Record

Owner: TJ IWOA STATE PATROL

Insured: TJ IWOA STATE PATROL

Type of Loss: Collision
Point of Impact: 12 Front

Owner:
TJ IWOA STATE PATROL
Creston, IA 50801

Job Number:
Written By: David Kelley

APDS010228986-001
Days to Repair: 0

Policy #: UNKNOWN Claim #:
Date of Loss:  11/12/2021 12:00 PM

Inspection Location: Repair Facility:
F & M BODY SHOP

901 S DIVISION ST

CRESTON, IA 50601

Other

(641) 782-5115 Evening

VEHICLE

2020 DODG Charger Police AWD (Fleet) 4D SED 8-5.7L Gasoline Sequential MPI

VIN: 2C3CDXKTOLH124226 Production Date: Interior Color:

License: Odometer: 0 Exterior Color:

State: Condition:
TRANSMISSION CONVENIENCE AM Radio Cloth Seats
Automatic Transmission Air Conditioning FM Radio Bucket Seats
4 Wheel Drive Intermittent Wipers Stereo Reclining/Lounge Seats
POWER Tilt Wheel Search/Seek WHEELS
Power Steering Cruise Control Augxiliary Audio Connection Styled Steel Wheels
Power Brakes Rear Defogger SAFETY PAINT
Power Windows Keyless Entry Drivers Side Air Bag Clear Coat Paint
Power Locks Message Center Passenger Air Bag OTHER

Power Mirrors
Power Driver Seat
DECOR

Dual Mirrors
Tinted Glass
Overhead Console

11/12/2021 2:55:57 PM

Steering Wheel Touch Controls
Telescopic Wheel

Climate Control

Backup Camera

Parking Sensors

RADIO

Anti-Lock Brakes (4)

4 Wheel Disc Brakes

Front Side Impact Air Bags
Head/Curtain Air Bags
Hands Free Device

SEATS

314048

Traction Control
Stability Control
California Emissions
Power Trunk/Liftgate

Page 1



Estimate of Record

Owner: TJ IWOA STATE PATROL Job Number:
2020 DODG Charger Police AWD (Fleet) 4D SED 8-5.7L Gasoline Sequential MPI

Line Oper Description Part Number Qty Extended Labor Paint
Price $
i FRONT BUMPER
2 O/H front bumper 34
3 Repl Bumper cover 68267765AC 1 740,00 Incl. 34
4 Add for Clear Coat 1.4
5 * Repl Lower grille w/o adaptive cruise 68214782AB 1 83.65 Incl.
6 COOLING
7 Repl Upper seal 68050130AB 1 73.20
8  AIR CONDITIONER & HEATER
9 Repl Condenser assy 68085784AA 1 521.00 m 15 M
10 AC Service evacuate & recharge m 14 M
11 # Hazardous Waste 1 3.00
12 # Evacuate/ Rechage R134a 1 25.00
13 # Flex Agent 1 5.00
14 # Tint Color 1 0.5
15 # R&I GRILLE PUSH GUARD 1.5
SUBTOTALS 1,450.85 7.8 5.3
ESTIMATE TOTALS
Category Basis Rate Cost $ i
Parts 1,450.85
Body Labor 49hrs @ $ 60.00 /hr 294.00
Paint Labor 53hrs @ $ 60.00 /hr 318.00
Mechanical Labor 29hrs @ $ 70.00 /hr 203.00
Paint Supplies 53hrs @ $ 40.00 /hr 212.00
Subtotal 2,477.85
Total Cost of Repairs 2,477.85
Deductible 0.00
Total Adjustments 0.00
Net Cost of Repairs 2,477.85

THIS IS NOT AN AUTHORIZATION TO BEGIN REPAIRS.

SUPPLEMENTS - Please be advised that the INSURANCE COMPANY requires notice of any supplements prior to the
work being performed. Failure to notify INSURANCE COMPANY and allow INSURANCE COMPANY to review the
supplemental charges may result in non-payment of the supplemental items.

ESTIMATE AUDIT - THIS DOCUMENT IS NOT AN APPRAISAL. INQUIRIES SHOULD BE DIRECTED TO THE
INSURANCE COMPANY LISTED AT THE TOP OF THIS DOCUMENT.

REPAIR SHOPS CAN CONTACT QCS AUDITOR FOR ANY REPAIR RELATED INQUIRIES AT 1-877-237-3727.

11/12/2021 2:55:57 PM 314048 Page 2



Quality Claims Solutions

105 N Krohn Place
Sioux Falls, SD 57103
Phone: 877.237.3727

Fax: 866.371.2844

Quality Claims Solutions Federal Tax ID; 46-0461202
INVOICE =
—
Attention/Adjuster: Jessica Hackbarth Invoice No: APDS010228986-001-3317
Company Name:  DAS Fleet Services Date: FIAREEE ZEsib
Customer ID:  IWAA
Address: 193 3E1ath st Claim Number: APDSOI0228986-001
DesMolnes, 1450519 Vehicle Owner: TJ IWOA STATE PATROL
) )
Quantity Description Unit Price Extended Amount
1 Technical Estimate Review $35.00 $35.00
Item Total: $35.00
Sales Tax: N/A
Invoice Total: $35.00

Your Solution for Today's Claims
www.qcsdirect.com




