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Customer Service

Date: November 30, 2021

To: Tammy Hollingsworth, Auditor of State
Victoria Newton, Treasurer of State
Executive Council

From: Mariah Flowers, Fleet Manager
DAS Fleet Services
Department of Administrative Services

Re: ALLOCATION REQUEST -29C20 Claim for Executive Council Consideration

Vehicle / Event | #1071/Deer
November &, 2021
Event Date
Summary Vehicle #1071 struck a deer. (228860)
Amount $2,167.85 - Estimate
Requested $ 35.00 - Review Invoice
$2,202.85 - Total
Supporting 29C20 Email Notification, Accident Report, Repair Estimate(s), Photos
Documentation

If you have any questions or are in need of additional information, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Thank you,

Mariah Flowers, Fleet Manager
DAS Fleet Services
Mariah.Flowers@iowa.gov
515-725-2243

" Hoover State Office Building | 1305 East Walnut Strest | Des Moines, IA50319 | (515) 281-5360 | http:/idas.jowa. gov



11/10/21, 10:34 AM State of lowa Mail - 29C20

Risk, DAS <das.risk@iowa.gov>

29C20

1 message

Risk, DAS <das.risk@iowa.gov> Wed, Nov 10, 2021 at 10:32 AM
To: Tammy Hollingsworth <Tammy.Hollingsworth@aos.iowa.gov>, TOS ExecutiveCouncil
<executivecouncil@tos.iowa.gov>

Please accept this email as initial 24 hr notification for AON, vehic struck a deer on 11/8/2021. | will

forward all information as soon as it is received.

All accident reports and estimates are due within 72 hours of an accident. Agencies have 60 days to
complete repairs to vehicles once approval is given.

Thank you,
DAS Fleet Services, Risk
Bcpartmentofy lowa Department of Administrative Services
Admlmstratlve Services 0. . .
5 T Division of Business and Property Services
mpowering People .
CollGhsatnn Office: 515-725-2243
Customer: Service Das.Risk@iowa.gov

https://das.iowa.gov

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Platt, Scott <scott.platt@dia.iowa.gov>

Date: Tue, Nov 9, 2021 at 9:59 AM

Subject: Vehicle Accident / Damage Report

To: DAS Risk <das.risk@iowa.gov>

Cc: Mark Speltz <mark.speltz@dia.iowa.gov>, Michelle Boyd <michelle.boyd@dia.iowa.gov>

I'm emailing to report damage to my State issued vehicle due to a deer strike.

Driver: Scott Platt

Department: DIA, Food & Consumer Safety Bureau

Vehicle #: 1071

VIN#: 3FA6P0G76HR316934

Make/Model/Year: 2017 Ford Fusion

Estimated Odometer Mileage: 64,712

Date of event: 11/8/2021

Time of Event: Approximately 5:50 pm

Location of Event: Keokuk County, Highway 21 approximately 2.5 miles north of Highway 92.

Event details: A male buck deer exited the ditch onto the shoulder of the road and was proceeding to cross the
highway with his head down. This male deer had a rack of antlers. I did not have time to slow down or to move
to the opposite lane of the highway and as I passed the deer I believe his antlers clipped the side of the car,
causing damage to the mirror and painted surfaces.

Damage to the vehicle appears to be mostly cosmetic in nature. The right side passengers mirror is broken,
although the mirror assembly is still intact and the outer mirror cover came off. I was able to return to the site of

https://mail.google.com/mail/b/ALGkdOwFdTpCRGrPolMFfJWKVNDbrkEwybEOTQhSROCOOVLARSHU/0/2ik=fc086bf7 6c&view=pt&search=all&permth... 1/5



Vehicle Accident Report

Time and location of accident

Accident Date (Mo/Day/Year) Time No. of Vehicles
11/09/2021 17:50 pm 1

County State

Keokuk lowa

Vehicle 1 (State vehicle)

Driver’s Name Work Street Address

Scott Platt 321 East 12th Street
Driver’s License No./State City, State, Zip

062BB3817 - 1A Des Moines, IA 50319-0083
Date of Birth Department Work Phone Home Phone
02/14/1970 DIA, Food Bureau (515) 669-3953 (641) 295-3808
License Plate No. VIN Year, Make, Model

1071 3FA6POG76HR316934 | 2017 Ford Fusion
Estimate ($) of Damage Description of Damage

Passenger's side mirror glass and cover hroken.
$2,335.22 Scratches to paint on the right front panel and
passenger's side door.

Vehicle/2 (othervehicle) if more than two vehicles-use additional forms

Driver’s Name Street Address
Driver’s License No./State City, State, Zip
Date of Birth Work Phone Home Phone License Plate No.

Description of Damage

DAS Fleet Services @ 109/S.E, 13th St. @ Des Moines, I1A 50319 @ 515-281-3162

Website: https://das.iowa.gov/procurement/flect services @ Email: das.risk@iowa.gov:




Property Damage other than vehicle (fence, utility pole, etc)

Owner’'s Name, Address and Phone

Description of Property Damaged

Injured Persons (attach additional sheetsiif necessary)

Vehicle No. 1/ Name and Address

Describe Injuries

Vehicle No. 2/ Name and Address

Describe Injuries

Name

Address/Phone

Name

Address/Phone

Accident Diagram

Complete diagram below, include a description of what happened.
Use the outline below to sketch the scene of your accident,

writing in street or highway names or numbers.

Use number 1 to indicate the State vehicle.

Hwy 21

[

South

I Deer

North

Traveling southbound
on HWY 21 when a deer
exited the ditch and
started to cross the
highway. The deer's
antlers clipped the
passenger's side of the
vehicle (front panel,
passenger mirror, and
passenger's door)
causing damage to the
vehicle.

DASFleet'Services @ 109 S.E. 13th St. @ Des Moines, |A 50319/ @ 515-281-3162

Website: https://das.iowa.gov/procurement/fleet:services @ Email: das.risk@iowa.gov




QUALITY CLAIMS SOLUTIONS

7405 S Bitterroot PI. Suite 100
SIQUX FALLS, SD 57108
Phone: (877) 237-3727, FAX:(866) 371-2844
qcs@qcsdirect.com

For:
QUALITY CLAIMS SOLUTIONS
DAS Fleet Services

Estimate of Record

Workfile ID:

22eefeed

Owner: STATE OF IOWA

STATE OF IOWA
Collision

Insured:
Type of Loss:

Point of Impact:
Side)

Owner:

STATE OF IOWA

109 SE 13TH ST

DES MOINES, IA 50319

Written By: David Kelley

Palicy #:
Date of Loss:

02 Right Front Pillar (Right

Inspection Location:

Copeland Collision Center

1308 17th ave E
Oskaloosa, IA 52577
Other

(641) 676-6060 Evening

NOT PROVIDED
11/11/2021 12:00 PM

Claim #:
Days to Repair:

Repair Facility:

Job Number:

APDS010228860-001
0

VEHICLE

2017 FORD Fusion S FWD 4D SED 4-2.5L Gasoline Sequential MPI TAN

VIN: 3FA6P0G76HR316934 Production Date: Interior Color:

License: Odometer: 64,713 Exterior Color: TAN

State: Condition:
TRANSMISSION CONVENIENCE AM Radio Hands Free Device
Automatic Transmission Air Conditioning FM Radio SEATS
POWER Intermittent Wipers Stereo Cloth Seats
Power Steering Tilt Wheel Search/Seek Bucket Seats
Power Brakes Cruise Control CD Player Reclining/Lounge Seats
Power Windows Rear Defogger Auxiliary Audio Connection WHEELS
Power Locks Keyless Entry SAFETY Aluminum/Alloy Wheels
Power Mirrors Alarm Drivers Side Air Bag PAINT

DECOR

Dual Mirrors
Tinted Glass
Console/Storage
Overhead Console

11/11/2021 3:00:43 PM

Message Center

Steering Wheel Touch Controls
Telescopic Wheel

Backup Camera

RADIO

Passenger Air Bag
Anti-Lock Brakes (4)

4 Wheel Disc Brakes

Front Side Impact Air Bags
Head/Curtain Air Bags

314048

Clear Coat Paint
OTHER

Traction Control
Stability Control
California Emissions

Page 1



Estimate of Record

Owner: STATE OF IOWA Job Number:
2017 FORD Fusion S FWD 4D SED 4-2.5L Gasoline Sequential MPI TAN
Line Oper Description Part Number Qty Extended Labor Paint
Price $
1 FRONT BUMPER & GRILLE
2 R&I R&I bumper cover 1.2
3 FRONT LAMPS
4 R&I RT Headlamp assy w/o signature 0.3
lamps
5 FENDER
6 # Rpr RT Fender 3.0 2.0
7 Add for Clear Coat 0.8
8 R&I RT Upper molding bright/black 0.2
9 R&I RT Fender liner w/o turbo w/2.5 0.3
liter DOHC
10 PILLARS, ROCKER & FLOOR
11 R&I RT Rocker molding 0.7
12 FRONT DOOR
13 R&I RT Belt molding 0.3
14 * Rpr  RT Quter panel 3.0 2.3
15 Overlap Major Adj. Panel -0.4
16 Add for Clear Coat 0.4
17 R&I RT Door glass FORD w/o laminate 0.6
18 R&I RT Handle, outside w/o passive 0.3
entry
19 R&I RT R&I trim panel 0.5
20 Repl RT Mirror assy FS7217682B 1 221.20 0.5
21 Repl RT Mirror cover DS7Z17D742AAPTM 1 55.25 0.2 0.5
22 Overlap Minor Panel -0.2
23 Add for Clear Coat 0.1
24 # Repl DECAL-AS PER INVOICE 1 0.3
25 R&I RT Applique all w/o keyless lock 0.2
pad
26 REARDOOR
27 * Rpr  RT Quter panel 1.0 23
28 Overlap Major Adj. Panel -0.4
29 Add for Clear Coat 0.4
30 R&I RT Belt malding 0.3
31 * R&I RT Applique front 0.2
32 R&I RT Applique rear 0.2
33 R&I RT Door glass FORD 0.3
34 R&I RT Window regulator 0.3
35 R&I RT Handle, outside w/o passive 0.3
entry
36 R&L RT R&I trim panel 0.5
37 # PRE REPAIR SCAN 1 50.00 05 M
38 # POST REPAIR SCAN 1 50.00 05 M
11/11/2021 3:00:43 PM 314048 Page 2



Estimate of Record

Owner: STATE OF IOWA Job Number:
2017 FORD Fusion S FWD 4D SED 4-2.5L Gasoline Sequential MPI TAN
39 # Hazardous Waste 1 3.00
40 # Cover Car 1 5.00 0.2
41 # Corrosion Protection 1 6.00
SUBTOTALS 390.45 15.9 7.8
ESTIMATE TOTALS
Category Basis Rate Cost $
Parts 390.45
Bady Labor 149hrs @ $ 62.15 /hr 926.04
Paint Labor 78hrs @ $ 100.00 /hr 780.00
Mechanical Labor 1.0hrs @ $ 71.36 /hr 71.36
Subtotal 2,167.85
Total Cost of Repairs 2,167.85
Deductible 0.00
Total Adjustments 0.00
Net Cost of Repairs 2,167.85

MyPricelink Estimate ID / Quote ID:
888088566649856000 / 95956327

THIS IS NOT AN AUTHORIZATION TO BEGIN REPAIRS.

SUPPLEMENTS - Please be advised that the INSURANCE COMPANY requires notice of any supplements prior to the
work being performed. Failure to notify INSURANCE COMPANY and allow INSURANCE COMPANY to review the

supplemental charges may result in non-payment of the supplemental items.

ESTIMATE AUDIT - THIS DOCUMENT IS NOT AN APPRAISAL. INQUIRIES SHOULD BE DIRECTED TQ THE

INSURANCE COMPANY LISTED AT THE TOP OF THIS DOCUMENT.

REPAIR SHOPS CAN CONTACT QCS AUDITOR FOR ANY REPAIR RELATED INQUIRIES AT 1-877-237-3727.

11/11/2021 3:00:43 PM 314048
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Quality Claims Solutions

105 N Krohn Place
Sioux Falls, SD 57103
Phone: 877.237.3727

Fax: 866.371.2844

Quality Claims Solutions Federal Tax ID: 46-0461202
INVOICE =
g e B
Attention/Adjuster: Jessica Hackbarth Invoice No: APDS0I10228860-001-3219
Company Name:  DAS Fleet Services Lt EirTlieag] =01 Al
Customer ID:  IWAA
Address: g At ot Claim Number: APDS010228860-001
Deshoines, |A50312 Vehicle Owner: STATE OF IOWA
L3 L J
Quantity Description Unit Price Extended Amount
1 Technical Estimate Review $35.00 $35.00
Item Total: $35.00
Sales Tax: N/A
Invoice Total: $35.00

Your Solution for Today's Claims
www.qcsdirect.com



