SVP Invoices - SFY 2022 (04/14/22)

Date Paid by Approval
. Vendor Description Amount Executive PP
Received X Date
Council
3/18/22 William A Schmitt, Ph.D. LLC Final Eval and report Damion Rutues $4,000.00
4/6/22 Rachel Kahn Ph.D. Final Eval report Larry Nicklus Dean Howard $4,000.00
3/20/22 Jeffrey Davis Ph.D. Record Review/Report Preparation Ross $3,200.00

$11,200.00 $0.00




William A. Schmitt, Ph.D,, L1L.C
Licensed Psychologist

PO Box 930376
Verona, W1 53593
(608) 698-2713
wschmitt55@gmail.com

INVOICE
Final Evaluation for Iowa §229A

Re: Damion Rutues
DOB: July 19, 1979

Evaluator: William A. Schmitt, PhD
Date: March 28, 2022

Final Evaluation and Report was completed and submitted March 28, 2022,

Contracted fee for services rendered: $4000.00

Thank you for this interesting referral.
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Palmer, Tina

From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]

Sent: Friday, March 18, 2022 2:48 PM
To: McAtes, Olivia; Palmer, Tina
Subject; RE: Invoice

Approved

SCOTT

Please note new email address: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov

Scott D. Brown

Special Assistant Attorney General/Area Prosecutions Division
Office of the Attorney General of lowa

1305 E. Walnut 81,

Des Moines, |A 50319

Main: (515) 281-5164 | Divisien: (515) 281-3648 | Direcl: (515) 281-6601 | Fax: {515) 281-8824
Email: scolt. brown@ag.iowa.qov | www.jowaattorneygeneral.goy

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email message (including any attachments) may be confidential or
protected by one or more of the following: the attorney-client privilege, attorney work product doctrine, or
applicable laws. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this message in error, please: (1) do not
read, print, copy, distribute or use it in any way; (2) permanently delete or destroy the message (including any
attachments); and (3} notify the sender immediately by reply email or telephone. Any unintended transmission
of this email message does not constitute a waiver of any applicable privilege or protection. Thank you,

From: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Friday, March 18, 2022 2:43 PM

To: Palmer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>; Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: Invoice

Please see the attached invoice. Thank you hoth!

Olivia McAtee

s Investigator Il

4. Office of the Attorney General of lowa

& 1305 E. Walnut 5t,

A3 Des Moines, lowa 50319

£Y  Main: (515) 281-5164 | Division: {515) 281-3648 | Direct: (515) 281-6566
Email: glivia.meatee@ag.lowa.qov | www iowaatlorneygeneral.gay




Rachel Kahn. Ph.D.

P.O. Box 6491

Monona, WI 53716-0491
USA

Phone: 608-620-3067

To:

lowa Office of the Attorney General
¢/o Olivia McAtee

Area Prosecutions Division

Hoover Building

1305 E. Walnut Street

Des Moines, IA 50319

LN

LCE

DATE: APRIL 5, 2022

Description

Amaount
Final Evaluation Report on Larry Nicklus Dean Howard $4,000
Engagement Letter: 10/29/2021
Report Date: 04/05/2022
Total $4,000

Payment should made out to Rachel Kahn and malled to Rachel Kahn, P.O. Box 6491, Monona, WI 53716~

0491

Gl

Rachel Kahn, Ph.D,
Licensed Psychologist
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Palmer, Tina

From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]

Sent: Wednesday, April 6, 2022 2:24 PM
To: McAtee, Olivia; Palmer, Tina
Subject: RE: Final LH

Approved.

Scott

Sent from my Verizon, Samsung Galaxy smariphone

~~~~~~~~ Original message --------

From: "McAtee, Olivia" <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>

Date: 4/6/22 3:14 PM (GMT-05:00)

To: "Brown, ScottAG [AG]" <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>, "Palmer, Tina" <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: Final LH

Please see the attached invoice. Thank you!

From: Rachel Kahn <rachel.kahn@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, April 5, 2022 3:55 PM

To: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: Final LH

Hi Olivia,
Here is the final report for Larry Howard. 1 attached the invoice as well - but wondering if it would be easier if [ just
submitted one with both trial and eval after next week. Either way is fine - whatever works best/easiest.

Thanks,

Rachel

Rachel Kahn, Ph.D.
Licensed Psychologist
217-621-5944

**NOTICE: This E-mail and any attachments may contain confidential
information. Use and further disclosure of the information by the
recipient must be consistent with applicable laws, regulations, and
agreements. If you received this email in error, please notify the




Jeffrey Davis, Ph.D.

Licensed Psychologist » lowa License #083838 « California License #PSY19044
P.O. Box 6243 » Los Osos, CA 93412 « 805-748-5081
Jeffreydavisphd@gmail.com

March 19, 2022

Olivia McAtee, Investigator ||
lowa Attorney General’s Office
1305 E. Walnut

Des Maines, 1A 50319

Respondent: Ross, Jonathan Andrew
DCI No.: 6709802A

Dear Ms, McAtee,

Below is the invoice for the preliminary evaluation of Jonathan Ross pursuant to lowa Code
§ 229A. Please remit to the address shown above.

Activity Report Date Total

Record Review/Report Preparation 03-15-22 $3,200

Please do not hesitate to contact me if you have questions.

Respectfuily,
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Palmer, Tina

AR R
From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]
Sent: Sunday, March 20, 2022 5:13 PM
To: McAtee, Olivia; Palmer, Tina
Subject: RE: Invoice
Approved
Scott

Sent from my Verizon, Samsung Galaxy smartphone

-------- Original message «-------

From: "McAtee, Olivia" <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>

Date: 3/20/22 4:37 PM (GMT-06:00)

To: "Palmer, Tina" <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>, "Brown, ScottAG [AG]" <Scott. Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: Invoice

Please see the attached invoice. Thank you!

From: Jeff Davis <jeffreydavisphd @gmail.com>
Sent: Saturday, March 19, 2022 9:47 PM

To: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee @ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: invaoice

Hi Olivia,
I've attached the invoice for the prelim evaluation of J. Ross (03-18-22) PRC.

Thanks,
Jeff

Jeffrey Davis, Ph.D.
Licensed Psychologist
CONFIDENTIALLY NOTICE: This message, and any attachments, may contain information that is

confidential, privileged, and/or protected from disclosure under state and federal laws that deal with privacy and
security of information. If you receive this message in error or through inappropriate means, please reply to this




