SVP Invoices - SFY 2022 (01/28/22)

Paid by

D A |
af:e Vendor Description Amount Executive pprova
Received X Date
Council

1/27/22 Barry M. Leavitt Psy.D. Preliminary Evaluation Patterson $3,200.00
1/6/22 Thomas Forensic, LLC Engagement Letter and Preliminary Repart $3,200.00
12/13/21 Thomas Forenslc, L1C Mileage $46.80
1/24/22 David Thornton, Ph.D, Testimony Hearing Mischke $2,400.00
1/24/22 David Thornton, Ph.D. Preliminary/Interview/Final/Testimony Report Diaz $9,600.00
1/24/22 David Thornton, Ph.D. Initial evaiuation and Preliminary Report Holtmevyer $3,200.00

Initial evaluation and Preliminary Report and

1/24/22 David Thornton, Ph.D. e .
summerize findings Hill

$3,200.00

$24,846.80 $0.00
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Barry M. Leavitt, Psy.D.

Barry M. Leavitt, Psy.D. & Associates, LLC
1500 Skokie Boulevard, Suite 315
Northbrook, IL 60062
(847) 849-555%

Fax: (847) 849-5554

barrymleavitt@comeast.net

INVOICE FOR FORENSIC PSYCHOLOGICAL SERVICES

Date: January 25, 2022
For Professional Services: Barry M. Leavitt, Psy. D. Fee:
RE: Dewayne Patterson
IaDOC #6040396
01/25/2022 Preliminary Evaluation 3,200.00
Totak _ _$3,200.00

Please make checks payable to:
Dr, Barry M. Leavitt
Barry M. Leavitt, Psy. D. and Associates, LLC

W /479 : /A—J /20 22,

Bané/ﬁfl Leavitt, Psy. D. Date
1llineis Licensed Psychologist

Hllinois Licensed Sex Offender Evaluator

Illinois Licensed Sex Offender Treatment Provider

Aﬂprovsﬁ

”f/ﬂf} )*)j f&’Téiﬁ" Ias
Agency. SVE isfz){/jg(’ ;’KL%”??’/"’
Obi Org

(/1 3057700

Class




Palmer, Tina

from: MicAtee, Olivia

Sent: Thursday, January 27, 2022 10:50 PM

To: Patmer, Tina; Brown, ScottAG [AG]

Subject: FW: Dewayne Patterson

Attachments: Signed |nvoice Patterson 01_25_2022 (1).pdf

Please see the attached invoice. Thank you!

From: Barry Leavitt <barrymleavitt@comcast.net>
Sent: Tuesday, January 25, 2022 10:26 AM

To: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: Dewayne Patterson

Good morning,

| have attached the preliminary evaluation for Mr. Patterson, along with my signature page and
invoice. Please let me know you have received this.

I look forward to discussing the case at the PRC this Friday morning.

Best,
Barry



THOMAS FORENSIC, LL.C

Tracy A. Thomas, Ph.D., ABPP

Board Certified Forensic Psychologist

Licensed Psychologist (Iowa, Nebraska, Missouri)
Phone (712) 730-8274

Fax (712)248-8655

Email: TracyThomas@ThomasForensic.com

Web: IowaForensicPsychologist.com

INVOICE

INVOICE #51A2022

DATE: 1/6/2022

TO: FOR:
Iowa Office of the Attorney General Forensic Consultation/Evaluative Services:
¢/o Olivia McAtee lowa Code 229A Evaluations

Area Prosecutions Division
Hoover Building

1305 E. Walnuf Street

Des Moines, 1A 50319

CASE DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE SERVICE AMOUNT
DATES
s an Engagement Letter: 12/26/2021
Donald White Sr. Preliminary Report Date: 1/6/2022 1/6/2022 $3,200
TOTAL $3,200

Make all checks payable to:
Thomas Forensic, LLC

¢/o Tracy Thomas

3827 Brickman Avenue
Ames, IA 50010

Claimant EIN: 47-1228282
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Tracy A. Thomas, Ph.D., ABPP
Board Certified Forensic Psychologist
Licensed Psychologist (IA, NE, M)




Palmer, Tina

From: Brown, ScottAG [AG])

Sent: Thursday, January 6, 2022 3:19 PM
To: McAtee, Olivia; Palmer, Tina
Subject: RE: Invoice for Donald White Sr,
Approved

SCOTT

Please note new email address: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov

5t Scott D. Brown
Special Assistant Attorney General/Area Prosecutions Division
Office of the Attorney General of lowa
1305 E. Walnut St.
Bes Moines, |1A 50319
Main: {515) 281-5184 | Division: (515) 281-3648 | Birect: (515) 281-6691 | Fax: (515) 281-8894
Email: scott.brown@ag.iowa.qov | www.iowaattorneygenaral.qov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email message (including any attachments) may be confidential or
protected by one or more of the following: the attorney-client privilege, attorney work product doctrine, or
applicable laws. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this message in error, please: (1) do not
read, print, copy, distribute or use it in any way; (2) permanently delete or destroy the message (including any
attachments); and (3) notify the sender immediately by reply email or telephone. Any unintended transmission
of this email message does not constitute a waiver of any applicable privilege or protection. Thank you.

From: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Thursday, January 6, 2022 2:36 PM

To: Palmer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>; Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: Invoice for Donald White Sr.

Please see the attached invoice. Thank you!

From: Jamie Tatarek <jamie@thomasforensic.com>
Sent: Thursday, January 6, 2022 11:46 AM

To: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: Invoice for Donald White Sr.

Olivia,

Attached is the invoice for Donald White Sr. that I am sending on behalf of Dr, Thomas. Please let me know if you need
anything else from me in this matter.

Thank you,




THOMAS FORENSIC, LL.C INVOICE
Tracy A, Thomas, Ph.D., ABPP

Board Certified Forensic Psychologist

Licensed Psychologist (Iowa, Nebraska, Missouri)

Phone (712} 730-8274

Fax (712)248-8655

Email: TracyThomas@ThomasForensic.com

Web: lowaForensicPsychologist.com

INVOICE #921A2021
DATE: 12/8/2021

TO: FOR:

Iowa Office of the Attorney General Forensic Consultation/Evaluative Services:
cfo Olivia McAtee lowa Code 229A Evaluations

Area Prosecutions Division

Hoover Building

1305 E. Walnut Street
Des Moines, 1A 50319

CASE DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE SERVICE AMOUNT
DATES
Kevin McDonald Trial Testimony 12/8/2021 $2,400
. Mileage: Ames to Webster County
Kevin McDonald Courthouse — Roundtrip (120 miles x .39) 12/8/2021 $46.80
TOTAL $2,446.80

Malke all checks payable to:
Thomas Forensic, LLC

¢/o Tracy Thomas

3827 Brickman Avenue
Ames, [A 50019

Claimant EIN: 47-1228282
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David Thornton, Ph.D.

4230 East Towne Blvd #115
Madison

WI 53704

USA

Phone 608-698-8406

DATE: JANUARY 24, 2022

For the Attention of: Olivia McAtee, Office of the Attorney General of Iowa

Description Amount
Testimony In Mischke Hearing (09/23/2021) $2,400,00
Total $2,400,00

Payment should be by check made out to David Thornton and mailed to David Thornton, 4230 East Towne

Blvd #115, Madison WI 53704
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David Thornton, Ph.D.

4230 East Towne Blvd #115

Madison
WI 53704
USA
Phone 608-698-8406 DATE: JANUARY 24, 2022
For the Attention of: Olivia McAtee, Office of the Attorney General of lowa
Description Amount
Preliminary Report on Damian Diaz{dated 7/16/2021) $3,200.00
Interview and final report on Damian Diaz {submitted $4,000,00
10/21/2021)
Testimony (11/22/2021) $2,400.00
Total $9,600.00

Payment should be by check made out to David Thornton and mailed to David Thornton, 4230 East Towne
Blvd #115, Madison WI 53704
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David Thornton, Ph.D.

4230 East Towne Blvd #115
Madison

WI 53704

USA

Phone 608-698-8406

DATE: JANUARY 24, 2022

For the Attention of: Olivia McAtee, Office of the Attorney General of Iowa

Description Amount
Initial Evaluation and Preliminary Report on Justin Holtmeyer $3,200.00
and summarize findings to PRC (PRC dated 11/19/2021)

Total $3,200.00

Payment should be by check made out to David Thornton and mailed to David Thornton, 4230 East Towne

Blvd #115, Madison WI 53704
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David Thornton, Ph.D.

4230 East Towne Blvd #115
Madison

WI 53704

USA

Phone 608-698-8406

For the Attention of: Olivia McAtee, Office of the Attorney General of Towa

Description Amount
Initial Evaluation and Preliminary Report on Gregory Hill and $3,200.00
summarize findings to PRC (report dated 09/19/2021)

Total $3,200.00

Payment should be by check made out to David Thornton and mailed to David Thornton, 4230 East Towne

Bivd #115, Madison WI 53704

DATE: JANUARY 24, 2022




Palmer, Tina

From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]

Sent: Monday, January 24, 2022 9:.05 PM
To: McAtee, Olivia; Palmer, Tina
Subject: RE: Invoices

Approved on all four. Thanks for the heads up on the higher amount on the third
invoice. They all look like standard fees we normally get charged.

SCOTT

Please note new email address: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov

Y & ScottD. Brown

Special Assistant Attorney General/Area Prosecutions Division
Office of the Attorney General of lowa

1305 E. Walnut St

Des Molnes, IA 50319

Main: {515) 281-5164 | Division: (515} 281-3648 | Direct: (515) 281-8691 | Fax: (515) 281-8894
Email: scolt. brown@aa.iowa.qov | www.jowaattorneygeneral.gov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email message (including any attachments) may be confidential or
protected by one or more of the following: the attorney-client privilege, attorney work product doctrine, or
applicable laws. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this message in error, please: (1) do not
read, print, copy, distribute or use it in any way; (2) permanently delete or destroy the message (including any
attachments); and (3) notify the sender immediately by reply email or telephone. Any unintended transmission
of this email message does not constitute a waiver of any applicable privilege or protection, Thank you,

From: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.lowa.gov>

Sent: Monday, January 24, 2022 1:17 PM

To: Palmer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>; Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: Invoices

Hi Tina and Scott,
| have attached four invoices for approval. Please note that the third attachment includes three fees, | have double
checked these and everything looks correct on my end, but just a heads up that the amount you’ll be approving is more

than the normal invoice.

Thank you,

Olivia

From: David Thornton <davidsmthornton@icloud.com>
Sent: Monday, January 24, 2022 12:50 PM



