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February 3, 2025

Accounting Department
Office of the Treasurer

Lucas Building
321 E 12" Street
Des Moines, IA, 50319

The Executive Council, in a meeting held on this date, approved the Department of Natural Resources’ request
for a supplemental emergency allocation in the amount of $4,510.85. This brings the total allocation to
$157,671.96. On May 21, 2019, Green Island Wildlife area in Jackson County and Princeton Wildlife Area in
Scott County were damaged by flood. Request was to cover repair costs.

This represents full and final payment and this allocation closed.

EXECUTIVE COUNCIL OF IOWA
Kristi Onstot

Kristi Onstot
Executive Secretary

cc: Kayla Lyon, Director, Department of Natural Resources
Sherry Arntzen, Bureau Chief, Parks, Forests and Preserves Bureau, Department of Natural Resources
Kara Bryant, Budget and Finance, Department of Natural Resources
Matt Bender, Department of Management
Heather Hackbarth, Department of Management

AOS Claim # 1788
TOS Job #



OFFICE OF AUDITOR OF STATE
STATE OF IOWA

Rob Sand
Auditor of Stat
State Capitol Building udrtorof State
Des Moines, Iowa 50319-0004
Telephone (515) 281-5834

January 21, 2025
Kristi Onstot
Executive Council
LOCAL
Subject: Flood Damages at Green Island Wildlife Area in Jackson County and

Princeton Wildlife Area in Scott County on May 21, 2019
FEMA Declared Disaster DR4421
Department of Natural Resources
Claim dated March 8, 2021
AOS Claim ID: 1788

The Department’s request included a supplemental allocation request of
$4,510.85 because additional damages were identified. We recommend Executive
Council approval of the supplemental allocation of $4,510.85, which increases the
allocation to $157,671.96. In accordance with Executive Council policy, we have
examined the invoices and supporting documentation for final payment related to this
loss. We have found the items to be in order as shown below:

Documented request $ 157,671.96
Executive Council allocation (Revised) $ 157,671.96
Less:
Previous payments $ 0.00
This payment 157,671.96
Total $ 157,671.96
Remaining Executive Council allocation 3 0.00

We recommend that reimbursement be made in the amount of $157,671.96.
This represents full and final payment on this allocation.

Sincerely,

Brian R. Brustkern, CPA
Deputy Auditor of State

cc: Kayla Lyon, Director, Department of Natural Resources
Monica Thelen, Wildlife Bureau, Department of Natural Resources
Kara Bryant, Budget and Finance, Department of Natural Resources



|OWA

DNR

IOWA DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

November 26, 2024

To: Tammy Hollingsworth, Auditor of State
Kristi Onstot, Treasurer of State

Executive Council

From: Kara Bryant, Federal Aid Coordinator
Department of Natural Resources

Re: Reimbursement Request —29C.20 Claim

GOVERNOR KIM REYNOLDS

DIRECTOR KAYLA LYON

AOS Claim # 1788
Location Green Island Wildlife Area in Jackson County
Event Date May 21, 2019

Event Summary

Flood damages

Amount Requested

$157,671.96

Request Details

1%t and final

DNR Accounting String

0233-542-0092-9A-0301

Copies of accounting documents paid by the DNR included in this request are attached. Actual costs were
higher than estimated when the allocation request was submitted therefore we are requesting an additional

$4,510.85.

If you have questions or need additional information, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Thank you,

Digitally signed by Kara
Bryant
Kara Bryant 5126
15:18:19 -06'00"
Kara Bryant, Federal Aid Coordinator
Department of Natural Resources

kara.bryant@dnr.iowa.gov

515-587-7409

Phone: 515-725-8200

6200 PARK AVE STE 200, DES MOINES IA 50321
www.lowaDNR.gov

Fax: 515-725-8201




Vendor Customer Name | Vendor Customer Doc Doc ID Object Name Account Code Cycle Check Amount |Bureau| PW
CD Date Number

Boomerang Corp 00002126375 GAX 11091922754 |Land Improvement |2023-0598-542-C900-19-901-9110- | 09/23/22 185699881 | 599,153.45|WL 1074

Boomerang Corp 00002126375 GAX|P1110242299|Land Improvement |2023-0598-542-C900-19-901-9110- | 10/24/22|85725741| 31,534.39|WL 1074

25% EC Request ~ $157,671.96



IOWA DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES PAYMENT REQUEST

{3 - "
Est.No.1  Pre-final ENGINEERING and REALTY SERVICES BUREAU (Capkal Improvement Comract)
i Project Description & Location: Payableto: = Boomerang Corp
Project No. 21-06-49-01 Request Date: 9/12/20 Green Island And Princeton Levee Repairs Address: 13225 Circle Drive, Suite A
Contract Date: 4/14/2 Maquoketa Wildlife Unit, JACKSON, lowa Anamosa, IA 52205

Specified Completion Date: 9/30/2022
Work Performed From: 7/18/2022 to 9/2/2022

kem Fund 7 Description Unitof ~Unit . QUANTITIES " T T T AmouNts
b Meas. rice  Contract Actual * Overrun Underrun Contract  Actual  Overrun  Undermun

FEMAT Mobilization for Al Sites ~ ™ LS 8875000 1.00f
Unclassified Fil T TeN T Tsira0 TUaie00  seoot
FEMA1 Siope Leveling (One Side of Levee) ~ LF. $2.00 1,750.00 1,750.00 f _...«m 50000
FEMA1 Seeding and Fertlizing __ Aces  $1,00000 060 1.10f 050 $1,00.00  $500.00
FEMA1 Erosion Matting ™ "7~ JSY. %130 2917.00 311120 f 194.20 ) $4,02456  $252.46
. FEMA1 Unclassified Fill e GY. T$1780 83600 goof T ~$14,880.80
7 FEMA1 Siope Leveling (One Side of Levee) ~ LF. $200 451000 451600Ff ey %808 $9,02000
.8 FEMAT Seeding and Fertiizing =~ ‘Acres © $1,00000 985 205f 050 . §1,55000 ' $2,050.00  $500.00
9 FEMA1 Erosion Matting R _ $130 '7517.00 836560 f 84860 8977270 $10,87528 $1,103.18
.10 FEMA1 Unclassified Fil .. CY.TTT$1780 46500 465007 8827700  $8277.00
.M FEMAT Siope Leveling (One Side of Lavee) " "LF. - Ts200 (251000F " "'$502000  $502000
12 FEMA1 Seeding and Fertiizing Acres  $1,000. 136f 050 " 386000  $1,380.00  $500.00
13 FEMATE at T BY. T s130 445910F 27610 "7 9543790  §5796.83  $358.93
14 FEMA1 Unclass ey sreo m.aoo 57600F 71025280  $10,352.80
|15 FEMAT Siope Leveling (One Side of Levee)  'LF. ~  $2.00 - 311000 “311000f " " "sgrano0 $6,22000
16 FEMA1 Seeding and Fertiizing Acres  $1,00000  1.07 1571 050 . $107000 $1570.00  $500.00
17 FEMA1 Erosion Matting T T ey $1.30 518300 552510 f 342.10 $6,737.90  $7,182.63  $444.73
18 FEMA1 Unclassified Fill A CY. $17.80 1,086.00 1,086.00 f | $19,330.80  $19,330.80
19 FEMAT Slope Leveling (One Side of Levee)  LF. $200 586000 586000f 1172000 $11,720. o0
20 FEMA1 Seeding and Fertilizing Acres  $1,00000 202 252f 050 $2,02000  $252000  $500.00
21 FEMA1 Erosion Matting _ SY.  $130 9767.00 9767.00f  $12,697.10  $12,697.10
22 FEMA1 Unclassified Fill .. CY. T %1780 70000  700.00 f . ... .851246000 $12,460.00
23 FEMA1 Slope Leveling (One Side of levee)  LE ~  $200 3,780.00  3,780.00 f B . . §7.56000  $7.560.00
_24 FEMA1 Seeding and Fertilzing .. Acres  $1,000.00 130  180f 050 __$1,30000  $1,800.00  $500.00 )
25 FEMA1ErosionMating T gyt _$1.30 630000 671580 f 41580 ' $8190.00  $8730.54  $540.54
26  FEMA1 Unclassified Fil .. .CY 31780 139000 1399007 . ..$2490220  $24,902.20
.27 FEMA1 Siope Leveling (One Side of Levee) ~ LF.  $2.00 755000 755000f ~§$1510000 $15,100.00
28 FEMA1EngineeringFabric gy $250 12583.00 1258300f ' 3145750 §31 457.50 ._
.29 FEMA1 Revetment, Class€ . .CY. " '$3700 "8,388.00 853180 f 14380 - $310,356.00 $315,676.60  $5,320.60
30 FEMA1 Seeding and Fertilizing 7 "Acres 087  087f " '7"sg7000 $870.00
31 FEMA1 Undlassified Fill SN - ?.So 63100 © 631.00f 7 7 U §91,231.80  $11,231.80
.32 FEMAT1 Slope Leveling (One Side of Levee) ~ LF $200 340500 340500f .. $6,81000  $6,810.00
33 FEMA1 SeedingandFertiizing ~  “Acres £ $1,000.00 147 A § T | _$117000 117000 0
34 FEMA1 Erosion Mattng 7 5 $1.30 567500 0001 " "567500  $7,377.50 $0.00 87371750
CO1a FEMA1 Rock Removal ... Ls smg0000 " 100 100t = ~ $11,000.00  $11,000.00

CO1b FEMA1 Class A Road Stone ) Tons  $30.00 1,000.00 100422 f 423  $30,000.00 $30,126.60  $126.60



ltem Fund Description Unit of Unit QUANTITIES AMOUNTS

z_".... xS i i N o -smmm _ulnm 1 oo_.__n.q.mn.\... ‘“_)w.?..‘m_‘ * 0<m:.=: c_.aw_.:.: Contract " Actual . Overrun  Underrun
T Denotes A Finaf Quantity sy . T T 3._.>_.m  $626,91830 $630,687.84 §$11,147.04 §7,377.50
FEMAI=FederaiFEMAT el Ce S ey S _
L. Dpprovals e i no:-ﬁco““:usmm O..Mqﬂ_momc:ﬁ mm»_BM.Ww ..M “MM_o:m_w Original Contract Amount $585,918.30
w”wﬂmmnww mmam.m:mn the items appearing hereon for paymentare * 4 001121202 ~ $41,000.00 _ No.  Date  Amount’ Allowable Quantity Overruns (+)  $11,147.04
21y .x.u QL T m (Oco_.—m_. —Jmm Ummz Uma .ﬂodmm n:m:mm o_v%—-m ﬂh..— Qoocco l—-%_ vﬂﬂf__o-._m e MQ QQ Dﬂmﬁ_ﬂ_q c:am-:—vc_x—m Al . ) Wﬂ.wﬂﬂ.mo
0 ’ Q \ ~Mv ‘ mm»:.-.nmnmm A ‘ mcv..._.cnm_ ﬁmmm,...mm,.m.wh
) yﬂ__\ru!dén n.._m:um Orders $41,000.00
L e s Net Contract Value of Work ~ $630,687.84
Recommended for Payment: Michael — sumsaiiz- Value of Completed Work ~ $630,687.84
Michael Dufoe, PE.  Dufoe e P _\t\ﬁ ‘ Materials Stored On-Site $0.00
nspacis e U Y Total Retained Percent (%) () $31,534.39
SRR (R et psates £ Amount Due Incl. This Estimate $599,153.45
Approved for Payment: ) \ .__m,“”w_ _u".m<.o=m_< AR $0.00
-.m<_m m —Am—. Digitally signed by Travis Baker mates
; Date: 2022.09.15 12:45:05 -05'00' zmw >Bo.._:ﬂ U:m ._.:_m mu»::mnm mmow 183 am
Bureau Chief Date
Checked by: i

S Ll Dale 57

=

599, 153 Y5 0548 -S4z -Cao0 17 GO  CIo01907 K

Tlrrin
Vo



Est. N

Project No. 21-06-49-01 Request Date: 9/12/2022

0.2  Final

Contract Date: 4/14/202
Specified Completion Date: 9/30/2022

IOWA DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
ENGINEERING and REALTY SERVICES BUREAU

R -

AYMENT REQUEST

(Capital Improvemnent Contract)

Project Description & Location: Payable to:

Green Island And Princeton Levee Repairs Address:
Magquoketa Wildlife Unit , JACKSON, lowa

Boomerang Corp

13225 Circle Drive, Suite A
Anamosa, |A 52205

Work Performed From: 7/18/2022 to 9/2/2022

Uitem © Fund | Description QUANTITIES N N

: No. - ) N ) . _Contract Actual  Underrun '
1 :FEMA1 Mobilization for All Sites wm.ﬂmc.oo..w $8,750.00 ¢ : :

Mmm_sﬁ m_am_o: Matting

9737750

$0.00°

2 FEMA1 Unclassified Fill $562480  $5, 624.80 -
Lém.rs 'FEMA1 :Slope Leveling AO_._m Side of _.m<mmv '$3,500 .00 "'$3.500.00 e
.4 FEMAT Seeding and Ferfilizing %o@.o,d,w $1.100.00  §500.00
"5 " FEMAT1 Erosion Matti 7$3,792.10  $4,044.56  $252.46
© 8 FEMA1 Unclassified 14 886,807 m._hrmm.ﬂmo st
: 7 FEMA1 Slope _.m<m=5mzh am Side oﬁ _qummw $9,020. 00: $9,020.00 - ol
.8 FEMAT Seeding and Fe $1,550.00 $2,050.00  $500.00
9 FEMAT Erosion Matting 7$9,77210 $10,875.08  $1,103.18
v 40" 3 nclassified Fill K Wm 277. oo .sm.MNWspnm‘.m : -
T ‘Siope Leveling (One Side of Levee) % 002,510, . $5,020.00 m
"2 Seeding and Fertilizing $1,000.00 086 - “$138000 " $50600
EN rosion Matting e $1.30 . 4,183.00 '$5437.90:  $5,796.83:  $358.93 .
: 14 nclassified Fill T ( | $10,252.80 . $10,252.80 .
2 15 lope Leveling (One Side of Levee) 3,110. 8. | $6,22000:  $6,220.00%
16 FEMAT1 Seeding and Fertiizing _ . 31 A _, 157 1070007 $1570.00 850000
:"17 | FEMAT Erosion Matting " $1.30¢ 5183.00° 552510 $6,737.90 . $7,182.63 . $444.73
.18 FEMAT Unclassified Fil $17.80° 1,086.00° 1,086.0 . $19,330.80° $19,330.80% i
19 " FEMAT Siope Leveling (One Side of Leves) 2.00 - 5:860.00 81172000 $11,720.00 ¢ i S—
20 $2,02000  $2,520.00 1 $500. 8 :
21 Erosion Matting  $12,697.10°  $12,697.10
= Unclassified Fill §12,460.00  $12,460.00
: 23 FEMAT1 Slope rm&m_,_:o A_Oam Side 2 _.m<m$ "$7. 56000 $7, 560.00°
: 24 FEMAT Seeding and Fertilizing ) $1,300.00°  $1,800.00:  $500.00 "
25 FEMAT Erosion Matting 7$8,190.00 | $8,730.54  $540.54
26 FEMA1 Unclassified Fill . $24.90220 $24,902.20
Nﬂ:. _u,m_sﬁ m_oum _.m<w_5m A0=m Side of _.m<m£ w._m ._oo 00 §15, 100. oow
,Eymm aTlm?}d Wx_wm_:mmﬂzn *nmUZn,".ni N $31 N_.MW mo ﬁ@m;b@ﬁ;mm il
29 'FEMAT Revetment, ClassE_ $310,356.00 $315,676.60 . $5,320.60
mo ‘.w._umzﬁ mmma_zm and _umn___N_:m .. $870.00: mmﬂm;oow )
31 .w_um_sﬁ c:n"mmmama Fill $11,231 80 mﬁ 231.80; § -
32 i ~ $6,810.00.  $6,810.00
= 33 $1,170.00:  $1,170.00 :
34 50 m.\ 377.80:

R



CO1a FEMA1

CO1b FEMA1
Item Fund
No.

* Um_._oﬁm,m

Rock Removal
Class A Road Stone

Descri iption

A Final Quantity

FEMA1=Federal-FEMA 1

are<threctand

Approvals

Eiaiciata

LS. $11,000.00 1.00 1.00 f $11,000.00  $11,000.00
Tons $30.00 1,000.00 1,004.22 f 4.22 $30,000.00  $30,126.60 $126.60
Unit of Unit QUANTITIES , - AMOUNTS
Meas. Price Contract  Actual * Overrun Underrun Contract Actual Overrun  Underrun
f TOTALS $626,918.30 $630,687.84 $11,147.04 $7,377.50

| hereby agree that the items appearing hereon for payment 1 09/12/2022  $41,000.00

Qpart of thi of this <o=n:mMWw Nm: paid

Recommended for Payment: Michael

Mithael Dufoe, P€.  Dufoe

Contract Change Orders Estimates Previously Approved

No. Date Amount No.  Date Amount

1 09/12/2022  $599,153.45

Total Change Orders $41,000.00 Total Previous $599,153.45

Estimates Siis it
smpmnte  Dpufral orgrells Swbmte) A2 oo
Department of Natural Resources, . [ 1
e owaciomn h?n hoy Lany eadet e vweviged [ Orfree
Date: 2022.10.17 16:23:38-05°00°

Inspectar

Approved for P

Travis Baker

ayment:

Date

JUOEQF.O;& g.\

Digitally signed by Travis Baker
Date: 2022.10.19 16:08:14 -05'00'

Bureau Chief

Checked by:

Date

351,534, 1

Date

CRAs DH2 -Cary— 19 - Do

st S sl 0N %N\%\

O,Cfif

e

¥

m&ﬁu_&o\m\ﬂ

\LN\P\?\F

b

Original Contract Amount  $585,918.30

Euoimzm,ocm:mg Overruns $11,147.04
(+) I (55, 5 e
Quantity Underruns {-) $7,377.50
Sub-Total ~ $589,687.84
Total Approved Change

Net Contract <m_E.w of Work ammo 687.84
<m_cm 3 Oo..:Eﬁg <<o% mmmo_mm.\ 84

Zmﬁm_._m_m Stored On-Site ~ $0.00
Total wmﬂ_smn_ Percent ASS o mo 00
Amount Due Incl. This

Estimate - mmmo mm.\ &
Total _u_.m<_o:m_< >vv3<ma «uwm 15345
Estimatess @

Net Amount Due This

Estimate «w._ mupum
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