Department of Govemor Kim Reynolds
Administrative Services Lt. Governor Adam Gregg

Empowering People - .
e Adam Steen, Director

Customer Service

Date: September §, 2022

To: Tammy Hollingsworth, Auditor of State
Victoria Newton, Treasurer of State
Executive Council

From: Mariah Flowers, Fleet Manager
DAS Fleet Services
Department of Administrative Services

Re: ALLOCATION REQUEST - 29C20 Claim for Executive Council Consideration

Vehicle / Event | #105236/Hail
July 4, 2022
Event Date
Summary Vehicle #105236 sustained hail damage. (240981)
Amount $2,781.00 - Estimate
Requested
Supporting 29C20 Email Notification, Accident Report, Repair Estimate(s), Photos
Documentation

If you have any questions or are in need of additional information, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Thank yon,

Mariah Flowers, Fleet Manager
DAS Fleet Services

Mariah.Flowers@iowa.gov
515-414-6582

s i

"Hoover State Office Building | 1305 East Walnut Street | Des Moines, IA50319 | (515) 281-536?| http://das.iowa.gov



9/8/22, 3:12 PM State of lowa Mail - 105236 - SVD - Hail

Risk, DAS <das.risk@iowa.gov>

105236 - SVD - Hail

1 message

Adams Jeannie <jadams@dps.state.ia.us> Wed, Jul 6, 2022 at 8:44 AM

To: "ExecutiveCouncil [TOS]" <ExecutiveCouncil@tos.iowa.gov>, Tammy Hollingsworth
<Tammy.Hollingsworth@aos.iowa.gov>
Cc: "Risk, DAS (das.risk@iowa.gov)" <das.risk@iowa.gov>

Good morning

Please accept the attached damage report on behalf of Inspector Heckert. While his car was parked on off duty hours a

storm came though and dumped hail on to his vehicle.
We will forward an estimate as it becomes available.

Thank you

Jeannie Adams

ISP Fleet & Supply, Fleet Asset Manager

Department of Public Safety

30 N.E. 48th Place

Des Moines, lowa 50313

Direct #: 515-725-0643

Cell Phone: 515-204-3019

Shop: 515-281-3277

Fax: 515-242-6321

Email: jadams@dps.state.ia.us<mailto:jadams@dps.state.ia.us>

[iobs]<https://dps.iowa.gov/divisons/administrative-services/dps-careers/4 7th-basic-academy>

From: Heckert Steve <heckert@dps.state.ia.us>

Sent: Wednesday, July 6, 2022 8:28 AM

To: vehicledamage <vehicledamage@dps.state.ia.us>; DAS.Risk@iowa.gov

Cc: Young Brian <byoung@dps.state.ia.us>; Carpenter Chuck <carpente@dps.state.ia.us>
Subject: Hell damage.

Hell damage.
Thank you,
Steve Heckert

Electrical Inspector

lowa Department of Public Safety

State Fire Marshal Division

Electrical Bureau

215 East 7th Street

Des Moines, lowa 50319-0047

(712) 390-0233

Email: heckert@dps.state.ia.us<mailto:heckert@dps.state.ia.us>

*NOTICE* This email message (including any file attachments transmitted with it) is for the sole use of the intended
recipient(s) and may contain confidential and legally privileged information. Any unauthorized use or disclosure of this
email by an unintended recipient is prohibited. If you have received this email in error please notify the sender by return
email and destroy all copies of the original message. No representation is made that this email or any attachments are
free of viruses. Virus scanning is recommended and is the responsibility of the recipient.
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State Vehicle Damage Report
Attach this completed form to an email along with the items identified below and
send to: DPS — Vehicle Damage; DAS — Risk
» One Repair Estimate from Approved State Bid Shop
> DOT MARS Report (if reportable)
» Memo from the Driver of the State Vehicle
» 3-4 photos of the vehicle damage
***Sworn Officers only: Complete a Line of Duty Form #432037 and send to DOT
if 10-50 was reportable!!!

STATE VEHICLE: (Mark if Act of NaturelX ) CASE #:

Date: 714122 Time: 3:00 a.m.
(Month/Day/Year) (Time plus a.m./p.m.)

Vehicle Plate #: | 105236 Vehicle Mileage: 56686
Vehicle

Description: 2020/ford/escape/1fmcu9g671uc31633
(Yr/Make/Model/ &

Ving)

Assigned To: Brian Young Badge # F720
Driven By: Steve Heckert Badge #

Driver's Lic #: | 891bb2207 Damage: $
Vehicle Towed: | No Towed By:

(Yes / No)

Towed To: Towing Cost: $

Seat Belt: Yes Type of Vehicle: Marked
(Yes / No) (Marked/Semi /Unmarked)
Injured/Injuries: 0/0

Occupants: 0

(Other than driver)

VEHICLE #2:

DL #: N/A State: N/A
Vehicle Lic. # N/A State: N/A
Driver's Name: N/A

Driver’s Address: | N/A

Owner's Name: N/A

Owner’'s Address: | N/A

Owner’s Phone: N/A




Insurance Info: N/A
(Carrier/Policy #/Phone)

Veh Description:
(Yr/Make/Model & Vin#) | N/A

Damage: SN/A Seat Belt: No
(Yes / No)

Injured/Injuries: N/A

Occupants: N/A

(Other than driver)

Occupant(s) Wearing Seat Belt: (ves/No) | Yes

OTHER INFORMATION:

Witnesses: N/A

Accident Location: 501 East 4" ST Peterson IA
(Street/Hwy)

County: Clay

Weather/Road Conditions:

Thunder storm and hell.

today.

Narrative: Had a thunderstorm 7/4/22 around 3AM. Noticed hell damage

(List Charge(s) and Statute Code(s))

Property Damage other than | N/A
Vehicles:

Cost: $N/A
Citations Issued To: N/A

| Investigating Officer:

| N/A

VEHICLE #3: (If needed) (For more vehicles, please make extra

copies of this portion)

DL #: N/A

State: N/A

Vehicle Lic. # N/A

State: N/A

Driver's Name: N/A

Driver's Address: | N/A

Owner’'s Name; N/A

Owner’s Address: | N/A




Owner’s Phone: N/A

Insurance Info: N/A

(Carrier/Policy #/Phone)

Veh Description:

(Yr/Make/Model & Ving) | N/A

Damage: $N/A Seat Belt: Yes
(Yes / No)

Injured/Injuries: N/A

Occupants: N/A

(Other than driver)

Occupant(s) Wearing Seat Belt: (ves/No)

| Yes




Printed Date: 8/9/2022

KEN BORTH AUTOBODY INVOICE
301 11TH ST SW
RO #: 36548
PO BOX 1053
SPENCER, IA 51301
(712) 262-7076, (712) 262-7777 (fax) Est: Dale Kabrick
20 Ford Escape
Sials OF lows Color: STATE OF IOWA
Type: TK 4 Door Utility Adjustor:
;-iome' VIN: 1TFMCU9G67LUC31633 Phone:
A Prod Date: Plate: Claim #: Deductible: 0
Work: .
j Odometer: Loss Type: Unknown
Cell: \
Engine:
P = Who Pays? (| = Insurance, C = Customer)
. Sup Labor | Paint
Qty | Type Description Part # Amount # Labor | Op Units | Units P
Parts
Existing Hood Assy Body |R&l 0.6 |
Eiir;?ing Hood Insulator Body [R&l 0.3 |
E;r;fmg Roof Headliner Body |R&l 37 |
Eii';fing Roof Overhead Console Body |R&l 03 |
Part .
E)Ec‘istt;ing Liftgate Assy Body | R&l 1.3 |
Upr Liftgate Trim Panel Body | R&l 0.1 I
Eigfing R Rear Combination Lamp Body |R&I 03 |
1 Sublet Hood 425.00 Body I
1 | sublet Roof 1'250-3 Body !
1 Sublet Right Rail 250.00 Body |
1 | Sublet Right Quarter Panel 100.00 Body |
1 | Sublet Right Fender 100.00 Body !
1 | Sublet Tailgate 250.00 Body |
1 |Parts AM | CORROSION PROTECTION ALLIED | Suel Repl 10.00 R I
Parts 10.00
Labor 396.00
Sublet 2,375.00
SubTotal 2,781.00
Taxes 0.00
Grand Total 2,781.00
Due from Insurance Due from Customer
SubTotal 2,781.00 | SubTotal 0.00
Tax 0.00 | Tax 0.00
Total 2,781.00 | Total 0.00
Total Amount | 2,781.00 |
INVOICE #22 8/9/2022 1:05 PM RO# 36548 KEN BORTH AUTOBODY
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