SVP Invoices - SFY 2022 (04/22/22)

Dat Paid by Approval
a. N Vendor Description Amaount Executive pp
Received . Date
Council
4/22/22 Thomas Forensic, LLC Initial Eval/Preliminary Report - Jesse Taggert $3,200.00
4/21/22 Thomas Forensic, LLC Interview/Final Eval, Trial Testimony and mileage $6,430.03
4/16/22 William A Schmitt, PhD., LLC initial Eval/Preliminary Report - Adam Sunkle $3,200.00
4/18/22 Rachel Kahn Final Eval - Larry Nicklus Dean Howard $2,400.00

$15,230.03 $0.00




THOMAS FORENSIC, LLC

Tracy A. Thomas, Ph.D., ABPP

Board Certified Forensic Psychologist

Licensed Psychologist (Iowa, Nebraska, Missouri)

Phone (712) 730-8274

Fax (712) 248-8655

Email: Tracy Thomas(@ThomasForensic.com
Web: lowaForensicPsychologist.com

TO:

lowa Office of the Attorney General
c/o Olivia McAtee

Area Prosecutions Division

Hoover Building

1305 E. Walnut Street

Des Moines, 1A 50319

INVOICE

INVOICE #601A2022
DATE: 4/22/2022

FOR:

Forensic Consultation/Evaluative Services:
lowa Code 229A Evaluations

CASE DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE SERVICE DATES AMOUNT
Engagement Letter: 3/21/2022
g . . . 3’200
Jesse Taggert Initial Evaluation/Preliminary Report Preliminary Report Date: 4/19/2022 $
TOTAL $3,200

Male all checks payable to:
Thomas Forensic, LLC

c/o Tracy Thomas

3827 Brickman Avenue
Ames, IA 50010

Claimant EIN: 47-1228282
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Tracy A. Thomas, Ph.D., ABPP
Board Certified Forensic Psychologist
Licensed Psychelogist {IA, NE, MO)




Palmer, Tina
[

_ _ L
From: McAtee, Olivia
Sent: Friday, April 22, 2022 1:03 PM
To: Palmer, Tina; Brown, ScottAG [AG]
Subject: FW: Jesse Taggert Invoice

HiTina, please see the below approvai. Thank you!

From: Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Sent: Friday, April 22, 2022 12:49 PM

To: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: RE: Jesse Taggert Invoice

Approved

Scott
Sent from my Verizon, Samsung Galaxy smartphone

wememeee Qriginal message ---—--—

From: "McAtee, Qlivia" <Qlivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>

Date: 4/22/22 10:30 AM {GMT-06:00)

To: "Palmer, Tina" <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>, "Brown, ScottAG [AG]" <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: Jesse Taggert Invoice

Please see the attached invoice. Thank you!

From: Jamie Tatarek <jamie@thomasforensic.com>
Sent: Friday, April 22, 2022 8:26 AM

To: McAtee, Olivia <Qlivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: Jesse Taggert Invoice

Good morning Olivia,

Attached is the invoice for Jesse Taggert’s Preliminary Report.

Thank you,

Jamie Tatarek, MA (Forensic Psychology)
Psychology Assistant
Thomas Forensic, L1.C




THOMAS FORENSIC, LLC

Tracy A. Thomas, Ph.D., ABPP

Board Certified Forensic Psychologist

Licensed Psychologist (Iowa, Nebraska, Missouri)

Phone (712) 730-8274

Fax (712) 248-8655

Email: TracyThomas@ThomasForensic.com
Web: JowaForensicPsychologist.com

TO:

Towa Office of the Attorney General
¢/o Olivia McAtee

Area Prosecutions Division

Hoover Building

1305 E. Walnut Street

Des Moines, IA 50319

INVOICE

INVOICE #581A2022
DATE: 4/21/2022

Forensic Consultation/Evaluative Services:
Iowa Code 229A Evaluations

CASE DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE SERVICE DATES AMOUNT
. ) . . Interview Date: 4/15/2022
Bobby Lewis Interview/Final Evaluation Final Evaluation Date: 4/19/2022 $4,000
Bobby Lewis Trial Testimony 4/21/2022 $2,400
Mileage: Ames to Polk

Bobby Lewis County Courthouse — 4/21/2022 $30.03
roundtrig {77 miles x .39)

TOTAL $6,430.03

Make all checks payable to:
Thomas Forensic, LLC

c/o Tracy Thomas

517 Grand Avenue

Suite 102

Ames, {A 50010

Claimant EIN: 47-1228282
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Tracy A. Thomas, Ph.D., ABPP
Board Certified Forensic Psychologist
Licensed Psychologist (1A, NE, MO)



Palmer, Tina

[ S |
From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]

Sent: Thursday, April 21, 2022 3:56 PM

To: McAtee, Olivia; Palmer, Tina

Subject: RE: Bobby Lewis invoice

Approved.

SCOTT

Please note new email address: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov

5 Scott D. Brown
¥ Special Assistant Atforney General/Area Prosecutions Division
Office of the Attorney General of lowa
1305 E. Walnut St.
Des Moines, A 50319
Main: (515) 281-5164 | Division: {515) 281-3648 | Direct: (515) 281-6691 | Fax: (515) 281-8804
Email: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov § www.iowaatiorneyaeneral.gov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email message (including any attachments) may be confidential or
protected by one or more of the following: the attorney-client privilege, attorney work product doctrine, or
applicable laws. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this message in error, please: (1) do not
read, print, copy, distribute or use it in any way; (2) permanently delete or destroy the message (including any
attachments); and (3) notify the sender immediately by reply email or telephone. Any unintended transmission
of this email message does not constitute a waiver of any applicable privilege or protection. Thank you.

From: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Thursday, April 21, 2022 9:52 AM

To: Palmer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>; Brown, ScoftAG {AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: Bobby Lewis invoice

Please see the attached invoice. The trial did end up happening in person so mileage is inciuded on there.
Thank you!

From: Jamie Tatarek <jamie@thomasforensic.com>

Sent: Thursday, April 21, 2022 8:56 AM

To: McAtee, Olivia <Qlivia.Mcalee@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: Bobby Lewis invoice

Good morning Olivia,

Attached is Dr. Thomas’s invoice for her services in the Bobby Lewis matter, in which she is testifying today. Please let
me know if you have any questions or need any additional information.

1




William A. Schmitt, Ph.D., LL.C
Licensed Psychologist

PO Box 930376
Verona, W1 53593

(608) 698-2713
wschmitt55@gmail.com

INVOICE

Preliminary Evaluation for fowa §229A
Re: Adam Sunkle
DOB: May 19, 1974

Evaluator: William A. Schmitt, PhD
Date: April 15,2022
¢ [Initial Evaluation/Preliminary Report was completed and submitted April 15, 2022.
Contracted fee for services rendered: $3200.
Thank you for this interesting referral.

wmsm»@

William A. Schmitt, Ph.D.
Licensed Psychologist
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Palmer, Tina

From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]

Sent: Saturday, April 16, 2022 12:52 PM
To: McAtee, Olivia; Paimer, Tina
Subject: RE: invoice

Approved

Scott

Sent from my Verizon, Samsung Galaxy smariphone

~~~~~~~~ Original message --------
From: "McAtee, Olivia" <Olivia.Mcatee(@ag.lowa.gov>
Date: 4/16/22 9:29 AM (GMT-06:00)

To: "Palmer, Tina" <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>, "Brown, ScottAG [AG]" <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: Invoice

Please see the attached invoice. Thank you! Happy Easter!

Olivia McAtee

& Investigator |l
¥ Office of the Attorney General of fowa
k1305 E. Walnut St.
Y &g Des Moines, lowa 50319
" Main: (515) 281-5164 | Division: (515) 281-3648 | Direct: (515) 281-6566
Email; olivia. mcatee@ag.iowa.gov | www.iowaattorneygeneral.goy




Rachel Kahn. Ph.D.

P.0. Box 6491

Mongna, WI 53716-0451
USA

Phone: 608-620-3067

To:

Iowa Office of the Attorney General
cfo Olivia McAtee

Area Prosecutions Bivision

Hoover Building

1305 E. Walnut Street

Des Moines, 1A 50319

INVOICE

DATE: APRIL 14, 2022

Description Amount
Final Evaluation Report on Larry Nicklus Bean Howard $2400
Engagement Letter: 10/29/2021

Trial Date: 4/13/2022

Total $2,400

Payment should made out to Rachel Kahn and mailed to Rachel Kahn, P.O, Box 6491, Monona, WI 53716-

0491

ol ot

Rachel Kahn, Ph.D.
Licensed Psychelogist
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Palmer, Tina

From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]

Sent: Monday, April 18, 2022 7:41 PM
To: McAtee, Olivia; Palmer, Tina
Subject: RE: invoice LH

Approved

Scott

Sent from my Verizon, Samsung Galaxy smartphone

-------- Original message --------
From: "McAtee, Olivia" <Olivia.Mcatee(@ag.iowa.gov>
Date: 4/18/22 7:30 PM (GMT-06:00)

To: "Palmer, Tina" <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>, "Brown, ScottAG [AG]" <Scott.Brown{@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: invoice LH

Please see the attached invoice. Thank you!

From: Rachel Kahn <rachel kahn@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, April 14, 2022 2:36 PM

To: McAtee, Olivia <Qlivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: invoice LH

Hi Olivia,

Here is my final invoice for Mr. Howard. The second part of cross seemed a bit harder - but 1 suppose | will know what to
expect next time. Let me know if you have any thoughts/suggestions based on my testimony. Don't mind hearing
critical/constructive feedback.

Take care!

Rache

Rachel Kahn, Ph.D.
Licensed Psychologist
217-621-5944

¥*NOTICE: This E-maif and any attachments may contain confidential
information. Use and further disclosure of the information by the
recipient must be consistent with applicable laws, regulations, and

i



