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April 7, 2025

Accounting Department
Office of the Treasurer

Lucas Building

321 E 12th Street

Des Moines, IA, 50319

The Executive Council, in a meeting held on today’s date, approved Department of Administrative Services
request for an emergency allocation in the amount of $3,978.45. On January 26, 2025, a Department of Public
Safety’s bearcat rescue vehicle was damaged by vandalism. Request was to cover repair costs.

This represents full and final payment and this allocation will be closed.
EXECUTIVE COUNCIL OF IOWA
Kristi Onstot

Kristi Onstot
Executive Secretary

cc: Adam Steen, Director, Department of Administrative Services
DAS Fleet Services, Risk
Matt Bender, Department of Management
Heather Hackbarth, Department of Management

AOS Claim # 3978
TOS Job #



OFFICE OF AUDITOR OF STATE

STATE OF IOWA
Rob Sand

Auditor of Stat
State Capitol Building uditor ot State

Des Moines, lowa 50319-0004

Telephone (515) 281-5834

March 4, 2025

Kristi Onstot
Executive Council
LOCAL

Subject: Damages to Bearcat Rescue Vehicle Caused by Vandalism on January 26, 2025
Department of Public Safety
Claim dated February 11, 2025
AOS Claim ID: 3978

In accordance with Executive Council policy, we have examined the claim for
29C.20 funds for the above-mentioned damages. It is our conclusion that the above
damage incurred by the Department of Public Safety is covered by Chapter 29C.20 of the
Code of Iowa. Therefore, we recommend an Executive Council allocation and
reimbursement in the amount of $3,978.45 to be paid to the Department of Administrative
Services. This represents full and final payment of the loss.

Sincerely,

Brian R. Brustkern, CPA
Deputy Auditor of State

cc: Lieutenant Bryan Guill, Iowa State Patrol Fleet & Supply Commander, Department
of Public Safety
Mariah Fucaloro, Fleet Services Manager, Department of Administrative Services
Heather Hackbarth, Department of Management



Department of
Administrative Services

|OWA.

KIM REYNOLDS, GOVERNOR ADAM STEEN, DIRECTOR
CHRIS COURNOYER, LT. GOVERNOR

Date: February 11, 2025

To:  Tammy Hollingsworth, Auditor of State
Victoria Newton, Treasurer of State
Executive Council

Re: ALLOCATION REQUEST -29C20 Claim for Executive Council Consideration

Vehicle / Event | #21 / Vandalism
January 26, 2025

Event Date

Summary Vehicle 21 - sustained vandalism damage during an assault on law enforcemel
(Claim # M59502)

Amount $3,978.45 - FINAL PAYMENT

Requested

Supporting 29C20 Email Notification, Accident Report, Repair Estimate/Invoice

Documentation

[t you have any questions or are in need ot additional information, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Thank you,

P

an Betts
DAS Fleet Risk Manager
ryan.bettsl(@iowa.gov
515-281-8008

Hoover State Office Building | 1305 East Walnut Street | Des Moines, IA 50319 | 515.242.5120 | das.iowa.gov



2/11/25, 11:14 AM State of lowa Mail - Fwd: Fw: ** External Email Alert ** RE: 29C20 24hr AON/Vandalism Damage Notification- Area B Bearcat Dam...

I ‘) W A Risk, DAS <das.risk@iowa.gov>

Fwd: Fw: ** External Email Alert ** RE: 29C20 24hr AON/Vandalism Damage

Notification- Area B Bearcat Damage
1 message

Fucaloro, Mariah <mariah.fucaloro@iowa.gov> Mon, Feb 10, 2025 at 9:22 AM
To: DAS Risk <das.risk@iowa.gov>

Mariah Fucaloro, CPM
Fleet Manager

Central Procurement and Fleet Services Enterprise
lowa Department of Administrative Services

510 E 12 St, Des Moines, IA 50319
515-725-2243 office

515-414-6582 mobile
mariah.fucaloro@iowa.gov
https://das.iowa.gov

Department of
Administrative Services

—————————— Forwarded message --—-—---—-

From: Adams Jeannie <jadams@dps.state.ia.us>

Date: Thu, Feb 6, 2025 at 10:28 AM

Subject: Fw: ** External Email Alert ** RE: 29C20 24hr AON/Vandalism Damage Notification- Area B Bearcat Damage
To: Fucaloro, Mariah <mariah.fucaloro@iowa.gov>

Please advise

Jeannie Adams

Fleet Asset Manager

Fleet & Supply

lowa Department of Public Safety

30 NE 48" Place | Des Moines, lowa 50313
Office: 515-725-0643

Mobile: 515-204-3019
jadams@dps.state.ia.us
https://dps.iowa.gov/
https://dpscareers.com/

Department of
Public Safety

https://mail.google.com/mail/b/AEoRXRSZThF4NIVXUPNap2l_1nGg3CuxC8p3nkhxcm-ZQzFwWAQDX/u/0/?ik=fc086bf76c&view=pt&search=all&permt... 1/5




2/11/25, 11:14 AM State of lowa Mail - Fwd: Fw: ** External Email Alert ** RE: 29C20 24hr AON/Vandalism Damage Notification- Area B Bearcat Dam...

https://mail.google.com/mail/b/AEoRXRSZThF4NIVxUPNap2l_1nGg3CuxC8p3nkhxcm-ZQzFwWAQDX/u/0/?ik=fc086bf76c&view=pt&search=all&permt...

*NOTICE* This email message (including any file attachments transmitted with it) is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain
confidential and legally privileged information. Any unauthorized use or disclosure of this email by an unintended recipient is prohibited. If you
have received this e-mail in error please notify the sender by return e-mail and destroy all copies of the original message. No representation is
made that this email or any attachments are free of viruses. Virus scanning is recommended and is the responsibility of the recipient.

From: Guill Bryan <guill@dps.state.ia.us>

Sent: Thursday, February 6, 2025 10:16 AM

To: Adams Jeannie <jadams@dps.state.ia.us>

Subject: FW: ** External Email Alert ** RE: 29C20 24hr AON/Vandalism Damage Notification- Area B Bearcat Damage

| have made the initial notification to Executive Council. Does Mariah want to take this now or how should we handle.

From: Tammy Hollingsworth <Tammy.Hollingsworth@AOS.IOWA.GOV>

Sent: Wednesday, January 29, 2025 5:18 PM

To: Guill Bryan <guill@dps.state.ia.us>; ExecutiveCouncil@tos.iowa.gov

Cc: Halverson David <dhalvers@dps.state.ia.us>; Bailey Troy <bailey@dps.state.ia.us>

Subject: ** External Email Alert ** RE: 29C20 24hr AON/Vandalism Damage Notification- Area B Bearcat Damage

“*External Email Alert* This email is from outside DPS. DO NOT CLICK links or attachments unless you
expected them. If unsure please forward to ITOC for review.

Notification of 29C.20 Damages Received — AOS Claim #3978

From: Guill Bryan <guill@dps.state.ia.us>

Sent: Monday, January 27, 2025 4:00 PM

To: ExecutiveCouncil@tos.iowa.gov; Tammy Hollingsworth <Tammy.Hollingsworth@AOS.IOWA.GOV>
Cc: Halverson, David [DPS] <dhalvers@dps.state.ia.us>; Bailey, Troy [DPS] <bailey@dps.state.ia.us>
Subject: 29C20 24hr AON/Vandalism Damage Notification- Area B Bearcat Damage

Importance: High

All,

Please see attached preliminary information of vehicle damage sustained by an ISP Bearcat rescue vehicle in Storm Lake
lowa.

The vehicle received damage from an intentional act of vandalism/ and or attempted assault/murder of law enforcement.

Please accept this as the 24hr notification of damage.

2/5



2/11/25, 11:14 AM State of lowa Mail - Fwd: Fw: ** External Email Alert ** RE: 29C20 24hr AON/Vandalism Damage Notification- Area B Bearcat Dam...
Please also advise if this is a qualifying event.

Thanks

Bryan

Lieutenant Bryan Guill X498 *
lowa State Patrol

lowa Department of Public Safety | Fleet and Supply

30 NE 48th Place, Des Moines, lowa 50313
Office: 515-281-3118

Mobile: 515-201-9958
guill@dps.state.ia.us

1033program@dps.state.ia.us

https://dps.iowa.gov/

https://dpscareers.com/

Department of
Public Safety

IOWA.

*NOTICE* This email message (including any file attachments transmitted with it) is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and
may contain confidential and legally privileged information. Any unauthorized use or disclosure of this email by an unintended
recipient is prohibited. If you have received this e-mail in error, please notify the sender by return e-mail and destroy all copies of the
original message. No representation is made that this email or any attachments are free of viruses. Virus scanning is recommended
and is the responsibility of the recipient.

From: Halverson David <dhalvers@dps.state.ia.us>
Sent: Monday, January 27, 2025 3:07 PM

To: Guill Bryan <guill@dps.state.ia.us>

Cc: Bailey Troy <bailey@dps.state.ia.us>

Subject: FW: Area B Bearcat Damage
Importance: High

See attached for Bearcat damage.

Major David Halverson

https://mail.google.com/mail/b/AEoRXRSZThF4NIVXUPNap2l_1nGg3CuxC8p3nkhxcm-ZQzFwAQDX/u/0/?ik=fc086bf76c&view=pt&search=all&permt... 3/5



2/11/25, 11:14 AM State of lowa Mail - Fwd: Fw: ** External Email Alert ** RE: 29C20 24hr AON/Vandalism Damage Notification- Area B Bearcat Dam...
Administrative Operations Officer

lowa State Patrol

lowa Department of Public Safety

215 E. 7t st
Des Moines, IA 50319
Cell-515.443.1094

dhalvers@dps.state.ia.us

Department of
Public Safety

|OWA.

*NOTICE* This email message (including any file attachments transmitted with it) is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and
may contain confidential and legally privileged information. Any unauthorized use or disclosure of this email by an unintended
recipient is prohibited. If you have received this e-mail in error please notify the sender by return e-mail and destroy all copies of the
original message. No representation is made that this email or any attachments are free of viruses. Virus scanning is recommended
and is the responsibility of the recipient.

From: Everett Ryan <everett@dps.state.ia.us>

Sent: Monday, January 27, 2025 2:42 PM

To: Bailey Troy <bailey@dps.state.ia.us>; Halverson David <dhalvers@dps.state.ia.us>
Subject: Area B Bearcat Damage

Importance: High

Majors,
Please see attached memo and photo of damage sustained to the Area B BC during the a standoff in Storm Lake.

Respectfully,

Lieutenant Ryan Everett x455%
Special Operations Officer

lowa State Patrol - HQ

215 E. 71" Street
Des Moines, la 50319
Office 515-725-0624

Email: everett@dps.state.ia.us

https://mail.google.com/mail/b/AEoRXRSZThF4NIVxUPNap2l_1nGg3CuxC8p3nkhxcm-ZQzFwWAQDX/u/0/?ik=fc086bf76c&view=pt&search=all&permt... 4/5
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http://dps.iowa.gov/

http://dpscareers.com/

Department of
Public Safety

IOWA.

*NOTICE* This email message (including any file attachments transmitted with it) is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and
may contain confidential and legally privileged information. Any unauthorized use or disclosure of this email by an unintended

recipient is prohibited. If you have received this e-mail in error please notify the sender by return e-mail and destroy all copies of the
original message. No representation is made that this email or any attachments are free of viruses. Virus scanning is recommended

and is the responsibility of the recipient.

This email message and its attachments may contain confidential information that is exempt from disclosure under lowa Code chapters 22, 1394,
and other applicable law. Confidential information is for the sole use of the intended recipient. If you believe that you have received this
transmission in error, please reply to the sender, and then delete all copies of this message and any attachments. If you are not the intended
recipient, you are hereby notified that any review, use, retention, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this message may be prohibited by law.

Auditor.lowa.Gov

https://mail.google.com/mail/b/AEoRXRSZThF4NIVxUPNap2l_1nGg3CuxC8p3nkhxcm-ZQzFwAQDX/u/0/?ik=fc086bf76c&view=pt&search=all&permt... 5/5



State Vehicle Damage Report

Attach this completed form to an email along with the items identified below and send

vehicledamage@dps.state.ia.us ; das.risk@iowa.gov

V'V VY3

One Repair Estimate from Approved State Bid Shop
DOT MARS Report (if reportable)

Memo from the Driver of the State Vehicle

3-4 photos of the vehicle damage

***Sworn Officers only: Complete a Line of Duty Form #432037 and send to DOT if 10-
50 was reportable!!!

STATE VEHICLE: (Mark if Act of Nature[ 1) CASE #: 2025002141

Date: 1/26/2025 Time: 1100 hours
(Month/Day/Year) (Time plus a.m./p.m.)
Vehicle Plate #: | 21 Vehicle Mileage: 9,650

Vehicle

Description:
(Yr/Make/Model/ &
Vin#)

2022 Lenco BearCat/ 550 Ford Chassis

VIN#1FDUF5HT7NDA06238

Assigned To: Lt. Everett Badge # 455
Driven By: AJ Nitzke Badge # 130
Driver’s Lic #: | 480AF4901 Damage: $5,000.00
Vehicle Towed: Towed By:

(Yes / No)

Towed To: Towing Cost: $

Seat Belt: Type of Vehicle:

(Yes / No) (Marked/Semi /Unmarked)
Injured/Injuries: None -

Occupants: 12-man tactical team and 1 negotiator

(Other than driver)

VEHICLE #2:
DL #: State:
Vehicle Lic. # State:

Driver's Name:

Driver's Address:

Owner’'s Name:

Owner’s Address:

August 2018



Owner’s Phone:

Insurance Info:
(Carrier/Policy #/Phone)

Veh Description:
(Yr/Make/Model & Vin#)

Damage: $ Seat Belt:
(Yes / No)

Injured/Injuries:

Occupants:
(Other than driver)

Occupant(s) Wearing Seat Belt: (ves/No) |

OTHER INFORMATION:

Witnesses: N/A

Accident Location: 325 Oneida Street, Storm Lake, lowa
(Street/Hwy)

County: Beuno Vista

Weather/Road Conditions: | N/A

** Please Include narrative of events here**

On January 26, 2025, the above listed BearCat was being used to end a
stand off with a lone armed suspect barricaded in a residence. During the
standoff the suspect fired at the BearCat several times with an automatic
weapon. The gun fire resulted in strikes to the body of the BearCat and
windshield. The round strikes to the right side of the windshield caused
spidering damage to the ballistic glass.

Property Damage other than | None
Vehicles:

Cost: N/A
Citations Issued To: N/A

(List Charge(s) and Statute Code(s))

| Investigating Officer: | Lt. Ryan Everett #455 |

VEHICLE #3: (If needed) (For more vehicles, please make extra copies of
this portion)

DL #: State:
Vehicle Lic. # State:
Driver's Name:

August 2018



Driver’'s Address:

Owner’'s Name:

Owner’s Address:

Owner’s Phone:

Insurance Info:
(Carrier/Policy #/Phone)

Veh Description:
(Yr/Make/Model & Vin#)

Damage: $

Seat Belt:
(Yes / No)

Injured/Injuries:

Occupants:
(Other than driver)

Occupant(s) Wearing Seat Belt: (ves/No)

August 2018



l- N[:[l Parts/Service Quote 108829

< ES
PI:IAat L ders™ Customer Code: IALIA
ur) B t' ? d rt ial ';l't P'ftnr li! MA 01201 Eltattion et (L 2)20
etnr Inaustrial Drive - Fittstielq, 3 -
PH: 413-443-7350 - FAX: 413-445-7865 teneo Tisx 0% U3-21 £9077
Page #: 1of 1

Bill To Ship To
lowa State Patrol lowa State Patrol
215 E, 7th Street Attn Ryan Everett
Des Moines, IA 50319 USA 30 NE 48th Place

Des Moines, |IA 50313 USA

Phone:515-419-5149 Phone:5156014987
Email: bailey@dps.state.ia.us Email: everett@dps.state.ia.us
Payment Terms Shipping Terms Ship Via
Net 30 Days FOB: Des Moines IA FEDEX FREIGHT
Shipping Estimate Inhouse Contact Stock Number
T8D Peter Farrell 6453
Shipping Notes:
** SHIPPING ADDRESS MUST HAVE A LOADING DOCK OR FORKTRUCK AVAILABLE FOR DELIVERY **
Item: Product # Qty Unit Price Total
BC1500-005P RH WINDSHIELD.SUNBAND.NO SPALL.HEATED.006481 17-BC1500-005P-HS 1 $2,723.00 $2,723.00
Urethane 17-160 3 $11.29 $33.87
Pinchweld Primer 538 / 3.4fl oz. - “dinol" 17-167 1 $21.67 $21.67
1/8" x 1/4" x 100' Foam Dam Tape: 74418x14BL 12-126 0.25 $22.32 $5.58
Primer Application Dauber 17-166 1 $0.25 $0.25
CRL 1/8" x 3/4" x 4" Neoprene Setting Blocks 17-SB574 2 $0.48 $0.96
CRL 1/4" x 1" x 4" Neoprene Setting Blocks 17-SB577 2 $0.82 $1.64
4" SPREADERS 30-1206 1 $0.73 $0.73
Crate for Windshield 14x48x36 100440 1 $800.00 $800.00
Shipping & Handling FREIGHTOUT 1 $390.75 $390.75
Net Total $3,978.45
Notes:

PLEASE USE THE FOLLOWING LINK TO PROCESS YOUR ORDER https://www.lencoarmar,com/parts-accessories-purchase/
ANY ORDERS OVER $5,000 PAID BY CREDIT CARD WILL HAVE A 3.5% SERVICE FEE.

The written approval of the Directorate of US Defense Trade Contrals and Lenco Industries, Inc. must be obtained before reselling, transferring, transshipping or disposing of a
defense article to any end user, end use or destination other than as stated on this Lenco quote or the shipper's export declaration in cases where an exemption is claimed under

this subchapter ITAR 123.9(A).

Acceptance of this quotation or entering into a purchase agreement with Lenco, the purchaser agrees to Lenco's full Terms and Conditions of Sale, available upon request. This
quote will be valid for 60 days.

ACCEPTANCE OF PROPOSAL

Authorized . /Z j Authorized
Signature:___ L& M 7)/2%/1,&,/ ‘f‘éf“g’/? V 2/7/15‘” Signature: Pier farnell
Please sign and return Peter Farrell

Thank you




1/29/25, 12:26 PM Lenco Industries

Billing Information Shipping Information
Mariah Fucaloro Ryan Everett

Towa State Patrol Iowa State Patrol

510 E 12th St 30 NE 48th Place

Des Moines IA 50319 US Des Moines IA 50313 US
P: 5154146582 E: everett@dps.state.ia.us

E: mariah.fucaloro@iowa.gov

Order Information

Order Description: Lenco Invoice

Order Amount: 3978.45
Payment Information Processor Response Information
Merchant: Lenco Industries Transaction Approved

Date: 01/29/2025 13:23:28 Response: APPROVED

Trans. Type: Card Sale AVS: 5-character Zip match only
Amount: 3978.45 CSC: CVV2/CVC2 Match
Currency: usb Auth. Code: 085625

Trans. ID: 10359148707

Card Num.: R AR AEL333

Privacy - Terms

https://nemerchant.transactiongateway.com/cart/cart.php?action=show_receipt&internal_key=817052f30bad0e4452d7f16956¢cf897e&internal_timesta... 117
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