Govemnor Kim Reynolds
Lt. Govemor Adam Gregg

Empowering People
Collaboration
Customer Service

Adam Steen, Director

Date: August 11, 2022

To: Tammy Hollingsworth, Auditor of State
Victoria Newton, Treasurer of State
Executive Council

From: Mariah Flowers, Fleet Manager
DAS Fleet Services

Department of Administrative Services

Re: ALLOCATION REQUEST -29C20 Claim for Executive Council Consideration

Vehicle / Event | # 105143/Hail
March 25, 2022
Event Date
Summary Vehicle #105143 sustained hail damage. (241986)
Amount $2,173.00 - Estimate
Requested
Supporting 29C20 Email Notification, Accident Report, Repair Estimate(s), Photos
Documentation

If you have any questions or are in need of additional information, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Thank you,

Mariah Flowers, Fleet Manager
DAS Fleet Services
Mariah.Flowers@iowa.gov
515-414-6582

" Hoover State Office Building | 1305 East Walnut Street | Des Moines, [A50319 | (515) 281-5360 | http://das.iowa.gov
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lowaWDV Risk, DAS <das.risk@iowa.gov>
29C20
1 message
Risk, DAS <das.risk@iowa.gov> Fri, Jul 1, 2022 at 2:43 PM

To: TOS ExecutiveCouncil <executivecouncil@tos.iowa.gov>, TammyHollingsiorth <Tammy.Hollingsworth@aos.iowa.gov>

Please accept this email as initial 24 hr notification for AON, vehidle 105143 s
forward all information as soon as it is received.

tained hail damage on 3/25/22. | will

All accidents must be reported via email or phone to Fleet Services within 24 hours. All accident reports and
estimates are due within 72 hours of an accident. Agencies have 60 days to complete repairs to vehicles once
approval is given.

Thank you,
DAS Fleet Services, Risk

lowa Department of Administrative Services
Division of Business and Property Services

Department of
Administrative Services

Empowering People

Collaboration Office: 515-725-2243
Customer. Service Das.Risk@iowa.gov

https://das.iowa.gov

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Adams Jeannie <jadams@dps.state.ia.us>

Date: Wed, Jun 29, 2022 at 3:48 PM

Subject: FW: MEYERS - Vehicle Damage Report (See Attached)

To: Risk, DAS (das.risk@iowa.gov) <das.risk@iowa.gov>, vehicledamage <vehicledamage@dps.state.ia.us>

Piease accept this notification on behalf of AD Meyers.
Thank you

Jeannie Adams

ISP Fleet & Supply, Fleet Asset Manager

Department of Public Safety

30 N.E. 48th Place

Des Moines, lowa 50313

Direct #: 515-725-0643

Cell Phone: 515-204-3019

Shop: 515-281-3277

Fax: 515-242-6321

Email: jadams@dps.state.ia.us<mailto:jadams@dps.state.ia.us>

[iobs]<https://dps.iowa.gov/divisons/administrative-services/dps-careers/47th-basic-academy>
From: Meyers Gerard <meyers@dps.state.ia.us>

Sent: Wednesday, June 29, 2022 2:11 PM

To: Guill Bryan <guill@dps.state.ia.us>; Adams Jeannie <jadams@dps.state.ia.us>

Cc: Feddersen Paul <fedderse@dps.state.ia.us>

Subject: MEYERS - Vehicle Damage Report (See Attached)

Lt. Guill,

https://mail.google.com/mail/b/AHUVXTrixg2uaAXtQF OklyHxPevrClz_PR4kWyDESKKjSn49WIlu-/u/0/?ik=fc086bf76c&view=pt&search=all&permthid=th... 1/3



71122, 2:43 PM State of lowa Mail - 29C20

Please find a vehicle damage report attached for processing.
| have not submitted before so please advise what further steps | may need to take.
Thank you sir.

Gerard

[cid:image001.png@01D66429.72BIBC20]<https://gcc02.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?
url=http%3A%2F %2Fwww.dps.state.ia.us%2FDCl%2F supportoperations % 2F Information%2Frecords %
2Findex.shtml&data=05%7C01%7Cjadams%40dps.state.ia.us%7Ca8595a31c3c64c66chbf508das5a0327fe%
7C8e7368ae110346¢c72aec2d08e01c2d874%7C0%7C0%7C637921267938844733%7CUnknown%
7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIljoiMC4wLjAWMDAILCJQIljoiV2IuMzIiLCJBTIlB Ik ThaWwil.CJXVCIBMNn0%3D%7C3000%
7C%7C%7C&sdata=PLP3ike8XXcVGpKbybk9%2B10Eenv%2BI3RT4ImtloloiGY %3D&reserved=0>

Gerard F. Meyers | Assistant Director

Division of Criminal Investigation

Cyber Crime Bureau

lowa Department of Public Safety

215 East 7th Street | Des Moines, lowa 50319

Direct: (515) 725-6053 | Fax: (515) 725-6020

Email: meyers@dps.state.ia.us<mailto:meyers@dps.state.ia.us>

*NOTICE* This email message (including any file attachments transmitted with it) is for the sole use of the intended
recipient(s) and may contain confidential and legally privileged information. Any unauthorized use or disclosure of this
email by an unintended recipient is prohibited. If you have received this e-mail in error please notify the sender by return
e-mail and destroy all copies of the original message. No representation is made that this email or any attachments are
free of viruses. Virus scanning is recommended and is the responsibility of the recipient.

9 attachments
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State Vehicle Damage Report
Attach this completed form to an email along with the items identified below and
send to: DPS - Vehicle Damage; DAS — Risk
» One Repair Estimate from Approved State Bid Shop
» DOT MARS Report (if reportable)
» Memo from the Driver of the State Vehicle
» 3-4 photos of the vehicle damage
**Sworn Officers only: Complete a Line of Duty Form #432037 and send to DOT
if 10-50 was reportable!!!

STATE VEHICLE: (Mark if Act of NatureXl) CASE #:

Date: 06/25/2022 Time: 8:00 a.m.

(Month/Day/Year) (Time plus a.m./p.m.)

Vehicle Plate #. | LBS013 Vehicle Mileage: 2512

Vehicle

Description: 2022 / Chevrolet / Traverse LT / 1TGNEVMKW8NJ108326

(Yr/Make/Model/ &

Vin#)

Assigned To: AD Gerard Badge # 1-142
Meyers

Driven By: AD Gerard Badge # [-142
Meyers

Driver's Lic#: |239CC0681 Damage: $

Vehicle Towed: | No Towed By:

(Yes / No)

Towed To: Towing Cost: $

Seat Belt: Yes Type of Vehicle: Unmarked

(Yes / No) {(Marked/Semi /Unmarked)

Injured/Injuries: None

Occupants: None

(Other than driver)

VEHICLE #2:
DL #: State:
Vehicle Lic. # State:

Driver's Name:

Driver's Address:

Owner’'s Name:

Owner’s Address:




Owner’s Phone:

Insurance Info:
(Carrier/Policy #/Phone)

Veh Description:
(Yr/Make/Model & Vin#)

Damage: $ Seat Belt: No
(Yes / No)

Injured/Injuries:

Occupants:

(Other than driver)

Occupant(s) Wearing Seat Belt: (vesio) | Yes

OTHER INFORMATION:

Witnesses: None
Accident Location: NA
(Street/Hwy)

County: Warren
Weather/Road Conditions: | Hail Storm

Narrative: DPS Vehicle #105143 - On the morning of Saturday, June 25,
2022 a large hail storm moved through my area of residence. | did not
inspect my vehicle until a colleague observed minor hail damage to the
hood of my vehicle on June 28, 2022. | contacted SAC Lamp and reported
the minor damage. This was an act of nature and | am submitting the
damage report in an attempt to arrange for a hail damage evaluation and
repair. Thank you. AD Gerard F. Meyers (I-142).

Property Damage other than | NA
Vehicles:

Cost: $
Citations Issued To: None

(List Charge(s) and Statute Code(s))

| Investigating Officer: | NA

VEHICLE #3: (If needed) (For more vehicles, please make extra
copies of this portion)

| DL #: | | State: |




Vehicle Lic. #

| State:

Driver's Name:

Driver’'s Address:

Owner’s Name:

Owner’s Address:

Owner's Phone:

Insurance Info:
(Carrier/Policy #/Phone)

Veh Description:
(Yr/Make/Model & Vin#)

Damage:

Seat Belt:
(Yes / No)

Yes

Injured/Injuries:

Occupants:
(Other than driver)

Occupant(s) Wearing Seat Belt: (ves/No)

| Yes




QUALITY CLAIMS SOLUTIONS

105 N Krohn Place
SIOUX FALLS, SD 57103
Phone: (877) 237-3727, FAX:(866) 371-2844
gcs@qcesdirect.com

For:

QUALITY CLAIMS SOLUTIONS
DAS Fleet Services

Estimate of Record

Workfile ID:

5a2a9510

Owner: IOWA STATE PATROL

TIOWA STATE PATROL
Collision

Insured:
Type of Loss:
Point of Impact: 27 Hail

Owner:
IOWA STATE PATROL
URBANDALE, 1A 50323

Written By: Wayne Malsam

Policy #:
Date of Loss:

Inspection Location:
Dent Eliminators
Urbandale, IA 50322
Other

(515) 278-1537 Evening

UNKNOWN
8/1/2022 12:00 PM

Claim #:
Days to Repair:

Repair Facility:

Job Number:

APDS010241986-001
0

VEHICLE

2022 CHEV Traverse LT2 AWD w/Cloth Interior (Fleet) 4D UTV 6-3.6L Gasoline Direct Injection

VIN: 1GNEVMKW8NJ108326 Production Date: Interior Color:

License: Odometer: Exterior Color:

State: Condition:
TRANSMISSION CONVENIENCE AM Radio Hands Free Device
Automatic Transmission Air Conditioning FM Radio Xenon or L.E.D. Headlamps
4 Wheel Drive Intermittent Wipers Stereo Blind Spot Detection
POWER Tilt Wheel Search/Seek Lane Departure Warning

Power Steering
Power Brakes
Power Windows
Power Locks
Power Mirrors
Heated Mirrors
Power Driver Seat
DECOR

Dual Mirrors

Body Side Moldings
Privacy Glass
Console/Storage

8/2/2022 2:20:35 PM

Cruise Control

Rear Defogger
Keyless Entry
Alarm

Message Center
Steering Wheel Touch Controls
Rear Window Wiper
Climate Control
Dual Air Condition
Backup Camera
Parking Sensors
RADIO

Auxiliary Audio Connection
Satellite Radio

SAFETY

Drivers Side Air Bag
Passenger Air Bag
Anti-Lock Brakes (4)

4 Wheel Disc Brakes
Traction Control

Stability Control

Front Side Impact Air Bags
Head/Curtain Air Bags
Communications System

314048

ROOF

Luggage/Roof Rack
SEATS

Cloth Seats

Bucket Seats

3rd Row Seat
WHEELS
Aluminum/Alloy Wheels
PAINT

Clear Coat Paint
OTHER

Signal Integrated Mirrors

Page 1



Estimate of Record

Owner: IOWA STATE PATROL

2022 CHEV Traverse LT2 AWD w/Cloth Interior (Fleet) 4D UTV 6-3.6L Gasoline Direct Injection

Job Number:

Line Oper Description Part Number Qty Extended Labor Paint
Price $
1 HOOD
2 * Subl Hood +25% 1 281.25
3 # 20fs 1 80.00
4 R&I R&I hood assy 0.7
5 R&I Insulator 0.3
6 FENDER
7 * Subl LT Fender 1 100.00
8 R&I LT Fender liner 0.4
9 FRONT DOOR
10 * Subl LT Door shell +25% 1 125.00
11  ROOF
12 = Subl Roof panel wjo silver roof rails i 406.25
+25%
13 % R&I Headliner w/o sunroof 3.5
14  ELECTRICAL
15 R&I Antenna w/o digital audio 0.3
16  PILLARS, ROCKER & FLOOR
17 * Subl LT Uniside panel +25% 1 187.50
18 * Subl RT Uniside panel +25% 1 125.00
19 QUARTER PANEL
20 * Subl LT Quarter panel 1 225.00
21  REAR LAMPS
22 R&I LT Tail lamp all 0.2
23 LIFT GATE
24 * Subl Lift gate 1 175.00
25 R&I Lower gate trim w/o power 0.3
liftgate black
26 R&I Upper gate trim black 0.1
27 * R&I Lift gate 1.2
28 R&I Spoiler 0.8
SUBTOTALS 1,705.00 0.0
8/2/2022 2:20:35 PM 314048 Page 2



Estimate of Record

Owner: IOWA STATE PATROL

Job Number:
2022 CHEV Traverse LT2 AWD w/Cloth Interior (Fleet) 4D UTV 6-3.6L Gasoline Direct Injection

ESTIMATE TOTALS
Category Basis Rate Cost $
Parts 0.00
Body Labor 7.8 hrs $ 60.00 /hr 468.00
Miscellaneous 1,705.00
Subtotal 2,173.00
Total Cost of Repairs 2,173.00
Deductible 0.00
Total Adjustments 0.00
Net Cost of Repairs 2,173.00

MyPriceLink Estimate ID / Quote ID:

983455342522277888 /

THIS IS NOT AN AUTHORIZATION TO BEGIN REPAIRS.

SUPPLEMENTS - Please be advised that the INSURANCE COMPANY requires notice of any supplements prior to the
work being performed. Failure to notify INSURANCE COMPANY and allow INSURANCE COMPANY to review the

supplemental charges may result in non-payment of the supplemental items.

ESTIMATE AUDIT - THIS DOCUMENT IS NOT AN APPRAISAL, INQUIRIES SHOULD BE DIRECTED TO THE
INSURANCE COMPANY LISTED AT THE TOP OF THIS DOCUMENT.

REPAIR SHOPS CAN CONTACT QCS AUDITOR FOR ANY REPAIR RELATED INQUIRIES AT 1-877-237-3727.

8/2/2022 2:20:35 PM

314048
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