SVP Invoices - SFY 2023 (11/10/22)

Date Paid by Approval
. Vendor Description Amount Executive
Received ) Date
Council
10/13/22 Wiliam A Schmitt Ph.D. Commitment Trial - Sims $2,400.00
10/17/22 Willlam A Schmitt Ph.D. Commitment Trial and expenses - Robinson 52,979.80
10/17/22 wWilliam A Schmitt Ph.D. Final Eval and Report - Offutt $4,000.00
11/10/22 Eric Jensen Ph.D. Court prep/testimony - Daugard $2,400.00
10/20/22 Rachel Kahn Ph.D. Initial Eval/Prelim Report - DeWall $3,200.00
10/24/22 Thomas Forensic LLC Initial Eval/Prelim Report - Johnson $3,200.00
11/10/22 Eric Jensen Ph.D. Full reportfopinion - Allen $4,000.00
11/10/22 william A Schmitt Ph.D. Final Eval and Report - Steele 54,000.00
11/10/22 william A Schmitt Ph.D. Final Eval and Report - Manning $4,000.00
131/13/22 Eric Jensen Ph.D. Trial prep/testimony - Chavez $2,400.00
$?32,579.80 $0.00




William A. Schmitt, Ph.D., LLC
Licensed Psychologist

PO Box 930376
Verona, WI 53593
(608) 698-2713
wschmitt55@gmail.com

INVOICE
Iowa §229A Commitment Trial

Name: Austin Sims

DOB: October 19, 2001
Evaluator: William A. Schmitt, PhD
Date: October 13, 2022

Commitment trial occurred on October 13', 2022

Contracted fee for services rendered: $2400.00

Total = $2400

Thank you for this interesting referral.
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Palmer, Tina

s

From: McAtee, Olivia

Sent: Thursday, October 13, 2022 12:06 PM

To: Palmer, Tina; Brown, ScottAG [AG]

Subject: FW: Invoice for trial today

Attachments: Austin Sims Ch. 229A exam - Schmitt invoice TRIAL.pdf

Please see the attached invoice. Thank you!

From: Bill Schmitt <wschmitt55@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, October 13, 2022 11:43 AM

To: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: Invoice for trial today

Hi Olivia,

Re: Austin Sims

Please see the attached invoice for processing, and thanks!

Bill




William A. Schmitt, Ph.D., LLC
Licensed Psychologist

PO Box 930376
Verona, W1 53593
(608) 698-2713
wschmittS S{@gmail.com

INVOICE
lowa §229A Commitment Trial

Name; Marques Robinson
DORB: June 3, 1985

Evaluator: William A. Schmitt, PhD
Date; September 23, 2022

Commitment trial oceurred on September 20-21, 2022

Travel expenses:

Mileage to/from Polk County, 1A: 562 miles (@ $0.50 per mile = $281.00
Hotel on 9/19/22 = $126.78
Hoiel on 9/20/22 = $118.72
Dinner on 9/19/22 = $13.58
Lunch on 9/20/22 = ' $7.99
Dinner on 9720722 = $22.86
Lunch on 9/21/22 = $8.87
Contracted fee for services rendered: $2400.00

Total = §2979.80

Thank you for this interesting referral.

Approved d{/ﬁf Jal, //y/@”%)
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William A. Schmitt, Ph.D.
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Bill Schmitt <wschmittss@gmail.com>

Gmail

Tell us how we didl Receipt for Order #40 at Des Moines Pizza Company - DeMo
Pizza Co.

1 message

Des Meines Pizza Company - DeMo Pizza Co. <no-reply@toastiab.com>
Reply-To: "no-reply@toastiab.com” <no-reply@toastiab.com>

To: "wschmitts5@gmail.com” <swschmitiS5@gmail.com>

Tue, Sep 20, 2022 at 6:30 PM

Thank yau for your order. Below is a teceipl for your recent vislt to Des Moines Plzza Company.
troubie viewing this email?

Des Moines Pizza Company
604 Locust Slreet
Des Moines. 1A 30309

Sarver. Chris J
Check #40
Guest Count: 1
Orderad:

§/20/22 6:28 PM

1 Small Mac Atlack $18.00
Subtotal $18.00
Tax 51.26
Tip $3.60
Total $22.86
tnput Typa C (EMV Chip Read)
ViSA CREDIT XEXXX%x2 2805
“Transaction Type Sale
Authorization Approved
Approval Code 084780
Payment D kMpdPXsJLTnF
Application 1D ADGCO000031010
Appiication Label VISA CREDIT
Terminal 10 532a138fb0ce50c
Card Reader BBPOS
VISA CARDHOLDER

Thank you for visiting DeMo Fizza Co,




HYATT
PLACE"™

INVOICE

Bil Schmitt
7501 Felton Dr.
Verona Wl 53593

HYATT PLACE DES MOINES
418 6th -Avenue

Des Moinas, 1A 50308

Tel: 515-282-5555

Fax; 515-282-5552
desmoines.place:hyati,com

Room No. 0623

United States Arrival 08:19-22
Depariure 09-20-22
Confirmation No. 3812872201 Folio Window 1
Group Name =~ = & oo FolioNo. -~ = 148708 e
Date . - Description ~“Charges Credits
09-19-22 Accommodation 96.00
09-19-22 Qcoupancy Tax 6.72
09-18-22 State Excise Tax 4.80
09-18-22 Parking Valet 18.00
09-19-22 Sales Tax _ 1.26
09-20-22 Visa HHXKAKXXMXAKAKZB0E XXIXK 126.78
Total 126.78 126.78
Guest Signaturs Balance 0:00

{ agree that my Babifity for this bil Is not waived and | agree
1o b held persenally liabite in the event that the indicated
parsan, company of associution fails to pay for any pari or
the Al amount of these ciargas.

XXXXXX868Y

Membershig:
Bonus Codes:
Qualifying Nights: 1
Etligible Spend: 96.00
Redemption Eligible: 19.26

Summary Invoice, please see front desk
for eligibility detais.

WE HOPE YOU ENJOYED YOUR STAY WITH US!

Thank vou for choosing Hyatt Flade Des Moines Downtown. Our goal i lo provide avery

vigil.

Plenase remit payment to: _
Hyalt Place Des Moines Downlown
418 Gih Avarug

Des Moinas, 1A 50308

guest with an exceptional stay and we ara interested in any comments regarding your .




HYATT
PLACE"™

INVOICE

Bill Schmitl
7501 Felton Dr.
Verona W 53593

HYATT PLACE DES MOINES
418 6th Avenue

Das Moines, 1A 50308

Tel: 515-282-5555

Fax: 516-282-565652
desmoings.place.hyatt.com

Room No. 0822

United States Arrival 09-20-22
Depariure 09-21-22

Confirmation No. 3688763901 Folio Window_ 1
Group Name IR Folio Ne. .-~ . 148750 —
Date-  Description - ..Charges “Credits
09-20-22 Accommodation 106.00
09-20-22 Occupancy Tax 742
09-20-22 State Excise Tax . 5.30 _
09-21-22 Visa JOCAXAXXXKXK X208 KKIXXK T 1_18.72

Total o 1s72 11872
Guest Signature Balance 0.00 |

| agree that my Hability for this b is not walved and | agree
10 be held porsonally Gable in the event thatl tha indicated
Derrson, company of associalion fals To pay for any pad o
the fulf amunt of these charges,

WoddunyattSummary SO

Membership: XXX HKXBBIY
Bonus Codes;

Quialifying Nights: 1

Eligible Spend: 108.00
Redemption Eligible: 0.00

Sumnmary Invoice, please see front dask
for eligibility details.

WE HOPE YOU ENJOYED YOUR STAY WITH US!

Thank you for choosing Hyait Place Des Moines Downtown. Our goal is to provide avery
guast with an exceplionat stay and we are intergsted In any comments regarding your
visil. - .

Pleasg remit payment {o:

Hyatt PMace Des Moings Downtowr
416 6th Averue

Des Moines, [A 50308




EMPLOYEE OWNED

42(3 Court Ave
¢ Moines, 50303
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Visa 4
PURGHASE $7.99
ekt i w2500 Yisa
CHIP READ
REFE: D034 Transaction Aoproved
CHASE VISA {as Credit)
ARG - TECCEDEQRAAFBAGF
SCHMITT AT LLTAM
Made: lssuer
AID: ARGROGO0O310LG
TV GROGO0SB00

TAG: 4601203218000
181 ESGO ARG 723

Caslifer Name: SCO

Date ime Store P0G Emp TEX

09720722 1220 PM 1155 4110800 0047
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Rate us HIGHLY SATISFIFD and receive
BUY ONE GEY ONE FREE '
ARY SARDRICH _

Go to wew.mcdvotce.com within 7 days
and tell us abot your vigit,
Validation Code; . .

Expires 30 days after receipi date.
Valid at participating US Nclonald's.
Survey-Coda:
-24368-02110-92122-12385-00084-7

Meonali's Restaurant 224588
3402 § CERTER &7
MARSHALLTORN, 14 50158
TELE B41 792 6802

Ko 2 0872172022 12138 PH
Stda! Order 1
1 B1F Chesse Heal 8,29
1 Gir Pounder Chesse
Flatn
1 H Coke
- Subtotal §.2¢8
Tax 0,58
Teke-Gut Tota) .47
Cashiess §.87
Ehenge 0.00
HER® B15528
CARD ISSUER ACLOUNTS
Visa SALE EERERRREEEE A0S
TRANSACTION AMOUNT 8.87
CHIP REAR

AUTHGRTZATION CODE - 07138
SEQ¥ 0000T7
AID: A0000CC0031010

Mefionald's Restaurant

Have & Nice Dayi
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Palmer, Tina

From: Brown, ScottAG {AG]

Sent: Monday, October 17, 2022 11:42 AM
To: McAtee, Olivia; Palmer, Tina
Subject: RE: Dr. Schmitt invoice - Robinson
Approved

SCOTT

Please note new email address: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov

Scoft D. Brown

Special Assistant Attorney General/Area Prosecutions Division
Office of the Attorney General of lowa

1305 E. Walnut St.

Des Moines, |1A 50319

Main: (515) 281-5164 | Division: (515) 281-3648 | Direct: (515) 281-6691 | Fax: (515) 281-8894
Email: scoft. brown@aq.iowa.gov | www.iowaattorneygeneral.gov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email message (including any attachments) may be confidential or
protected by one or more of the following: the attorney-client privilege, attorney work product doctrine, or
applicable laws. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this message in error, please: (1) do not
read, print, copy, distribute or use it in any way; (2) permanently delete or destroy the message (including any
attachments); and (3) notify the sender immediately by reply email or telephone. Any unintended transmission
of this email message does not constitute a waiver of any applicable privilege or protection. Thank you.

From: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Monday, October 17, 2022 11:15 AM

To: Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown®@ag.iowa.gov>; Palmer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: Dr. Schmitt invoice - Robinson

Hi Scott and Tina,

Please see the attached invoice. For some reason this must’ve been lost in the snail mail and Dr. Schmitt sent this to me
almost a month ago.... Can we please have this approved ASAP?

Thank you,
Olivia

Olivia McAtee

. Investigator Il

N Office of the Attorney General of lowa

et 1305 E. Walnut St.

i Des Moines, towa 50319

= Main: (515) 281-5164 | Division: {515} 281-3648 | Direct: {515) 281-6566
Email; olivia. meatee@aq.iowa.qov | www.lowaattorneygeneral.gov




William A. Schmitt, Ph.D., LLC
Licensed Psychologist

PO Box 930376
Verona, WI 53593

(608) 698-2713
wschmitt55@gmail.com

INVOICE
Final Evaluation for lowa §229A

Re: Lloyd Offutt

DOB: July 2, 1955

Evaluator: William A. Schmitt, PhD
Date: October 5, 2022

Final Evaluation and Report was completed and submitted October 5, 2022.

Contracted fee for services rendered: $4000.00

Thank you for this interesting referral.

7 N rover Q_ﬂ 748 ) ) % .
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Palmer, Tina

. B — ]
From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]

Sent: Monday, Qctober 17, 2022 8:14 PM

To: McAtee, Olivia; Palmer, Tina

Subject: RE: nvoice

Approved

SCOTT

Please note new email address: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov

-’ Scott D. Brown

Special Assistan{ Attorney GenerallArea Prasecutions Division
Office of the Attorney General of jowa

1305 E. Walnut St.

Des Moines, 1A 50319

Main: {515} 281-5164 | Division: {515) 281-3648 | Direct: (515) 281-6691 | Fax: (515) 281-8894
Email: scott. brown@an.iowa.gov | www.iowaattorneygeneral.gov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email message (including any attachments) may be confidential or
protected by one or more of the following: the attorney-client privilege, attorney work product doctrine, or
applicable laws. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this message in error, please: (1) do not
read, print, copy, distribute or use it in any way; (2) permanently delete or destroy the message (including any
attachments); and (3) notify the sender immediately by reply email or telephone. Any unintended transmission
of this email message does not constitute a waiver of any applicable privilege or protection. Thank you.

From: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Monday, October 17, 2022 8:10 PM

To: Palmer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>; Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: Invoice

Hi Tina and Scott,

Please see the attached invoice. Thank youl

Olivia McAtee

Investigator Ii
/L Office of the Attorney General of fowa

it 1305 E. Walnut St.

2 Des Moines, lowa 50319

&7 Main; (515) 281-5164 | Division: (515) 281-3648 | Direct; (515) 281-6566
Email: olivia.mcatee@ag.iowa.gov | www.jowaattorneygeneral.gov




Eric Jensen, Ph.D.
81 Kimball Terrace
Shelburne, VT 05482

ebjensen@comcast.net
Phone 352-214-2039

TO:

Olivia McAtee

Office of Iowa Attorney General
1305 E. Walnut St

Des Moines, IA 50319

REGARDING:

INVOICE

INVOICE # 2005

DATE: OCTOBER 18, 2022

SVP Respondent: Franklyn L. Daugard

DC# 6441017

DESCRIPTION

HOURS RATE AMOUNT
Flat fee
Court prep/ftestimony 10/17-10/18/22 service $2400.00
~ Q ,

Approved \(j{if Lo / éj/%)’za:f/2>

Date_/ /10122~ $00.00 /

Ciass Ol g

(VH0 31004385

Tax ID#008408740 — 10000




Palmer, Tina

From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]

Sent: Friday, November 11, 2022 1:00 PM
To: Palmer, Tina

Subject: RE: Daugard trial involce
Approved

SCOTT

Please note new email address: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov

Scott D. Brown

Special Assistant Aftorney General/Area Prosecutions Division
Office of the Attorney General of lowa

1305 E. Walnut St.

Des Moines, 1A 50319

Main: (515) 281-5164 | Division: {615) 281-3648 | Direct: (515) 281-6691 | Fax: (515} 281-8694
Email: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov | www.lowaatlorneygeneral.gov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email message (including any attachments) may be confidential or
protected by one or more of the following: the attorney-client privilege, attorney work product doctrine, or
applicable laws. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this message in error, please: (1) do not
read, print, copy, distribute or use it in any way; (2) permanently delete or destroy the message (including any
attachments); and (3) notify the sender immediately by reply email or telephone. Any unintended transmission
of this email message does not constitute a waiver of any applicable privilege or protection. Thank you.

From: Palmer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Thursday, November 10, 2022 11:53 AM

To: Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: Daugard trial involce

Can | please get approval for this one.

From: McAtee, Olivia <Qlivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, October 18, 2022 1:44 PM

To: Palmer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>; Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: Daugard trial involce

Piease see the attached invoice. Thanks!

From: ERIC JENSEN <ebjensen@comcast.net>
Sent: Tuesday, October 18, 2022 1:41 PM

To: McAtee, Olivia <Qlivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: Daugard trial involice




Rachel Kahn. Ph.D.

P.O. Box 6491

Monona, WI 53716-0491
USA

Phone: 608-620-3067

To:

Iowa Office of the Attorney General
c/o Olivia McAtee

Area Prosecutions Division

Hoover Building

1305 E. Walnut Street

Des Moines, 1A 50319

INVOICE

DATE: OCTOBER 19, 2022

Description Amount
Initial Evaluation/Preliminary Report on Wade Alan $3,200.00
Dewall

Engagement Letter; 08/11/2022

Preliminary Report Date: 10/19/2022

Total $3,200.00

Payment should made out to Rachet Kahn and mailed to Rachel Kahn, P.O. Box 6491, Monona, Wi 53716~

0491

%*g/}é/‘/ Apprevediljff /'zﬁ/ / i/g/ﬂﬁ'/é)

Date // /]f.{?/fﬂz Aot -‘8,\';5)59&&”5)‘ ,
Rachel Kahn, Ph.D. paency OV P _EXRENSE -~ L2 WD I

Licensed Psychologist

Class OB Org

O0003/FH 7 F e




Palmer, Tina

From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]

Sent: Thursday, October 20, 2022 11:28 AM
To: McAtee, Olivia; Palmer, Tina

Subject: RE: WD prelimn

Approved

SCOTT

Please note new email address: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov

- Scott D, Brown

Special Assistant Attorney General/Area Prosecutions Division
Office of the Attorney Genera! of lowa

1305 E. Walnut St.

Des Moines, 1A 50319

Main: (515) 281-5164 | Division: (515) 281-3648 | Direct: (515) 281-6691 | Fax: (515) 281-8894
Email: scotl.brown@ag.iowa.gov | www.iowaattorneyaeneral.gov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email message (including any attachments) may be confidential or
protected by one or more of the following: the attorney-client privilege, attorney work product doctrine, or
applicable laws. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this message in error, please: (1) do not
read, print, copy, distribute or use it in any way; (2) permanently delete or destroy the message (including any
attachments); and (3) notify the sender immediately by reply email or telephone. Any unintended transmission
of this email message does not constitute a waiver of any applicable privilege or protection. Thank you.

From: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Thursday, October 20, 2022 11:20 AM

To: Palmer, Tina <Tina.Paimer@ag.iowa.gov>; Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: WD prelim

Please see the attached invoice. Thank you!

From: Rachel Kahn <rachel.kahn@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, October 20, 2022 9:34 AM

To: McAtee, Olivia <Qlivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: Fwd: WD prelim

---------- Forwarded message -—-—-——-

From: Rachel Kahn <rachel kahn@gmail.com>
Date: Wed, Oct 19, 2022 at 4:46 PM

Subject: WD prelim

To: McAtee, Qlivia <Qlivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>




THOMAS FORENSIC, LL.C INVOICE

Tracy A. Thomas, Ph.D., ABPP

Board Certified Forensic Psychologist

Licensed Psychologist (lowa, Nebraska, Missouri)
Phone (712) 730-8274

Fax (712) 248-8655

Email: Tracy Thomas@ThomasForensic.com

Web: lowaForensicPsychologist.com

INVOICE #1601A2022
DATE: 10/24/2022

TO: FOR:

lowa Office of the Attorney General Forensic Consultation/Evaluative Services:
¢/o Olivia McAtee Iowa Code 229A Evaluations

Area Prosecutions Division

Hoover Building

1305 E., Walnut Street
Des Moines, IA 50319

CASE DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE SERVICE DATES AMOUNT
Engagement Letter: 8/11/2022
. - . - 3.900
Kevin Johnson initial Evaluation/Preliminary Report Preliminary Report Date: 10/20/2022 83,
TOTAL $3,200
Make all checks payable to: // , —9
Thomas Forensic, LLC . / / s
c/o Tracy Thomas Appmve;ﬁ SIS T LA )
3827 Brickman Avenue Date // / 10729 wet 390000
Ames, TA 50010 Agency SUP f;%/}@w - TR PN
Claimant EIN: 47-1228282 Class i) Org

000207 445 ,ﬂ f*‘fl}mw%; %ﬁ{ o

Tracy A. Thomas, Ph.D., ABPP
Board Certified Forensic Psychologist
Licensed Psychologist {IA, NE, MO)




Palmer, Tina

o

From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]

Sent: Monday, October 24, 2022 2:48 PM
To: McAtee, Olivia; Palmer, Tina
Subject: RE: Kevin Johnson Report
Approved

SCOTT

Please note new email address: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov

Scott D. Brown

Special Assistant Attorney General/Area Prosecutions Division
Office of the Attorney General of jowa

1305 E. Walnut St.

Des Moines, 1A 50319

Main: {515) 281-5164 | Division: (515) 281-3648 | Direct: (515) 261-6691 | Fax: (515) 281-8894
Email: scott.brown@ag.iowa.qov | www.iowaattorneygenerat.qgov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email message (including any attachments) may be confidential or
protected by one or more of the following: the attorney-client privilege, attorney work product doctrine, or
applicable laws. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this message in error, please: (1) do not
read, print, copy, distribute or use it in any way; (2) permanently delete or destroy the message (including any
attachments); and (3) notify the sender immediately by reply email or telephone. Any unintended transmission
of this email message does not constitute a waiver of any applicable privilege or protection. Thank you.

From: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Monday, October 24, 2022 2:44 PM

To: Paimer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>; Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: Kevin Ichnson Report

Hi Scott and Tina, please see the attached invoice. Thank you!

From: Jamie Tatarek <jamie@thomasforensic.com>
Sent: Monday, October 24, 2022 2:17 PM

To: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: RE: Kevin Johnson Report

Here you go! Happy busy Monday!

From: McAtee, Olivia <QOlivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Monday, October 24, 2022 1:20 PM

To: Tracy Thomas <TracyThomas@thomasforensic.com>; Jamie Tatarek <jamie@thomasforensic.com>
Subject: RE: Kevin Johnson Report




Eric Jensen, Ph.D. § | VOECE

81 Kimball Terrace

Shelburne, VT 05482

ebjensen@comcast, net INVOICE # 2010
Phone 352-214-2039 DATE: NOVEMBER 9, 2022
TO: REGARDING:

Olivia McAtee SVP Respondent: Robert W. Allen, 111

Office of Iowa Attorney General DC# 6162689

1305 E. Walnut St
Des Mgines, IA 50319

DESCRIPTION HOURS RATE AMOUNT
Flat fee
Full report/opinion sarvice $4000.00

!\pprovedﬁjz ey ({(/’//‘%/??/
Date /://///}/22 Arnifzf/%@, /}{?’
Agency SUP LIS - Allen
Class b Org

V03100 438

Tax ID#008408740 TOTAL $4000.00




Palmer, Tina
m

From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]

Sent: Thursday, November 10, 2022 5:53 AM
To: McAtee, Olivia; Palmer, Tina

Subject: RE: Allen final report and invoice
Approved

SCOTT

Please note new email address: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov

5 Scott D. Brown

Special Assistant Attorney General/Area Prosecutions Division
Office of the Attorney General of lowa

1305 E. Walnut St,

Bas Moines, 1A 50319

Main: {515) 281-5164 | Division: (515) 281-3648 | Direct: (515) 281-6891 | Fax: {515) 281-8804
Email: scolt.brown@ag.iowa,qov | www.iowaattorneygeneral.qov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email message (including any attachments) may be confidential or
protected by one or more of the following: the attorney-client privilege, attorney work product doctrine, or
applicable laws. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this message in error, please: (1) do not
read, print, copy, distribute or use it in any way; (2) permanently delete or destroy the message (including any
attachments); and (3) notify the sender immediately by reply email or telephone. Any unintended transmission
of this email message does not constitute a waiver of any applicable privilege or protection. Thank you.

From: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, November 9, 2022 3:50 PM

To: Palmer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>; Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: Allen final report and invoice

Hi Tina and Scott,

Please see the attached invoice. Thank you!
From: ERIC JENSEN <ebjensen@comeast.net>
Sent: Monday, November 7, 2022 9:27 AM

To: McAtee, Olivia <QOlivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: Allen final report and invoice

Hi QOlivia,

Attached please find the final report and invoice for Robert Allen. Thank you for this referral.



William A. Schmitt, Ph.D., LLC
Licensed Clinical Psychologist

PO Box 930376
Verona, W1 53593
(608) 698-2713
wschmitt55@gmail.com

INVOICE
Final Evaluation for Iowa §229A

Re: Micheal Steele

DOB: June 26, 1998

Evaluator; William A. Schmitt, PhD
Date: November 9, 2022

Final Evaluation and Report was completed and submitted November 9, 2022.

Contracted fee for services rendered: $4000.00

Thank you for this interesting referral.
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William A. Schmitt, Ph.D.
Licensed Psychologist
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Palmer, Tina

L I ]
From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]

Sent: Tuesday, November 15, 2022 11:21 AM

To: Palmer, Tina

Subject: RE: Final report, etc

Approved.

SCOTT

Please note new email address: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov

' Scott D. Brown

Special Assistant Attorney General/Area Prosecutions Division
Office of the Attorney General of lowa

1305 E. Walnut St.

Des Moines, 1A 50319

Main: {515) 281-5164 | Division: (515) 281-3648 | Direct: (515) 281-6691 | Fax: (515) 281-8854
Email: scott. brown@ag.iowa.gov | www.iowaattomeygeneral.gov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email message (including any attachments) may be confidential or
protected by one or more of the following: the attorney-client privilege, attorney work product doctrine, or
applicable laws. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this message in error, please: (1) do not
read, print, copy, distribute or use it in any way; (2} permanently delete or destroy the message (including any
attachments); and (3) notify the sender immediately by reply email or telephone. Any unintended transmission
of this email message does not constitute a waiver of any applicable privilege or protection. Thank you.

From: Paimer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, November 15, 2022 9:10 AM

To: Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: Final report, etc

Can | have your approval on this one?

From: McAtee, Olivia <Qlivia. Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Thursday, November 10, 2022 9:18 AM

To: Palmer, Tina <Tina,Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>; Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott, Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: Final report, etc

Good morning, please see the attached invoice. Thank you!

From: Bill Schmitt <wschmitt55@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, November 9, 2022 8:57 PM

To: McAtee, QOlivia <Qlivia.Mcatee @ag.iowa.gov>; Cretsinger, Keisha [AG] <Keisha.Cretsinger@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: Final report, etc




William A. Schmitt, Ph.D., LL.C
Licensed Psychologist

PO Box 930376
Verona, WI 53593
(608) 698-2713
wschmitt55@gmail.com

INVOICE
Final Evaluation for Iowa §229A

Re: Lawrence Manning
DOB: April 28, 1970

Evaluator: William A. Schmitt, PhD
Date: November [, 2022

Final Evaluation and Report was completed and submitted November 1, 2022,

Contracted fee for services rendered: $4000.00

Thank you for this interesting referral. }7 ‘ /) 4
£ i :
Approved w-f/?ﬁ«f /e Z{;/ﬁZ/U
u}mg \[\/D ﬁ?’it@wfif/ff/jj ,{‘r;f %ﬂ[ﬂ /{9 .
' roeney VP Expepse =Nlnning
William A. Schmitt, Ph.D. Class Obj Org h
Licensed Psychologist
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Palmer, Tina

L T L]
From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]

Sent; Tuesday, November 15, 2022 11:21 AM

To: Palmer, Tina

Subject: RE: LM final report, efc

Approved.

SCOTT

Please note new email address: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov

‘: Scott D. Brown

Special Assistant Attorney General/Area Prosecutions Division
Office of the Attorney General of lowa

1305 E. Walnut St

Des Moines, |A 50319

Main: (515) 281-5164 | Division: {515) 281-3648 | Direct: (515) 281-6691 | Fax: (515) 281-8894
Email; scotl. brown@ag.iowa.gov { www.iowaattorneygeneral.gov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email message (including any attachments) may be confidential or
protected by one or more of the following: the attorney-client privilege, attorney work product doctrine, or
applicable laws. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this message in error, please: (1) do not
read, print, copy, distribute or use it in any way; (2) permanently delete or destroy the message (including any
attachments); and (3} notify the sender immediately by reply email or telephone. Any unintended transmission
of this email message does not constitute a waiver of any applicable privilege or protection. Thank you.

From: Palmer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, November 15, 2022 9:09 AM

To: Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: LM final report, etc

Can | have your approval on this one.

Thanks,
Tina

From: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Thursday, November 10, 2022 10:42 AM

To: Palmer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>; Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: LM final report, etc

Good marning, please see the attached invoice. Thank you!



Eric Jensen, Ph.D.
81 Kimball Terrace
Shelburne, VT 05482

ebjensen@comcast.net
Phone 352-214-2039

TO:

Olivia McAtee

Inv. II SYP

Office of Iowa Attorpey General
1305 E. Walnut St

Des Moines, IA 50319

JICE

INVOICE # 1131
DATE: NOVEMBER 15, 2022

REGARDING:

SVP Respondent: Mario Chavez
DOB: 12/9/97

DESCRIPTION HOURS RATE AMOUNT
Flat fee
Trial prep/testimony 11/8-11/10/22 service $2400.00

Tax ID#008408740

TOTAL $2400,00




Palmer, Tina

U000 T
From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]
Sent: Sunday, November 13, 2022 4:33 PM
To: McAtee, Olivia; Palmer, Tina
Subject: RE: Chavez trial invoice

Approved

SCOTT

Please note new email address; scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov

Y H Scott D. Brown

Special Assistant Attorney General/Area Prosecutions Division
Office of the Attorney General of lowa

1305 E. Walnut St,

Des Moines, (A 50319

Main: (515) 281-5164 | Division: {515) 281-3648 | Direct: (515) 281-6691 | Fax: (515) 281-8894
Email: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov | www.icwaattornevgeneral.gov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email message (including any attachments) may be confidential or
protected by one or more of the following: the attorney-client privilege, attorney work product doctrine, or
applicable laws. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this message in error, please: (1) do not
read, print, copy, distribute or use it in any way; (2) permanently delete or destroy the message (including any
attachments); and (3) notify the sender immediately by reply email or telephone. Any unintended transmission
of this email message does not constitute a waiver of any applicable privilege or protection, Thank you.

From: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee @ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Sunday, November 13, 2022 4:11 PM

To: Palmer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>; Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: Chavez trial invoice

Hi, please see the attached invoice. Thank you!

From: ERIC JENSEN <ebjensen@comcast.net>
Sent: Friday, November 11, 2022 9:12 AM

To: McAtee, Olivia <Qlivia. Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: Chavez trial invoice

Hi Olivia
Attached please find the invoice for yesterday's trial of Mr. Chavez

Thanks
EJ



