Gray Miller Persh LLP

2233 Wisconsin Avenue NW Suite 226 Washington, DC 20007 Tax ID 46-4381194



Iowa PBS

6450 Corporate Drive Johnston, IA 50131-6450

Invoice 37638

Date	Oct 13, 2022
Service Thru	Sep 30, 2022

In Reference To: General (Fees)

Date	Ву	Services	Hours	Rates	Amount
09/01/2022	B.Persh	Respond to email from M. Phillips re FCC adverse adjudication reporting and due diligence.	0.10	\$ 437.00/hr	\$ 43.70
09/02/2022	B.Persh	Prepare memorandum and email re annual FCC annual EEO public file report requirements and postings for Iowa broadcast stations.	0.10	\$ 437.00/hr	\$ 43.70
09/06/2022	T.Gray	Review underwriting issues (College Savings Iowa); emails with S. Bailey re same.	0.30	\$ 437.00/hr	\$ 131.10
09/08/2022	M.Miller	Research regarding IPBB structure under Iowa Code and possible state restructure and FCC restrictions/issues with same.	0.70	\$ 437.00/hr	\$ 305.90
09/08/2022	T.Gray	Review issues re possible restructuring of lowa state agencies and possible effects on lowa PBS.	1.10	\$ 437.00/hr	\$ 480.70
09/09/2022	B.Persh	Analysis, review and respond to email from M. Wendel re FCC annual EEO public file reports, recruitment source listings and interviewee/hire data.	0.20	\$ 437.00/hr	\$ 87.40
09/09/2022	M.Miller	Analyze issues regarding Iowa state restructuring and impact on Iowa PBS; prepare for and telephone conference with Iowa PBS team regarding same; follow up work on federal licensing scheme as applied to state entities.	1.80	\$ 437.00/hr	\$ 786.60
09/09/2022	T.Gray	Telephone conference with M. Phillips, A. Batt and S. Ramsey re lowa state agency reorganization issues and re re-introduction of copyright bill in lowa legislature; research re state reorganization issues.	1.30	\$ 437.00/hr	\$ 568.10
09/12/2022	T.Gray	Research and work on memo to Iowa PBS re state restructuring issues.	0.80	\$ 437.00/hr	\$ 349.60

09/14/2022	M.Miller	Work on memo to Iowa PBS regarding FCC licensee control and federally mandated license control over programming, personnel and finances.	1.80	\$ 437.00/hr	\$ 786.60
09/14/2022	M.Miller	Research regarding federal and FCC case law and lowa PBS debate criteria and Libertarian candidate; review candidate emails to lowa PBS.	1.70	\$ 437.00/hr	\$ 742.90
09/14/2022	T.Gray	Review and advise on issues regarding Libertarian candidate request to be included in gubernatorial debate.	1.10	\$ 437.00/hr	\$ 480.70
09/15/2022	M.Miller	Research regarding public TV candidate debates and third party inclusion; prepare for and conference call with IPBB regarding Libertarian candidate for Iowa governor and upcoming debate; draft response to Libertarian candidate regarding candidate criteria.	4.80	\$ 437.00/hr	\$ 2,097.60
09/16/2022	B.Persh	Review 2021-22 annual EEO public file report positions filled/recruitment source listings for Iowa PBS; respond to email from M. Wendel re same, long -term initiatives, public file/website postings and documentation retention.	0.40	\$ 437.00/hr	\$ 174.80
09/16/2022	M.Miller	Emails with Iowa PBS regarding Mr. Stewart's request for clarification about cash contributions criteria for gubernatorial debate.	0.60	\$ 437.00/hr	\$ 262.20
09/19/2022	M.Miller	Work on Iowa PBS gubernatorial debate issues regarding polling requirement and 10% threshold; draft Iowa PBS response to candidate (R. Stewart) regarding same.	1.80	\$ 437.00/hr	\$ 786.60
09/20/2022	M.Miller	Work on Iowa PBS response to inquiry about "appealing" polling threshold gubernatorial candidate criteria for general election debate.	0.90	\$ 437.00/hr	\$ 393.30
09/23/2022	M.Miller	Work on Iowa PBS gubernatorial debate issues and candidate's financial showing to meet debate criteria; emails and telephone call with Iowa PBS regarding same.	1.20	\$ 437.00/hr	\$ 524.40
09/26/2022	M.Miller	Work on Iowa PBS issues regarding candidate deadline to satisfy gubernatorial debate criteria and review email from Mr. Stewart relating to debate criteria; email to Iowa PBS regarding same.	0.60	\$ 437.00/hr	\$ 262.20
09/26/2022	T.Gray	Review issues and telephone call with M. Miller re Rick Stewart latest missive regarding participation in gubernatorial debate.	0.40	\$ 437.00/hr	\$ 174.80
09/30/2022	B.Persh	Review and reply to email from M. Wendel re annual EEO public file report posting on station website.	0.10	\$ 437.00/hr	\$ 43.70
				Total Hours	21.80 hrs
				Total Fees	\$ 9,526.60
		т	otal Inv		\$ 9,526.60
Total Invoice Amount Previous Balance					\$ 279.80
09/29/2022 Payment - ACH Split Payment					(\$279.80)
Balance (Amount Due)					\$ 9,526.60



Gray Miller Persh LLP PO Box 716330 Philadelphia, PA 19171-6330