THOMAS J. MILLER
ATTORNEY GENERAL

1305 E. WALNUT ST.
DES MOINES, IA 50319
Main: 515-281-5164 » Direct: 515-281-4419
Email: Jeffrey. Thompson@iowa.gov
www.iowaattorneygeneral.gov

JEFFREY S. THOMPSON
SOLICITOR GENERAL
IOWA DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE

OFFICE OF THE ATTORNEY GENERAL

January 12, 2022

Ms. Victoria Newton
Executive Secretary
Executive Council
State Capitol
L-O-C-A-L

Re: Request for Payment of SVP Court Costs
Dear Victoria:

Our Office requests Executive Council approval for payment pursuant to
Iowa Code section 7D.10 for court costs and expenses incurred in prosecuting
civil commitments under lowa Code chapter 229A for the Sexually Violent
Predator (SVP) program.

In addition to the cost of employee salaries, travel and support devoted to
this program, the Office incurs substantial expenses for expert witnesses. These
expenses have increased substantially due to the growing number of chapter 229A
commitments. Section 7D.10 authorizes payment of court costs and expenses by
the Executive Council “[i]f sufficient funds for court costs have not been
appropriated to a state department, or if sufficient funds are not otherwise
available for such purposes within the budget of a state department.” There is no
specific appropriation for these expenses and sufficient funds are not otherwise
available.

Therefore, pursuant to Iowa Code section 7D.10, the Office requests
Executive Council approval of payment of $9,600.00 for record review/report
preparation (invoices enclosed).

i rely, g
JE RZ{ S. TH

MPSON
Solicitor General




SVP Invoices - SFY 2022 (01/05/22)

Paid by
Date . . Approval
. Vendor Description Amount Executive
Received Date
Council
12/27/21 William A. Schmitt, Ph.D., LLC Initial Evai/Prelim Report Marques Robinson $3,200.00
12/27/21 William A. Schmitt, Ph.D., LLC Initial Eval/Prelim Report Damion Rutues $3,200.00
12/17/21 Jeffrey Davis, Ph.D. Record Review/Report Preparation Bullock $3,200.00

$9,600.00 $0.00




William A. Schmitt, Ph.D,, LI.C
Licensed Psychologist

PO Box 930376
Verona, WI 53593

(608) 698-2713
wschmitt55@gmail.com

INVOICE

Preliminary Evaluation for lowa §229A

Re: Marques Robinson
DOB: June 3, 1985

Evaluator: William A. Schmitt, PhD
Date: December 23, 2021

o Initial Evaluation/Preliminary Report was completed and submitted December 23, 2021.
Contracted fee for services rendered: $3200.
Thank you for this interesting referral.
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Palmer, Tina

A O
From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]
Sent: Tuesday, January 4, 2022 931 PM
To: Palmer, Tina
Subject: RE: MR Prelim report
Approved
SCOTT

Please note new email address: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov

¥ Scott D. Brown
Special Assistant Aftorney General/Area Prosecutions Division
Office of the Attorney General of lowa
1305 E. Walnut St.
Des Moines, 1A 50319
Main: (515) 281-5164 | Diviston: (515) 281-3648 | Direct; {515) 281-6691 | Fax: (515) 281-8694
Email: gcoft brown@ag.iowa.gov | www.iowaattornevageneral.gov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email message (including any attachments) may be confidential or
protected by one or more of the following: the attorney-client privilege, attorney work product doctrine, or
applicable laws, If you are not the intended recipient or have received this message in error, please: (1) do not
read, print, copy, distribute or use it in any way; (2) permanently delete or destroy the message (including any
attachments); and (3) notify the sender immediately by reply email or telephone. Any unintended transmission
of this email message does not constitute a waiver of any applicable privilege or protection. Thank you.

From: Palmer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, January 4, 2022 4:16 PM

To: Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Suhject: FW: MR Prelim report

From: McAtee, Olivia <Qlivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Monday, December 27, 2021 11:25 AM

To: Palmer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>; Brown, ScottAG [AG) <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: MR Prelim report

Please see the attached invoice. Thank you!

From; Bill Schmitt <wschmitt55@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, December 23, 2021 8:19 PM

To: McAtee, Olivia <Qlivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: MR Prelim report




William A. Schmitt, Ph.D., LLC
Licensed Psychologist

PO Box 930376
Verona, WL 53593
(608) 698-2713
wschmitt55@gmail.com

INVOICE

Preliminary Evaluation for Iowa §229A

Re: Damion Rutues
DOB; July 19, 1979

Evaluator: William A. Schmitt, PhD
Date: December 27, 2021

o TInitial Evaluation/Preliminary Report was completed and submitted December 27, 2021.

Contracted fee for services rendered: $3200.

Thank you for this interesting referral.
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William A. Schmitt, Ph.D.
Licensed Psychologist

i Dy
;ﬂ ! o -’ / i T s
Approved “‘;;_j[ ﬁfij—{é CpILES

Date f/’f; //Z nf S ALe
Agency Y };J L }‘f\ﬁﬁiff{/(, /757{;‘} UeS

Class O Org

Doy 3101315




Palmer, Tina

From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]

Sent: Tuesday, January 4, 2022 9:31 PM
To: Palmer, Tina

Subject: RE: Prelim reports

Approved

SCOTT

Please note new email address: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov

Scott D. Brown

Special Assistant Attorney General/Area Prosecutions Division
Office of the Attorney General of lowa

1365 E. Walnut St.

Des Moines, 1A 50319

Main: (515) 281-5164 | Division: (515) 281-3648 | Direct: (515) 281-6691 | Fax: (515) 261-8894
Email: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov | www.jowaattorneygeneral.qov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email message (including any attachments) may be confidential or
protected by one or more of the following: the attorney-client privilege, attorney work product doctrine, or
applicable laws. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this message in error, please: (1) do not
read, print, copy, distribute or use it in any way; (2) permanently delete or destroy the message (including any
attachments); and (3) notify the sender immediately by reply email or telephone. Any unintended transmission
of this email message does not constitute a waiver of any applicable privilege or protection. Thank you.

From: Palmer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, January 4, 2022 4:16 PM

To: Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: Prelim reports

From: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee @ag.iowa.gov>
Sent: Monday, December 27, 2021 11:32 AM

To: Brown, SCottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>; Palmer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: Prelim reports

Please see the attached invoice. Thank youl

From: Bill Schmitt <wschmitt55@email.com>
Sent: Monday, December 27, 2021 11:14 AM

To: McAtee, Olivia <Qlivia.Mcatee @ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: Prelim reports




Jeffrey Davis, Ph.D.

Licensed Psychologist » lowa License #083838 » California License #PSY 19044
P.O. Box 6243 #Los Osos, CA 93412 « 805-748-5081
Jeffreydavisphd@gmail.com

December 17, 2021

Olivia McAtee, investigator |
lowa Attorney General's Office
1305 E. Walnut

Des Moines, |1A 50319

Respondent: BULLOCK, Daunte D.
DCI No.: 1147686

Dear Ms. McAlee,

Below is the invoice for the preliminary evaluation of Mr. Daunte Bullock pursuant to
lowa Code § 229A. Please remit {o the address shown above.

Activity Report Date Total

Record Review/Report Preparation 12-13-21 $3,200

Please do not hesitate to contact me if you have questions.

Respectfully,

%% D
Jeffrey Davis, Ph.D. j YR
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Paimer, Tina

D00 s e
From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]

Sent: Tuesday, January 4, 2022 9:31 PM

To: Palmer, Tina

Subject; RE: Invoice for Bullock

Approved

SCOTT

Please note new email address: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov

7 Scott D. Brown
Special Assistant Attorney General/Area Prosecutions Division
Office of the Attorney General of lowa
1305 E. Walnut St.
Des Moines, 1A 50319
Main: (515) 281-5164 | Division: (515) 281-3648 | Direct: (515} 281-6691 | Fax: {(515) 281-8894
Email: scott. brown@ag.iowa.gov | www.iowaattornevaeneral goy

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email message (including any attachments) may be confidential or
protected by one or more of the following: the attorney-client privilege, attorney work product doctrine, or
applicable laws. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this message in error, please: (1) do not
read, print, copy, distribute or use it in any way; (2) permanently delete or destroy the message (including any
attachments); and (3) notify the sender immediately by reply email or telephone. Any unintended transmission
of this email message does not constitute a waiver of any applicable privilege or protection. Thank you.

From: Palmer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, January 4, 2022 4:17 PM

To: Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: Invoice for Bullock

From: McAtee, Olivia <Qlivia.Mcatee@ag.jowa.gov>

Sent: Friday, December 17, 2021 12:19 PM

To: Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>; Palimer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: Invoice for Bullock

Please see the attached invoice, Thank you!

From: Jeff Davis <jeffreydavisphd@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, December 17,2021 12:12 PM

To: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: Invoice for Bullock




