SVP Invoices - SFY 2022 (02/23/22)

Date Paid by Approval
. Vendor Description Amount Executive PR
Received X Date
Council
2/16/22 Thomas Forensic LLC Interview/Final Eval/ Trial Test/mileage-Tripp $6,492.04
2/16/22 Eric Jensen Ph.D. Trial prep and testimony - Hubby $2,400.00
2/23/22 William A. Schmitt, Ph.D., LLC Initial Eval/Preliminary Report Offutt $3,200.00
2/14/22 Rachel Kahn Ph.D. tnitial Eval/Preliminary Report VanGundy $3,200.00

$15,292.04 $0.00



THOMAS FORENSIC, LL.C INVOICE
Tracy A. Thomas, Ph.D., ABPP

Board Certified Forensic Psychologist

Licensed Psychologist (Towa, Nebraska, Missouri)

Phone (712) 730-8274

Fax (712) 248-8655

Email: TracyThomas@ThomasForensic.com

Web: [owaForensicPsychologist.com

INVOICE #271A2022
DATE: 2/15/2022

TO: FOR:
lowa Office of the Attorney General Forensic Consultation/Evaluative Services:
¢/o Olivia McAtee Iowa Code 229A Evaluations

Area Prosecutions Division
Hoover Building

1305 E. Walnut Street

Des Moines, [A 50319

CASE DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE SERVICE DATES AMOUNT
. . . . Interview Date: 2/2/2022
Robert Tripp Interview / Final Evaluation Final Evaluation Date: 2/14/2022 $4,000
Robert Tripp Trial Testimony 2/15/2022 $2,400

Mileage: Ames to Wapello County
Robert Tripp Courthouse — Roundtrip 2/15/2022 $92.04
{236 miles x .39)

TOTAL $6,492.04

Make all checks payable to:
Thomas Forensic, LLC Approved =
c/o Tracy Thomas jf 7 A kat b
3827 Brickman Avenue Date 2142 040 A 7/

Ames, 1A 50010

g
Jg;W ,
z/w;y

Sl Sl

Claimant EIN: 47-1228282

Tracy A. Thomas, Ph.D., ABPP
Board Certified Forensic Psychologist
Licensed Psychologist (IA, NE, MO)




Palmer, Tina
L

From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]

Sent: Wednesday, February 16, 2022 1:10 PM

To: McAtee, Olivia; Palmer, Tina

Subject: RE: Robert Tripp Invoice and billing questions
Approved.

SCOTT

Please note new email address: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov

4 Scott D. Brown

Special Assistant Attorney General/Area Prosecutions Division
Office of the Attorney Generai of lowa

1305 E. Walnut $t,

Des Moines, 1A 50319

Main: (515) 281-5184 | Division: (515) 281-3648 | Direct: {(515) 281-6691 | Fax: (515) 281-8894
Emaill: scoti.brown@ag.iowa.qov | www.iowaattorneygeneral.gov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email message (including any attachments) may be confidential or
protected by one or more of the following: the attorney-client privilege, attorney work product doctrine, or
applicable laws. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this message in error, please: (1) do not
read, print, copy, distribute or use it in any way; (2) permanently delete or destroy the message (including any
attachments); and (3) notify the sender immediately by reply email or telephone. Any unintended transmission
of this email message does not constitute a waiver of any applicable privilege or protection. Thank you.

From: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, February 16, 2022 1:02 PM

To: Palmer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>; Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: Robert Tripp Invoice and billing questions

Please see the attached invoice, Scott, please note the mileage included. We do generally approve and pay this for our
experts, but we have not yet paid mileage in 2022 because so many things have been held remotely, so just a heads up.

Thank you,
Olivia

From: Jamie Tatarek <jamie@thomasforensic.com>
Sent: Tuesday, February 15, 2022 11:39 AM

To: McAtee, Olivia <Clivia.Mcatee @ag.iowa.gov>

Cc: Tracy Thomas <tracythomas@thomasforensic.com>
Subject: Robert Tripp Invoice and billing questions

Good morning Olivia,




Attached is the invoice for Robert Tripp’s Interview/Final Report and Trial Testimony. Please let me know if you need
anything further on this matter.

Additionally, there are two invoices for SVP matters that [ do not believe have been paid, both from July 2021. They
were sent to you on 7/25/2021 (Barr) and 7/29/2021 (Eaton), and you forwarded them along. Tina had said the following
on 11/10/21 when I inquired of these matters: “These have all been sent over to the Executive Council for payment. They
are having a meeting this Monday so some of these should pay.” Dr. Thomas received payment on a different matter that
1 had inquired about, but not these two, to the best of my knowledge. Would it be possible to have these looked into?

In fe the Detention of JA2021  CVCVO26160  SVP Testimony  7/22/2021 $2,672.36

Joshua Barr
In re the Detention of John 57 114 ovevosssss VP FInal&op0m001 8644974
Eaton Testimony
Thank you,

Jamie Tatarek, MA (Forensic Psychology)
Psychology Assistant
Thomas Forensic, LLC



Palmer, Tina

From: McAtee, Olivia

Sent: Wednesday, February 16, 2022 1:02 PM

To: Palmer, Tina; Brown, ScottAG [AG]

Subject: FW: Robert Tripp tnvoice and billing questions
Attachments: Tripp, Robert_nvoice_SVP_Final.Testimony.pdf

Please see the attached invoice. Scott, please note the mileage included. We do generally approve and pay this for our
experts, but we have not yet paid mileage in 2022 because so many things have been held remotely, so just a heads up.

Thank you,
Olivia

From: Jamie Tatarek <jamie@thomasforensic.com>
Sent: Tuesday, February 15, 2022 11:39 AM

To: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>

Cc: Tracy Thomas <tracythomas@thomasfarensic.com>
Subject: Robert Tripp Invoice and billing questions

Good morning Olivia,

Attached is the invoice for Robert Tripp’s Interview/Final Report and Trial Testimony. Please let me know if you need
anything further on this matter.

Additionally, there are two invoices for SVP matters that I do not believe have been paid, both from July 2021. They
were sent to you on 7/25/2021 (Barr) and 7/29/2021 (Eaton), and you forwarded them along. Tina had said the following
on 11/10/21 when I inquired of these matters: “These have all been sent over to the Executive Council for payment. They
are having a meeting this Monday so some of these should pay.” Dr. Thomas received payment on a different matter that
I had inquired about, but not these two, to the best of my knowledge. Would it be possible to have these looked into?

In re the Detention of

Joshua Barr 341A2021 CVCV026160 SVP Testimony ~ 7/22/2021 $2,672.36

In re the Detention of John SVP Final &
Eaton 37142621 CVCV038884 Testimony 712972021 $6,449.74
Thank you,

Jamie Tatarek, MA (Forensic Psychology)
Psychology Assistant
Thomas Forensic, LLC




Eric Jensen, Ph.D.
81 Kimball Terrace
Shelburne, VT 05482

ebjensen@comcast.net
Phone 352-214-2039

TO:

Olivia McAtee

Inv. II SvP

Office of Iowa Attorney General
1305 E, Walnut St

Des Molnes, IA 50319

REGARDING:

SVP Respondent: M. Hubby
DOB: 10/10/73

INVOICE

INVOICE # 111
DATE: FEBRUARY 16, 2022

DESCRIPTION HOURS RATE AMOUNT
Flat fee
Trail prep and testimony 2/14/22 service $2400.00
Awrovedh,jf-{/m,., el
Date ,?/Qj//j nt A AL AL
Agency S\ LE)ENSE - Ay
Class Obj Org
008 % | L0498
Tax ID#008408740 TOTAL $2400.00




Palmer, Tina

From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]

Sent: Wednesday, February 16, 2022 11:36 AM
To: McAtee, Olivia; Palmer, Tina

Subject: RE: Hubby trial invoice

Approved.

SCOTT

Please note new email address: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov

H Scott D. Brown

Special Assistant Attorney General/Area Prosecutions Division
Office of the Attorney General of lowa

1306 E. Walnut St.

Des Moines, |1A 50319

Main: {515) 281-5164 | Division: (515) 281-3648 | Direct: (515) 281-6691 | Fax: (515) 281-8894
Email: scott.brown@ag.iowa.qov | www.iowaaltorneygeneral.gov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email message (including any attachments) may be confidential or
protected by one or more of the following: the attorney-client privilege, attorney work product doctrine, or
applicable laws. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this message in error, please: (1) do not
read, print, copy, distribute or use it in any way; (2) permanently delete or destroy the message (including any
attachments); and (3) notify the sender immediately by reply email or telephone. Any unintended transmission
of this email message does not constitute a waiver of any applicable privilege or protection. Thank you.

From: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee @ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, February 16, 2022 11:25 AM

To: Palmer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>; Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: Hubby trial invoice

Please see the attached invoice. Thank you!

From: ERIC JENSEN <ebjensen@comcast.net>

Sent: Tuesday, February 15, 2022 7:04 AM

To: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: Hubby trial invoice

Hi Olivia,
Here is the trial invoice for Mr. Hubby's trial yesterday.

Thanks.




William A. Schmitt, Ph.D., LLC
Licensed Psychologist

PO Box 930376
Verona, WI 53593

(608) 698-2713
wschmitt55@gmail.com

INVOICE

Preliminary Evaluation for Iowa §229A
Re: Lloyd Offutt
DOB: July 2, 1955

Evaluator: William A. Schmitt, PhD
Date: February 13, 2022

o Initial Evaluation/Preliminary Report was completed and submitted February 13, 2022.
Contracted fee for services rendered: $3200.
Thank you for this interesting referral.

WHASC

William A, Schmitt, Ph.D.
Licensed Psychologist

Afﬂpmved\;;’f//ft / L/ /’//// E

ngency. NP L LI~ ol 177

Class,___ . Cbi____. 09
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Palmer, Tina

I 00—
From: Brown, ScottAG {AG]
Sent: Wednesday, February 23, 2022 2:09 PM
To: Palmer, Tina
Subject; RE: LO prelim report etc
Approved

SCOTT

Please note new email address: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov

Scott D. Brown

Special Assistant Attorney General/Area Prosecutions Division
Cffice of the Attorney General of lowa

1305 E. Walnut St.

Des Moines, 1A 50319

Main: (515) 281-5164 | Division: (515) 281-3648 | Direct: (515) 281-6691 | Fax: {515) 281-8894
Email: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov | www.iowaattorneygeneral.gov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email message (including any attachments) may be confidential or
profected by one or more of the following: the attorney-client privilege, attorney work product doctrine, or
applicable laws. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this message in error, please: (1) do not
read, print, copy, distribute or use it in any way; (2) permanently delete or destroy the message (including any
attachments); and (3) notify the sender immediately by reply email or telephone. Any unintended transmission
of this email message does not constitute a waiver of any applicable privilege or protection. Thank you.

From: Palmer, Tina <Tina.Paimer@ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, February 23, 2022 11:09 AM

To: Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: LO prelim report etc

Still need appraoval for this one.

Thank yous,
Tina

From: McAtee, Olivia <Qlivia.Mcatee @ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Monday, February 14, 2022 11:15 AM

To: Palmer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>; Brown, ScottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: LO prelim report etc

Please see the attached invoice. Thank youl!



Rachel Kahn. Ph.D.

P.0. Box 6491

Monona, WI 53716-0491
USA

Phone; 608-620-3067

To:

Iowa Office of the Attorney General
c/o Olivia McAtee

Area Prosecutions Division

Hoover Building

1305 E. Walnut Street

Des Moines, IA 50319

INVOIC

DATE: FEBRUARY 14, 2022

Description Amount
Initial Evaluation/Preliminary Report on Edwin Donti $3,200.00
Vangundy

Engagement Letter: 1/20/2022

Preliminary Report Date: 2/14/2022

Total $3,200.00

Payment shoutd made out to Rachel Kahn and mailed to Rachel Kahn, P.O. Box 6491, Monona, WI 53716-

0491

Gt

Rachel Kahn, Ph.D.
Licensed Psychologist

A?provaa‘\uwj figs T
Date_A/33/3 300000

Agency O\T Ly e/15¢ - \inGuindt /
Class Chj Org

(000309 577




Palmer, Tina

IOt - |
From: Brown, ScottAG [AG]
Sent: Monday, February 14, 2022 8:07 PM
To: McAtee, Olivia; Paimer, Tina
Subject: RE: EV 2/18

Approved

SCOTT

Please note new email address: scott.brown@ag.iowa.gov

H Scott D. Brown

Special Assistant Attorney General/Area Prosecutions Division
Office of the Attorney Generai of lowa

1305 E. Walnut 5t.

Des Moines, 1A 50319

Main: {515) 281-5164 | Division: (515) 281-3648 | Direct: (515) 281-6691 | Fax: (515) 281-8894
Email: scott. brown@an.iowa.gov | www.iowaaftorneygeneral.qov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email message (including any attachments) may be confidential or
protected by one or more of the following: the attorney-client privilege, attorney work product doctrine, or
applicable laws. If you are not the intended recipient or have received this message in error, please: (1) do not
read, print, copy, distribute or use it in any way; (2) permanently delete or destroy the message (including any
attachments); and (3) notify the sender immediately by reply email or telephone. Any unintended transmission
of this email message does not constitute a waiver of any applicable privilege or protection. Thank you.

From: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee @ag.iowa.gov>

Sent: Monday, February 14, 2022 2:08 PM

To: Palmer, Tina <Tina.Palmer@ag.iowa.gov>; Brown, SCcottAG [AG] <Scott.Brown@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: FW: EV 2/18

Please see the attached invoice. Thank youl

From: Rachel Kahn <rachel.kahn@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, February 14, 2022 1:52 PM

To: McAtee, Olivia <Olivia.Mcatee@ag.iowa.gov>
Subject: £V 2/13

Hi Olivia,
Here is the report for Edwin Vangundy as well as the attached invoice.

Thanks!!



Rachel

Rachel Kahn, Ph.D.
Licensed Psychologist
217-621-5944

**NOTICE: This E-mail and any attachments may contain confidential
information. Use and further disclosure of the information by the
recipient must be consistent with applicable laws, regulations, and
agreements. if you received this email in error, please notify the
sender; delete the email; and do not use, disclose, or store the
information it contains,




