
PROFESSIONAL SERVICE: GEN FUND UTILITY METRO ANT. NOTE

Amegy Credit Card 965.04$           

Petty Cash -$                 

Olson & Olson 700.00$           

BBG Consulting 2,750.00$        

HDR Engineering - 6,441.00$        764.07$           132.44$     

Inframark 3,862.59$        

811 19.95$             

USIC 501.27$           

TOTAL 10,856.04$      5,147.88$        132.44$     -$              

1/18/2022Disbursements Presented to Council

























TX BBG Consulting Inc
201 Westheimer unit G
Houston, TX  77006 US
(832) 656-7136
ACCOUNTING@BBGCODE.COM

BILL TO
City of Hilshire Village
8301 Westview
Houston, TX  77055

INVOICE 8858

DATE 01/03/2022    TERMS Net 30

DUE DATE 02/02/2022

DATE ACTIVITY DESCRIPTION QTY RATE AMOUNT

12/31/2021 Services Building Official Services Monthly 
Contract

1 2,750.00 2,750.00

TOTAL DUE $2,750.00



Invoice
Please send remittance with copy of invoice to

HDR, Inc.
US Engineering Accounts Receivable

susan.blevins@hilshirevillagetexas.com P. O. Box 74008202
Chicago, IL  60674-8202

City of Hilshire Village Invoice No. 1200403174
8301 Westview Invoice Date 1/13/2022
Houston, Texas  77055 Month Ending 12/25/2021

HDR Project No. 10281855 $7,337.51
Attn:  Ms. Susan Blevins

Invoice for services from: 11/21/21 to 12/25/21
8001 Bromley 

Labor Hours Rate Total
Javier Vasquez 1.50 $156.23 234.35$      
Javier Vasquez 0.50 $167.17 83.59$        

Total: 317.94$      Total This Invoice: $317.94
Verizon

Labor Hours Rate Total
Efrain Him 5.50 $254.69 1,400.80$   
Efrain Him 1.50 $264.88 397.32$      
Carol Qu 3.00 $99.06 297.18$      

Total: 2,095.30$   Total This Invoice: $2,095.30
1226 Glourie

Labor Hours Rate Total
Presley Lundquist 1.00 $109.34 109.34$      

Total: 109.34$      Total This Invoice: $109.34
Miscellaneous Engineering
Labor Hours Rate Total
Efrain Him 1.50 $254.69 382.04$      
Efrain Him 1.00 $264.88 264.88$      
Javier Vasquez 6.25 $156.23 976.44$      
Javier Vasquez 1.50 $167.17 250.76$      
Carol Qu 3.25 $99.06 321.95$      
Mileage:    17.20 @ 0.560$         9.63$          

Total: 2,205.70$   Total This Invoice: $2,205.70
1302 Friarcreek

Labor Hours Rate Total
Aaron Croley 1.00 $124.86 124.86$      
Javier Vasquez 3.50 $156.23 546.81$      

Total: 671.67$      Total This Invoice: $671.67
Hilshire Villas S/D Replat Amendment

Labor Hours Rate Total
Efrain Him 0.50 $254.69 127.35$      

Total: 127.35$      Total This Invoice: $127.35
1228 Glourie

Labor Hours Rate Total
Javier Vasquez 1.50 $156.23 234.35$      

Total: 234.35$      Total This Invoice: $234.35

Professional Engineering Services provided to the City of Hilshire Village for on-going services.



Water Meters/Vaults Replacement
Labor Hours Rate Total

Efrain Him 3.00 $254.69 764.07$      
Total: 764.07$      Total This Invoice: $764.07

1306 Pine Chase
Labor Hours Rate Total

Javier Vasquez 0.75 $156.23 117.17$      
Total: 117.17$      Total This Invoice: $117.17

8201 Mallie
Labor Hours Rate Total

Aaron Croley 2.00 $124.86 249.72$      
Javier Vasquez 2.00 $156.23 312.46$      

Total: 562.18$      Total This Invoice: $562.18
Wirt Road Safety Project

Labor Hours Rate Total
Efrain Him 0.50 $264.88 132.44$      

Total: 132.44$      Total This Invoice: $132.44

TOTAL DUE THIS INVOICE: $7,337.51



Engineering Service Codes (ESC):
01 - Services Requested by Mayor
02 - Services Requested by Member of Council
03 - Third Party Requests Referred by City Secretary, City Attorney or Building Official

03.1 - Code/Building Ordinance Clarifications
03.2 - Public/Property Owner Requests for Information
03.3 - Other Governmental Agency Requests for Information

EFRAIN HIM 
DATE TASK HOURS
11-30-2021 Coord w/ City and MS-Team Mtg w/ City of Houston on Water Meter Vault Replacement at

Pine Chase Grove (2)  and Hickory Shadows (ESC 01 - Mayor RH) 3.00
12-07-2021 Coord w/ City & Review of Verizon/MCI Conduits for Ridgeley & Bromley One Cell Node Towers

(ESC 03-SB) 2.50
12-09-2021 Coord w/ Angel Balderas (Eagle Eye) on City Record Drawings & Previous Submittal Reviews for Verizon/MCI 

Conduits for Ridgeley & Bromley One Cell Node Towers (ESC 03 - SB) 2.00
12-13-2021 Coord w/ City on Hilshire Villas S/D Replat Amendment (ESC 03 - SB) 0.50
12-14-2021 Coord on Verizon/MCI Conduit Plans Review (ESC 03 - SB) 1.00
12-17-2021 Coord & Prep of Engineer's Report for Monthly City Council Mtg (ESC 01 - Mayor RH) 1.00
12-17-2021 Coord w/ Batterson on No Parking & Street Signs Replacement Project (ESC 03 - SB) 0.50
12-21-2021 Coord w/ City on American Rescue Act Plan of 2021 Funding & City's 2021 CIP List, and Revision to Drainage Plan 

Requirements Prior to Demolition Activities (ESC 03 - SB) 1.00
12-22-2021 Coord w/ COH on ILA Status for Wirt Road Safety Project (ESC 03 - SB) 0.50
12-22-2021 Coord on Verizon/MCI Conduit Plan Review (ESC 03 - SB) 0.50
12-23-2021 Coord on Verizon/MCI Conduit Plan Review (ESC 03 - SB) 1.00

Total: 13.50
AARON CROLEY

DATE TASK HOURS
11-23-2021 ESC 03 - S. Blevins - 1302 Friarcreek erosion control plan review 0.50
12-03-2021 ESC 03 - S. Blevins - 1302 Friarcreek erosion control plan review 0.50
12-09-2021 ESC 03 - S. Blevins - 8201 Mallie Ct erosion control plan review 1.00
12-17-2021 ESC 03 - S. Blevins - 8201 Mallie Ct erosion control plan review 1.00

3.00
PRESLEY LUNDQUIST

DATE TASK HOURS
12-21-2021 1226 Glourie; pre-demo inspection (ESC 03 - S. Blevins) 1.00

1.00
JAVIER VASQUEZ

DATE TASK HOURS
11-22-2021 ESC 03-S. Blevins-1306 Pine Chase Drive Parking Pad-Resident coordination meeting to review 

outstanding items 0.75
11-22-2021 ESC 03-S. Blevins-Creekstone Circle - Review front yard area for potential installation of landscape 0.75
11-23-2021 ESC 03-S. Blevins-1302 Friarcreek Lane Erosion Control plan review and coordination 1.00
11-24-2021 ESC 03-S. Blevins-8201 Mallie Ct Erosion Control plan review 0.50
11-24-2021 ESC 03-S. Blevins-8001 Bromley Drive drainage plan review 0.50
12-02-2021 ESC 03 S. Blevins-1228 Glourie Drive pre demo inspection and coordination 1.50
12-02-2021 ESC 03 S. Blevins-1302 Friarcreek erosion control plan and coordination 0.50
12-03-2021 ESC 03 S. Blevins - Street sign replacement coordination 0.25
12-03-2021 ESC 03 S. Blevins- Bromley Rd. paving point repair coordination 0.25
12-03-2021 ESC 03 S. Blevins- 8201 Mallie Ct. erosion control plan and coordination 0.50
12-09-2021 ESC 03-S. Blevins - Coordination for Truegrid field meeting 0.50
12-09-2021 ESC 03-S. Blevins-1302 Friarcreek Erosion control plan review and coordination with Contractor  2.00
12-09-2021 ESC 03-S. Blevins -8201 Mallie Court erosion control plan review and coordination 1.00
12-10-2021 ESC 01 - Mayor Herron - Field Meeting to Review Truegrid product and application locations 2.00
12-10-2021 ESC 03 - S. Blevins - Coordination for paving point repairs 0.50
12-13-2021 ESC 03 S. Blevins - 8001 Bromley Road Drainage Plan Review 1.00
12-16-2021 ESC 01 - Mayor Herron- December Agenda and Engineer's Report Development 2.00
12-20-2021 ESC 03 - S. Blevins- Updates to Drainage Requirements 0.25
12-20-2021 ESC 03 - S. Blevins-Coordination with Sign Vendor (Batterson, LP) for project documents 0.25



12-20-2021 ESC 03 - S. Blevins-8001 Bromley Road Drainage Plan Review 0.50
12-21-2021 ESC 01 - Mayor Herron - December City Council Meeting 1.00

Total: 17.50
CAROL QU

DATE TASK HOURS
11-22-2021 Coordinating with Batterson on documents for sign replacement NTP (ESC 03 - S. Blevins) 0.50
12-06-2021 Coordination with TrueGrid vendor (ESC 03 - S. Blevins) 0.25
12-10-2021 Site visit/walkthrough for roadway renovations with TrueGrid (ESC 03 - S. Blevins) 2.50
12-14-2021 Reviewing MCImetro/Verizon conduit plans along Ridgely Drive (ESC 03 - S. Blevins) 0.50
12-15-2021 Reviewing MCImetro/Verizon conduit plans along Ridgely Drive (ESC 03 - S. Blevins) 2.50

6.25



Inframark, LLC Client ID Number 1-00121

2002 West Grand Parkway North, Suite 100

Katy, Texas 77449 Invoice Number 1135524

(281) 578-4200 Invoice Date 1/13/2022

Due Date 2/12/2022

To: City of Hilshire Village

Utility Department

Hilshire Utilities

8301 Westview

Houston, Texas 77055

Service 
Description

Total

Maintenance Services $3,862.59

Subtotal $3,862.59

Sales Tax $0.00

Please Pay This Amount Total $3,862.59

Remit To: Inframark, LLC

P.O. Box 733778

Dallas, Texas 75373-3778

Please include the Project ID and the Invoice Number on the check stub of your payment.



INFRAMARK, LLC 13 Jan 2022 09:54:07AM CST

DISTRICT :  CITY OF HILSHIRE VILLAGE Go Green! Think before you print.

INVOICE NO.  1135524 - SUMMARY

INVOICE DATE: 1/13/2022

Work Type / Sub Category
Equipment 

Costs Labor Costs
Materials/Other 
Service Costs Sales Tax Total Total Costs

Maintenance, Lift Station

LS1

General Maintenance & Repairs $8.00 $43.66 $0.00 $0.00 $51.66

Preventative Maintenance $332.63 $607.38 $16.71 $0.00 $956.72

LS1 Total $340.63 $651.04 $16.71 $0.00 $1,008.38

LS Total $340.63 $651.04 $16.71 $0.00 $1,008.38

Maintenance, Water

General Maintenance & Repairs $424.00 $1,978.66 $108.35 $0.00 $2,511.01

Lab Fees or Laboratory Sampling $0.00 $0.00 $343.20 $0.00 $343.20

MW Total $424.00 $1,978.66 $451.55 $0.00 $2,854.21

Invoice Total $764.63 $2,629.70 $468.26 $0.00 $3,862.59

Page 1 of 1



INFRAMARK, LLC 13 Jan 2022 09:54:07AM CST

DISTRICT :  CITY OF HILSHIRE VILLAGE Go Green! Think before you print.

INVOICE NO.  1135524 - DETAIL

INVOICE DATE: 1/13/2022

Work Type / Sub 
Category

Date 
Complete

WO 
Number

Address Task Details Equipment 
Costs

Labor 
Costs

Materials/Other 
Service Costs

Sales Tax 
Total

Total Costs B/C

Maintenance, Lift 
Station

LS1

General 
Maintenance & 
Repairs

12/6/2021 2711747 COHV District 
Area 

Winterize a Lift Station; WINTERIZE 
FACILITY -LS1 in preparation for 
cold weather

$8.00 $43.66 $0.00 $0.00 $51.66 N

General Maintenance & Repairs 
Total

$8.00 $43.66 $0.00 $0.00 $51.66

Preventative 
Maintenance

12/9/2021 2696064 COHV District 
Area 

Three Month Communication & 
Alarm System PM (Electrical); Three 
Month Communication & Alarm 
System PM (Electrical) - Sched#: 
5860 SchedType: ELEC DateSched: 
11/01/21

$58.00 $162.96 $2.84 $0.00 $223.80 N

12/20/2021 2720769 COHV District 
Area 

Six Month Check Valve PM 
(Mechanical) must verify work type; 
Six Month Check Valve PM 
(Mechanical)  - Sched#: 6390 
SchedType: MECH DateSched: 
12/01/21

$274.63 $444.42 $13.86 $0.00 $732.91 N

Preventative Maintenance Total $332.63 $607.38 $16.71 $0.00 $956.72

LS1 Total $340.63 $651.04 $16.71 $0.00 $1,008.38

LS Total $340.63 $651.04 $16.71 $0.00 $1,008.38

Maintenance, Water

General 
Maintenance & 
Repairs

12/15/2021 2726079 COHV District 
Area 

Flushing of a Water System; Dec 
flush

$124.00 $442.33 $0.00 $0.00 $566.33 N

Page 1 of 3



INFRAMARK, LLC 13 Jan 2022 09:54:07AM CST

DISTRICT :  CITY OF HILSHIRE VILLAGE Go Green! Think before you print.

INVOICE NO.  1135524 - DETAIL

INVOICE DATE: 1/13/2022

Work Type / Sub 
Category

Date 
Complete

WO 
Number

Address Task Details Equipment 
Costs

Labor 
Costs

Materials/Other 
Service Costs

Sales Tax 
Total

Total Costs B/C

12/5/2021 2726870 COHV District 
Area 

Chlorine Residual in the Water 
System; WEEKEND RESIDUAL 
12/4-12/5

$32.00 $261.98 $0.00 $0.00 $293.98 N

12/3/2021 2727157 1011 Ridgeley 
Dr 

Customer Move Out - Read Meter, 
Disconnect or Turn Off Service; 

$0.00 $0.00 $20.00 $0.00 $20.00 N

12/3/2021 2727170 1011 Ridgeley 
Dr 

Customer Move In - Read Meter, 
Reconnect or Turn On Service; 

$0.00 $0.00 $20.00 $0.00 $20.00 N

12/12/2021 2732540 COHV District 
Area 

Chlorine Residual in the Water 
System; WEEKEND RESIDUAL 
12/11-12/12

$44.00 $206.47 $0.00 $0.00 $250.47 N

12/13/2021 2733570 1241 Ridgeley 
Dr 

Customer Move Out - Read Meter, 
Disconnect or Turn Off Service; 

$0.00 $0.00 $20.00 $0.00 $20.00 N

12/13/2021 2733638 1241 Ridgeley 
Dr 

Customer Move In - Read Meter, 
Reconnect or Turn On Service; 

$0.00 $0.00 $20.00 $0.00 $20.00 N

12/14/2021 2734814 3 Hickory 
Shadows Dr 

Read Meter, Check For Leaks, 
Customer Requested; RE READ 
METER- CK FOR LEAKS- TAG 
DOOR W RESULTS AND MTR 
READ

$12.00 $41.47 $0.25 $0.00 $53.72 N

12/17/2021 2736725 COHV District 
Area 

Investigate Poor Water Quality of a 
Water System; Flush for nitrification

$32.00 $110.58 $0.00 $0.00 $142.58 N

12/19/2021 2737598 COHV District 
Area 

Chlorine Residual in the Water 
System; weekend residual due 
12/18-12/19

$36.00 $168.93 $0.00 $0.00 $204.93 N

12/17/2021 2738345 1330 Glourie Dr Investigate Water System Leak; 
Called to investigate leak on yard, 
found source of the leak at the 
house line connection, turned off 
water per customer for repairs.

$32.00 $144.04 $3.24 $0.00 $179.28 N

12/17/2021 2738403 1330 Glourie Dr Turn Off Water Service for Water 
Consumption; Turn off water for 
future repair on house line 

$4.00 $18.01 $3.24 $0.00 $25.25 N

12/22/2021 2741466 1123 Guinea Dr Locate a Water System Asset; 
Locate meter and mark for the 
builder

$16.00 $55.29 $1.62 $0.00 $72.91 N

12/26/2021 2741932 COHV District 
Area 

Chlorine Residual in the Water 
System; weekend residual due 
12/25 -12/26

$44.00 $304.32 $0.00 $0.00 $348.32 N

Page 2 of 3



INFRAMARK, LLC 13 Jan 2022 09:54:07AM CST

DISTRICT :  CITY OF HILSHIRE VILLAGE Go Green! Think before you print.

INVOICE NO.  1135524 - DETAIL

INVOICE DATE: 1/13/2022

Work Type / Sub 
Category

Date 
Complete

WO 
Number

Address Task Details Equipment 
Costs

Labor 
Costs

Materials/Other 
Service Costs

Sales Tax 
Total

Total Costs B/C

1/2/2022 2745793 COHV District 
Area 

Chlorine Residual in the Water 
System; WEEKEND RESIDUAL 1/1-
1/2

$48.00 $225.24 $0.00 $0.00 $273.24 N

1/10/2022 2754863 14 Pine Creek 
Ln 

Customer Move In - Read Meter, 
Reconnect or Turn On Service; 

$0.00 $0.00 $20.00 $0.00 $20.00 N

General Maintenance & Repairs 
Total

$424.00 $1,978.66 $108.35 $0.00 $2,511.01

Lab Fees or 
Laboratory 
Sampling

12/23/2021 2733181 COHV District 
Area 

Purchase Laboratory Services for 
Water System Asset; Water Utility 
Services, IncDecember

$0.00 $0.00 $343.20 $0.00 $343.20 N

Lab Fees or Laboratory Sampling 
Total

$0.00 $0.00 $343.20 $0.00 $343.20

MW Total $424.00 $1,978.66 $451.55 $0.00 $2,854.21

Invoice Total $764.63 $2,629.70 $468.26 $0.00 $3,862.59

Page 3 of 3



INFRAMARK Work Order
District: COHV WO#: 2696064 Dept: 5725 WO Type: LS Resp: MTX Issued: 10/29/2021
Asset ID/Description: COHV-LS1/City of Hillshire Village Lift Station # 1

I10- West @ Wirt Rd at Ridgely Dr

Activity Code/Description: PM3MADLR/Three Month Communication & Alarm System PM (Electrical)

Address/Location: COHV District Area Sched: 11/1/2021

Additional Address/Location or Task Details: Three Month Communication & Alarm System PM (Electrical) - Sched#: 5860 
SchedType: ELEC DateSched: 11/01/21

Req By: Assigned To: Accounts Receivable GL Code: 40800

Utility Staking #: UCC Start: UCC End:

OLD Meter ID: Read: MIU: Special Class: Planned 
Maintenance

NEW Meter ID: Read: MIU: Gallons Flushed:

Date Complete: 12/9/2021 Attachments: 1 Backcharge To:  L-B-S:    

Material / Inventory ID Vendor / Description PO# / P-Card Qty Price

MS0011 Paper Towel 0.25 $1.37

SA0043 Glove - Disposable - Nitrile - L 4.00 $1.47

Labor / Equipment ID Job Class Date Units OT? Price

700711 - Zachary Bridges  12/9/2021 2.00 N $162.96

TX121558 - Electrical Truck ELECTRK 12/9/2021 2.00 N $58.00

Milestone: Closed Invoice#: 1135524 Date Invoiced: 1/13/2022 Total Price: $223.80

Mgr Rev Req: No Bid Price: $0.00 Manager Name: Billing Notification: No

Field Comments: (12-9-21)Test all alarms on dialer for operation. Verify with manager that all callouts have proper numbers and 
names. Completed three month dialer pm. All is running ok at this time

No Problem Found     Customer Responsibility     New WO     New Asset     Void WO/Reason:

Page 1 of 1



INFRAMARK Work Order
District: COHV WO#: 2711747 Dept: 5755 WO Type: LS Resp: OPS Issued: 11/16/2021
Asset ID/Description: COHV-LS1/City of Hillshire Village Lift Station # 1

I10- West @ Wirt Rd at Ridgely Dr

Activity Code/Description: LSWTR/Winterize a Lift Station

Address/Location: COHV District Area Sched:

Additional Address/Location or Task Details: WINTERIZE FACILITY -LS1 in preparation for cold weather

Req By: TRACY BUTCHER Assigned To: Accounts Receivable GL Code: 40500

Utility Staking #: UCC Start: UCC End:

OLD Meter ID: Read: MIU: Special Class:  

NEW Meter ID: Read: MIU: Gallons Flushed:

Date Complete: 12/6/2021 Attachments: 1 Backcharge To:  L-B-S:    

Material / Inventory ID Vendor / Description PO# / P-Card Qty Price

Labor / Equipment ID Job Class Date Units OT? Price

008315 - James West 12/6/2021 0.50 N $43.66

TX119056 - Utility Truck UTLTRK 12/6/2021 0.50 N $8.00

Milestone: Closed Invoice#: 1135524 Date Invoiced: 1/13/2022 Total Price: $51.66

Mgr Rev Req: No Bid Price: $0.00 Manager Name: Billing Notification: No

Field Comments: Everything is below ground all ok

No Problem Found     Customer Responsibility     New WO     New Asset     Void WO/Reason:

Page 1 of 1



INFRAMARK Work Order
District: COHV WO#: 2720769 Dept: 5740 WO Type: LS Resp: MTX Issued: 11/29/2021
Asset ID/Description: COHV-LS1/City of Hillshire Village Lift Station # 1

I10- West @ Wirt Rd at Ridgely Dr

Activity Code/Description: PM6MMCKLV/Six Month Check Valve PM (Mechanical) must verify work type

Address/Location: COHV District Area Sched: 12/1/2021

Additional Address/Location or Task Details: Six Month Check Valve PM (Mechanical)  - Sched#: 6390 SchedType: MECH 
DateSched: 12/01/21

Req By: Assigned To: Accounts Receivable GL Code: 40800

Utility Staking #: UCC Start: UCC End:

OLD Meter ID: Read: MIU: Special Class: Planned 
Maintenance

NEW Meter ID: Read: MIU: Gallons Flushed:

Date Complete: 12/20/2021 Attachments: 3 Backcharge To:  L-B-S:    

Material / Inventory ID Vendor / Description PO# / P-Card Qty Price

HW0097 Knocker Loose 0.25 $2.57

MS0011 Paper Towel 0.25 $1.37

MS0037 Cleaner - Bathroom - Foaming 0.25 $2.29

GL0003 Degreaser - Big Orange - 
Liquid

0.25 $3.96

SA0043 Glove - Disposable - Nitrile - L 10.00 $3.68

Labor / Equipment ID Job Class Date Units OT? Price

605328 - Isaac Santos  12/20/2021 4.00 N $244.44

700322 - Jamiyah Mitchell  12/20/2021 4.00 N $199.98

TX120167 - Crane Truck CRNTRK 12/20/2021 4.00 N $208.00

CONFINGE - Confined 
Space Kit - General (Daily)

CONFINGE 12/20/2021 1.00 N $66.63

Milestone: Closed Invoice#: 1135524 Date Invoiced: 1/13/2022 Total Price: $732.91

Mgr Rev Req: No Bid Price: $0.00 Manager Name: Billing Notification: No

Field Comments: BG 4" (2) Valve system off, disassemble check valve, clean thoroughly, reassemble check valve. Test and 
return to service.

No Problem Found     Customer Responsibility     New WO     New Asset     Void WO/Reason:

Page 1 of 1



INFRAMARK Work Order
District: COHV WO#: 2726079 Dept: 5755 WO Type: MW Resp: OPS Issued: 12/2/2021
Asset ID/Description:  / 

Activity Code/Description: MWFLUSH/Flushing of a Water System

Address/Location: COHV District Area Sched:

Additional Address/Location or Task Details: Dec flush

Req By: jcw Assigned To: Accounts Receivable GL Code: 40500

Utility Staking #: UCC Start: UCC End:

OLD Meter ID: Read: MIU: Special Class:  

NEW Meter ID: Read: MIU: Gallons Flushed: 80,000.00

Date Complete: 12/15/2021 Attachments: 0 Backcharge To:  L-B-S:    

Material / Inventory ID Vendor / Description PO# / P-Card Qty Price

Labor / Equipment ID Job Class Date Units OT? Price

605678 - Mickayla Trombley  12/8/2021 5.75 N $317.92

605678 - Mickayla Trombley  12/15/2021 0.50 Y $41.47

605678 - Mickayla Trombley  12/15/2021 1.50 N $82.94

TX120169 - Utility Truck UTLTRK 12/8/2021 5.75 N $92.00

TX120169 - Utility Truck UTLTRK 12/15/2021 0.50 N $8.00

TX120169 - Utility Truck UTLTRK 12/15/2021 1.50 N $24.00

Milestone: Closed Invoice#: 1135524 Date Invoiced: 1/13/2022 Total Price: $566.33

Mgr Rev Req: No Bid Price: $0.00 Manager Name: Billing Notification: No

Field Comments: Monthly dead end flushing

No Problem Found     Customer Responsibility     New WO     New Asset     Void WO/Reason:

Page 1 of 1



INFRAMARK Work Order
District: COHV WO#: 2726870 Dept: 5755 WO Type: MW Resp: OPS Issued: 12/2/2021
Asset ID/Description:  / 

Activity Code/Description: DCL2RES/Chlorine Residual in the Water System

Address/Location: COHV District Area Sched:

Additional Address/Location or Task Details: WEEKEND RESIDUAL 12/4-12/5

Req By: tracy b Assigned To: Accounts Receivable GL Code: 40500

Utility Staking #: UCC Start: UCC End:

OLD Meter ID: Read: MIU: Special Class:  

NEW Meter ID: Read: MIU: Gallons Flushed:

Date Complete: 12/5/2021 Attachments: 0 Backcharge To:  L-B-S:    

Material / Inventory ID Vendor / Description PO# / P-Card Qty Price

Labor / Equipment ID Job Class Date Units OT? Price

008315 - James West  12/4/2021 1.00 Y $130.99

008315 - James West  12/5/2021 1.00 Y $130.99

TX119056 - Utility Truck UTLTRK 12/4/2021 1.00 N $16.00

TX119056 - Utility Truck UTLTRK 12/5/2021 1.00 N $16.00

Milestone: Closed Invoice#: 1135524 Date Invoiced: 1/13/2022 Total Price: $293.98

Mgr Rev Req: No Bid Price: $0.00 Manager Name: Billing Notification: No

Field Comments: 12/4/21 Dr 3.14 POE 3.92 12/5/21 Dr 2.90 POE 4.30

No Problem Found     Customer Responsibility     New WO     New Asset     Void WO/Reason:

Page 1 of 1



INFRAMARK Work Order
District: COHV WO#: 2727157 Dept: 5755 WO Type: MW Resp: OPS Issued: 12/2/2021
Asset ID/Description:  / 

Activity Code/Description: CSTOFMVOUT/Customer Move Out - Read Meter, Disconnect or Turn Off Service

Address/Location: 1011 Ridgeley Dr Sched:

Additional Address/Location or Task Details:

Req By: Billing Assigned To: Accounts Receivable GL Code: 40500

Utility Staking #: UCC Start: UCC End:

OLD Meter ID: 90379832 Read: 757.10 MIU: Special Class:  

NEW Meter ID: Read: MIU: Gallons Flushed:

Date Complete: 12/3/2021 Attachments: 1 Backcharge To:  L-B-S:    

Material / Inventory ID Vendor / Description PO# / P-Card Qty Price

MS72 MISC. Photos 1.00 $0.00

CSTOFMVOUT 1.00 $20.00

Labor / Equipment ID Job Class Date Units OT? Price

605678 - Mickayla Trombley  12/3/2021 0.75 N $0.00

TX120169 - Utility Truck UTLTRK 12/3/2021 0.75 N $0.00

Milestone: Closed Invoice#: 1135524 Date Invoiced: 1/13/2022 Total Price: $20.00

Mgr Rev Req: No Bid Price: $0.00 Manager Name: Billing Notification: Yes

Field Comments: Read meter, turned meter off. Drive time.

No Problem Found     Customer Responsibility     New WO     New Asset     Void WO/Reason:
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INFRAMARK Work Order
District: COHV WO#: 2727170 Dept: 5755 WO Type: MW Resp: OPS Issued: 12/2/2021
Asset ID/Description:  / 

Activity Code/Description: CSTONMVIN/Customer Move In - Read Meter, Reconnect or Turn On Service

Address/Location: 1011 Ridgeley Dr Sched:

Additional Address/Location or Task Details:

Req By: Billing Assigned To: Accounts Receivable GL Code: 40500

Utility Staking #: UCC Start: UCC End:

OLD Meter ID: 90379832 Read: 757.10 MIU: Special Class:  

NEW Meter ID: Read: MIU: Gallons Flushed:

Date Complete: 12/3/2021 Attachments: 1 Backcharge To:  L-B-S:    

Material / Inventory ID Vendor / Description PO# / P-Card Qty Price

MS72 MISC. Photos 1.00 $0.00

CSTONMVIN 1.00 $20.00

Labor / Equipment ID Job Class Date Units OT? Price

605678 - Mickayla Trombley  12/3/2021 0.25 N $0.00

TX120169 - Utility Truck UTLTRK 12/3/2021 0.25 N $0.00

Milestone: Closed Invoice#: 1135524 Date Invoiced: 1/13/2022 Total Price: $20.00

Mgr Rev Req: No Bid Price: $0.00 Manager Name: Billing Notification: Yes

Field Comments: Read meter, turned meter on. Meter stopped.

No Problem Found     Customer Responsibility     New WO     New Asset     Void WO/Reason:
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INFRAMARK Work Order
District: COHV WO#: 2732540 Dept: 5755 WO Type: MW Resp: OPS Issued: 12/9/2021
Asset ID/Description:  / 

Activity Code/Description: DCL2RES/Chlorine Residual in the Water System

Address/Location: COHV District Area Sched:

Additional Address/Location or Task Details: WEEKEND RESIDUAL 12/11-12/12

Req By: tracy b Assigned To: Accounts Receivable GL Code: 40500

Utility Staking #: UCC Start: UCC End:

OLD Meter ID: Read: MIU: Special Class:  

NEW Meter ID: Read: MIU: Gallons Flushed:

Date Complete: 12/12/2021 Attachments: 0 Backcharge To:  L-B-S:    

Material / Inventory ID Vendor / Description PO# / P-Card Qty Price

Labor / Equipment ID Job Class Date Units OT? Price

700366 - Charles Lowe  12/11/2021 1.25 Y $93.85

700366 - Charles Lowe  12/12/2021 1.50 Y $112.62

TX116022 - Utility Truck UTLTRK 12/11/2021 1.25 N $20.00

TX116022 - Utility Truck UTLTRK 12/12/2021 1.50 N $24.00

Milestone: Closed Invoice#: 1135524 Date Invoiced: 1/13/2022 Total Price: $250.47

Mgr Rev Req: No Bid Price: $0.00 Manager Name: Billing Notification: No

Field Comments: 12/11 DR-2.97, IC-3.65... 12/12 DR-2.94, IC-3.70...

No Problem Found     Customer Responsibility     New WO     New Asset     Void WO/Reason:
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INFRAMARK Work Order
District: COHV WO#: 2733181 Dept: 5755 WO Type: MW Resp: OPS Issued: 12/10/2021
Asset ID/Description:  / 

Activity Code/Description: MWLAB/Purchase Laboratory Services for Water System Asset

Address/Location: COHV District Area Sched:

Additional Address/Location or Task Details: Water Utility Services, IncDecember

Req By: Assigned To: Accounts Receivable GL Code: 40400

Utility Staking #: UCC Start: UCC End:

OLD Meter ID: Read: MIU: Special Class:  

NEW Meter ID: Read: MIU: Gallons Flushed:

Date Complete: 12/23/2021 Attachments: 1 Backcharge To:  L-B-S:    

Material / Inventory ID Vendor / Description PO# / P-Card Qty Price

PO Water Utility Services, 
Inc&nbsp; 68365

130096 1.00 $343.20

Labor / Equipment ID Job Class Date Time In Time Out OT?

Milestone: Closed Invoice#: 1135524 Date Invoiced: 1/13/2022 Total Price: $343.20

Mgr Rev Req: No Bid Price: $0.00 Manager Name: Billing Notification: No

Field Comments:

No Problem Found     Customer Responsibility     New WO     New Asset     Void WO/Reason:
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INFRAMARK Work Order
District: COHV WO#: 2733570 Dept: 5755 WO Type: MW Resp: OPS Issued: 12/12/2021
Asset ID/Description:  / 

Activity Code/Description: CSTOFMVOUT/Customer Move Out - Read Meter, Disconnect or Turn Off Service

Address/Location: 1241 Ridgeley Dr Sched:

Additional Address/Location or Task Details:

Req By: Billing Assigned To: Accounts Receivable GL Code: 40500

Utility Staking #: UCC Start: UCC End:

OLD Meter ID: 43413324 Read: 6005.08 MIU: Special Class:  

NEW Meter ID: Read: MIU: Gallons Flushed:

Date Complete: 12/13/2021 Attachments: 1 Backcharge To:  L-B-S:    

Material / Inventory ID Vendor / Description PO# / P-Card Qty Price

MS72 MISC. Photos 1.00 $0.00

CSTOFMVOUT 1.00 $20.00

Labor / Equipment ID Job Class Date Units OT? Price

605678 - Mickayla Trombley  12/13/2021 0.75 N $0.00

TX120169 - Utility Truck UTLTRK 12/13/2021 0.75 N $0.00

Milestone: Closed Invoice#: 1135524 Date Invoiced: 1/13/2022 Total Price: $20.00

Mgr Rev Req: No Bid Price: $0.00 Manager Name: Billing Notification: Yes

Field Comments: Read meter, turned meter off. Drive time.

No Problem Found     Customer Responsibility     New WO     New Asset     Void WO/Reason:
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INFRAMARK Work Order
District: COHV WO#: 2733638 Dept: 5755 WO Type: MW Resp: OPS Issued: 12/12/2021
Asset ID/Description:  / 

Activity Code/Description: CSTONMVIN/Customer Move In - Read Meter, Reconnect or Turn On Service

Address/Location: 1241 Ridgeley Dr Sched:

Additional Address/Location or Task Details:

Req By: Billing Assigned To: Accounts Receivable GL Code: 40500

Utility Staking #: UCC Start: UCC End:

OLD Meter ID: 43413324 Read: 6005.08 MIU: Special Class:  

NEW Meter ID: Read: MIU: Gallons Flushed:

Date Complete: 12/13/2021 Attachments: 1 Backcharge To:  L-B-S:    

Material / Inventory ID Vendor / Description PO# / P-Card Qty Price

MS72 MISC. Photos 1.00 $0.00

CSTONMVIN 1.00 $20.00

Labor / Equipment ID Job Class Date Units OT? Price

605678 - Mickayla Trombley  12/13/2021 0.25 N $0.00

TX120169 - Utility Truck UTLTRK 12/13/2021 0.25 N $0.00

Milestone: Closed Invoice#: 1135524 Date Invoiced: 1/13/2022 Total Price: $20.00

Mgr Rev Req: No Bid Price: $0.00 Manager Name: Billing Notification: Yes

Field Comments: Read meter, turned meter on, meter stopped.

No Problem Found     Customer Responsibility     New WO     New Asset     Void WO/Reason:
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INFRAMARK Work Order
District: COHV WO#: 2734814 Dept: 5755 WO Type: MW Resp: OPS Issued: 12/13/2021
Asset ID/Description:  / 

Activity Code/Description: CSREREAD/Read Meter, Check For Leaks, Customer Requested

Address/Location: 3 Hickory Shadows Dr Sched:

Additional Address/Location or Task Details: RE READ METER- CK FOR LEAKS- TAG DOOR W RESULTS AND MTR READ

Req By: Billing Assigned To: Accounts Receivable GL Code: 40500

Utility Staking #: UCC Start: UCC End:

OLD Meter ID: 29569133 Read: 5739.11 MIU: Special Class:  

NEW Meter ID: Read: MIU: Gallons Flushed:

Date Complete: 12/14/2021 Attachments: 0 Backcharge To:  L-B-S:    

Material / Inventory ID Vendor / Description PO# / P-Card Qty Price

MS31 MISC. Customer Service Tag 1.00 $0.25

Labor / Equipment ID Job Class Date Units OT? Price

605678 - Mickayla Trombley  12/14/2021 0.75 N $41.47

TX120169 - Utility Truck UTLTRK 12/14/2021 0.75 N $12.00

Milestone: Closed Invoice#: 1135524 Date Invoiced: 1/13/2022 Total Price: $53.72

Mgr Rev Req: No Bid Price: $0.00 Manager Name: Billing Notification: Yes

Field Comments: Reread meter, no leaks found. Left door tag

No Problem Found     Customer Responsibility     New WO     New Asset     Void WO/Reason:
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INFRAMARK Work Order
District: COHV WO#: 2736725 Dept: 5755 WO Type: MW Resp: OPS Issued: 12/16/2021
Asset ID/Description:  / 

Activity Code/Description: MWINVPWQ/Investigate Poor Water Quality of a Water System

Address/Location: COHV District Area Sched:

Additional Address/Location or Task Details: Flush for nitrification

Req By: Clint A. Assigned To: Accounts Receivable GL Code: 40500

Utility Staking #: UCC Start: UCC End:

OLD Meter ID: Read: MIU: Special Class:  

NEW Meter ID: Read: MIU: Gallons Flushed: 60,000.00

Date Complete: 12/17/2021 Attachments: 0 Backcharge To:  L-B-S:    

Material / Inventory ID Vendor / Description PO# / P-Card Qty Price

Labor / Equipment ID Job Class Date Units OT? Price

605678 - Mickayla Trombley  12/16/2021 2.00 N $110.58

TX120169 - Utility Truck UTLTRK 12/16/2021 2.00 N $32.00

Milestone: Closed Invoice#: 1135524 Date Invoiced: 1/13/2022 Total Price: $142.58

Mgr Rev Req: No Bid Price: $0.00 Manager Name: Billing Notification: No

Field Comments: Flushed for nitrification 

No Problem Found     Customer Responsibility     New WO     New Asset     Void WO/Reason:
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INFRAMARK Work Order
District: COHV WO#: 2737598 Dept: 5755 WO Type: MW Resp: OPS Issued: 12/16/2021
Asset ID/Description:  / 

Activity Code/Description: DCL2RES/Chlorine Residual in the Water System

Address/Location: COHV District Area Sched:

Additional Address/Location or Task Details: weekend residual due 12/18-12/19

Req By: tracy b Assigned To: Accounts Receivable GL Code: 40500

Utility Staking #: UCC Start: UCC End:

OLD Meter ID: Read: MIU: Special Class:  

NEW Meter ID: Read: MIU: Gallons Flushed:

Date Complete: 12/19/2021 Attachments: 0 Backcharge To:  L-B-S:    

Material / Inventory ID Vendor / Description PO# / P-Card Qty Price

Labor / Equipment ID Job Class Date Units OT? Price

700366 - Charles Lowe  12/18/2021 1.00 Y $75.08

700366 - Charles Lowe  12/19/2021 1.25 Y $93.85

TX116022 - Utility Truck UTLTRK 12/18/2021 1.00 N $16.00

TX116022 - Utility Truck UTLTRK 12/19/2021 1.25 N $20.00

Milestone: Closed Invoice#: 1135524 Date Invoiced: 1/13/2022 Total Price: $204.93

Mgr Rev Req: No Bid Price: $0.00 Manager Name: Billing Notification: No

Field Comments: 12/18 DR-2.51, IC-3.62... 12/19 DR-1.93, IC-0.67...

No Problem Found     Customer Responsibility     New WO     New Asset     Void WO/Reason:
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INFRAMARK Work Order
District: COHV WO#: 2738345 Dept: 5755 WO Type: MW Resp: OPS Issued: 12/17/2021
Asset ID/Description:  / 

Activity Code/Description: MWINVL/Investigate Water System Leak

Address/Location: 1330 Glourie Dr Sched:

Additional Address/Location or Task Details: Called to investigate leak on yard, found source of the leak at the house line 
connection, turned off water per customer for repairs.

Req By: sandy- 713 4635305 Assigned To: Accounts Receivable GL Code: 40500

Utility Staking #: UCC Start: UCC End:

OLD Meter ID: 20916775 Read: 107.90 MIU: Special Class:  

NEW Meter ID: Read: MIU: Gallons Flushed:

Date Complete: 12/17/2021 Attachments: 2 Backcharge To:  L-B-S:

Material / Inventory ID Vendor / Description PO# / P-Card Qty Price

MS72 MISC. Photos 2.00 $3.24

Labor / Equipment ID Job Class Date Units OT? Price

701171 - Daniel Wall  12/17/2021 2.00 Y $144.04

TX110117 - Utility Truck UTLTRK 12/17/2021 2.00 N $32.00

Milestone: Closed Invoice#: 1135524 Date Invoiced: 1/13/2022 Total Price: $179.28

Mgr Rev Req: No Bid Price: $0.00 Manager Name: Billing Notification: No

Field Comments: Drive time. Spoke with customer over the phone & verified location of leak before heading over. Noticed full 
meter box & soaked yard upon arrival, removed water with a bucket & pump to reveal the source of the leak at 
the house line connection to the meter. Explained the situation to the customer before turning off the water so 
they won't be charged overnight before a professional comes to repair the leak. Separate MWTOFFC WO 
created to turn the water off

No Problem Found     Customer Responsibility     New WO     New Asset     Void WO/Reason:
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INFRAMARK Work Order
District: COHV WO#: 2738403 Dept: 5755 WO Type: MW Resp: OPS Issued: 12/17/2021
Asset ID/Description:  / 

Activity Code/Description: MWTOFFC/Turn Off Water Service for Water Consumption

Address/Location: 1330 Glourie Dr Sched:

Additional Address/Location or Task Details: Turn off water for future repair on house line 

Req By: Daniel Wall Assigned To: Accounts Receivable GL Code: 40500

Utility Staking #: UCC Start: UCC End:

OLD Meter ID: 20916775 Read: 107.90 MIU: Special Class:  

NEW Meter ID: Read: MIU: Gallons Flushed:

Date Complete: 12/17/2021 Attachments: 2 Backcharge To:  L-B-S:

Material / Inventory ID Vendor / Description PO# / P-Card Qty Price

MS72 MISC. Photos 2.00 $3.24

Labor / Equipment ID Job Class Date Units OT? Price

701171 - Daniel Wall  12/17/2021 0.25 Y $18.01

TX110117 - Utility Truck UTLTRK 12/17/2021 0.25 N $4.00

Milestone: Closed Invoice#: 1135524 Date Invoiced: 1/13/2022 Total Price: $25.25

Mgr Rev Req: No Bid Price: $0.00 Manager Name: Billing Notification: Yes

Field Comments: Turned off water for future repairs to be made to the customer house line 

No Problem Found     Customer Responsibility     New WO     New Asset     Void WO/Reason:
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INFRAMARK Work Order
District: COHV WO#: 2741466 Dept: 5755 WO Type: MW Resp: OPS Issued: 12/22/2021
Asset ID/Description:  / 

Activity Code/Description: MWLOC/Locate a Water System Asset

Address/Location: 1123 Guinea Dr Sched:

Additional Address/Location or Task Details: Locate meter and mark for the builder

Req By: Mickayla Trombley Assigned To: Accounts Receivable GL Code: 40500

Utility Staking #: UCC Start: UCC End:

OLD Meter ID: Read: MIU: Special Class:  

NEW Meter ID: Read: MIU: Gallons Flushed:

Date Complete: 12/22/2021 Attachments: 1 Backcharge To:  L-B-S:    

Material / Inventory ID Vendor / Description PO# / P-Card Qty Price

MS72 MISC. Photos 1.00 $1.62

Labor / Equipment ID Job Class Date Units OT? Price

605678 - Mickayla Trombley  12/22/2021 1.00 N $55.29

TX120169 - Utility Truck UTLTRK 12/22/2021 1.00 N $16.00

Milestone: Closed Invoice#: 1135524 Date Invoiced: 1/13/2022 Total Price: $72.91

Mgr Rev Req: No Bid Price: $0.00 Manager Name: Billing Notification: No

Field Comments: Found meter, Cassie said builders possibly connected house line to neighbors irrigation by accident. Could not 
verify, new house is being built and they have fence up and it's locked. Cassie is going to have the builder 
check.

No Problem Found     Customer Responsibility     New WO     New Asset     Void WO/Reason:
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INFRAMARK Work Order
District: COHV WO#: 2741932 Dept: 5755 WO Type: MW Resp: OPS Issued: 12/22/2021
Asset ID/Description:  / 

Activity Code/Description: DCL2RES/Chlorine Residual in the Water System

Address/Location: COHV District Area Sched:

Additional Address/Location or Task Details: weekend residual due 12/25 -12/26

Req By: tracy b Assigned To: Accounts Receivable GL Code: 40500

Utility Staking #: UCC Start: UCC End:

OLD Meter ID: Read: MIU: Special Class:  

NEW Meter ID: Read: MIU: Gallons Flushed:

Date Complete: 12/26/2021 Attachments: 0 Backcharge To:  L-B-S:    

Material / Inventory ID Vendor / Description PO# / P-Card Qty Price

Labor / Equipment ID Job Class Date Units OT? Price

700366 - Charles Lowe  12/24/2021 1.00 Y $75.08

008315 - James West  12/25/2021 1.00 Y $130.99

008315 - James West  12/26/2021 0.75 Y $98.25

TX116022 - Utility Truck UTLTRK 12/24/2021 1.00 N $16.00

TX119056 - Utility Truck UTLTRK 12/25/2021 1.00 N $16.00

TX119056 - Utility Truck UTLTRK 12/26/2021 0.75 N $12.00

Milestone: Closed Invoice#: 1135524 Date Invoiced: 1/13/2022 Total Price: $348.32

Mgr Rev Req: No Bid Price: $0.00 Manager Name: Billing Notification: No

Field Comments: 12/24 Data entered in birdnest... 12/25/21 POE 3.66 Dr 0.98 12/26/21 3.77 Dr 3.55

No Problem Found     Customer Responsibility     New WO     New Asset     Void WO/Reason:
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INFRAMARK Work Order
District: COHV WO#: 2745793 Dept: 5755 WO Type: MW Resp: OPS Issued: 12/29/2021
Asset ID/Description:  / 

Activity Code/Description: DCL2RES/Chlorine Residual in the Water System

Address/Location: COHV District Area Sched:

Additional Address/Location or Task Details: WEEKEND RESIDUAL 1/1-1/2

Req By: tracey b Assigned To: Accounts Receivable GL Code: 40500

Utility Staking #: UCC Start: UCC End:

OLD Meter ID: Read: MIU: Special Class:  

NEW Meter ID: Read: MIU: Gallons Flushed:

Date Complete: 1/2/2022 Attachments: 0 Backcharge To:  L-B-S:    

Material / Inventory ID Vendor / Description PO# / P-Card Qty Price

Labor / Equipment ID Job Class Date Units OT? Price

700366 - Charles Lowe  12/31/2021 1.00 Y $75.08

700366 - Charles Lowe  1/1/2022 1.00 Y $75.08

700366 - Charles Lowe  1/2/2022 1.00 Y $75.08

TX116022 - Utility Truck UTLTRK 12/31/2021 1.00 N $16.00

TX116022 - Utility Truck UTLTRK 1/1/2022 1.00 N $16.00

TX116022 - Utility Truck UTLTRK 1/2/2022 1.00 N $16.00

Milestone: Closed Invoice#: 1135524 Date Invoiced: 1/13/2022 Total Price: $273.24

Mgr Rev Req: No Bid Price: $0.00 Manager Name: Billing Notification: No

Field Comments: 12/31- 01/01 Data entered in birdnest... 01/02 DR-3.10, IC-3.98...

No Problem Found     Customer Responsibility     New WO     New Asset     Void WO/Reason:
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INFRAMARK Work Order
District: COHV WO#: 2754863 Dept: 5755 WO Type: MW Resp: OPS Issued: 1/9/2022
Asset ID/Description:  / 

Activity Code/Description: CSTONMVIN/Customer Move In - Read Meter, Reconnect or Turn On Service

Address/Location: 14 Pine Creek Ln Sched:

Additional Address/Location or Task Details:

Req By: Billing Assigned To: Accounts Receivable GL Code: 40500

Utility Staking #: UCC Start: UCC End:

OLD Meter ID: 30174464 Read: MIU: Special Class:  

NEW Meter ID: Read: MIU: Gallons Flushed:

Date Complete: 1/10/2022 Attachments: 0 Backcharge To:  L-B-S:    

Material / Inventory ID Vendor / Description PO# / P-Card Qty Price

CSTONMVIN 1.00 $20.00

Labor / Equipment ID Job Class Date Units OT? Price

605678 - Mickayla Trombley  1/10/2022 0.75 N $0.00

TX120169 - Utility Truck UTLTRK 1/10/2022 0.75 N $0.00

Milestone: Closed Invoice#: 1135524 Date Invoiced: 1/13/2022 Total Price: $20.00

Mgr Rev Req: No Bid Price: $0.00 Manager Name: Billing Notification: Yes

Field Comments: Drive time. People there asked me not to turn on water yet.

No Problem Found     Customer Responsibility     New WO     New Asset     Void WO/Reason:
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Texas Excavation Safety System, Inc.
PO Box 678058
Dallas TX 75267 Invoice

#21-27048
12/31/2021

21-27048

1 of 1

  AMOUNT DUE
Bill To

City of Hilshire Village
Attn: Susan Blevins
8301 Westview
Houston TX 77055
United States

$19.95
Due Date: 1/30/2022

Terms Due Date PO # Additional Info Status
Net 30 1/30/2022 Open

Quantity Description Rate Amount

22 Message Fees for December 2021 / HLV $0.95 $20.90

1 Credit for cancelled notifications / HLV $-0.95 $-0.95

  Total $19.95

  Amount Paid $0.00

  Amount Due $19.95



1  of 1 Date Printed: 1/3/22

USIC Locating Services, LLC
P.O. Box 715409
Cincinnati, OH 45271-5409
1-317-575-7849 - Office
USICBilling@usicllc.com - Email

Invoice No:        483986
 
 

  
  
  

City of Hilshire Village TX
8301 Westview
Houston, TX 77055
 

Attn:  Susan Blevins
 
 

Additional Info:  HLV | TX

Date of Invoice:
Due Date:
Period:

12/31/21
1/30/22

12/1/21 - 12/31/21

Grouping Description Quantity Rate Total

HLV Per Ticket 4 $ 95.48 $ 381.92

HLV Project Time 5 $ 23.87 $ 119.35

HLV Quarter Hour 2 $ 0.00 $ 0.00

Grand Total $ 501.27
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