
pitn*ybowes :{p

NASPO ValuePoint FMV Lease Agreement (Option C)
I I

Agreement Number

Your Business lnformation

Full Legal Name of Lessee / DBA Name of Lessee

HAI\,,IBURG TOWNSHIP

Tax lD # (FEIN/TIN)

381 855320

Sold-To: Address

10405 MERRILL RD, WHITMORE LAKE, MI,48189-9745, US

Sold-To: Contact Name

Marcy l\,liller

Sold-To: Contact Phone #

8102221137

Sold-To: Account #

001260s31 1

Bill-To: Address

PO Box 157, Hamburg, M1,48139-0157, US

Bill-To: Contact Name

Marcy Miller

Bill-To: Contact Phone #

8102221137

Bill-To: Account #

oo17295246

Bill-To: Email

aphamburgtwp@hamburg.mi.us

Ship-To: ,Address

10405 MERRILL RD, WHITMORE LAKE, MI,48189.9745, US

Ship-To: Contact Name

l\,4arcy Miller

Ship-To: Contact Phone #

8102221137

Ship-To: Account #

001260531 1

PO#

Your Business Needs

Item Business Solution Description

SendPro C Auto

lnterface to Inview Dashboard

C Series lMl N,leter

Connect+ Accounting Weight Break Reports

Cost Acctg Accounls Level (100)

Account List lmporuExport

Sendpro C Auto 95

Basic Cost Accounting

Protective Dust Cover - SendPro C Auto

PowerGuard LE Seruice Package

Meter Equipment - C Series

C Series lntegrated Scale

SendPro C Series Scale Upgrade

us174885.4 2t23

@2023 Pitney Bowes lnc. All rlghE reserued.

Pitney Bowes Confi dential lnformation

SENDPROCAUTO

1 FXA

7H00

APAC

APAX

APKN

C5CC

CAAB

COVER-SPCA

F9PG2

MElA

MP81

MP81 10

PABl
C Series Premium App Bundle
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SendPro Online-Pitneyship

Pitneyship Basic 1 User

Single [Jser Access

Web Browser lntegration

SendPro C Series Shipping lntegration

Softguard For SendPro C500

Retum LbUlnstr - SendPro Auto C

Standard SLA-Equipment Seruice Agreement (for SendPro C Auto)

Manual Weight Entry

HZ03 95 LPIV Speed

SendPro C500 Base System ldentifier

USPS Rates with lvletered Letter

E Conf Services for Metered LTR. BDL

Retail Ground LOR

10lb/skg Weighing option for MP81

PTJl

PTJA

PTJN

PTKl

PTK2

SJS2

SPACRL

STDSLA

zH24

zH29

zHc5

ZHDs

ZHDT

ZHD9

ZHWM

Monthly Amount

s 130.64

$ 162.52

Your Payment Plan

lnitial Term: Payment Amount:

12 $ 391.92

48 $ 487.s6

'Does nol include any appliable sabs, use, ot propedytaxeswhich will be billed separalely.
ff lhe equipnent liged above is replacing Wur cutrent meler, your turenl meter will be teken oul of seNb one thb lease commenceg

( )Tax Exempt Certificate Attached
( )Tax Exempt Ceftificate Not Required

(X) Purchase PoweP transaction fees included
( ) Purchase PowePtransaction fees extra
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Your Signature Below

forthatsoftwarelocatedatThoseadditionaltermsareincorporatedbyreference.

NASPO VALUEPOINT CTR058808; 220000000858

State/EntitYs Contract#

Signature:

Emai[: aphamburgtwp@hamburg.mi.us
Print Name

Title

Date uate

Email Address

Sales lnformation

DAVID VALENCIA david.valencia@pb.com

Account Rep Name Email Address PBGFS Acceptance

L*Sg""t*"

Pri"tN*

Prtney Bowes Srgnature

us17,488s.4 2t23

@2023 Pihey Bowes lnc. All dghts rcserved.

Pitney Bowes Confi dential lnformation
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Marcy Miller

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

David Valencia <David.Valencia@pb.com>

Tuesday, February 11,2025 3:49 PM

AP Hamburg Twp

RE: MARCY MILLER

Hi Marcy,

Thank you for your response at the moment you are paying about StSg per month. The paperwork ljust sent
provides a discount for the 12 first months of 5130 and the remaining months will only be 5162. I look forward in
continuing our partnership.

Warmest regards,

David Valencia
Account Manager
SendTech North America

T +1 866 581 1234 ext.2005
david.valencia@pb. com
pitneybowes.com

For assistance with billing, service, or postage please call the Pitney Bowes All-in-One number 18441256-6444.

Create a case for billing or service support
http://www.pitnevbowes.com:443lus/support/article/fi)0051286/how-to-create-an-account-support-case.htm!

pitney bowe
3001 Summer Street
Stamford, CT 06926

s@

Pitney Bowes - Confidential

From: AP Ham burg Twp <apha m bu rgtwp@ ha m bu rg.m i. us>

Sent: Tuesday, February 17,2025 3:45 PM

To: David Valencia <David.Valencia@pb.com>

Subject: RE: MARCY MILLER

David,

Does the new machine increase our lease rate?

Marcy Miller
Hamburg Township
Accounting Specialist
810-231-1000 et223
APHAMBURGTWP@HAMBURG.MI.US

1
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pitney bowes @

Pitney Bowes - Confidential

From: David Valencia <David.Valencia@pb.com>

Sent: Tuesday, February 1.L,2025 3:35 PM

To: AP Ha m bu rg Twp <a pha m bu rgtwp @ ha m burg.ln Lus>
Subject: MARCY MILLER

Hi Marcy,

Thank you for your response. I removed Brittany from the account. I also went ahead and sent you the paperwork

for a like for like meter without any additional bells and whistles. As I stated, you are currently in your renewal grace

period and I would just hate to see you pay more if you wait until your current agreement expires to renew our
partnership. You should see it coming from an Adobe email shortly. Your current machine was built a few years back

and why not take the updated version if you are eligible for it. I went ahead and added a complimentary ink cartridge
to your order, so please try to return it as soon as possible. Looking forward in continuing our partnership.

Warmest Regards,

David Valencia
Account Manager
SendTech North America

T +1 866 581 1234 ext. 2005
david.valencia@pb.com
pitnevbowes.com

For assistance with billing, service, or postage please call the Pitney Bowes All-in-One number (8441256-6444.

Create a case for billing or service support
http://www.pitnevbowes.com:443/us/support/article/000051286/how-to-create-an-account-support-case.html

3001 Summer Street
Stamford, CT 06926

Pitney Bowes - Confidential
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