

RECEIVED

NOV - 1 2021

CITY OF GROSSE POINTE WOODS  
CLERK'S DEPARTMENT

**McGraw Morris** P.C.

GRAND RAPIDS

TROY

SAGINAW

THOMAS J. MCGRAW  
G. GUS MORRIS  
CRAIG R. NOLAND  
STACY J. BELISLE  
KEVIN K. KILBY  
CHRISTOPHER J. RAITI  
CHARLES E. LOVELL  
AMANDA M. ZDARSKY  
THOMAS D. LANDA  
ERIC C. TURNBULL

2075 W. BIG BEAVER ROAD  
SUITE 750  
TROY, MICHIGAN 48084  
TELEPHONE: (248) 502-4000  
FACSIMILE: (248) 502-4001

September 29, 2021

GLENN A. DIEGEL  
Of Counsel

ATTN: BRUCE SMITH  
CITY OF GROSSE POINTE WOODS  
20025 MACK PLAZA  
GROSSE PTE. WOODS, MI 48236

**RE: STATEMENT 8157 – LEGAL SERVICES FOR CITY OF GROSSE POINTE WOODS**

Balance prior Invoice:	\$1,015.00
Payment Received :	<u>-1,015.00</u>

Balance remaining: \$ 0.00

STACY J. BELISLE:	5.50 Hours x \$175/hr =	\$962.50
KEVIN KILBY:	0.70 Hours x \$175/hr =	<u>\$122.50</u>

**BALANCE DUE:** Pay \$1,085.00

101210806.000

SM 10/28/2021

*Bruce Smith* 10/29/21

# MCGRAW MORRIS P.C.

2075 WEST BIG BEAVER  
SUITE 750  
TROY, MI 48084  
248-502-4000  
TAX I.D. #27-1058649

Attn: BRUCE SMITH  
CITY OF GROSSE POINTE WOODS  
20025 MACK PLAZA  
GROSSE POINTE WOODS, MI 48236

Statement Date: September 14, 2021  
Statement No. 8157  
Account No. 3184.100  
Page: 1

RE: FOIA MATTERS

OUR FILE #3184.1000

## Fees

			Hours	
06/09/2021	SJB	REVIEW EMAILS FROM CLIENT REGARDING FOIA REQUEST FOR PERSONAL INFORMATION RELATING TO DEATH INVESTIGATION.	0.30	52.5
06/15/2021	SJB	EMAILS WITH CLIENT REGARDING STATUS OF FOIA RESPONSE FOR PROTECTED INFORMATION.	0.10	17.5
06/18/2021	KK	RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF EMAIL REGARDING FOIA FROM ATTY BELISLE. PHONE CONFERENCE WITH ATTY BELISLE REGARDING SAME.	0.30	52.5
06/22/2021	SJB	PREPARE EMAIL TO CLIENT REGARDING REDACTIONS APPLICABLE TO FOIA RESPONSE AND WITNESS INFORMATION.	0.30	52.5
06/30/2021	SJB	EMAILS WITH CLIENT REGARDING STATUS OF FOIA REQUEST.	0.20	35.0
07/26/2021	SJB	EMAILS WITH CLIENT REGARDING STATUS OF FOIA REQUEST FOR POLICE/ARREST INFORMATION.	0.20	35.0
08/02/2021	SJB	PREPARE EMAIL RECOMMENDATION TO CLIENT REGARDING FOIA REDACTIONS AND RELATIONSHIP TO DISCOVERY.	0.60	105.0
08/20/2021	SJB	EMAILS WITH J. KOSANKE REGARDING FOIA REQUEST FOR ACCIDENT REPORTS.	0.40	70.0
08/24/2021	SJB	REVIEW FOIA REQUEST REGARDING ELECTION MATERIALS; REVIEW FOIA PROVISIONS REGARDING REQUESTED INFORMATION.	0.80	140.0

			Hours	
08/25/2021	SJB	REVIEW INFORMATION RECEIVED FROM CLIENT REGARDING FOIA REQUEST FOR ACCIDENT INFORMATION; REVIEW FOIA PROVISIONS REGARDING REDACTION OF POLICE REPORTS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLIENT REGARDING RESPONSE TO FOIA REQUEST FOR ACCIDENT REPORT INFORMATION.	1.20	210.0
	KK	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ATTY BELISLE REGARDING FOIA ISSUES. E,AIL REGARDING FOIA ISSUES.	0.40	70.0
08/26/2021	SJB	REVIEW ATTORNEY RESPONSE TO FOIA RESPONSE REGARDING REVIEW OF ACCIDENT REPORTS AND REDACTIONS; TELEPHONE CALL WITH J. KOSANKE REGARDING RESPONSE AND PROCEDURE; REVIEW CASE LAW PROVIDED BY CLIENT REGARDING REDACTION OF DOCUMENTS.	1.40	245.0
		For Current Services Rendered	<u>6.20</u>	<u>1,085.0</u>

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Recapitulation</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>
STACY J. BELISLE	Partner	5.50	\$175.00
KEVIN KILBY	Associate	0.70	175.00

Previous Balance	\$1,015.0
Total Current Work	1,085.0

Payments

07/19/2021	Payment - Thank you	-1,015.0
	Balance Due	<u>\$1,085.0</u>