

ROSATI, SCHULTZ, JOPPICH & AMTSBUECHLER, P.C.  
 27555 Executive Drive, Suite 250  
 Farmington Hills, MI 48331  
 (248) 489-4100 Tax ID# 38-3107356

RECEIVED

JAN 12 2024

CITY OF GROSSE POINTE WOODS  
 CLERK'S DEPARTMENT

January 9, 2024

City of Grosse Pointe Woods  
 Attn: Frank Schulte, City Administrator  
 20025 Mack Plaza  
 Grosse Pointe Woods, MI 48236

Invoice # 1080706

In Reference To: General Counsel

Professional Services Rendered Through December 31, 2023

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>City Council</u>		
12/4/2023 DAW Attend Committee of the Whole and regular City Council meetings	1.60 \$145.00/hr	232.00
12/8/2023 DAW Telephone conference with Mayor regarding two inactive committees	0.10 \$145.00/hr	14.50
12/15/2023 DAW Receipt/review of correspondence with agendas and packets from City Clerk for 12/18/23 meetings	0.50 \$145.00/hr	72.50
12/18/2023 DAW Attend Council meeting	2.10 \$145.00/hr	304.50
SUBTOTAL:	[ 4.30	623.50]
<u>General Administration</u>		
12/1/2023 DAW Receipt/review of correspondence regarding issue with 11/13 meeting minutes; Telephone conference from City Administrator	0.30 \$145.00/hr	43.50

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
12/1/2023	DAW	Telephone conference with City Clerk and City Administrator regarding agenda packet question	0.10 \$145.00/hr	14.50
	DAW	Telephone conference with City Administrator regarding employment issues	0.40 \$145.00/hr	58.00
	DAW	Receipt/review correspondence from City Administrator regarding employment issues; Internal correspondence (2) to L. Amtsbuechler	0.60 \$145.00/hr	87.00
	DAW	Receipt/review correspondence from Ms. Lint to the City Clerk	0.40 \$145.00/hr	58.00
12/2/2023	DAW	Receipt/review correspondence from City Administrator regarding employment contract issues; Correspondence in response	0.30 \$145.00/hr	43.50
	DAW	Receipt/review of correspondence between City Administrator; Attorney Hallahan and Assessor regarding attendance at closed session on 12/4/23	0.20 \$145.00/hr	29.00
12/3/2023	DAW	Research state law regarding qualified voter file issues; Correspondence to Assistant City Administrator	0.70 \$145.00/hr	101.50
	DAW	Research state law regarding City Charter and City Code regarding settling compensation for municipal judge; Correspondence to City Administrator with response	0.80 \$145.00/hr	116.00
	DAW	Research City Code, City Charter and Pension Board minutes regarding rehiring a retiree; Correspondence to City Administrator	1.20 \$145.00/hr	174.00
12/4/2023	DAW	Telephone conference with City Administrator regarding employment issues and pending litigation	0.40 \$145.00/hr	58.00
	DAW	Telephone conference with Mayor regarding committees that are no longer needed	0.20 \$145.00/hr	29.00
12/6/2023	DAW	Receipt/review correspondence from Clerk (2) and receipt/review of correspondence from Assistant City Administrator with Michigan Indigent Defense	0.90 \$145.00/hr	130.50

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		Commission contract and insurance certificate for review; Correspondence in response, noting deficiencies		
12/8/2023	DAW	Receipt/review correspondence from Assistant City Administrator to State of Michigan with executed certification of records	0.20 \$145.00/hr	29.00
12/11/2023	DAW	Receipt/review correspondence from Clerk to Attorney Tomlinson regarding Freedom of Information Act question; Correspondence in response	0.20 \$145.00/hr	29.00
12/12/2023	DAW	Telephone conference with City Administrator to discuss litigation and PFAS class action	0.40 \$145.00/hr	58.00
	DAW	Telephone conference with Mayor and City Administrator to discuss Local Officials Compensation Commission issue	0.30 \$145.00/hr	43.50
	DAW	Telephone conference with Mayor regarding Local Officials Compensation Commission issue	0.10 \$145.00/hr	14.50
	DAW	Meeting with Treasurer about the Building Authority Committee	0.10 \$145.00/hr	14.50
12/13/2023	DAW	Receipt/review correspondence from Clerk regarding scheduling a conference call about liquor license issues; Correspondence in response; Meeting set for December 15	0.20 \$145.00/hr	29.00
	DAW	Receipt/review correspondence from Assistant City Administrator regarding Michigan Indigent Defense Commission contract	0.20 \$145.00/hr	29.00
12/14/2023	DAW	Receipt/review of correspondence (2) from Clerk with certificates of insurance for the Michigan Indigent Defense Commission contract; Review certificates and contract requirements; Correspondence in response that professional liability coverage is still missing	0.50 \$145.00/hr	72.50

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
12/14/2023	DAW Receipt/review of correspondence (3) between City Administrator and insurance agent regarding notification to the insurance company of the Zoning Board of Appeals appeal filed by Ms. Lint; Correspondence to M. Zalewski	0.40 \$145.00/hr	58.00
	DAW Receipt/review of correspondence between City Administrator and GLWA concerning 3M and DuPont PFAS settlements	0.20 \$145.00/hr	29.00
	DAW Review of City files and research concerning possible dissolution of the Mayor's Mack Avenue Business Study Committee and the Grosse Pointe Woods Building Authority; Research MCL 123.951, et. seq.; Correspondence to Mayor	2.90 \$145.00/hr	420.50
	DAW Correspondence to Clerk regarding due date for outside litigation status report; Receipt/review correspondence from clerk	0.20 \$145.00/hr	29.00
	DAW Preparation of Outside Litigation Semi-Annual Report	2.60 \$145.00/hr	377.00
	DAW Receipt/review correspondence from Treasurer with questions regarding Notice of Settlement in General Mill Supply Co. v Great Lakes Water Authority and the City of Detroit with attached Notice; Review Notice; Correspondence to Treasurer in response	0.50 \$145.00/hr	72.50
12/15/2023	DAW Telephone conference with City Administrator regarding building code issue concerning gutter requirements; Review City Code for gutter regulations; Correspondence to City Administrator	0.50 \$145.00/hr	72.50
	DAW Receipt/review correspondence from Clerk rescheduling conference call regarding liquor licenses; Correspondence in response	0.20 \$145.00/hr	29.00
	DAW Receipt/review correspondence from McGraw Morris regarding status of Brys v GPW; Addition of status of General Mill Supply Co v GLWA and City of Detroit to Outside Litigation Report; Finalize report and send	1.50 \$145.00/hr	217.50

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	to City Clerk for distribution to the Mayor and City Council		
12/18/2023	DAW Receipt/review correspondence from Clerk with Professional Liability Certificate of Insurance for Michigan Indigent Defense Commission contract. Review certificate; Correspondence to City Clerk	0.40 \$145.00/hr	58.00
12/19/2023	DAW Telephone conference with Mayor regarding Building Authority Committee and Mayor's Mack Ave. Task Force	0.20 \$145.00/hr	29.00
	DAW Receipt/review correspondence from Clerk with additional information from HELM regarding essential senior services	0.20 \$145.00/hr	29.00
12/20/2023	DAW Receipt/review of correspondence between Ms. Lint and Attorney Tomlinson regarding Freedom of Information Act issue; Forward to M. Zalewski for the file	0.20 \$145.00/hr	29.00
	DAW Receipt/review of five more correspondences from and to Ms. Lint regarding Freedom of Information Act issues	0.30 \$145.00/hr	43.50
	DAW Receipt/review of correspondence with insurance certificate for professional liability insurance (Michigan Indigent Defense Commission contract) from Assistant City Administrator; Review and approve; Correspondence in response	0.30 \$145.00/hr	43.50
12/21/2023	DAW Receipt/review correspondence from Clerk to Ms. Lint regarding Freedom of Information Act request; Receipt/review correspondence from Attorney Tomlinson regarding scheduling a meeting for later today; Correspondence in response	0.30 \$145.00/hr	43.50
	DAW Telephone conference with Clerk with a link to the Summary of Council action on 12/18/23; Review Summary	0.30 \$145.00/hr	43.50

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
12/21/2023	DAW	Telephone conference with City Administrator and Clerk regarding 707 N. Renaud	0.40 \$145.00/hr	58.00
	DAW	Attend telephone meeting with Attorneys Tomlinson and Zalewski	0.50 \$145.00/hr	72.50
	DAW	Correspondence to Clerk regarding Freedom of Information Act processing matters	0.40 \$145.00/hr	58.00
12/22/2023	DAW	Receipt/review of correspondence (2) from Clerk, including Freedom of Information Act estimate for Wilamonski request	0.30 \$145.00/hr	43.50
	DAW	Receipt/review of multiple correspondence regarding Freedom of Information Act form and deposit issue between Assistant City Administrator and Freedom of Information Act requestor, Ms. Wilamowski	0.30 \$145.00/hr	43.50
	DAW	Receipt/review correspondence from Clerk with Freedom of Information Act cost estimate sent to requestor, Ms. Wilamowski	0.20 \$145.00/hr	29.00
12/26/2023	DAW	Receipt/review correspondence from Assistant City Administrator with complaint regarding a photo used in the City calendar; Correspondence in response	0.50 \$145.00/hr	72.50
	DAW	Receipt/review correspondence from City Administrator requesting a draft response to the complaint regarding the City calendar photo; Correspondence in response with needed information	0.70 \$145.00/hr	101.50
12/27/2023	DAW	Receipt/review of correspondence between Clerk and Ms. Wilamowski regarding her second Freedom of Information Act request	0.20 \$145.00/hr	29.00
	DAW	Telephone conference with City Administrator regarding complaint about the City calendar	0.20 \$145.00/hr	29.00
	DAW	Review of City calendar photos and draft response to complaint about the City calendar; Correspondence to City Administrator with draft	0.90 \$145.00/hr	130.50

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
12/27/2023	DAW Receipt/review of correspondence between Clerk and Ms. Wilamowski regarding her second Freedom of Information Act request	0.20 \$145.00/hr	29.00
	DAW Telephone conference with City Administrator regarding complaint about the City calendar	0.20 \$145.00/hr	29.00
	DAW Review of City calendar photos and draft response to complainant about the City calendar; Correspondence to City Administrator with draft	0.90 \$145.00/hr	130.50
12/28/2023	DAW Receipt/review correspondence from City Administrator and from Assistant City Administrator regarding Municode and City Charter provisions; Telephone conference from City Administrator to discuss	0.30 \$145.00/hr	43.50
12/29/2023	DAW Receipt/review correspondence from Ms. Lint to Clerk regarding Freedom of Information Act requests; Receipt/review correspondence from Clerk to Ms. Lint regarding Freedom of Information Act requests; Telephone conference from City Administrator regarding Ms. Lint's Freedom of Information Act requests and an employment matter	0.90 \$145.00/hr	130.50
	SUBTOTAL:	[ 27.00	3,915.00]
	<u>Litigation</u>		
12/4/2023	DAW Receipt/review of correspondence and voice message from Attorney Tomlinson; Correspondence in response regarding Lint v GPW	0.50 \$145.00/hr	72.50
	DAW Correspondence to Plaintiff's attorney advising that an extension of time to answer the complaint may be needed in the Lint v GPW matter	0.40 \$145.00/hr	58.00
	DAW Receipt/review of correspondence with email threads and attachments from Ms. Lint from the City Administrator regarding Zoning Board of Appeals	0.50 \$145.00/hr	72.50

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		minutes in the Lint v GPW matter		
12/4/2023	DAW	Receipt/review of multiple correspondences (7) from Clerk with attached video, plans and photos regarding the Lint v GPW matter	0.50 \$145.00/hr	72.50
12/5/2023	DAW	Receipt/review correspondence from insurance agent and from City Administrator regarding status of review by ARGO/Paragon Insurance in the Lint v GPW matter	0.40 \$145.00/hr	58.00
12/7/2023	DAW	Receipt/review correspondence from City Administrator regarding Rosati, Schultz handling the lawsuit for Lint v GPW; Correspondence in response; Multiple internal correspondence regarding handling the case	0.80 \$145.00/hr	116.00
12/8/2023	DAW	Receipt/review correspondence from City Administrator with insurance coverage information regarding the Lint v GPW matter; Correspondence to M. Zalewski regarding internal and external issues, including an extension of time to answer the Complaint	0.40 \$145.00/hr	58.00
	DAW	Correspondence to Plaintiff's attorney regarding extension of time to answer the Complaint regarding Lint v GPW	0.50 \$145.00/hr	72.50
12/11/2023	DAW	Receipt/review correspondence from Ms. Lint's attorney with an appeal from the Zoning Board of Appeals decision on 11/20; Correspondence in response to serve the City Clerk; Correspondence to City Clerk and M. Zalewski with the appeal	0.80 \$145.00/hr	116.00
12/12/2023	JES	Conference call with F. Schulte, S. Como, D. Walling regarding PFAS claim submissions and whether GLWA is interested in working with retail customers for submitting a joint claim; review Interpretive Guidance on Interrelated Drinking Water Systems and Allocation Procedures	0.30 \$145.00/hr	43.50
	JES	Correspondence to F. Schulte regarding recommended questions to address to GLWA and provide information on PFAS testing firm providing	0.40 \$145.00/hr	58.00



			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		discounted testing		
12/13/2023	JES	Receipt/review correspondence from F. Schulte to GLWA regarding submission of claim forms for the PFAS settlements with 3M and DuPont	0.10 \$145.00/hr	14.50
12/14/2023	JES	Receipt/review correspondence from F. Schulte forwarding email from GLWA regarding they will review question from City on submitting claim forms for PFAS litigation settlements	0.10 \$145.00/hr	14.50
	DAW	Receipt/review of multiple correspondence from Plaintiff in Lint v GPW regarding Plaintiff's request for a certified record of the Zoning Board of Appeals meeting on November 20th	0.30 \$145.00/hr	43.50
12/19/2023	DAW	Correspondence to Appraiser regarding trial on The Rivers; Receipt/review his response	0.30 \$145.00/hr	43.50
12/20/2023	DAW	Receipt/review of multiple correspondence (4) and a video tape from Ms. Lint regarding neighbor's video camera in the Lint v GPW matter; Forward all information to M. Zalewski for litigation file	0.50 \$145.00/hr	72.50
	DAW	Receipt/review correspondence from Attorney Tomlinson in the Lint v GPW matter; Correspondence in response	0.30 \$145.00/hr	43.50
12/21/2023	DAW	Receipt/review of multiple correspondence (4) regarding filing issues and Motion to Strike pleadings; Correspondence in response	0.30 \$145.00/hr	43.50
12/22/2023	DAW	Receipt/review correspondence from City Administrator to M. Zalewski requesting insurance coverage update	0.10 \$145.00/hr	14.50
12/26/2023	DAW	Receipt/review correspondence from Attorney General's office regarding defendant's eligibility for his conviction to be set aside in the People v McMillan matter; Correspondence to Attorney Tomlinson	0.30 \$145.00/hr	43.50

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
12/27/2023	DAW Receipt/review correspondence from Attorney Hallahan regarding status of the DRSN v GPW trial; Correspondence in response	0.20 \$145.00/hr	29.00
	DAW Receipt/review correspondence from Attorney Hallahan regarding status of the trial on DRSN v GPW; Correspondence in response	0.20 \$145.00/hr	29.00
12/29/2023	JES PFAS: Receipt/review and response to correspondence from City Manager regarding communication from B. Wolfson of GLWA to discuss with member after new federal regulations are issued	0.20 \$145.00/hr	29.00
SUBTOTAL:		[ 8.40	1,218.00]
For professional services rendered		39.70	\$5,756.50
Additional charges:			
		<u>Qty/Price</u>	
<u>City Council</u>			
12/4/2023	Attorney Mileage - Committee of the Whole and Council Meeting [D. Walling]	73 0.65	47.45
12/18/2023	Attorney Mileage - Council Meeting [D. Walling]	73 0.65	47.45
SUBTOTAL:			[ 94.90]
<u>General Administration</u>			
12/12/2023	Attorney Mileage to pick up two files for review [D. Walling]	73 0.65	47.45
SUBTOTAL:			[ 47.45]

	<u>Amount</u>
Total costs	\$142.35
Total amount of this bill	\$5,898.85
Previous balance	\$2,990.00
12/21/2023 Payment - thank you. Check No. 68378	(\$2,990.00)
Balance due	<u>\$5,898.85</u>

---

Please include your Invoice Number on your payment. Thank you.

Attorney Summary

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>
Debra A. Walling, Associate	38.60	145.00
Joellen Shortley, Associate	1.10	145.00

101 266 801.000

SM 11/10/24

FS 1-10-24