

ROSATI, SCHULTZ, JOPPICH & AMTSBUECHLER, P.C.
 27555 Executive Drive, Suite 250
 Farmington Hills, MI 48331
 (248) 489-4100 Tax ID# 38-3107356

January 8, 2025

City of Grosse Pointe Woods
 Attn: Frank Schulte, City Administrator
 20025 Mack Plaza
 Grosse Pointe Woods, MI 48236

Invoice # 1082792

In Reference To: General Counsel

Professional Services Rendered Through December 31, 2024

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>City Council</u>		
12/2/2024 DAW Attend Committee of the Whole and City Council meetings	0.80 \$145.00/hr	116.00
12/16/2024 MJZ Receipt/review of agenda packet for 12-16-24 City Council and Committee of the Whole meetings	0.40 \$155.00/hr	62.00
MJZ Attend City Council and Committee of the Whole meetings	0.90 \$155.00/hr	139.50
SUBTOTAL:	[2.10	317.50]
<u>Finance/Treasurer</u>		
12/18/2024 DAW Receipt/review correspondence from City Clerk to Nickel & Saph Insurance with claim for vehicle damage submitted by Ms. Holly Rossetti for \$10,224.85, plus rental car for \$1,124.31	0.40 \$145.00/hr	58.00
SUBTOTAL:	[0.40	58.00]

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>General Administration</u>			
12/2/2024	DAW	Continued review of agendas and packets for the Dec. 2, 2024 Committee of the Whole and City Council meetings; Review Sec. 8-284(a) and (b) of the City Code to prepare for the public hearing concerning a six foot privacy fence	0.60 \$145.00/hr 87.00
	DAW	Receipt/review correspondence from Sedgwick Claims Examiner regarding retention of Rob Huth, Kirk Huth Law to defend the City in Impastato v Grosse Pointe Woods; Receipt/review correspondence in response from Nickel & Saph Insurance Agency	0.40 \$145.00/hr 58.00
	DAW	Preparation of final edits, updates and review of the Semi-Annual Outside Litigation Report; Correspondence to City Clerk with the Report and spreadsheet regarding pending tax appeals	0.70 \$145.00/hr 101.50
12/4/2024	DAW	Receipt/review correspondence from Public Safety Director with MCOLES Community Policing Competitive Grant Contract and Hold Harmless Agreement for review and approval of both documents	1.00 \$145.00/hr 145.00
12/5/2024	DAW	Receipt/review correspondence from City Clerk with the Summary of Council action on 12/2/24	0.20 \$145.00/hr 29.00
12/6/2024	DAW	Receipt/review of correspondence with Service Agreement for GPAAS from the Public Safety Director; Review agreement; Correspondence in response with no objections	0.80 \$145.00/hr 116.00
12/9/2024	DAW	Receipt/review correspondence from Assistant City Administrator regarding Director of Public Safety regarding service for stray dogs/cats	0.20 \$145.00/hr 29.00
12/10/2024	DAW	Receipt/review correspondence from Public Safety Director with a proposed Hold Harmless Agreement for a gift of 5 license plate readers from the Grosse Pointe Public Safety Foundation; Review and respond	1.10 \$145.00/hr 159.50

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	with proposed edits; Receipt/review correspondence in response from Public Safety Director		
12/10/2024	DAW Receipt/review correspondence from Attorney Kennedy with revisions to the Senior Interlocal Agreement; Review revisions; Correspondence to City Administrator with approval; Receipt/review correspondence from City Administrator and from Attorney Martin regarding approval of the revisions	0.70 \$145.00/hr	101.50
	DAW Receipt/review correspondence from Public Safety Director regarding License Plate Reader Hold Harmless Agreement; Correspondence in response	0.40 \$145.00/hr	58.00
12/11/2024	MJZ MCOLES Hold Harmless Agreement: Correspondence to Assistant City Administrator	0.10 \$155.00/hr	15.50
	MJZ Janson Claim: Multiple correspondence to and from City Administrator	0.20 \$155.00/hr	31.00
	MJZ Janson Claim: Preparation of Release of Claims	0.70 \$155.00/hr	108.50
	MJZ License Plate Reader Hold Harmless Agreement: Receipt/review of documents provided by City	0.20 \$155.00/hr	31.00
	MJZ License Plate Reader Hold Harmless Agreement: Correspondence to Director of Public Safety	0.10 \$155.00/hr	15.50
12/12/2024	MJZ License Plate Reader Hold Harmless Agreement: Correspondence to attorney for Grosse Pointe Public Safety Foundation	0.10 \$155.00/hr	15.50
	MJZ License Plate Reader Hold Harmless Agreement: Multiple correspondence to and from Director of Public Safety	0.10 \$155.00/hr	15.50
	MJZ License Plate Reader Hold Harmless Agreement: Telephone conference with attorney for Grosse Pointe Public Safety Foundation	0.20 \$155.00/hr	31.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
12/12/2024	MJZ License Plate Reader Hold Harmless Agreement: Telephone conference with City Administrator, Assistant City Administrator, and Director of Public Safety	0.10 \$155.00/hr	15.50
	DAW Receipt/review correspondence from Attorney McGraw regarding upcoming oral argument scheduled in the Michigan Court of Appeals on the Dubrelle v GPW, et al lawsuit; Receipt/review correspondence from City Administrator to City Council	0.40 \$145.00/hr	58.00
12/13/2024	MJZ License Plate Reader Hold Harmless Agreement: Multiple correspondence to and from Assistant City Administrator	0.10 \$155.00/hr	15.50
	DAW Receipt/review correspondence from City Clerk with links to the Council and Committee of the Whole meeting agendas and packets; Review agendas and packets	0.60 \$145.00/hr	87.00
12/14/2024	DAW Receipt/review correspondence from City Clerk with agenda and packet for the Committee of the Whole and City Council meetings on 12/16	0.50 \$145.00/hr	72.50
12/18/2024	DAW Receipt/review correspondence from City Clerk with the Summary of Council action on 12/16/24	0.20 \$145.00/hr	29.00
12/23/2024	DAW Telephone conference with Public Safety Director and Assistant City Administrator regarding conditional offer of employment; Review and approve agreement and return to Public Safety Director	0.50 \$145.00/hr	72.50
	DAW Receipt/review of correspondence (2) from Public Safety Director with an agreement with Motorola for review; Review agreement; Correspondence in response to Public Safety Director noting issues with the agreement	0.80 \$145.00/hr	116.00
12/27/2024	DAW Receipt/review correspondence from Public Safety Director and from Motorola with the Master Agreement and Vigilant System Addendum (38 pages) for review concerning License Plate Recognition	1.40 \$145.00/hr	203.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	(LPR) system; Review documents; Correspondence to Public Safety Director with issues still in need of clarification		
12/30/2024	DAW Receipt/review correspondence from Attorney Landa regarding more detailed information about the Michigan Court of Appeals oral argument in Dubrelle v GPW litigation; Correspondence in response	0.30 \$145.00/hr	43.50
	DAW Receipt/review correspondence from City Clerk to Nickel & Saph Insurance Agency with a Notice of Claim submitted by Mr./Mrs. Losinski, including repair estimate; Receipt/review correspondence (2) from Nickel & Saph in response regarding same police report number for two different claims; Receipt/review correspondence from City Clerk in response	0.50 \$145.00/hr	72.50
	SUBTOTAL:	[13.20	1,933.00]
	For professional services rendered	15.70	\$2,308.50
	Additional charges:		
		<u>Qty/Price</u>	
	<u>City Council</u>		
12/2/2024	Attorney Mileage - Council and Committee of the Whole meetings [D. Walling]	73 0.67	48.91
12/16/2024	Attorney Mileage - Council and Committee of the Whole meetings [M. Zalewski]	73 0.67	48.91
	SUBTOTAL:		[97.82]
	Total costs		\$97.82
	Total amount of this bill		\$2,406.32

	<u>Amount</u>
Previous balance	\$4,428.41
12/19/2024 Payment - thank you. Check No. 71481	(\$4,428.41)
Balance due	<u><u>\$2,406.32</u></u>

Please include your Invoice Number on your payment. Thank you.

Attorney Summary

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>
Debra A. Walling, Associate	12.50	145.00
Matthew J. Zalewski, Shareholder	3.20	155.00

101-266-801,000

SS

FS 1-9-28