YORK, DOLAN & TOMLINSON, P.C.

Attorneys and Counselors at law 22600 Hall Road, Ste. 205 Clinton Township, Michigan 48036 586-263-5060 Fax 586-263-4763

John A. Dolan (jdolan@yorkdolanlaw.com) Timothy D. Tomlinson (ttomlinson@yorkdolanlaw.com) Linda M. McGrail (Imcgrail@yorkdolanlaw.com) Fred A. York (1930-1989)

RECEIVED

June 7, 2022

JUN 1 3 2022

CITY OF GROSSE POINTE WOODS CLERK'S DEPARTMENT

CITY OF GROSSE POINTE WOODS ITEMIZED LIST OF LEGAL SERVICES RENDERED May, 2022

SUBJECT	DATE	SERVICES	TIME	
BUILDING/PLANNING	: :			
General	05/13/22	Receipt & review email from Modrak	.2	
	05/24/22	Re: Planning Commission; Reply email TC w/Tutag re: Planning Commission;	.2	
		Prepare & attend Planning Commission Meeting	1.0	
Ordinances		Meeting	1.0	
Mobile Food Vendors	05/19/22	TC w/Tutag; Review & revise; Email		
2.2001.00		Tutag	.5	
	05/25/22	Revise; Email Tutag	.5	
Signs	05/03/22	Conference w/Building Administration;		
		Revise ordinance; Email Building	<u>2.5</u>	
TOTAL BUILDING/PLA	NNING:		4.7	\$728.50
SUBJECT	DATE	SERVICES	TIME	
MUNICIPAL COURT:				
General/Prosecutions	05/04/22 05/11/22	Prepare & attend pretrials Review files & prepare plea offers for 5/18 docket; Receipt & review	2.0	
		email re: vaping; Research; Reply email	2.4	

	• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •	school grounds; Research; Reply email	1.0
SUBJECT	DATE	SERVICES	TIME
	05/18/22	Prepare & attend pretrials	2.5
	05/20/22	TC w/House Council; Review docket	.5
	05/23/22	Review files & prepare plea offers for	.5
	03123122	5/25 docket; TC w/DB re: Ming complaint	1.2
	05/24/22	TC w/DB	.2
	05/25/22	Prepare & attend pretrials	2.4
	05/27/22	Receipt & review email w/LARA	2.4
	03121122	Form from Pointe Alarm; Research;	
		Reply email	.5
	05/31/22	Receipt & review docket	.2
	03/31/22	receipt & review docket	.2
Specific Files			
People v Bogan	05/24/22	Receipt & review Application to	
•		Set Aside Conviction	.5
People v Clark	05/03/22	TC w/Defendant's attorney; Receipt	
•		& review email w/Stip & Order;	
		Reply email	.4
	05/23/22	TC w/DB	.2
People v Connier	05/26/22	Receipt & review email w/Stip & Order;	
		Reply email	.3
People v King	05/05/22	Receipt & review email from Court; Reply email	.2
People v Lopiccolo	05/02/22	Review Defendant's attorney's	
		corresp; Email Defendant's attorney	.8
	05/03/22	Receipt & review email; Reply email	.2
	05/11/22	TC w/Det. Seidel	.2
	05/31/22	2 TC w/witness; TC w/Gateway's attorney	.6
People v Love	05/24/22	Receipt & review Appearance & Discovery	
		Demand; Email GPW DPS	.5
People v McIlwain	05/03/22	TC w/Defendant's attorney; Receipt &	
-		review Stip & Order; Reply email	.4
People v Middlebrook	05/19/22	Receipt & review discovery from DPS	.3
	05/31/22	TC w/victim; Review file; Email re:	
		subpoenas	.5
People v Suhan	05/31/22	TC w/Attorney Resnick	.2
People v Tutehill	05/31/22	Receipt & review Incident Report w/Summons	
		& Complaint Request; TC w/Complainant;	
		TC w/DB	.8
People v Winterfield	05/26/22	Receipt & review 3 emails & video w/Summons	
		9- Complaint Dogwoot, TC m/Dood, Dogly	

& Complaint Request; TC w/Reed; Reply

1.0

email to Reed

TOTAL MUNICIPAL COURT:	20.0	\$3,100.00
TOTAL HOURS (155/HR) & FEES – May, 2022 COSTS:	24.7	\$3,828.50
TOTAL FEES & COSTS - May, 2022		\$3.828.50

Breakdown:

 General/Planning:
 4.7 hrs
 101210.821.200
 \$1728.50

 Municipal Court:
 20.0 hrs
 101210.801.100
 \$1360.00

Son W10/2022 FS 6-10-22

YORK, DOLAN & TOMLINSON, P.C. Attorneys and Counselors at law 22600 Hall Road, Suite 205 Clinton Township, Michigan 48036

linton Township, Michigan 48036 586-263-5060 Fax 586-263-4763

John A. Dolan (jdolan@yorkdolanlaw.com) Timothy D. Tomlinson (ttomlinson@yorkdolanlaw.com) Linda M. McGrail (lmcgail@yorkdolanlaw.com) Fred A. York (1930-1989)

June 7, 2022

Via Email (fschulte@gpwmi.us)
Mr. Frank Schulte, City Administrator
City of Grosse Pointe Woods
20025 Mack Plaza
Grosse Pointe Woods, MI 48236

RE: YORK, DOLAN & TOMLINSON, P.C. - LEGAL BILLING

Dear Mr. Schulte:

Enclosed is our statement for legal services rendered for the month of May, 2022. If you have any questions regarding same, please do not hesitate to contact us. We remain,

Very truly yours,

YORK, DOLAN & TOMLINSON, P.C.

Timothy D. Tomlinson

Timothy D. Tomlinson

TDT/jabh Enclosure

cc: Sue Como, Via Email (scomo@gpwmi.us) w/Enclosure

Shawn Murphy, Via Email (smurphy@gpwmi.us) w/Enclosure