‘YIM Invoice

YANMAR MASTRY ENGINE CENTER . culae el

2801 Anvil Street North INVOICEL: INYE38570

Saint Petersburg FL 33710 Acct. No. 252061

United States Terms

(727) 522-9471 Due Date

WWW.MASTRY.COM PO # 2722624
Created From Sales Order #50844329

Bill To Ship To Sales Rep Doug Jensen

Scott Schultz Green Cove Springs _?Palgﬁwgg#\nethod it el

Water and Waste Water Utilities 900 Gum St Py

321 Walnut Street Green Cove Springs FL 32043 gn!pp!ng Px gotde =hipiyaxables

Green Cove Springs, FL 32043 United States Ipping fax Rate

United States

STATION 326

3PH MEC35 DSA 1 | 157840 35 KW 3 PH 17.830.00 | 17.830.00

Subtotal 17,830.00

Shipping Cost (Truck Other) 182.80
Total 18,012.80

Balance Due $18,012.80

NOTICE TO EXPORTER: You must obtain Export Power of attorney from Yanmar Mastry Engine Center. Farwarders or carriers cannot combine other invoices
without written agreement. A copy of all BL, AWB, Truck BL, AES filing and Commercial Invoice must be sent to MEC-IEC@MASTRY,COM for each shipment.
Commercial invoice must have our invoice number, You must follow OFAC sanction country list regulation or any EAR regulation before shipments are
processed. Call 727-522-9471 with questions,

All goods remain the property of YANMAR MASTRY ENGINE CENTER until paid in full
A 15% restocking fee on all returns - All returns must be accompanied by this invoice and an RMA# - No returns accepted after 30 days

oved
Cg@, :2’.13 Q)

PO# 27722624
L eave PO 94_3,4:9———

MR~ wvessste



Scott Schultz

From: Mivel Simmons <msimmons@mastry.com>

Sent: Thursday, February 18, 2021 3:42 PM

To: Scott Schultz

Subject: Yanmar Mastry Engine Center: Invoice #INV838572

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. . Do not click links or open attachments
unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

] § Invoice
YANMAR MASTRY ENGINE CENTER Date 2/18/2021
2801 Anvil Street North Invoice # INV838572
Saint Petersburg FL 33710 Acct. No. 252061
United States Terms
(727) 522-9471 Due Date
httus:z‘,’link.edqenilot.ccm/siez344SZaNtiGktW4F0iCMot0HEOnSO?u:htto://www.mastrv.com/po # 2722624
i hipT
Bill To gré:n gove Springs Created Sales Order
Scott Schultz 900 Gum St From #50844330
Water and Waste Water Utilities Green Cove Springs FL 32043 Sales Rep  Doug Jensen
321 Walnut Street United States Shipping ¢ Other
Green Cove Springs, FL 32043 :'rzt;gg N
United States o .
Shipping -Not Taxable-
Tax Code
Shipping
Tax Rate
u AT , T
I | T i ] I ) { jon =14 ."_'_A.‘_"I ate| Am t
3PH MEC35 DSA 1 [157672 35 KW 3 PH 17,830.00 17,830.00
Subtotal 17,830.00
Shipping Cost (Truck Other) 182.80
Total 18,012.80
Balance Due $18,012.80

NOTICE TO EXPORTER: You must obtain Export Power of attorney from Yanmar Mastry Engine Center. Forwarders or carriers cannot combine other invoices without written agreement, A
copy of all BL, AWB, Truck BL, AES filing and Commercial Invoice must be sent to MEC-IEC@MASTRY.COM for each shipment. Commercial invoice must have our invoice number, You must
follow OFAC sanction country list regulation or any EAR regulation before shipments are processed. Call 727-522-9471 with questions. All goods remain the property of YANMAR MASTRY
ENGINE CENTER until paid in full A 15% restocking fee on all returns - All returns must be accompanied by this invoice and an RMA# - No returns accepted after 30 days

Links contained in this email have been replaced. If you click on a link in the email above, the link will be analyzed for known
threats. If a known threat is found, you will not be able to proceed to the destination. If suspicious content is detected, you
will see a warning.
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Scott Schultz

From: Mivel Simmons <msimmons@mastry.com>

Sent: Thursday, February 18, 2021 2:13 PM

To: Scott Schultz

Subject: Yanmar Mastry Engine Center: Invoice #INV838533

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. . Do not click links or open attachments
unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Ef Invoice
YANMAR MASTRY ENGINE CENTER Date 2/18/2021
2801 Anvil Street North Invoice # INV838533
Saint Petersburg FL 33710 Acct. No. 252061
United States Terms
(727) 522-9471 Due Date
https://link.edgepilot.com/s/38b925df/XSwVpDNamO0ilGaeb3UcyxA?u=http://www.mastry.com/ PO # 2722624
Bill To grr';gnTgove Springs Created Sales Order
Scott Schultz 900 Gurn St From #50844264
Water and WaSte Water UtllltleS Green Cove Springs FL 32043 Sa|eS Rep Doug Jensen
321 Walnut Street United States shipping 1. Other
Green Cove Springs, FL 32043 Methgd
. Tracking #
United States .
Shipping -Not Taxable-
Tax Code
Shipping
Tax Rate

i Serual/ BII;N:‘ ;. _ besérib{ién i 2 = -"Iiat_e_ 40

'pe4045n028092 160 KW JD 27,912.00 55,824.00
. _ ' PE4045N028094 .

S608-SEB375 2|ea | Y-110amps 4,367.00 8,734.00

i ! YY-220amps

| D-190amps

| | ZZ-220amps
Subtotal 64,558.00
Shipping Cost (Truck Other) 548.40
Total 65,106.40

Balance Due $65,106.40

NOTICE TO EXPORTER: You must obtain Export Power of attorney from Yanmar Mastry Engine Center. Forwarders or carriers cannot combine other invoices without written agreement. A
copy of all BL, AWB, Truck BL, AES filing and Commercial Invoice must be sent to MEC-IEC@MASTRY.COM for each shipment. Commercial invoice must have our invoice number, You must
follow OFAC sanction country list regulation or any EAR regulation before shipments are processed. Call 727-522-9471 with questions, All goods remain the property of YANMAR MASTRY
ENGINE CENTER until paid in full A 15% restocking fee on all returns - All returns must be accompanied by this invoice and an RMA# - No returns accepted after 30 days

Links contained in this email have been replaced. If you click on a link in the email above, the link will be analyzed for known
threats. If a known threat is found, you will nof able to proceed to the destination. If suspicious content is detected, you

will see a warning. g_pp
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Scott Schultz

From: Mivel Simmons <msimmons@mastry.com>

Sent: Thursday, February 18, 2021 3:38 PM

To: Scott Schultz

Subject: Yanmar Mastry Engine Center: Invoice #INV838568

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. . Do not click links or open attachments
unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

(] § Invoice
YANMAR MASTRY ENGINE CENTER Date 2/18/2021
2801 Anvil Street North Invoice # INV838568
Saint Petersburg FL 33710 Acct. No. 252061
United States Terms
(727) 522-9471 Due Date
https://link.edgepilot.com/s/d697a7e2/5NYD8XN2ZEqk091uWVieBg?u=http://www.mastry.com
= Ship To PO # 2722624
Bill To Gre:n Cove Springs Created Sales Order
Scott Schultz 900 Gum St From #50844326
Water and Waste Water Utilities Green Cove Springs FL 32043 Sales Rep  Doug Jensen
321 Walnut Street United States Shipping e Other
Green Cove Springs, FL 32043 rr‘:t:'g: 2
United States . -
Shipping -Not Taxable-
Tax Code
Shipping

Tax Rate

'35 KW 1 PH 18,700.00 | 18,700.00

1166882
Subtotal 18,700.00
Shipping Cost (Truck Other) 182.80
Total 18,882.80
Balance Due $18,882.80

NOTICE TO EXPORTER: You must obtain Export Power of attorney from Yanmar Mastry Engine Center. Forwarders or carriers cannot combine other invoices without written agreement. A
copy of all BL, AWB, Truck BL, AES filing and Commercial Invoice must be sent to MEC-IEC@MASTRY.COM for each shipment. Commercial invoice must have our invoice number, You must
follow OFAC sanction country list regulation or any EAR regulation before shipments are processed. Call 727-522-9471 with questions. All goods remain the property of YANMAR MASTRY
ENGINE CENTER until paid in full A 15% restocking fee on all returns - All returns must be accompanied by this invoice and an RMA# - No returns accepted after 30 days

Links contained in this email have been replaced. If you click on a link in the email above, the link will be analyzed for known
threats. If a known threat is found, you will not be able to proceed to the destination. If suspicious content is detected, you

will see a warning. l
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STRAIGHT BILL OF LADING - SHORT FORM

City e s ncJ FLoA3sTl
State and zip

o 219 -TTsU0

Carrier Name: /1, »{fin Phone G/ i il SHIPMENT IDENTIFICTION NO.
Carrier Address: - 2+ i o0 Date
Clity ¢ helr Bt fj = FREIGHT BILL PRO NO.
Stateand Zip: ! i/ /s e SAC DUNS 1 ~
ol = . AR TRAILER/CAR NUMBER
Cor:asignee(\iﬁtt"[\ l R AR ui’.{_
Address oo Gum ot ROUTE
; s s e Bea 1 R 42
City ACweeny \ OVE o el b D203
State and Zip - )
EROM: = oy s [ ; - : SPECIAL INSTRUCTIONS | _
FR.OM' Sy & WL L aan oo berol e dde Can gz
Shipper o i DY CorstCilChk oottt oo z,;{"f}u
Address 111 Lonuncciaaat Pl '

FOR PAYMENT SEND BILL TO: _

Name Li”)il--iu,-, l'k 2 5".,(;}_'\“?" LQ_ELL.U”
Address ¢ o (o SF
City AU LALVIL

State & Zip i;{ I"]k?.t‘umfut_h e} Fo 30

SHIPPER'S INTERNAL DATA

SID NO.

Numbar 8hipping 1+ (1
A g | A

[ Wergn suectia.
| " Cortection’

TO _ PREPAID
Subjec 1o Section 7 of condllions, I this
Address shipmant is o be delivered 10 the consignee COLLECT
City Witho! recourse on the consigrior, the censignor | TOTAL $
State & Zij]_ shall sign the following statement: CHARGES
The carrier shall ke delivay of thi
NOTE - Where the rate Is dspendant on value, shippers are required to state‘peclﬁcally s”pm::l" M:,:,m p:;:“r::l :, ,791;1‘: :m :;. aothe [FREIGHT CHARGES
|in writing the agreed or declared value of the property. Jawiul charges, ARE PREPAID.UNLESS
The agreed or decfared viaue of the proerty Is heraby spaclficlly stated by the shipper to MARKED COLLECT
be not exceading
' Signature of Consignor
$ per 9 CHECK BOX IFCOLLECT [}

RECEIVED, subjoct (o the classifications and lawully filad tariffs in effect on the date of the Issue of this Bill of Lading. the property described ebove In apparent good order, except es noled (contents and
conditions of contents of packeges unknown), marked consignad and dostined as indicated abovo which sald carmler (ho word carrler being undorstood throughout this contract as meaning any parson of
corporation In possession of the property under the contract) agrees to carry 10 Its usual place f dellvery at sald destination, if on its route, otherwise (0 dellver lo another carrler on the roule 10 [is destinalion.
It I8 mutually agreed ae lo aach carrier of @i or any of tho sald proporty, over all or any portion of sakd routa k destination and as lo aach party at any tine Inlotested In all or any of said properly, thal every
sarvica to be parformed hereunder shall be subject to the bill of lading terms and conditions In the governing classliication 6n the date of shipment. Shipper hereby certifies that he Is familiar with all the blll of
lading terms and conditions In tha govarning classification and theo sald lorms and conditions Bre huiaby agread to by Ihe shippor and accepled for himself and his assigns.

SHIPPER

bt ; \ g ;
PEHL{, .',,p'{_,.'“f,L}.iti,‘Oi'\[l.U(_&

CARRIER
PER

* Mark *X" or "RG" If apprapitate (o designate Hazardous Matorials as defined In the Department of Transport Flagulations governing the transporiation ol hazardous matenials. The uge of this column is an
optional mathod for Identifylng hazardous materials on bills of lading per Section172.201(aj(1)(ll) of Tlllo 49, Code of Federsl Regulations. Ako, when shipping hazardous malerlals Lhe shipper's carilfiication

statemant prescribed in Seclion 172.204(8) of the Federal Regulations must ba Indicated on the blll of lading, unless a specilic exemption fom this requirement is provided in tha Regulations for a particular

malerial,

-




