From: Rogers, Kevin

To: Kevin Wagner
Cc: McGauley-Steinberg, Cheryl; Shaw, Brent; Flint, Robert (Skip)
Subject: FW: Request for Federal Participation, Change Order 2, Palmetto Ave., 435677-1-58-01, G2390
Date: Monday, March 13, 2023 8:31:27 AM
Attachments: ce loao 240x46 ddfcf290-2d69-4d4c-a5c7-ee3ac33e0e44.png
Change Order 2 435677-1-58-01 G2390.docx
RFI #4.pdf

RE RFI #4, Palmetto Ave. Sidewalk, City Concurrance435677-1-58-01, G2390.pdf

Kevin D. Rogers

D2 District Construction Services Manager
Florida Department of Transportation
District 2 Construction Office

1109 South Marion Avenue

Lake City, FL 32025

Office- 386-961-7416
Kevin.Rogers@dot.state.fl.us

From: Moseley, Douglas <Douglas.Moseley@dot.state.fl.us>

Sent: Monday, March 13, 2023 6:35 AM

To: Rogers, Kevin <Kevin.Rogers@dot.state.fl.us>

Cc: Bordner, Jason <Jason.Bordner@dot.state.fl.us>

Subject: FW: Request for Federal Participation, Change Order 2, Palmetto Ave., 435677-1-58-01,
G2390

Kevin,
Concur with the recommendations below. FHWA Participation for $1328.05 and 12 non-
compensable days.

Thanks,
Doug

From: Rogers, Kevin <Kevin.Rogers@dot.state.fl.us>

Sent: Friday, March 10, 2023 12:17 PM

To: Moseley, Douglas <Douglas.Moseley@dot.state.fl.us>; Bordner, Jason
<Jason.Bordner@dot.state.fl.us>

Subject: FW: Request for Federal Participation, Change Order 2, Palmetto Ave., 435677-1-58-01,
G2390

Doug/Jason,

Please see attached CO 02 on the subject LAP project for your review for federal
participation. Of note:
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[bookmark: _Hlk489866037]District Two Local Agency Change Order Request 

Change Order Number 2



Financial Project Number: 435677-1-58-01	Contract Number: G2390



Project Description: Palmetto Avenue Sidewalk		Local Agency: City of Green Cove Springs 



Contractor:  Elton Alan

Original Contract Amount: 	$1,544,374.81

Change in Contract Amount CO #1: 	$633.19

Change in Contract Amount CO #2:  	$1,328.05

Present Contract Amount:  	$1,546,366.05



Original Contract Days: 	296 days

Change in Contract Days-CO #1: 	Twelve (12) days 

Change in Contract Days- CO #2:  	Twelve (12) days

Current Contract Days:  	320 days



Change due to Design Error or Omission	Yes	No X



Description of Changes: 

1. Adds 19.55 Sy of 6” Concrete Sidewalk and an additional 13.33 Sy of concrete removal. 

1. Adds 12 Days for Weather and Holidays from 12/1/22 to 2/28/23.



Justification for Changes

1. The existing driveway located at station 142+60 does not extend far enough back to match the proposed sidewalk. If the sidewalk is poured per the plans there will be a 3’ gap at the rear of the sidewalk across the driveway. By adding the additional concrete removal and 6” concrete sidewalk the sidewalk will remain a constant width through the corridor.

2. Adds the following Days from 12/1/22 to 2/28/23:

· Weather; 12/15/22, 2/2/23

· Holiday; 12/24/22 thru 1/2/23

Resources/ Materials



		Item No.

		Item Description

		Quantity

		Unit Price

		Total Additional Cost



		110-4-10

		Existing Concrete Removal

		13.33 SY

		$12.82

		$170.89



		

522-2

		6” Concrete Sidewalk and Driveways

		19.55 SY

		$59.19

		$1157.16



		

Estimated Total Change Cost

		$1328.05







                                                                                                                                                            

Local Agency Representative                                                                                  Date



                                                                                                                                                            

District Two Program Administrator                                                                            Date





                                                                                                                                                            

Contractor                                                                                                                     Date




Palmetto Ave

FIN: 435677-1-58-01
LAP Contract No.: G2390

REQUEST FOR MODIFICATION (RFI)

Instructions:

1. This form is part of a control system to assure prompt answers to questions which may arise during construction.

2. Please submit the original to the Project Administrator.

3. This form need not be typed, but LEGIBILITY IS ESSENTIAL.

4. The Project Administrator will assign numbers and maintain a numbered log. Numbers may be obtained by telephone.
5. The Referred to should be left blank. The project Administrator will fill in.

6. Under "REFERENCE", please provide relevant reference(s) to project or bridge elements, drawing, specifications etc.

RFINO.: 4 DATE:  03/03/23
INQUIRY FROM: Tony Lewis OF: EltonAlan
DRAWING REFERENCE:

DESCRIPTION OF QUESTION OR PROBLEM:

The 2 driveways at station 142+60 does not extend far back enough to match the rear of the proposed sidewalk. If it is
poured per the plan, there will be a 2-3’ gap at the rear of the sidewalk across this driveway. A suggested solution is to
transition the sidewalk toward the back of curb so that the proposed rear of the sidewalk lines up with the existing back

of driveway as detailed on the attachment

REFERRED TO: Kevin Wagner OF:
RESPONSE:
Signature:
Date:

Distribution:






From: Mike Null

To: Kevin Wagner; Steve Thomas; Heather Rocha

Cc: Greg Bauer; Lori Williams; Belinda Lubben; Jack Varndell; Derek Gil; Shaw, Brent; Flint, Robert (Skip)
Subject: RE: RFI #4, Palmetto Ave. Sidewalk, 435677-1-58-01, G2390

Date: Monday, March 6, 2023 11:21:49 AM

Attachments: image001.png

| agree with keeping the sidewalk straight. The $1,300 in additional funding is acceptable.

Thanks,

Mike Null

Assistant City Manager

City of Green Cove Springs
ph (904)297-7500, ext. 3324
fx (904)284-8609

From: Kevin Wagner <kwagner@consoreng.com>

Sent: Monday, March 6, 2023 11:15 AM

To: Steve Thomas <sthomas@greencovesprings.com>; Heather Rocha <hrocha@elementeg.com>
Cc: Mike Null <mnull@greencovesprings.com>; Greg Bauer <gbauer@greencovesprings.com>; Lori
Williams <lwilliams@consoreng.com>; Belinda Lubben <blubben@consoreng.com>; Jack Varndell
<jack.varndell@consoreng.com>; Derek Gil <dgil@elementeg.com>; Shaw, Brent
<brent.shaw@dot.state.fl.us>; Flint, Robert (Skip) <robert.flint@dot.state.fl.us>

Subject: RF| #4, Palmetto Ave. Sidewalk, 435677-1-58-01, G2390

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization.. Do not click links or
open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Good morning,

Please see the attached RFI from Elton Alan in regards to the driveway at station 142+60. It would be
my recommendation that we add the additional concrete and go straight through the drive rather
than adjusting the alignment as shown in the RFI. The added cost would be approximately $1300.00
for the additional 6” concrete sidewalk and concrete removal. If the City would like to add the
additional concrete we will prepare a change order for review. If you have any questions please
advise.

Kevin Wagner
PROJECT ADMINISTRATOR
0: +1.352.281.6857 Ext. 51061
m: +1.352.281.6857
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The content of this email is confidential and intended for the recipient specified in message only. It is
strictly forbidden to share any part of this message with any third party, without a written consent of
the sender. If you received this message by mistake, please reply to this message and follow with its
deletion, so that we can ensure such a mistake does not occur in the future.

Links contained in this email have been replaced. If you click on a link in the email above, the link will
be analyzed for known threats. If a known threat is found, you will not be able to proceed to the
destination. If suspicious content is detected, you will see a warning.






e All adjustments are being performed at the established contract unit prices
e There is no re-work, , delay, premium costs, or inefficiencies associated with this change
e The changes are Value Added adjustments needed to make the project functionally

operational.
e All of this work falls within the Project Limits and is consistent with the Original Scope.

Therefore, the CCEl feels the request for FHWA Participation in the cost of $1328.05 and 12
non-compensable days (weather/Holiday days) should be granted in accordance with the
guidelines provided in the contract documents and the FHWA Core Curriculum Manual.

Thank you,

Kevin D. Rogers

D2 District Construction Services Manager
Florida Department of Transportation
District 2 Construction Office

1109 South Marion Avenue

Lake City, FL 32025

Office- 386-961-7416
Kevin.Rogers@dot.state.fl.us

From: Kevin Wagner <kwagner@consoreng.com>

Sent: Tuesday, March 7, 2023 11:48 AM

To: Rogers, Kevin <Kevin.Rogers@dot.state.fl.us>

Cc: Lubben, Belinda <blubben@consoreng.com>; Williams, Lori <lwilliams@consoreng.com>
Subject: Request for Federal Participation, Change Order 2, Palmetto Ave., 435677-1-58-01, G2390

EXTERNAL SENDER: Use caution with links and attachments.

Kevin,

Attached, please find Change Order No. 2 for Palmetto Ave., 435677-1-58-01, G2390 for your review
and federal participation determination.

This change order addresses the following changes:
e Adds additional concrete removal and 6” concrete sidewalk through an existing driveway.


mailto:Kevin.Rogers@dot.state.fl.us
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e Adds weather and holidays

It is our recommendation that the full amount of $1328.05 and 12 added Weather and Holidays be
considered FHWA Participating.

Any questions, please let me know. Thanks.

Kevin Wagner
PROJECT ADMINISTRATOR
0: +1.352.281.6857 Ext. 51061
m: +1.352.281.6857
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The content of this email is confidential and intended for the recipient specified in message only. It is
strictly forbidden to share any part of this message with any third party, without a written consent of
the sender. If you received this message by mistake, please reply to this message and follow with its
deletion, so that we can ensure such a mistake does not occur in the future.
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