CITY OF GREENACRES TABULATION

Notice of Bid: November 13, 2022
Advertised in Palm Beach Post & on City Website: November 13, 2022

Bid Number: 23-003

Description: Fence Installation, Maintenance and Repair Services

AREA B (CENTRAL BROWARD COUNTY) AND AREA C (SOUTH BROWARD COUNTY/MIAMI-DADE COUNTY)

Department:
Opening Date:
Opened By:
Witnessed By:

Public Works
12/13/2022
Monica Powery
Randi Whitcomb

Phone:

Vendor Name:|E. Gomez Construction

Address: (2109 W. 76th Street

Hialeah, FL 33016

(305) 603-8619
Email:|egomez@egomezconstruction.com

Martin Fence Co.

862 13th Street

Lake Park, FL 33403

(561) 848-2688

mfence@martinfence.com

Description Unit of Measure Unit Cost Unit Cost
Provide and Install New Fencing (Board on Board)
1.1|Board on Board Fencing | & | PerLinearFoot |$ 40.00 | NO BID
Provide and Install New Fencing (Split Railing)
2.1]Provide and Install New Fencing (Split Railing) | 4 [ PerlLinearFoot [$ 38.00 | NO BID
Provide and Install New Fencing (Galvanized and Vinyl Coated)
3.1 4' Per Linear Foot | $ 15.00 NO BID
3.2 Galvanized Fenin 5' Per Linear Foot | $ 14.00 NO BID
3.3 Chain Link Fabric v?/ith Top Rail 6' Per Linear Foot | $ 28.00 NO BID
3.4 8' Per Linear Foot | $ 35.00 NO BID
3.5 10' Per Linear Foot | $ 35.00 NO BID
3.6 4' Per Linear Foot | $ 13.00 NO BID
3.7 Galvanized Fencin 5' Per Linear Foot | $ 10.00 NO BID
3.8 Cpain Link Fabrio with Tension Wire without Top Rail 6 | Perlinear Foot |$ 25.00 NO BID
3.9 8' Per Linear Foot | $ 31.00 NO BID
3.10 10' Per Linear Foot | $ 28.00 NO BID
3.1 4 Each $ 200.00 NO BID
3.12 Galvanized Posts 5' Each $ 140.00 NO BID
3.13 Corner Posts with Braces & Each $ 500.00 NO BID
3.14 8' Each $ 600.00 NO BID
3.15 10' Each $ 500.00 NO BID
3.16 4 Each $ 200.00 NO BID
3.17 Galvanized Post 5' Each $ 140.00 NO BID
3.18 Ter;ei]rr:;zlePostossviith Braces & Each $ 350.00 NO BID
3.19 8' Each $ 360.00 NO BID
3.20 10' Each $ 360.00 NO BID
3.21 4 Each $ 180.00 NO BID
3.22 Galvanized Posts 5' Each $ 90.00 NO BID
323 Including Posts with Braces; Line Posts and Intermediate Post & Each $ 300.00 NO BID
3.24 8' Each $ 400.00 NO BID
3.25 10' Each $ 350.00 NO BID




Vendor Name:

Address:

Phone:
Email:

E. Gomez Construction

2109 W. 76th Street
Hialeah, FL 33016
(305) 603-8619

egomez@egomezconstruction.com

Martin Fence Co.

862 13th Street

Lake Park, FL 33403
(561) 848-2688
mfence@martinfence.com

Item Description Unit of Measure Unit Cost Unit Cost
3.26 4' Per Linear Foot | $ 80.00 NO BID
3.27 5' Per Linear Foot | $ 60.00 NO BID
3.28|Galvanized Gates — Single Swing including Posts with Braces 6' Per Linear Foot | $ 160.00 NO BID
3.29 8' Per Linear Foot | $ 180.00 NO BID
3.30 10' Per Linear Foot | $ 180.00 NO BID
3.31 4' Per Linear Foot | $ 180.00 NO BID
3.32 5' Per Linear Foot | $ 100.00 NO BID
3.33|Galvanized Gates — Single Roll including Posts, Braces & Wheels 6' Per Linear Foot | $ 190.00 NO BID
3.34 8' Per Linear Foot | $ 220.00 NO BID
3.35 10' Per Linear Foot | $ 180.00 NO BID
3.36 4' Per Linear Foot | $ 19.00 NO BID
3.37| . . 5' Per Linear Foot | $ 15.00 NO BID
3.38 X'l?g' I\/?r?jtgi:t(;gc':'r;% Rail 6 Per Linear Foot | $ 35.00 NO BID
3.39 8' Per Linear Foot | $ 42.00 NO BID
3.40 10' Per Linear Foot | $ 55.00 NO BID
3.41 4' Each $ 300.00 NO BID
3.42 Vinvl Coated Post 5' Each $ 150.00 NO BID
343 Cgr}rl1eroF’ao:t wit?msE?races & Each $ 600.00 NO BID
3.44 8' Each $ 600.00 NO BID
3.45 10' Each $ 300.00 NO BID
3.46 4' Each $ 300.00 NO BID
3.47 Vinyl Coated Posts 5' Each $ 150.00 NO BID
348 Terininal Posts with Braces & Each $ 500.00 NO BID
3.49 8' Each $ 500.00 NO BID
3.50 10' Each $ 300.00 NO BID
3.51 4' Per Linear Foot | $ 130.00 NO BID
3.52 5' Per Linear Foot | $ 80.00 NO BID
3.53|Vinyl Coated Gates — Single Swing including Posts with Braces 6' Per Linear Foot | $ 180.00 NO BID
3.54 8' Per Linear Foot | $ 230.00 NO BID
3.55 10' Per Linear Foot | $ 180.00 NO BID
3.56 4' Per Linear Foot | $ 160.00 NO BID
3.57 5' Per Linear Foot | $ 90.00 NO BID
3.58|Vinyl Coated Gates — Single Roll including Posts, Braces & Wheels 6' Per Linear Foot | $ 200.00 NO BID
3.59 8' Per Linear Foot | $ 240.00 NO BID
3.60 10' Per Linear Foot | $ 170.00 NO BID
Removal and Disposal of Existing Fence

4.1|Fence Height: 4’ Per Linear Foot | $ 10.00 NO BID

4.2|Fence Height: 5’ Per Linear Foot | $ 5.00 NO BID

4.3|Fence Height: 6’ Per Linear Foot | $ 14.00 NO BID

4.4|Fence Height: 8’ Per Linear Foot | $ 18.00 NO BID




Vendor Name:|E. Gomez Construction Martin Fence Co.

Address:[2109 W. 76th Street 862 13th Street
Hialeah, FL 33016 Lake Park, FL 33403
Phone:|(305) 603-8619 (561) 848-2688

Email:[egomez@egomezconstruction.com mfence@martinfence.com

Description Height Unit of Measure Unit Cost Unit Cost
4.5|Fence Height: 10’ Per Linear Foot | $ 16.00 NO BID

Repairs to Existing Fence
5.1|Labor per man hour for the repair of existing fences Per Man Hour $ 40.00 NO BID

Contractor’s percent markup for materials required to repair existing fences. (Materials to be billed at net cost plus the
5.2|percentage markup. Markup on sales tax is not permitted. A copy of the itemized materials invoice from the supplier must 10% NO BID
be included with all invoicing.)

Specialty Fencing Installation and Material (PVC, Wood, Wrought Iron and Aluminum)
6.1|Labor per man hour for the installation of specialty fences materials Per Man Hour $ 60.00 NO BID

Contractor’s percent markup for specialty fencing materials. (Materials to be billed at net cost plus the percentage
6.2|markup. Markup on sales tax is not permitted. A copy of the itemized materials invoice from the supplier must be included 10% NO BID
with all invoicing.)

Contractor’s percent markup for approved subcontracted services. (To be billed at net cost plus a percentage markup.
6.3|Markup on sales tax is not permitted. A copy of the itemized subcontracted services invoice from the subcontractor must 10% NO BID
be included with all invoicing.)

Contractor’s percent markup for approved used of rental equipment. (To be billed at net cost plus a percentage markup.
6.4|Markup on sales tax is not permitted. A copy of the itemized subcontracted services invoice from the subcontractor must 10% NO BID
be included with all invoicing.)

CITY OF GREENACRES TABULATION

Note: All recommendations for award are unofficial until City Council approval




